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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 23 May 2018 8:20 AM
'Eliza Ho'
SUR

RE: Market Value - SKC4709S/ DOA: 20.05.20'18

Dear Eliza,

The market value of SKC 47095 is $34K-$36K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Eliza Ho Imailto:Eliza_Ho@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 3:50 PM

Subject: Market Value - SKC4709S/ DOA: 20.05.2018

Hi,

Please advise on market value, than k you.



Eliza Ho
Assistant Executive, Ctaims Services (Motor)
D: +6565942554 lF: +65 6225 7402 letiza ho@se.msie-asia.com
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CONFIDENTIAL]TY NOTICE
This e-ma I (lnclLtding any attachments) may contain informatron that is privileged or confidential- The sending of thjs e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient ls not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the rntended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the ernail and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.
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Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner lD:

Vehicle Details
t552C

Pr!1nary co!99r,

Manufacturing Year:

Red*-loir **--:--'

vF41eq0e9q1930816

103.0 kw (138 bhp)

139:187:P

!! N1pz]ottl

29,Aue20lt
0

engin"No., 
--' 

L98A70001653419

Chaslig No,:

Maximum Power Output:

First Registration Date:

: TransferCount:

i COE Expiry Date:

' COE Category:
1 COE Period(Years):

, QP Paid:

g2o,I87.oo loOI)ActualARF Paid:

I nte.1{e!- l}!! [e latq p_eq!t9

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibilily Exqiry Date: zP 4yg79z\
PARF RebateAmount: $13,121.00
lntended COE Rebate Details

COE Rebate Amount:

ioiat neUate amountt
$16,102.00

$29,223.OO

The information contained herein is correct as at22MavZOIB
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