Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Autolnsure (Claims) <claimsO1@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January, 2019 10:28 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: LETTER OF CLAIM SLP5025U / YOUR REF: CC4/ASM18009321/Sha3 /
ENDORSED DV

Attachments: SIGNED DV SLP5025U C2858 AXA.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Vic,

We refer to the captioned matter and to your DV attached below.

Kindly refer to our client's endorsed DV for your proceeding of payment.

Thank You.

*Kindly note that our mailing address is as follows:

6 Marsiling Lane $739145
tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards

Geraldine Lim

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626

f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg
g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately

notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This
may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service
providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.




On Fri, Nov 9, 2018 at 4:23 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sam,

We refer to your below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to
our Insured’s part, we have our principal’s instruction and confirm acceptance of your counter proposed of
$2.219.60 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

Kindly let the owner chop and sign the attached DV and forward back to us the a copy for our Principal to
process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to AUTO INSURE PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



= Save the Larth- Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: claims01 @web-dezigners.com <claims01 @web-dezigners.com> On Behalf Of Autolnsure
(Claims)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 3:10 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LETTER OF CLAIM SLP5025U / YOUR REF: CC4/ASM18009321/Sua3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Thin Thin,

We refer to the above matter and email below.

Please be informed that our client is unable to accept your proposal.

Kindly let us have your revised offer:

1. Cost of Repairs (+gst) $ 1,904.60



2. Loss of LOR (4DAYS) $ 284.00
3. LTA Search Fee $ 31.00
$2,219.60

We have attached all necessary documents in our Letter of Claim sent on 30 Aug 2018 to
support your revision of offer. Do refer from our Letter of Claim and let us have your DV soon.

Thanks.

*Kindly note that our mailing address is as follows:

6 Marsiling Lane $739145

tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards

Sam Goh
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This

may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party
service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.



On Fri, Nov 9, 2018 at 2:46 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin @lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the below matter.

We propose to settle as follow:

1. Cost of Repairs (+gst) $1,904.60
2. Loss of LOR & LOI (4DAYS) $ 280.00
3. LTA Search Fee $ 2.00

$2,186.60

Kindly let us have your acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

5



From: claims01 @web-dezigners.com <claims01 @web-dezigners.com> On Behalf Of Autolnsure
(Claims)

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 4:00 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LETTER OF CLAIM SLP5025U / YOUR REF: CC4/ASM18009321/Sua3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Thin Thin,

We refer to the above matter and reminder below.

Please be inform that we have yet to receive your offer till to-date.

Kindly let us have your offer soon.

Thanks.

*Kindly note that our mailing address is as follows:
6 Marsiling Lane S739145
tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards

Sam Goh



did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M

6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081

W: www.autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please

immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This
may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party
service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

On Thu, Sep 27, 2018 at 10:50 AM, Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01 @autoinsure.com.sg> wrote:

Dear All,

We refer to the above matter and to your email below.

Please be informed that we have yet to receive your offer till to-date.

Kindly let us have your offer soon.

Thanks.

*Kindly note that our mailing address is as follows:

6 Marsiling Lane S739145



tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards

Alywin Yeo

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M

6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This

may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party
service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

On Thu, Aug 30, 2018 at 2:21 PM, Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01 @autoinsure.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi,

Letter of Claim and relevant documents as attached.

Kindly advise if you need any more information to support this claim.

*Note: If documents are requested to be mailed, we will only provide LOC, Repairer's Bill and LOA.
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Kindly state your request in writing if you require more documents.*

Thanks.

*Kindly note that w.e.f 21st Mar 2017, we are relocated to:
6 Marsiling Lane S739145
tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards
Geraldi

ne Lim
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628

mobile: (65) 88332626

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626
f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy.

This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third
party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.
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