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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 3:38 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBD1199J Finalization

Hi Veron ,  

 

Noted with thanks  
 
Best Regards, 
 
Wong Chee Wei  
Pandan Crash Repair 
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd. 
DID 68676919  

 

 

 
From:        "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)" <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
To:        CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>, SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>  
Date:        07/06/2018 02:21 PM  
Subject:        RE: GBD1199J Finalization  

 

 

 

Dear Chee Wei,  
   
Confirmed Lump Sum $11,300 before excess $500 @ 10 working days.  
   

   

   

Best Regards,  

Veron Chen | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

   

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter [mailto:pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 11:16 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fw: GBD1199J Finalization  

   
Hi  
 
As requested refer to e mail below  
 
Best Regards, 
 
Wong Chee Wei  
Pandan Crash Repair 
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd. 
DID 68676919  
----- Forwarded by CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes on 07/03/2018 10:57 AM -----  
 
From:        CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes  
To:        taufikh@lkkauto.com  
Cc:        Denis Teo Chin Chye/sparkcarcare/cdge/delgronotes@delgronotes, Ng Zong Xiong/cdge/delgronotes@delgronotes  
Date:        06/30/2018 03:22 PM  
Subject:        GBD1199J Finalization  
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Hi Taufikh ,  
 

 
With attached for above mentioned matter for you action and advice  
 

 

 
Photo check item and supplementary parts :  
 

 

 
Photo aft repair : 
Best Regards, 
 
Wong Chee Wei  
Pandan Crash Repair 
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd. 
DID 68676919  


