Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 December, 2018 11:54 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Ce MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SFT6100D AND SJT7643A ON 20/05/2018 Qur

Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/0206.21

Dear Vivian,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 5:45 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SFT6100D AND SJT7643A ON 20/05/2018 Our Ref:
17/18/18/VP05/020621

l.onpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020621
1. KK Ref: CC4/LPC18009277/T1wb3

Hi Gerald
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 22 May 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

I'his is a chain collision involving 4 vehicles chain collision where Ol was the last vehicle
I accordance to the MCF guideline, we have to settle 3™ claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Performance Motors Limited is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $6,250.80 $3802.83
2. Loss of USE ($ 600.00 x 3days) $ 180.00 $ 180.00(3days x $60.00)
3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 200 §  2.00
[ Total | $6,432.89 $3.984.83

#*3 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.



The above is for your approval.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

I'hone; 6841-8625 | email; Vivianlau@]kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Btk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 3:19 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SFT6100D AND SJT7643A ON 20/05/2018 Our Ref:
17/18/18/VP05/020621

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May, 2018 2:56 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SFT6100D AND SJT7643A ON 20/05/2018 Qur Ref:
17/18/18/VP05/020621

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.
2



Pgr_fprmgpce Motors Limited

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road

#17- 04107 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Attention: Motor Claims

“Without Prejudice™

27 July 2018
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SFT6100D & SJT7643A ON 20.05.2018

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

The accident was caused solely by the negligence on the part of your insured. As a result of the
said accident, our client has suffered losses which are set out hereunder as follows:-

Costofrepair : S% 380283

Lossofuse : S$  180.00 (S$60.00 x 3 days)
GlAsearchfee | S§ 2.00
Total . S$ 398483

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
Copy of Accident Report

Copy of Final Repair bill & GIA search slip

Copy of Certificate of Insurance

Copy of Identification Card & Driving License

Copy of Letter of Authorisation

Weas pmloom, B

kLo =

Please note that you or your insured should send us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter
within fourteen (14) days from the date of this letter, failing which our client will have no
alternative but to commence legal proceedings against you without any further notice to you or
your insured.

Should you have a counterclaim against our client arising out of the accident, you are also
required to send a letter giving full particulars of the counterclaim together with all relevant
supporting documents within eight (8) weeks of your receipt of this letter.

For any correspondence, please contact Ms Caroline Tan at 6319-0174 | Fax. 6479-4601 or
amgang Ao s email to pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg.

Yours sincerely

/(l:v—j

Teng Wai Khan
Customer Service Manager, Body & Paint




Performance Motors Limited

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

ACCIDENT INVOLVING /7 ¢/000 g V776454 oN 2/ [1F

4.4 ‘;.a "..__ .-I.:-I . . . ...;'\-::. 5
, A7 Tnn g Chlas swner of Vehicle RegistrationNo. 2~ /7400
hereby authorise Performance Motors Limited to submit, correspond, negotiate and
settle my claim for cost of repair andfor uninsured losses arising from the above accident.

| further authorise Performance Motors Limited to execute, sign, seal and deliver all
documents whatsoever in relation to this matter and to accept and receive any payment
due to me in respect of my claim above.

| hereby declare that all acts and documents done by virtue of this Letter of Authorisation
on my behalf shall be good valid and effectual to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if
the same had been done or executed by me in person.

| further confirm that the acceptance by Performance Motors Limited of the settlement
amount in respect of such claim shall constitute the full discharge of my claim in respect of
such loss and damage.

Signed by:
B A Y

Neme: 7A4n/ ZAly Coras  Om) 2/ /05 /¢
NRIC No.: \;Z!;’;/?g'ﬁ(:/ '

In the presence of:

MName :
NRIC No.:

(Date) 2/ / e _';'/f &

FORM B1 VERSHON 1-SEPT 2017



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/VP05/020621
DATE : 12 December 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

[/'We, TAN ENG CHAI confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SIT 7643A the sum of Singapore Dollar Three Thousand Nine
Hundred Fifty Four and Cents Eighty Three Only ($ 3,954.83 } in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SJT 7643A & SFT 6100D on 20 May
2018 along JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVE7 & AVE 2

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/KAMARUZAMAN BIN ALI / SAHEMAH BINTE YUSOPE) against all
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in
respect of the said accident.

IWe further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to
PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action,

51019

/I511)i9

I BNG. CHAL.

Name of vehicle owner /Date



Performance Motors Limited

A member of the Sime Darby Group
Co. Reg. Ho. 1974015594 Q5T Reg. Mo M2-0020081-x

EMW Dealer

280, FKampong Arang Road
East Coast Centre
Singapore 438180

303, Rlexandra Road
Sime Darky Perfotmance Cenbre
Singapare 158441

315
313y

Rlexandra Road

Sime Darby Business Centoe

Singapore 15%%44

Tel., 83180100 (Sales & Admin Tel, HILGORER [(RfrerSaisd) " :::-::I:E:Nr ﬁ::—ifij:
e gty
SERVICE TAX INVOICE
p ,
Repalir Order No. Bl 1271178 Page HNo. 1 of 2
Invoice Number 1988873 / WSE
Date IN 3p/o05/2018 relce DEbE 20/07/2018
Cust. 8ve. Advisor: Han Ewan Yong Payment Terms 30 Days From Invoice
Invoice By Sharcon Heng ]
[ - CUSTOMER INFORMATION - - INVOICE TO - 158
Mr TAN ENG CHAI Lonpac Insurance Bhd
110 Woodlands Avenue 5 300 Beach Read
#07-21 #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Singapore 739015 _ |
W CHASSIE NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
| SFT6100D V926367 25/04/2018 216D CAT 2735 )
r o
= === LAB@UR 1===- o NETT
To replace rear bumper and bumper carrier including to 850.00
remove and install body parts in order lo carry oul painting
job.
To respray rear bumper 934.00
To remove old PDC assembly and reconnect to new bumper 150.00
including conduct checks for proper function
To check electrical wiring systems and lightings at the 150.00
rear section for proper function.
Sundries. 80.00
INS CLAIMS : ACCIDENT REPAIR. DIRECT SETTLEMENT, 0.00
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 20.5.2018. 3RD PARTY CAR : SJT7643A.
YOUR REF:171818VPOS/020621.
VEHICLE WAS SURVEYED BY MR TAUFIKH FROM LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD ON 3052018 AT 1040 AM.
AUTHORISED REPAIR BY MS VIVIAN LAU FROM LKK ON
23.5.2018 VIA E-MAIL.
PROPOSE LOSS OF USE = $60X3. THE AMOUNT IS SUBJECTED 0.00
TO INSURANCE COMPANY COMFIRMATION.
GIA SEARCH FEE = $2.00. 0.00
Total Labour 2,164.00
Retail
romumae (ERGRITE  asae s Y- ELicE N
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED {PDC) 1 966.25 95625
REAR BUMPER CARRIER 1 423.80 423.80
Total Parts 1,380.05

r




Performance Motors Limited

A memoer of the Sime Darby Group
Co. Reg, Ho, 197401559W G3T Feg, Ho Mo-00IO08L1-X

et = e S 315, Alexandra Road
03, hlexandra Road o i B Sime Darby Business Centre
Sime Darby Performance Centre RASL COMEE CENLTS Singapore 159544
Singapore 159941 Singapore 418160 Tel. G31H0528 [nfrersales)
Tel, €319 |Sales & Adsiin) Tel., &3150888 (AfterSaleEl EI150533/530 (Metorrad)

G 1 |AFrersales] Fax. &344%772 Fax. B47%6801 f{hfterSales)
Fax M E4TRARIE [Motorrad

SERVICE TAX INVOICE

Repalr Order No. : Bl 1271178 Page No. : 2 of 2
Invoice Number : 1988873 / WSB
Date IN : 30/05/2018 s TIARE . 20/07/2018
Cust. Sveo. Advisor: Han Ewan Yong Payment Terms : 30 Days From Invoice
Invoice By : Sharon Heng
r —— =
Lakhour Charges 2,084.00 Total Labour & Parts Charges 5% 3,554.05
Parts Charges : 1,390.05 Less Insurance Excess (1 0.00
Lubricant/Misc 80.00 Invoice Total Amount Exclude GST 5% 3,554.05
GST @ 7% 1 248.78
Invoice Total Amount Include GST 5% 3,802.83
Computer generated invoice. No signature is required.  |ameunt Payable Include GST s$ 3.802.83

All amounts are in Singapore Dollars.

Work was carried out subject to the Company's Terms and Conditions of Service.

No complaints will be entertained unless reported within seven (7) days of the date of this invoice.
For credit purchases, interest @ 1% per month will be debited on overdue amounts.




lnvolee

5. 4 GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
' GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Sl ASSOCIATION Dperﬂtingl Hm.l_rs: I".-'In.nda:.r to Friday S9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No: GR-18-076531
Cate of Request: 21/05/2018 Your Ref Mo: Onling Purchase

Serformance Motors Limited

303 Alexandra Road

3ime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 21/05/2018

Page 1 o

Enquiry By Han Kwan Yong

TF Vehicle No SJT7643A

Accident Date 20/05/2018

Inguiry Result:

TP Vehicla No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJITTE43A Lonpac Insurance Bhd 17/07/2017-28/10/2018 +85 62507388
“hank You

he images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association af Singapore and v
ike no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any lass or damage arising oul of or in connection with the repo

r their images.

his is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

ltps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=18... 21/05/201



[nvoice

“GENERAL
INSURANCE

il ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-076531
Date of Request: 21/05/2018

Paerformance Motors Limited
303 Alexandra Road

Sime Darby Performance Centre
Singapore 159941

Dear SirMadam,

TAX INVOICE

Yaour Ref Mo:

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Online Purchase

Enqguiry Date 21/05/2018

Enguiry By Han Kwan Yong

TP Vehicle No. SJT7E434

Accident Date 20/05/2018

DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (53) i

TP Insurer Enquiry 1_&_}'
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

I'his is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMG Official use:
Date;
[¥] GIRO [] Cash[] Cheque

11&:‘4

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=18... 21/05/201!



