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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ukl Ave 1 2801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapons 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188807188R GST Reg. No. 19-060T198-R

Affiliated to Faderation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16
CHARTIS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120

Rt CC4/AIG18009247/T1uad

Date 21-05-2018

Coda . AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ET 7628D Veh. Inspected GBD 2473K
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No, Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 21/052018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  15/05/2018 |inspection Date 23/05/2018
Survey held at MILLION AUTO SERVICE
4 PENJURU PLACE
#01-12 2.8 PENJURU TECH HUP
SINGAFPORE 608782
5a. Remarks

A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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MILLION AUTO SERVICE

No. 4 Penfuru Place #01-12, 2.8 Penjuru Tech Hub, Singapore 608782
Website: http:/fwww.millionaulo.com Emall: onauto.com
Tel: 8567 OB17, 6264 8087 Fax: 6791 4716
Reg No: 317413/00-K GST Reg No: M90363178A

31-Jul-18

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
AlG Building

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 (8) 079120 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Attention: Motor Claim Department

ESTIMATE COST FOR REPAIR GBD2473K HYUNDAI H100 2.5 (A}

Rear lid 16 249500 4
Rear bumper 418.30 A
Rear wheaterstrip 187.60 wf «
Rear bumper reforcemeant 347.00 K
Rear sensor 188.00 fw " 5
Windscreen sealant 50.00 ML 3
To dismantle & assembly rear windscrean 180.00 (2o
To dismantle & replace rear bumper, lid, rubber & sensor,
Te dismantle wiper motar, inner lock 80.00 ¥ 00
To knock & weld inner panal
To spray paint & putty rear lid, bumper & inner panel 800.00 ;l‘il..'l'i}
Sub total : 5,555.80
GST 7% : 388.91
Total : 5,944,771
2 k0l §o
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Hsiao Tong SLI{KAutn}

From: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 1:39 PM
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBD2473K LOD

Dear Thin Thin,

We confirmed acceptance your offer, please issue DV.

Thanks |

Hest Regands,

Ms Chong

Milllon Aute Servive

Mo Penjuru Place #01-12,
Singapore bOSTE2
2049091 (82285020

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, November 26, 2018 1:16 PM

To: Ms Chong <mschang@millionauto.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD2473K LOD

‘WITHOUT PREIUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we have our Principal instruction to propose the
settlement at Global Sum 5§ 3,100.00 (all-in).

Kindly confirm the acceptance.

Thanks,

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ld

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108



Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 3:21 PM

To: 'Ms Chong' <mschang@millionauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD2473K LOD

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we have our Principal instruction to propose the
settlement at Global Sum 55 2,920.00 (all-in).

Kindly confirm the acceptance.

Thanks.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed [ Inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/inflluence on the issues
of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, w02-25 | S{g08033)

From: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 2:42 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@ |kkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBD2473K LOD

Dear Thin Thin,

Please refer to the attachments for GRD2473K LOD.
We look forward on your favorable reply.

Thanks |

Best Regards.

Ms Chong

Million Auto Service

Nad Penuru Place #0112,

Singapore GOBTE2



62649091 /82285020

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 9:49 AM

To: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

<shupei@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD2473K estimate

Without Prejudice
Dear Ms Chong,
Enclosed herewith mark estimate for your perusal,

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2960 | emml: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408033)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 10:45 AM

To: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin {LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkau m>

Subject: FW: GBD2473K estimate

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will lock into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/AIG1B009247/T1ua3 Taufikh / Thin Thin

To check availability of the case haniler, you may contact the undersigneil.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone! 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108



8lk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933]

From: Ms Chong <mschong@millionauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 6:00 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: ref; GBD2473K estimate

Dear Taufikh,

Please refer to the attachment for GBD2473K estimate.
Thanks |

Best Regards,

Ms Chong

Million Auto Service

Nod Penjuru Place 201-12,
Stngapore 605782
62640091 /82285020



Hsiao Tnﬂ !Ll(!{Autu!

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 4:54 PM

To: evangchaini@gmail.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING ET 7628D & GBD 2473K ON 15/05/2018

I L7 s

A DA B Ple g

51 UBLAVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : 1065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Our Ref: CC4/AIG18009247/T1ub3

06 JUNE 2018

ONG MAH LAY

781 UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST
#09-27 SUNHAVEN

SINGAPORE 486069

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING ET 7628D & GBD 2473K ON 15!05!21!13

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) {if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,
Yours faithfully,

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 67414108

Emaill: thinthin@Ikkauto.com

C.C AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION LETTER

[, Eulay Chemical & Diesel (S) Pte Ltd (the third party claimant’) of
No.11 Tuas Link 3 (S) 638527 (address), owner of GBD2473K _(vehicle
no.). Hereby authorize MILLION AUTO SERVICE (“the workshop”) to
act for me with respect to my claim for repair cost and/or rental and/or loss
of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. _GBD2473K that was damaged pursuant
to the accident which occurred on 15/05/2018 (date) along PIE Twd Tuas
Dir. Before Slip Rd To Bendenmeer (S) (location) involving vehicle no/s
ET7628D (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a
manner the they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being
made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis
insofar as the driver / owner / insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Date this __23 _ (day) of __Mayv__ (month) _2018 (year)

Eulay Chemical & Diesel (S) Pte Litd
.} Tuas Link 3 Singapore 638527
Tel: ﬁﬂﬁiﬂl?ﬁ (3 Lines) Fax: 68631 160

\
R T . : =
Signed ‘t')y’{the third party claimant™ Signed by “the wurkst(ﬂ "




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, MILLION AUTO SERVICE (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreeinenl with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§583.100.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. GBD 2473K that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred on 15/08/2018 (date) along PIE TWD TUAS BEFORE SLIP ROAD TO
BENDEMEER involving vehicle no/s ET 76281

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 23/05/2018 (date) at “the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner EULAY CHEMICAL & DIESEL (S)
PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. GBD 2473K make the claim as st out in the

above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on histher behalf in a manner that
we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party ¢laimant®™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement Jodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
domage to GBD 2473K (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liahility basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Counts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Datedthis "~  (day)of ___ VY=t  (maonth) 20 _E {vear)
L AV
MTH- /
Signed by sppointed survevor Signed by *the wnrkshpp“ {with chop)

\
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MIION AUTO SERVICE

No. 4 Penjuru Place #01-12, 2.8 Penjuru Tech Hub, Singapore 608782
Websita: http:/fwww.milionaute.com Emall: wendy@millionauto.com
Tal: 6567 0817, 6264 9091 Fax: 6791 4716
Reg No: 317413/00-K GST Reg No: MB03B3176A

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Final Repair bill : 79158

AlG Building

78 Shanlon Way #07-16 Date : 14/08/2018

Singapore 078120 Vehicle Num : GBD2473K
Make/Model : HYUNDAI H100 2.5 {A)

Attention - Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng#

Contact - 64193000 Fax No.: 88357416 Accident Date : 15/05/2018

Claim Ne.; 25133001665G003
Reference : ETTB28D
Policy No.: DMCV175010715

SN Quantity Particular Amount 53
Lump sum repair cost 2,600.00
GST T%: 182.00
2,782.00
Loss of use - 4 days x 3100 400.00
LTA search 7.48
Amount Due 5§ __3,189.48

SingDollars: Three Thousand One Hundred Eighty-Nine And Cents Forty-Nine Onl

P

x‘Uﬂ‘\

Fq___)lﬁn Auto Senrb:a‘ '|,




Receipt Page | of 1
> Back to OneMotoring

Land Tr;mhm:r&\ul hority
Land Transpan Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore STSTO

GST Registration Mo. - M4-0006528-2
Prinl Data/Time : 16 May 2018 / 13:42:24
Receipt Date/Time - 18 May 2018 / 13:42:24
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : TNET-D0000-1580516-001264

Previous Receipt No.
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST(5%) (5§) |5%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - ET 76280

As at 15 May 2018/19:50:00

Insurancs Co:/AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - ETTEZED

Enquiry Fee 7.00 D49 749
201805781340122 16648
Sub-Total T.00 048 748
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.48 748
Rounding Difference 004
Eule Total Amount Payable 745
b ] i
LSy R L Paid By
———ral 3"'ﬁrlc"d;ﬂm 745
Total 745
Cash Change Q.00
Tendered Amaunt 745
Excess Refundable Amount Q.00

THANK ¥OU AND HAVE A KICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments Lo the Authority are good and promptly setiled by the payment service
pravider ! financial Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
may apply. ;

Print Receipt oK Save as PDF

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION _ID=F1301001TT 16/05/2018



Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlans

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING oy
Case | Notified _|Est Submitted | Ad] Assigned Adj Apt Ad] Submitted ins Auth'ed Statis
" | 22 may 2018 ﬂ::;’ 2018 $3$2,600.00 $$2,600.00 ::.":'1" for Burvay
Edit keg | ok At Rk | Edit Estimates | 'm:hn] Canctd Coe. |

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS B [[Created by adjuster]
ONG MAM LAY, [D: S1667510F

EULAY CHEMICAL & DIESEL (S) PTE LTD, Co.Reg. No.: 2002002310

15/05/2018 19:00 - :59
[#4S Months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Jrmree—r
Policy/Caver
" Ne. ! 1800001657 (Comprehensive)

il:nl.eufl-mﬂ-:

Palicy M.
ET762800 | tClammanty: |DMEVI7S010715

P m—— | Excess:
Milllion Auto Service () No. 4 Penjuru Place #01-12, G0B7E2 Jurong East - Tel:
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. [Express) - Tel: 65-641%-3000 ... [Handled by Tan, Bennbe-WZ - £41% 1718] Bannie-

WEZ.TanPaig.com .
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel. 6826 91549

LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] . [Final Rpt due
31/05/2018]

(iiﬁcumnmlm:um View All |  Compose Case ail |
There are no mail for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Tack | comptete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
| No results.
|

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 5/12/2018



Menmen ¢-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBD2473K [25133001665G)
[ET7628D]
™
EULAY CHEMICAL & DIESEL (5) PTE LTD
May 15 2018 7:00PM
[ONG MAH LAY]
Milllon Auto Service

Page 1 of 2

Upload Documents | _ Upioad Phatos | Mew Letter | uplosd vides | _upkoad uss | View [iiew in Browser | ]
Letters/Correspondences Loer page  |v]| M
[Mo [Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 {prem) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown 0
Photos/Images ——— e [3perpage  [¥] BB
'No | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) = Thumbmnail | Print
1 30/11/1807:52 | Odometer Reading © | eaws | B3
2 30/11718 07:52 | Chassis Number 0 | waaws | A
1 AIE07:52 | Genersl View - D | adrc | A
4 3011/1807:50 | Geners! View 0| wedws | A
'S [30/11/1807:52 | General View D | edws | A
& I0/11/1807:52 | General View 0| e |
(7 [30711/18 02:52 General View D | wadws | A
8 30/11/18 0752 | General View O | adwc | BA
8  |30/11/1807:52 | General View 0 | waars | A
(10 [3011/1807:52 | Geners! View 0 | wedws | BB
i 11 30/11/1807:52 | Ganeral View 0| dws | A
112 30/11/1807:52 | Genersl View O asws | &
13 30/111807:52 | General View o Q| osawc | A
14 30/11/18 0752 General View 0 | waiwc | A
15 |30/11/1807:52 | General View 0 | weaws | B4
16 |3I0/11/1807:52 | General View 0 | coaws | A
17 |30/11/18 07:52 | General View - 0 | wedwc | A
18 30/11/1807:52 | Ganeral View 0 | wadwc | A
19 [30/11/1807:52 | Genersl View 0 | aarwc | A
20 |30/11/18 07:52 | General View O | eaws | B
21 [30/11/1807:52 | General View D | csaws | &
22 (3011/1807:52 | Genaral View O | s | |
23 |30/11/18 07:52 | General View D | waaws | & |
24 |0/11/1807:52 | General View D | sadwe | |
25 011218 10:50 | Reinspection Photo O  esowc | A
26 01/12/1810:50 | Reinspection Photo D | tedwc | B4
27 |01/12/18 10150 | Reinspection Phota 0 | oadwc | B
ke —— - lperpage  |v| B
No  |Relabal /Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lid [HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 Z1/05/16 71:04 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 21.05.2018 [ T
2 21/051E8 21:04 | MOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP 8 Load POF
3 21012104 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP +TP GIA REPORT Load TIF
& 1203183104 TR GIAREPORY o s Losd POF
5 05/12/18 13:58 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load PDF
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Letters/ Correspandences 1 per page ~|| BA
No [Fmaizes On | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
(6 |05/12/18 13:58 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM - S i Load POF

7 [05/12/1813:58  Release Voucher N Loag FOF |

|8 05/12/718 13:58 LTA SEARCH Load POF |

(9 |0S/32/18 13:58 LETTER TO O1 Load POF |

|No |Finalmed Cn ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 5G] Thumbnall | Print
1 |22/05/1809:36 | O1 GIA REPORT © | toadroF

Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | primt ||

lﬁtmmﬂmtmmm

Dur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG)

Show Remarks Ta: [ Handling Insurer
Fente BaTnarks e proats uniess yau show 8D sihee paries.
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: ET7628D (Insd veh) Model: HYUNDAI H-1 STAREX 2.5D
GBD2473K (TP veh) CRDI (A)
| Date of Accident: | 15/05/2018
Global Sum Settiement | - | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate '3 5,044 71|
Final Repair Cost 4 3.100.00
Loss of Use ' § 4.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) '$ days
LTA / GIA Search Fee '$
Othars: '3
'§
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) '$ 3,100.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicale
below)

A] For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario Mo

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (*) (%)
* Assaessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) | Million Aulo Service - 3,100.00
2) -
3 = 1
05 Dec
JOANME LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
|Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice: Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg e 19es07188r)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto com;assignments@/kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG1B008247/T1PA302
Date: 05/12/2018

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer- AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple_ Ltd  Policy No: 1800001857

Claimant Vehicle Gepaa7ak Insured Vehicle No: ET7628D

Date of Loss: 15052018 Mature of Claim. ™ Claim No: 25133001865G

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No GBD2473K

Make & Model: HYUNDAI H-1 STAREX, 2.5 D CRDI (A) Engine No: D4CBES58778

Reg. Date: 13/08/2014 (Man, Year: 2014) Chassis No©  KMFWBX7KMELS89287

Colour Black Odometer 103672 km

Engine Capacity 2497 cc

Market ValueNew Car  »

Price
Sum Insured (S$).

Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake [Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/70 R16 Rear Tyre Size 218/7T0R16
Front Left Side: Roadstone 6 mm Rear Lsft Side: Roadstone 6 mm
Front Right Side: Roadstone 6 mm Rear Right Side; Roadstone 6 mm
The nbove valuss represant the remaning hre resds depi
COST OF CLAIMS - - Repairer's. Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Parts 3,685.80 231044 1,366.36 aror
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,870.00 820,00 950.00 50.80
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 5,555.80 3.239.44 2.316.36 41.69
Approved Tolal (Overridden) (S$) 2,600.00
(55) 5,555,80 2,600.00 295580 53.20
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S35) 38891 182.00 206.91 53.20
Nett Amount (S$) 5.944.T1 2,782.00 3,162.71 53.20
+ Loss of Usa (4.0 x S$80.00/day) (S$) 320.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S$) T7.45
Nett Liability (5§) 3,109.45
Global Sum Sattlement (S$) 3,100.00

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment.

21/052018
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Date Inspected. 23/0572018 Inspected Al: Million Auto Service
No. 4 Penjuru Place #01-12
Singapore 608782
Estimated Period of Repair; 4.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE This repert represents our findings af ifhe tme and place of inspection stated hersin. Such inspechion has been carmed ouf to the bes! of our
knewledge and ability bul any othar kabiity undar any cther crrcumstancas is hemby expressly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR LID Bent 2468500F *1,896.00 FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformad 41B30F "418.30FL
3 1 *REAR WEATHERSTRIP Cut 187.50F “187.50FL
a 1 *‘REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Not Necessary 347 00F “FL
5 1 *REAR SENSOCR Mot Waorking 18B.00FS *1BB.0OFS
B 1 ‘WINDSCREEN SEALANT Mecessary 50.00FS *50.00FS
F=Franchise parl S=Spcheft. L=ListhemDisc.
Sub Total (S§)  3,685.80 2,839.80
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/20.00% (S%) 0.00 520,36
Total Parts (S§%) 3,685.80 2,319.44

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thare are no new miscellansous ilems selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repailrer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO DISMANTLE & ASSEMBLY REAR WINDSCREEN New 180.00 120,00
2 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE REAR BUMPER ,LID ,RUBBER & New 880.00 400,00

SENSDOR,TO DISMANTLE WIPER MOTOR ,INNER LOCK TO

KNOCK S&WELD INNER PANEL
3 TO SPRAY PAINT & PUTTY REAR LID ,.BUMPER & INNER Mew B00.00 400,00

PANEL

Gross Labour Cost (5§) 1,870.00 920.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES =
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