Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September, 2018 11:48 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: KKLau; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto);
Vic (LKKAuto); Jasmine Cai Yuyan

Subject: 3rd Reminder for Offer - TP claiming against AIG - 1 SHC 1977P GBG
7561R CC3/AIG18009209/K1lub3 17/5/2018 Thin Thin

Attachments: IMG_3613.JPG; IMG_3614.JPG; IMG_3615.JPG

Importance: High

3rd Reminder

Without Prejudice
Dear Thin Thin

Please advise if your insured filed the accident report. This matter has been long protracted and our hirer is
becoming impatient.

Attached herewith some scene photos for your attention.
Please revert with your settlement offer by 03/10/2018.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September 2018 10:26 AM

To: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok

Cc: KKLau; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Jasmine Cai
Yuyan

Subject: RE: 2nd Reminder for Offer - TP claiming against AlG - 1 SHC 1977P GBG 7561R CC3/AI1G18009209/K1ub3
17/5/2018 Thin Thin

Dear Cecilia,
We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report. We have send reminder to our
Insured.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok <cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 4:31 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Jasmine Cai Yuyan
<jasminecai@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: 2nd Reminder for Offer - TP claiming against AIG - 1 SHC 1977P GBG 7561R
CC3/AIG18009209/K1ub3 17/5/2018 Thin Thin

Importance: High

2nd Reminder

Without Prejudice

Dear Thin Thin

Our hirer chases again. Please revert with your offer within the next seven (7) days.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: Cecilia Lee Peng Geok

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 8:44 AM

To: shupei@lkkauto.com

Cc: KK Lau LKK; LKK Admin LKK; Thin Thin LKK; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong LKK; Vivian Lau LKK; Vic LKK;
Jasmine Cai Yuyan

Subject: Reminder for Offer - TP claiming against AIG - 1 SHC 1977P GBG 7561R CC3/AIG18009209/K1ub3
17/5/2018 Thin Thin

1 SHC 1977P GBG 7561R CC3/A1G18009209/K1ub3 17/5/2018 Thin Thin
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Please refer to the subject matter and our LOD dated 01/06/2018.

It has been more than 2 months, please look into the matter and revert with your settlement offer.



Thank you.

Best Regards

Cecilia Lee

Claims Department | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8354 | Fax: 6214 1843

From: "Shu Pei (LKKAuto)" <shupei@Ilkkauto.com>

To: Jasmine Cai Yuyan <jasminecai@cdge.com.sg>, Cecilia Lee Peng Geok
<cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com>

Cc: KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, "Thin Thin (LKKAuto)"
<thinthin@I|kkauto.com>, "Joy Irene (LKKAuto)" <Joylrene@I|kkauto.com>, "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)"
<chewht@lkkauto.com>, "Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)" <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>, "Vic (LKKAuto)"
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Date: 25/06/2018 02:11 PM

Subject: Acknowledgement of LOD's - TP claiming against AIG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Cecilia / Jasmine,

We acknowledge receipt of your LOD’s for the following cases.

NO TAXI NO.

Ol's NO. Our reference DOA

Case Handler / Investigator

1SHC 1977P

GBG 7561R CC3/AIG18009209/K1ub3 17/5/2018
Thin Thin

2 SHB 6621M

SBR 6776L CC3/AIG18009616/K1jb3 24/5/2018
Joy

3 SHC 8247S

SLS 5221D CC3/A1G18009620/K1ub3 25/5/2018
Thin Thin

4 SHB 3229H

SLX 53127 CC3/AIG18009471/K1pb3 23/5/2018
Hsiao Tong

5SHA 5727D

SLQ 6931S CC3/LCR18009880/K1wb3 27/5/2018
Vivian

6 SHA 4047P

SJW 1444G CC3/LCR18010277/K1wb3 3/6/2018
Vivian

7 SHC 8769C

SJY 5882M CC3/AIG18010276/K1hb3 4/6/2018
Vic

8 SHA 6121U

SLQ 2581U CC3/AIG18010686/K1jb3 8/6/2018
Joy

9 SHD 4851T

GBC 6014G CC3/AIG18010685/K1jb3 8/6/2018
Joy



10 SHA 7536A

SLE 6175X CC3/LCR18009618/K1jb3 25/5/2018
Joy

11 SHB 2258E

SJT 5303U CC3/AIG18009875/K1wb3 29/5/2018
Vivian

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Thank you.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




