Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Hi Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 25 June 2018 11:03 AM

‘Sharon'

<REJECTION> Your Ref: GY 1609Z Our Ref: CC6/LCR18009204/Apb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLL 7099P(AIG) & GY 1609Z ON 08/05/2018]

SLL7099P - Ol VIDEO FOOTAGE.MP4

Attached here is a copy of our insured’s car video footage for your easy reference.

The video shows that our insured driver stopped his car, suddenly there was a jerk / impact on his vehicle.
We are of the view that our insured version is more credible. Your client had collided onto our insured

vehicle from behind.

In view of this, we regret to inform your that we have our principal instruction to reject your client claim.

Thank you.

Please note that the video footage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You undertake to
preserve its confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make available the video footage in whole or in

part, to any third party.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 2:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Request for Evidence> Your Ref: GY 1609Z Our Ref: CC6/LCR18009204/Apb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLL 7099P(AIG) & GY 1609Z ON 08/05/2018]

Our Ref: GY 16092

Your Ref: CC6/LCR18009204/Apb3



Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to below, please find attached accident scene photos for your reference.

The damages on your insured’s car does not tally with his report stating that we hit onto the rear of his car. Instead,
it was your client who reversed out by giving way to the car to exit and was not cautious therefore he hit onto my
client’s vehicle.

Therefore, my client’s version is more credible.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Sharon Chia

MG Solution Pte Ltd

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Singapore 415933

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 2 June, 2018 11:10 AM

To: 'mg3solution@gmail.com' <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Subject: <Request for Evidence> Your Ref: GY 1609Z Our Ref: CC6/LCR18009204/Apb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL
7099P(AIG) & GY 1609Z ON 08/05/2018]

Your Ref: GY 16092 Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC6/LCR18009204/Apb3

Dear Sirs/ Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 7099P(AIG) & GY 1609Z ON 08/05/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that your client hit him from behind.
Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.




Brief Details.

| am GRAB Driver. Cn 08/05/2018 at about 3.40pm, | was driving the car, Maroon/Red colour Milsubisni
Aftrage, bearing registration no. SLL7099P, along East Coast Road towards Mountbatten direction. | was
approaching the entrance of United Mansion at 592 East Coast Road and made a left tum onlo the
compound. There was another car exiting the compound and as such | gave way to the car to exit {13, As
a result, half of my car was still along East Coast Road. Out of a sudden, | felt an impact from the rear. |
then saw that a lomy bearing registration no. GY1602Z had collided onto the rear of my car. We ook
photos and exchange contact details. Nobody was injured and no other property was damaged

| called my car rental company and was informed lo lodge a police repon

2

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter.

Appreciate and early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



