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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 2:11 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ

Dear Denise, 

 

Noted. Thanks 

 

On Thu, Mar 21, 2019 at 10:59 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Darla, 

  

Apologise, There is a caculation error. 

  

Total should be lump sum $8800. 

  

Part $7,205 

+115% 8285.75 

Labour $2650 

s/nett 95 

total 11,030.75 

  

Please recheck please 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 9:59 AM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Denise, 

  

COR $8,900 lump sum is accepted. 

  

Kindly make an offer in merimen 

  

Thank you! 

  

On Thu, Mar 21, 2019 at 10:00 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Darla, 

  

Refer to below email 

  

Reoffer at lump sum $8,900.00/- 

  

Please get check and get back. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 11:51 AM 

To: 'Darla Balingit' <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Cc: 'Jing Tong Choo' <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Daral, 

  

We have added labour 1. From $800 to $1000 

  

Therefore here is our calculation, 

  

Parts: $7,345.00 

+15%: $8,446.75 

Labour: $2,650.00 

S/N: $95.00 

Total: $11,191.75 

  

Reoffer at lump sum $8,900.00/- 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 10:46 AM 

To: 'Darla Balingit' <darla@autoncars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Darla, 

  

Let me check with Rasul and get back to you 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Darla Balingit <darla@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 10:37 AM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Denise, 

  

RHF door and RH side skirt was repaired. 

  

Kindly add labour for both. 

  

Thank you! 
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On Fri, Mar 8, 2019 at 12:08 PM Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg> wrote: 

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Date: Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 5:22 PM 

Subject: RE: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

To: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg> 

  

Dear Jaden, 

  

RHF door is repair not payable. 

  

My calculation is without it but you have included in. 

  

Confirm with you if got replaced? 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 5:09 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 
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Dear Denise, 

  

Apologies, must be $9,730 lump sum, forgot to deduct item #28 and 32 

  

Please see attached 

  

On Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 4:13 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Jaden, 

  

Can I have your calculation breakdown to arrive lump sum $10800 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 4:04 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Denise, 

  

We regret that we are unable to accept offer of $6,800 
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We counter propose $10,800 lump sum based on our repair estimate with markings 

  

Thank you!  

  

On Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 2:27 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Jaden, 

  

There is no limit upon repairing 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 2:05 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Denise, 

  

This vehicle doesn't have repair limit upon repairing right? 
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On Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 1:03 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear jaden, 

  

Enclosed estimate marking 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 10:04 AM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Denise, 

  

Could you please attach your computation? 

  

There's a lot of question marked items which was taken by the appointed surveyor that time. 

  

Thank you! 

  

On Thu, Mar 7, 2019 at 9:15 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Dear Jaden, 

  

Can confirm. 

  

Offer at lump sum $6,800/-,  10days 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 4:25 PM 

To: 'Jing Tong Choo' <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Dear Jing Tong, 

  

Offer at lump sum $6,800/-,  10days 

  

Kindly check and confirm 
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Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jing Tong Choo <jtchoo@autoncars.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 25 January 2019 9:19 AM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SGV 1991J / DOA: 12/05/2018 / EQ 

  

Hi Denise, 

  

I have send the after repair to rasul and did not receive any finalization from him. 

 

--  

Best regards, 

  

Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 

Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best regards, 
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Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 

Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best regards, 

  

Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 

Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best regards, 

  

Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 
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Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best regards, 

  

Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 

Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best regards, 

  

Jaden Choo 

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#01-04 Area 'A' S(417883) 

Contact No: 6555 2909 / 81881361 

Web: www.autoncars.com.sg 

Email: JTChoo@autoncars.com.sg 

 

 

  

--  

Best Regards, 
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Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

  

--  

Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 

e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards, 

Darla Balingit 

Auto N Cars Services Pte Ltd 

  

m: +65 8499 3326 

o : +65 6555 2909 Fax : 6841 7181 
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e: darla@autoncars.com.sg 

web site : www.autoncars.com.sg 

office: Auto Bay@ Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 

Blk 1 #01-04  

Singapore 417883 


