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Catherine ChnnE (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) <Janice_Goh@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 21 May, 2018 9:43 AM

To: Coco Lu Ting; assignments

Ce: ECICS Claims

Subject: FW: our veh 5LQ2225Z, your veh SCF111X on 16/05/2018 ;  Our ref
DMPC1800157H

Attachments: 5AS52407756.pdf; [Untitled])_1-2.jpg

Without Prejudice
Dear Coco

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LEK for the survey.

Aside to LKK
Flease assist to arrange for TP PRS

Thank you

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

“*Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: Coco Lu Ting [mailto:coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 21 May, 2018 B:58 AM

To: ECICS Claims; Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims); Phoebe Jay Xie
(ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Don Bong Kiong Hua; Edwin Abcede Caina; Tay Jian Ye

Subject: RE: our veh SLQ2225Z, your veh SCF111X on 16/05/2018 ; Our ref DMPC1800197H

Dear lanice,
Thank you for your reply, please arrange survey for our customer car today 12pm to 5pm. thank you
Best regards

Coco Lu Ting

From: ECICS Claims fma-iltu.-glaims@ggig,@m.sg}
Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 2:38 PM

To: ECICS Claims; Coco Lu Ting; Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims):
1



Phozbe Jav Xie (ECICS, Claims)
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Don Bong Kiong Hua; Edwin Abcede Caina; Tay Jian Ye
Subject: RE: our veh 5LQ2225Z, your veh SCF111X on 16/05/2018 ; Our ref DMPC1800197H

Without Prejudice
Dear Coco

Our insured has reported the accident to us

Liability is clear,

We would like to do direct settlement for this case and please advise to arrange survey for your client's vehicle
Thank you,

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: «65 6303 0182
FAX. +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: ECICS Claims

Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 8:52 AM

To: Coco Lu Ting; ECICS Claims; Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims);
Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Don Bong Kiong Hua; Edwin Abcede Caina; Tay Jian Ye

Subject: RE: our veh 5LQ2225Z, your veh SCF111X on 16/05/2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Coco

Thank you for your email

Please be informed that our insured has not reported the accident to us. As such, we are unable to advise liability
now,

Do you want to arrange the survey first?

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsyrvey@ecics.com.sq
directly.

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **



From: Coco Lu ﬁng--[maiitu:mgg, u@cyclecarriage.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 17 May, 2018 4:49 PM
To: ECICS Claims; Valerie Yap Jia Pei (ECICS, Operations); Lionel Chua Kok Keong (ECICS, Claims); Phoebe Jay Xie
(ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Don Bong Kiong Hua; Edwin Abcede Caina; Tay Jian Ye
Subject: our veh SLQ2225Z, your veh SCF111X on 16/05/2018

Dear officer in charge,
Please advise us the liability for this case, we attached the video footage and related documents for your reference.

Best regards

(Coco Lu

209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339

DID: 65 6568 4501 /9186 5200
Fax: 65 6565 1240

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

EH™ = 7

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited: as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy ar deliver this message to anyone, In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opiniens contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 11:29 AM

To: "Laurg Araos Songcuan Jr

Cc: ‘Andre Chow En De’; 'Loi Ai Ting’; ‘Cheng Jo Jo'; "Yusof Bin Hashim'; ‘Taufikh
(LKKAUto): 'SUR"; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 5LQ2225Z (KIA) - FINALIZE *** LKK REF: C5/1C518009181/T1sb

Dear Larry,

Confirm final fig of $ 3,304.00 before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to ECICS LTD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

sent: Monday, 13 August 2018 5:37 PM

To: Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg=; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
<ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng lo
Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Yusof Bin Hashim <yusof.hashim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 5L02225Z (KIA) - FINALIZE =+% | KK REF: CS/1C518009181/T1sb

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
CS/1C518009181/T1sb Shirley

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: b7414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

1



From: Lauro Araos Songcuan Jr <lauro.songcuan @cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 5:11 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg=; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng Jo
lo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Yusof Bin Hashim <yusof.hashim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: SLQ2225Z (KIA] - FINALIZE

Dear Sir/Madam,
Pls. refer to attached files and photos.
Kindly confirm finalized amount of § 3,304.00 before Gst SLQ2225Z.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

|
@@ ' Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE |

Cycle & Carriage Singapore + 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 » www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

5 A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



MMIETGEE40T1 { MTUC Income Inswance Co-operative Lid - HOQ
EMTRY DATE & TIME: 17/06/2018 08:31
SUBMTTED BY: Murhidayan ksig

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMFORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasa raport cqrrer.!l}_‘ the details of the accident fo speed up the claims process.,
2, This Form must be sompleted by the Palicyhalder andlor the Authoreed Drivar,

3, Infermation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possiole, Any wilful misrepresantation or witholdang of material facts may allow Insurance companies o
. _—— ——

repudiate policy ability,

4. The issue and aceeptance of this Farm by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability an the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be refarred to the Police for investigation.

B. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore {GIA] for
archiving and that copies of this repert will, for a fee, be made available upon application by imerested parties. .
7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, yau heraby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and 1o copes of the repart being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

17/05/2018 08:31

16/05/2018 08:40

JUNCTION OF TOA PAYOH LOR 1 AND LOR 2
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
NRIC Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo

Altarnative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Maodel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Categary

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Folicy Mumber

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

s5LQ22252

TAN LING LING

579078452
TANBERNICE@YAHOO.COM.SG
(LOCAL) +65-82886652
OFFICE-NOPHOME

KIA
CERATO FORTE-1.6 (A}

PRIVATE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURAMNCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5092188287

TAN LING LING
ST9078452

09/03/1979

INDOOR

25/04/2006

12 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-82886652

OFFICE-NOPHONE
TANBERNICE@YAHOO.COM.SG

Page 1al12



Address

Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

‘ehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident
Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Mumber of vehicles involvad in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

MNumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Passenger 1

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes.Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If ¥es against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Remarks/ Reasons:

Was there any audio recorded?

BLK 204 #12-1135
TOA PAYOH NORTH

310204
NO
OWNER

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO

YES
NO
2

NAME: . AUBREY
GENDER: : FEMALE

NO

NO

YES

YES

ADVISED Ol TO SUBMIT TO MOTOR CLAIMS EMAIL
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Calour
Details Of Properties
Yehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Mumber
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Mame

Mature Of Damage

SCF111X

PRIVATE CAR
NG SHI Yl TANIA

£082322982
94888438

Page 2 of 12



Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)
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Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Flegse report correctly the detois of the sccigert to speed wp the clums process.

2. Thus Foren must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Drives

3. Infermation provided must be 38 truthful and sccurate as possible, Any wilful musrepresentation of withralding of material
tacts may 5l'ow Insurance companics to repudiate policy liabifity.

4 The izsue and acceptance af this Form fy insurinze companies is not ar ademission of policy Hakiiity on the part of the insurane
coOmpaniag,

3. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

B, The raport will be forward= by the insurers of the GLA Records Management Cenlbre estabiished by the Generdl Insurance
Association of Sinpapore (G14) tor archiving and that coples of this report will tor & tee be made available upen application by
interesiod parties,

7. Ry the lodgment of this report to tie IMgurers, you herelry consent to the archoving of this repornt 9t the centre and to copes nf
the: report baing made available afcresad.

A Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (FDPA)
| understand, acknawledpe, apree and conszent thas

{0 My irsurer, iy warkshop and the Gereral Ipsurange Assogiation of Singapore ["GIA") mayfare permitled Lo collect, use,
diselose and/or process my personal data/personsl information et out in this [farm] 2nd any other personal intarmation
provided by me or pessessed by my nsurer {collectively the “Persanal Information”) and discloss and transfer such
Parsanal Informution 1o all insursr(zl wha have insured vehiclels] imealvad in this arcident (all msurer(s) who have insurad
wehicha(s) involved in this sccident shall be collzot valy referred = as the “insurers” |, the insurers’ lawyersfiaw firms, the
Monatary Autherty of Smpapore snd any relevant govesninent agency/oulbority (such as the pelice], for the purpose]s)
af

i) processing, hasghng and/or desling with my claems inguding the settlement of the daims snd any necessary
iyestigations ralating 1o the ol alms:

(i} investgating the sccident and/or my claims,
[iii} earrying el and/or dealing with my instructions o fesponding to any enguiries by ms,

|iv) sdministering my claims (including the mailing of correzpordence, stalemoenty, Invoices, reports ar nobices In me,
waleh could Involve disclosure of cartain parsonal data about me to bring abours delivery of the same s will as on the
exlernat cower of envelapas/mal packapes); andfor

v} complying with applicasie 'awin administering, processing, hendiing andfar dealing with my Caims icollectively the
“Purposes”|
(b} allinsurer)s) who have insured Yehiele(s] inealved o this accident and the insurers’ wyers aw firms, mayfare permitted
1 collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personzl Infarmation for one or mare o thi: above Purpases, and

(c] ey Persanal Intormation may/can be dist osed by 2ny of the Insurers andror GIA o their third party service providers ar
agentslincluding thels lawyers/taw Hems) which may be sited putside of Singapore, far ang or more of the above Purposes.

{d) iy Personzl Information will oiso be collected and usea o compile claims history lor the purpese ot fraud detection,
Imvestigaticn urd mansgement in prezeat and all futipe claims

(o]  the information co collested under (d) abowe may be shared f distlosed:

1 ra all insurers and /o ey otfere thied parties that stk in evaluating, investigating, controfling or managing fraud.
regulaters, W snforcement ang government agencies 23 reasonably réguired for the purposes stated, or

(il tor compiving with regquitements under any regulatinng, kiwes o court arders

oy
/ "/'] i
,'?.. "f ot |‘:
; M - ) ,-45.1-‘..:.._ )
Ppiicyhalder’s Sigratu r:l} Drwar's Signalure Re g Lentre Pertonnst's Signature
oo b Tiemg; [ 70Y /A 1 [1¥ driwar & not the policyhiaider) Name: Dl Wed

66T Late & Time NAEC/FIN N f?'f“'&’"if 7
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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DECLARATION
1If\e declare the foregoing particulars #re LrUe in every respect.
JI,.f ' s J{-”
PV o i A

A - -
Policyholder's Signature
Fie BT
Drote B Time; | 'r‘_,.-{-_\ 'k

[ L

Driver's Sigrature
i driver 15 ot the polcyhaldend
[Date & Time

Repclrﬁﬁ; Centre Personnel's Signature
Namie:  FAC 3~ P

NRIC/TIN NO: G, .
Traz
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REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE

\DENTITY CARD NO. 879078452
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA

€9

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609338 Tel

PTELTD

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

65684567 Fax: 65651240

KIN

Co Reg Mo : 190405410K ESTIMATE GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Ms TAN LING LING Cust No/Name /Ms TAN LING LING
Reg No/Reg Date 51022257 / 30/06/201
BLK 204 TOA PAYOH MORTH Date In/Mileage / 0
;%ﬁ;ﬁ;g:;g?ﬂ;glﬂ” SPRING Chassis No KNAFX411MH5721438
Engine No G4FGGEHE37 566
Contact Mo Mobile: B2BB6G5Z Make/Model KIA/CERATO K3 1.6 A EX BWY
Colour/Trim SWP SMOW WHITE PEAR/ WK SATURN BLACK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CSMO0081 Cash 17/05/2018/ 14:21 TLC 442 [ Cocolu 28811
Description of Goods / Services Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNT88000 { /29 1650.00
TO RENEW REAR BUMPER, REPAIR REAR FENDER LH, REAR END PANEL N
E PNTS8000 & - 100.00
TO REMOVE & INSTALL PARKING SENSOR "
E PNT98000 K H < 1680.00
TO SPRAY PAITM FOR REAR BUMPER, REAR END PANEL, REAR FENDER LH
£ 90000001 20.00
TO CHECK WIRING & ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 2
A 90000001 =" 200.00
TO CONDUCT DIAGMOSTIC CHECK FOR THE CAR SYSTEM
M SUNDRY oL 20.00
Sundry = Ry i
M COVER-RR BUMPER 1.00 688.00 00.00| “““ 688.00
M COVER-RR BUMPER,CTR 1.00 347.00 00.00| “vt~"347.00
M BEAM-RR BUMPER .00 318.00 00.00[" " _° 318.00
M STAY-RR BUMPER LH 1.00 120.00 00.00 pn 120.00
M BRACKET-RR BUMPER SIDE MTG,LH 1.00 29,00 00.00| &e-"29.00
URVEYOR NAME B _:1RMﬂﬁﬁ‘ foh|R34!
T Fﬁx
DATE N CLs Lk 2 1 iy
B T e '\f;,\\
g ST b
e "qii- it ¢
- S—— M o
K Auto Consuliants hence nolly————— MM, AR i A
% SuAR | Mitsndo Corrn -
& v |
h: l
Confirm & aécepted by |
g subject iof Nett 5,172.00
" 7% GST on 5172.00 362.04
i' Total Payable 5,534.04
Authurumtury and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of quote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
Estimated costs quoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include

any additional parts or labour which may be requi

red after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be

informed that a

deposit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing

the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTE LTD

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684567 Fax: 65651240

PRO-FORMA INVOICE

Co Reg We : 199405410K

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

GST Reg Ho :

ME-8500111-X

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

Ms TAN LING LING

BLK 204 TOA PAYOH NORTH
#12-1135 TOA PAYOH SPRING
SINGAPORE 310204

Cust No/Name /Ms TAN LING LING
Reg No/Reg Date SLQ22257 / 30/06/2017
Date In/Mileage 21/05/2018/ 8206

Chassis/Package KNAFX411MHG721438 /XC1753

Engine No GAFGGH637566 |
Contact No Mobile: BZB8EGSZ Make/Model KIASCERATD K3 1.6 A EX BWY ]
21/05/ Colour/Trim SWP SMOW WHITE PEAR/ WK SATURN BLACK ]
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CTROOOBO Cash 13/08/2018/ 16:50 TLC 884 [ Laurc Songcuan 28811
Description of Goods | Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount %
E PNTBB0O00 1100.004
REMEW REAR BUMPER, REPAIR REAR FENDER LH,
E PNT88000 60.004
REMOVE & I[NSTALL PARKING SENSOR
E PNT9B000 B40.00.1
SPRAY PAINT FOR REAR BUMFPER, REAR FENDER LH
A G0000001 20,004
CHECK WIRING & CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 90000001 200.00 4
CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK FOR THE CAR SYSTEM
M SUNDRY 20.00 ¢
SUKDRY
X COVER-RR BUMPER 1.00 68E.00 00.00 f88.00 17
X COVER-RR BUMPER,CTR - 1.00 347.00 00.00 7001
X BRACKET-RR BUMPER SIDE MTG,LH - 1.00 29.00 00.00 29.004"
Z TEXT
TP ECICS
DOA: 16/05/2018
SURVEYOR: TAUFIKH
4 DAYS
“Guarantee your wgrronty, maintoin with Cycle & Carrioge.”
Parts 1,064.00 Nett 3,304.00
Labour 2,220.00 7% G5T on 3304.00 231.28
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 3,535.28
Diagnostics Job 0.00
Sundry/0Qthers 20.00
Total (w/e GST) 3,304.00

This is not an official tax invoice.

This is a computer generated decument, no signature is required.
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CYCLE & CARRILGE

VEHICLEND :_SLQ2%2257

MODEL : \aa/ cenATO K2 1.6 A B

WiE: 29211

Material g 1| 06k.00

Labour g 24000

Sub-Total $ 2%o4.00

Less 2% Disc $ =
| LessExcess 3§ = t:

Total $ 304-9° 7
| GST7% $ 221-2% |
% Grand Total _: § __3,535.29 |
.E Finalise By/Date : _Lpiuy od 13[0R]IX ‘

REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

[ ] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIR TOOK L WORKING DAYS

g TP vehide no: SEE T ( E‘mas\
v daim G weacd %n ¢ 2,00
y clam \ges ol eJTAL.



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNe1assoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com,assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/ICS18009181/T15B8N2
Date: 270812018

RE CE

Handling . .

Eivus ECICS Limited Policy No:

Claimant : ;

Vehicle No : SLO2225Z Insured Vehicle No : SCF111X

Date of Loss:  168/05/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: DMPC1800197H

RIFTI Fl 10N

Reg No: sSLQ2225Z

Make & Model: K1A CERATO FORTE, 1.6 (A) Engine No: G4AFGGHB3T566

Reg. Date: 30/06/2017 (Man. Year: 2017) Chassis No: KNAFX411MHET21438

Colour: White Odometer: B206 km

Engine Capacity: 1591 cc

Market Value/New Car NIA

Price:
Sum Insured (S§):

Market Value/New Car Price

TiMm

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Medification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55R16
Front Left Side: MNexen 6 mm Rear Left Side: MNexen 6 mm
Front Right Side: Mexen 6mm Rear Right Side: Nexen & mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 1,5622.00 1,084.00 438.00 28.78
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,650.00 2,220.00 1.430.00 3018
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S8) 5,172.00 3,304.00 1,868.00 36.12
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 362.04 231.28 130.76 36.12
Nett Amount (S5) 5,534.04 3,535.28 1,998.76 36.12
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 21/05/2018

Date Inspected:

21/05/2018 Inspected At:

Cycle & Carriage KIA Pte Ltd (Pandan

Gardens)
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE: This report represents our findings &l the fime and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspechion has been camed out fo the best of our
knawledge and ability but any ather liability under any oiher circumstances 15 hereby expressly excluded.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fi usebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 27/8/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS - -
Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 27 Aug 2018)

Parts: 144 KIA CERATO FORTE 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairers (Price-denominated Standard List) _
Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SLQ22257) '
Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *COVER-RR BUMPER Deformed 688.00FS *688.00FS
2 1 *COVER-RR BUMPER,CTR Cut 34700FS *347.00FS
3 1 *BEAM-RR BUMPER Mot Mecessary 318.00FS *FS
4 1 *STAY-RR BUMPER LH Mot Necessary 120.00FS *FS
5 1 *BRACKET-RR BUMPER SIDE MTG,LH MNecessary 29.00FS *29.00FS
6 1 *SUNDRY Mecessary 20.00FS *20.00F5
F=Franchise part. S=SpcNell =

Total Parts (S5) 1,522.00 1,084.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https:f.fsingapnrf:.merimcn.cﬂmfclaimsfindex,s:fm?fusebux=MTRadjustar&fuseactinn=g... 27/8/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Ho

Particulars

Labour ltems

1

Z
3

TO RENEW REAR BUMPER,REPAIR REAR FENDER
LH,REAR END PANEL

TO REMOVE & INSTALL PARKING SENSOR

TO SPRAY PAINT FOR REAR BUMPER,REAR END
PANEL,REAR FENDER LH

TO CHECK WIRING & ELACTRICAL SYSTEM

TO CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK FOR THE CAR
SYSTEM

Page 3 of 3

Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Mew 1,650.00 1,100.00

New 100.00 60.00

New 1,680.00 840.00

MNew 20.00 20.00

New 200.00 200.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,220.00

3,650.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https:ffsingapnre,rncrimen.u;:mm’claimsfindr:x.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjustcr&fuseaclin‘m:g... 27/8/2018



