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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 9:09 AM

To: 'Jenny Toh'

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF4150A&SJP1063J ON 15/05/2018-ARRANGE SURVEY 

****LKK REF:CC4/QBE18009127/T1wb3 

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED.PDF; TP GIA REPORT.PDF; Preliminary_Advice.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir /Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLF 4150A at M/s Ding Auto Pte Ltd. 

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- Estimated cost of repair  

- Preliminary advice 

- TP GIA report 

 

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625. 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 17 May 2018 2:29 PM 

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF4150A&SJP1063J ON 15/05/2018-ARRANGE SURVEY 

 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 May 2018 3:37 PM 

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF4150A&SJP1063J ON 15/05/2018-ARRANGE SURVEY 

 
Our ref: V0117218 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

Kindly survey the TP vehicle :- 

 

Insured : SJP1063J 

TP Vehicle : SLF4150A 

Date of accident :15/05/2018 

Contact : as below 

 

Kindly acknowledge receipt. 

 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Jenny Toh 
Senior Assistant, Claims 
QBE Emerging Markets – Singapore 
 
QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Phone: +65 6477 1225    
Email: jenny.toh@qbe.com  
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 
 

 

From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 May, 2018 2:42 PM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng 

<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Duan Hongbo <duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF4150A&SJP1063J ON 15/05/2018-ARRANGE SURVEY 

 

Dear Jenny, 

 

We would like to request surveyor from LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd to survey our clients vehicle. 

 

Please arrange survey as soon as possible.  

 
Thank you 
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BEST REGARDS 
DD HASHIM 
DING AUTO PTE LTD  
TEL Office : 92394128 
FAX :62652690 
ADDRESS:249 JALAN BOON LAY SINGAPORE 619523 
 

 

On Wed, May 16, 2018 at 2:15 PM, Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> wrote: 

Our ref : V0117218 

Dear Hashim 

 We refer to the above captioned matter. 

 We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle.  We propose to use one of the motor 

surveyors named in the attached list: 

 COMPANY 

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd  

Automobile Inspection Services 

KM Auto Assessors Pte 

Ltd                           

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Priority Services 

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd 

  

Please let us know within two (2) working 

  

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Jenny Toh 
Senior Assistant, Claims 
QBE Emerging Markets – Singapore 

  

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Phone: +65 6477 1225    

Email: jenny.toh@qbe.com  
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 
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From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 May, 2018 1:06 PM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng 

<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Duan Hongbo <duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF4150A&SJP1063J ON 15/05/2018-ARRANGE SURVEY 

  

Dear Motor Claims Dept, 
 
Vehicle lying at 249 Jalan Boon Lay. 

Please arrange survey for the above vehicle. 

  

Case is in Chain collision. 

  

Here I attached together GIA report for your reference.  

  

  

Thank you 

BEST REGARDS  

DD HASHIM 

DING AUTO PTE LTD  
TEL Office : 92394128 
FAX :62652690 
ADDRESS:249 JALAN BOON LAY SINGAPORE 619523 
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----------------- 

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are 

not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this 

email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform 

us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced. 
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