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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 11:16 AM

To: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi

Cc: BHAS - Jacelyn Loh; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng; BHAS - Bernard Kee; Admin A; Vic 

(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 05.10.2018

Attachments: SKM_C224e18073122000.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Yun Shi, 
 

We refer to your below email. 
 

We recommend COR @ P/P $5,721.84 with 5 Days (subject to our principal’s approval). 
 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi [mailto:yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 10:51 AM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A 
Cc: BHAS - Jacelyn Loh; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng; BHAS - Bernard Kee 
Subject: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 05.10.2018 
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REMIDER!!! 

 

 

Dear Vic, 
 

Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 
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Thank you. 
 

 

 

 

Thank You & Best Regards, 
Yun Shi 

 

Address: Blk 1,Sector C, Sin Ming Industrial Estate 

#01-111/113/115/117 Singaopre:575636 

(T) +65-6559 8944 /8940          (F) +65-6515 3144 / +65-6269 2404 

Email: yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg  
Website: http://www.bhauto.com.sg 

 

 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee <bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 2:40 PM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHG - Johnny Lim <johnny@bhglobal.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; 
BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Ngai Kar Kit 
<karkit.ngai@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Zhou Ya Ping <yaping.zhou@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Chan Yun 
Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

Dear Vic, 
 

Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 

 

Thank you 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
 

    
(W) +65-6559 8945         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 1:42 PM 
To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: BHG - Johnny Lim <johnny@bhglobal.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; 
BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Ngai Kar Kit 
<karkit.ngai@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Zhou Ya Ping <yaping.zhou@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

Dear Vic 

 

This case has been drag for quite sometime 

 

The first email to MA was on 31/07/2018 

 

 Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 

 

Thank you 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
 

    
(W) +65-6559 8945         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee  
Sent: Monday, 3 September 2018 11:12 AM 
To: 'macf@lkkauto.com' <macf@lkkauto.com>; 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Anthony Lau 
<anthony.lau@bhauto.com.sg>; BHG - Johnny Lim <johnny@bhglobal.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh 
<jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

 

Dear Vic / Ma 

 

 Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 

  
Thank You 

 

Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
 

    
(W) +65-6559 8945         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
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From: BHAS - Bernard Kee  
Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 10:38 AM 
To: BHG - Johnny Lim <johnny@bhglobal.com.sg>; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
Cc: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Anthony Lau 
<anthony.lau@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

Dear Vic 

 

 Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 

  
Thank You 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
 

    
(W) +65-6559 8945         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
 

From: BHG - Johnny Lim  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 4:42 PM 
To: BHAS - Bernard Kee <bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
Cc: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Anthony Lau 
<anthony.lau@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

Hi Vical, 
 

Hope you are well.  It will be wonderful if you could kindly advise asap. 
Sincerely appreciated. 
 

Best Regards,  

 

JOHNNY LIM  

DIRECTOR - LOGISTICS & GLOBAL MOBILITY  

 

(W): +65 6291 4444 Ext: 405 | (F): +65 6265 6332  
(D): +65 6210 2378 | (M): +65 9733 1904  

Mail: johnny@bhglobal.com.sg | Web: www.bhglobal.com.sg I  Visit our new eStore at www.bh-estore.com 

 



5

 

Please consider the environment before printing this Email.  
This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual or the group named. Attachments or contents of this mail are for information 
and co-ordination purposes only. At any time, without prejudice, express liability or claims from or towards BH GLOBAL CORPORATION LTD and its 
Subsidiaries. Information disclosed and enclosed may not be revealed or circulated to any addressee; this mail is not intended for. If you are not the named addressee 
you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors, omissions or virus transmitted in the contents 
of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission. ---- BH GLOBAL CORPORATION LTD, No: 8 Penjuru Lane, Singapore 609189, 
www.bhglobal.com.sg 

 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee  
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2018 4:26 PM 
To: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
Cc: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Anthony Lau 
<anthony.lau@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHG - Johnny Lim 
<johnny@bhglobal.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

 

Dear Vicalpeh 

 

 Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 

  
Thank You 

 

  
Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee 

  

 

(W) +65-6559 8945         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
  

From: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng  
Sent: Tuesday, 31 July 2018 10:02 PM 
To: Ma C.F (LKKAuto) <MaCF@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 
BHAS - Bernard Kee <bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; 
BHAS - Anthony Lau <anthony.lau@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FINALIZE SLX6031C TP INDIA DOA 10.20.2018 

  
Dear all, 
  
Kindly refer to attached file for finalize our vehicle SLX6031C amount is 5721.84 B/GST Part By Part 
  
Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap 
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Thank You 

  
Best Regards, 

Wen Zheng  

 

(W) +65-6559 8945              (F) +65-6269 2404        (HP) +65 9621 2084 

(E)wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg    http://www.bhauto.com.sg  

         
  


