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From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Monday, 21May 201g g:51 AM
Jas Tan Siok Thiew
Vincent Ho; chris.chionhhs@axa.com.sg; rlatthew.nghj@axa.com.sg; KKLau; SUR;Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

RE: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for sFW5g9 92 - Toyotacorolla Altis
Classic 1.6 CVT

Dear Jas,

The market value of SFW sgggzis $65K-$6gK (Estimated) as at May lg.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

IKK Auto Consultants pte ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256_4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi tndustrial park, Ubi Avenue t, #02_25 | S(40g933)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturd ay, t9 May 2019 g:26 AM
To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; Jas Tan siok Thiew <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>
cc: Vincent Ho <vincent.ho@axa'com.sg>; chris.chionhhs@axa.com.sg; matthew.nghj@axa.com.sg; KKLau<kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for sFWSgggZ - Toyota corolla Altis classic 1.6 cw
HiValuation Team,

I refer to the subject. please get back to AXA,s Jas.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Olivia Lau

LKK Auto Consultants pte Ltd

From: NG Matthew <matthew.nehi@axa >
Sent: Saturday, May tg,2OLg 7:54 AM
Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for SFW5899Z - Toyota corolla Altis Classic 1.6 cw
To: <bhtav@autoprobe. >, <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>, <bernardong@aiaxl >,<iosevloh@aiaxins >, <frankie@fta.com.sst, .**orrurv*6ftrlilil<benson@lbs-auto.com>,
<ntc!@lbs:au!q.cq.m>, KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>, olivia t-au ltrrRuto).otiuir|au@ttt.r,o..r*r,
<iimmv'lee@prioritvservices.sg>, <cvnthia.onp@prio >, <rickvtdrta.cornsg>, <elson@rta.com.sg>,
<collin.wong@a-pa >, <ootrick.soo@a-oa >
cc: TAN Jas <Lq$a-n@axarcln.lg>, Ho vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.ss>, cHloNH Hock san christopher
<chris.chionhhs@a



Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Jas Tan with the Market Value for this case.

DOA:09/05 lzltg

Thank you.

Warmest Regards

!{e!thew NG

Specialist I Claims Services - SITF

AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd l8 Shenton Way, #24-0I AXA Tower, Singapore 068811

Email: matthew.nghi@axa.com.sq
DID: (65)

lwww.axa.com.sg

$tt"""" consider the environment before printing this email

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial,

is prohibited. lf you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

-----Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. lf you are

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



PARF/Cft)E Rebate Enquiry

> BacktoOneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicte
Vehicle Owner Partlcul*rs
OurnerlDType:

OwnerlD:
Vehlcle Details
VehicleNo.:

Vehicleto be Exported:

I ntended Detegistrftlon Date:

VehicleMake;

VehicleMode!:

PrimaryColour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum PowerOutput:

Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Da'tc:

First Registretion Date:

TranrferCount

ActualARFPaid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eliglbillty:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Dater

PARF RebateAmount:

lnterded COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category;

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmountl

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 May 2018

Page I of1

hA: epfr*

( AxA)
5ingaporc NRIC

7651C

sFw5899Z

Yes

14May2018

TOYOTA

coRoLtAALTlS CTASSTC 1.6 sVT
White

20,:5

12RX497055

Mnos3REH104529081

90,0kW (120bhp)

$17,8s4,00

11Jun 2015

1lJun 2015

o

$12,804.m (VOW

Yes

tO)un2025

12603-o0

1O Jun 2025

A - Car upto 1600cc & 97kW {130bfip}

10

$64JsO.oO

$41765.S
155,g68.00

OK (? -6(

https://wl.lta,gov,sglta/wVaction/enquireRebateByP.ubllcBEforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F03... 14/05/2018


