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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
lo:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Monday, 21 May 2018 B:38 AM
Kitty Teo Poh Guek
yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg;'WANG Peter';'ANG Richard'; SUR

RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00FYW / SKJ99H / DOA:03.05.2018

Dear Kitty,

The market value of SKJ 99H is $100K-$105K (Estimated) as at May 18.

- Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue 7,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sharon Kho [mailto:sharon.kho@ f riorityservices.sg]
Sent: Friday, 18 May 2018 4:10 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; bokhari@jpknights.com; admin@lbs-auto.com; LKK

Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; rta@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg
Cc: 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek' <Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; 'WANG Peter'
<peter.wang@axa.com.sg>;'ANG Richard' <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M00FYW / SKJ99H / DOA : 03.05.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kittv.teo@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2

#01-1545 Singapore 7 60779

T el : 62934822 F ax: 62963283



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
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MERCTDESSENZ
1,5LJt:350"' :

PrimaryColout: Red

Enguile,PABF/-C- gF.Rebpts for Rggistgf-ed Ve-hiq[e ,, DeB: ek lU
' Vehicle Owner Particulars

t0pco)OwnerlDType:

OwnerlD:
Vehicle Detalls

Singapore NRIC

6548F

Vehicle No.:

i Vehicleto be Exported:

: l$g{gu Pq:f?-gl*ry!9n P3!-ei 17 May2018

VehicleMake:

\lehicle Mode[:

ManufacturingYear: 2011

EqellgfJe:

Chassis No:

2769563ffi89177

wDDt724572F033880

Maximum PowerOutput:

Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Date:

225.0kW (30tbhp)

$74,962.A0

22Mar2$I2
First Registratlo1 D3te:

Ti'ansfer Count:

22Mar2Ot2

ActualARF Paid:

lnt_e-n!g{ PA,RF Rebqte Dgtgif g

PARF Eliglbility:

PARF Elielbility Expiry Date:

r PARF RebateAmount:

iro,rur.oo 31(4
Yes

t ,aLYPIJ1-a?
$48,725.00

21Mar2O22

" 
e:9416!1x$:["-ysl

I

lntend ed "g9HBebate P-el ailr
COE Expiry Date:

COECategory:

QP Paid: $73,890.00

COE Rebate Amountl 928,403.00

Total Rebate Amount: $77,128.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 May 2018
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