Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear May,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Account Dept,

FYNA

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Monday, 19 November 2018 3:43 PM

Accounts (LKKAuto); 'MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG'
SUR

FW: Wrong Claim Reference Number

LKKINVOICE1-SLE 9188P.PDF

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: May Chua Hui Chin <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 3:25 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Wrong Claim Reference Number

Dear Sir / Madam,

As spoken a moment.

We have note that the claim number was wrong.

The correct claim reference should be D18/3966M instead.

Thank you

May Chua
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507

38591 Fax No. : 6507 3849 |[Email: maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.






