Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: ANG Richard <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 May 2018 10:35 AM

To: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation; ricky@rta.com.sg; elgene@rta.com.sg;
collin.wong@a-pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg

Subject: FW: Check Market Value (MV) - SBM00G6B/SKT816C DOA : 04.05.2018

Attachments: Vehicle registation certificate.pdf

Dear all,

Please revert to us in an urgent basis.

72,7(

Thank you.

Regards,

Richard Ang | Specialist, Motor (Property) Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: richard.anghs@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

GLOBAL INSURANCE
BRARND

FOR THE 8™
CONSECUTIVE YEAR

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Sharon Kho [mailto:sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2018 10:34 AM

To: nick@lbs-auto.com; olivialau@lkkauto.com; 'LKK Auto - Valuation' <valuation@lkkauto.com>; ricky@rta.com.sg;
elson@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; ANG Richard
<richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>; WANG Peter <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>; HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>
Subject: Check Market Value (MV) - S8MO0GEB/SKT816C DOA : 04.05.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to richard.angbs@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2
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sbate Enquiry

Owner ID:

i ~ Vehicle Details

Venlcle No

. Vehicle to he Exported .
intended De-reglstratlon Date

Vehicle Mal(e

Manufacturing Year:

_ EngineNo:
(i Chass
_ Max:mum Power Output

O.T

Open Market Value:

Dr:gmal Regmtratton Date

First Registration Date:

_ Transfer Count:

Acfual ARF Paid.:. .

~ Intended PARF Rebate Details
~ PARF Eligibility:

PARF Ehglbl!lty Eypiry Date

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COERebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

| COECategory:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount -
Total Rebate Amount

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBeforeD...

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
_Vehicle Owner Particulars
..OwneriDType:

| ?E__If]g_apore“ ch e

2778H

No

! 07M'a§2613'

N e U o
~_Primary Colour:

HYUNDAI

ELANTRAADTSGLSAT

2017

| GAFGHUS20880

'KNHD841CMJU569238'__._"._:' _  -

~ 938LW (125 bhp)
$1196000

09Nev2017

09 Nov 2017

0
$11,960.00

| 08Nov2027

$8 970.00

~ 08Nov 2027

© A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$4176100

© $39,684.00

The mformatic»n contamed herem ts car rect as at 07 May 2{)18

OK

$43 65400 oo

07/05/18 4:49 PM



