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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 18 August, 2018 12:53 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Fw: Your Ref: SHC 3969A_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKA 1079G / SHC 

3969A / OTHERS ON 15/05/2018 LKK REF CC4/AIG18009057/Dha3

Attachments: Release Voucher.pdf

Your Ref : CC4/AIG18009057/Dha3 
Our  Ref : SHC 3969 A (150518)  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Vic 
 
Your email of 16-08-2018 refers.  
 
Strictly on a without prejudice basis and without any admission of liability, we confirm settlement for our client's 
property damage claim (Cost of repair, GIA search and the loss of rental & income during the period of repair) at a 
global sum of $18,600.00. 
 
Please note that the settlement reached is strictly for the aforesaid property damage claim only and is without 
prejudice to the hirer of SHC 3969 A, Larry Tay Yak Siong's injury and other losses against your principals, M/s AIG 
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd and /or their insured. 
 
As requested, we return the attached Release Voucher duly endorsed (see the attached pdf file) for your kind 
attention. 
 
Kindly expedite to process payment and forward us your cheque for the settlement sum of $18,600.00 made in favour 
of M/s Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd as soon as possible.  
 
Thank you and have a great weekend. 
 
 
Best Regards 
William 
Claims Department 
 
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd  
10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A 
#03-19 AMK AutoPoint  
Singapore 568047 
 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims)  
 
DISCLAIMER: 
 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. 
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. 
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached 
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby 
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination 
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. 
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this 
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission 
or any modification. 

� Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 
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On Saturday, 18 August 2018, 12:45:58 PM SGT, Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd <chunnimotor@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  
 
 
 
 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
To: Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd <chunnimotor@yahoo.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018, 5:17:30 PM SGT 
Subject: Your Ref: SHC 3969A_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKA 1079G / SHC 3969A / OTHERS ON 
15/05/2018 LKK REF CC4/AIG18009057/Dha3 
 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear William, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKA 1079G / SHC 3969A / OTHERS ON 15/05/2018 

 
We refer to the above matter. 

  

We were informed by our principal that the matter was settled at a global sum of $18,600.00 (all in). 

  

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV forward back to us a copy for payment processing.  

  

Thank you. 

  

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice 
basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms 
of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made 
in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or 
any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.  

  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  


