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_ MS CAR AUTO PTE LTD =tk s ve 4 #0197 Frevmins @ Fabs Bkt Singapore $15875
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Nivitha !LKK Autn!

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 May 2018 9:21 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MS Car Auto; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident

involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987) (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time
around 22:15
Attachments: CCF14018_0006.pdt

Dear Catherine / Nivitha, 146 am@ 1515 1€

Kindly refer to our attachment and email below. WHCI' I'“

£ Pason© Desmond 3r
Please proceed to appoint Adrian Ling to conduct a survey of the vehicle SKM 8950G on
without Prejudice Basis. U@ fchan

We look forward to recelving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: MS Car Auto [mailto:mscarautopl@amall.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 May, 2018 6:12 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Subject: Re: 2 Days Naotice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987 (Your Ref) Dated
11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We are agreeable with

6 : Adrian Ling

Warmest Regards,
Desmond Jr
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Mon, May 14, 2018 at 6:06 PM, ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com> wrote:



Dear Desmand Jr,

We refer to your email below.

We will proceed to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly with your
workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert, (Please see attached).

Please let us know within 2 working days whether you are agreeable to the appointment of any of the
motor surveyors provided to you as a single joint expert. You may select one of the listed motor
Surveyors.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: MS Car Auto [mailto:mscarautopl@amail.com]
Sent: Monday, 14 May, 2018 4:42 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN
Subject: 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987) (Your Ref) Dated 11
May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987] (Your Ref)
Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

@ CALTEX KIOSK - CHONG PANG



We represent our client; Shaiful Bin Buang, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client's
vehicle registration number: SKM 8950G and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SKF 1987).

Warmest Regards,

Desmond Jr
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838



Mei Kwan !i.KKAutu]

From: ONG U Ll <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 3:14 PM

Tao: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident
Involving SKM B950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987J (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time
around 22:15

Attachments: SKF1987) 110518 PDF: RE: Reporting for SKF1987) Our Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020606

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mei Kwan
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.
You may follow up with our Insured driver for the photographs.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 9:49 AM

To: 'Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuUtn); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Qur Ref: 17/18/18/VP0S5/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accdent Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref)
and SKF 1987] (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Mei Kwan
Our Insured has still not reported the accident to us. We are following up on this matter,

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto: Melkwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 9:32 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref)
and SKF 1587] (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Li Li,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

1



. Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 89506G (Our Ref)
and SKF 1987) (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Mei Kwan
Our Insured has not reported the accident to us yet. We are following up on this matter.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 2:07 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref)
and SKF 1987] (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18009043 /Awa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned,

Thank you

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@|kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 May, 2018 9:48 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: ‘MT_Claim_SG' <m im .com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP0S/020606 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8350G (Our Ref)
and SKF 1987) (Your Ref) Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.



On Mon, May 14, 2018 at 6:06 PM, ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <gricwoo @lonpac.com> wrote:

Dear Desmond Jr,
We refer to your email below.

We will proceed to conduct a pre-repalir survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly with your
workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert. (Please see attached).

Please let us know within 2 working days whether you are agreeable to the appointment of any of the
motor surveyors provided to you as a single joint expert. You may select one of the listed motor
surveyors.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767

From: MS Car Auto [mailto:mscarautopl@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 14 May, 2018 4:42 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; MT_Clalm_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN
Subject: 2 Days Notice: Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 8950G (Our Ref) and SKF 1987) (Your Ref) Dated 11
May 2018, Time around 22:15

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SKM 89506 (Our Ref) and SKF 1987) [Your Ref)
Dated 11 May 2018, Time around 22:15

@ CALTEX KIOSK - CHONG PANG



Mei Kwan Si.KKAutn] =

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 12:50 FM

To: melvin1523romeo@hotmail. com

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: Reporting for SKF1987) Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020606
Dear Melvin

As spoken, please provide us with the photographs taken by you for our review.
Thank you.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: ONG L1 L]

Sent;: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 1:01 PM

To: 'melvin1523romeo@hotmail.com’

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: Reporting for SKF1987] Our Ref: 17/18/1B/VP05/020606

Dear Melvin
As spoken, please see below for the policy details of your vehicle:-

POLICY NO  :Z/17/VP05/015049
PERIOD FROM :14/09/2017 TO 26/5/2018

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

L. (the third party claimamt™) of

(address). owner of

{vehicle no.) hereby authorize (*the workshop™)

1o act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for
my vehicle no that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on

(date) along (location)

involving vehicle no/s (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a4 manner that they deem fit
and the workshop 1s further authorized 1o receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque’s being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this " (day)of " (month)20_'" (year)
N
=¥
Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™

{with chop if applicable) {with chop)



hello

THIS IS YOUR INVOICE

g

UEN: 2017260927
No 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 701-07
: 8-Nov-19
Premier @ Kaki Bukit INVOICE DATE L.
Singapore 415875 INVOICE NOS: MSCB950G-18/0224
Tel: 6385 1838 Fax: 6386 1838 Reference: SKM BOs0G
msgroupoffice@gmail.com Date Of Accident: 11-May-18

Billed To Lonpac Insurance Bhd

On Behalf Of:  Shaiful Bin Buang
Invoice Type: 3rd Party PD Claim

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$§)
Lump Sum Amount Payable for Supply of Spare Parts & Labour
Pertaining to Accident Repair of: SKM 8950G
GLOBAL SETTLEMENT 5 1.507.00
Discount § -
Amount Due $ 1,507.00
COMMENTS
1. Total payment due in 30 days For MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

2. Al| Chegues must be made payable to MS CAR AUTO PTELTD
3. Please include our Invaice number at the back of your chegue
4. Zero Liability |

Sirgnat:ure B Stamp

PAYMENT DETAILS

Prepared by Yop June [ Ma)

THANK YOU FOR YOUR PROMPT PAYMENT Pace 1 of |



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: MS Car Auto <mscarautopl@gmail.com:

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 12:10 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM BO50G [TP) & SKF 19871 (0O1) OM 11/05/2018

Good Afternoon Khanchna,
Thank You for your email dated 8th Non 2015,

This is to confirm our acceptance of your offer of $1507, Kindly forward us DV for our client signature.
Thank You and Have a Great Weekend Ahead '-)

Warmest Regards,
Yap lune
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

B Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838

On Thu, Nov 7, 2019 at 11:34 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna @ |kkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice
{save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter and your e-mall below.

fFor amicable setflement on a without prejudice basis. we propose setflement on a global sum for $1,507.00(all
in).

Please confirm acceplance.
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting te legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this

negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subseguently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 11:34 AM

To: MS Car Auto

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM B950G (TP} & SKF 1987) (O1) ON 11/05/2018

Without Prejudice
(save as lo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
we refer o the above mater and your e-mail below

For amicable settlemeant on a without prejudice basis, we propose settlement on a global sum for $1,507.00(all
in),

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matier is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intentlon of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resarting to legal proceedings. No admission of Hability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of lerms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotintion terms/setilement.”™

Best Regards,

Khanchna) Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaalkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MS Car Auto <mscarautopl@gmail. com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 11:30 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchnat@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKM 8950G (TP) & SKF 1987 (OI) ON 11/05/2018

Dear Khanchna ,

Attached here a video footage for vour attention.
Thank You and have a Nice Day :-)

Warmest Regards,
Desmond Ng
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 2:48 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Mandate Request - Accident involving SKM B950G (TP) & SKF 1987] (OI-LONPAC] on
11/05/2018

Attachments: SKM B950G-0.mp4; LKK Adjustment Report.pdf; LKK Inspection Report.pdf; LKK SURVEY
PHOTOS pdf, TP LOD.pdf

LPC ref: 17/1B/18/VP05/020606
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18009043/Aka3g2
Dear Sit/Madam.

we refer 1o the above matier.

we have highlighted to your good office on 15/05/2018 of Third-Party's request o do Direct Settiement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.,

We noted from the video [as attached) that third party vehicle was stationary and our Insured driver reversed
and collided into parked Third party vehicle. We opine that BOLA 23 is applicable and liability is down against
Insurad,

surmmary to offer to third party repairer "MS CAR AUTO PTE LTD" as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cos! ol Repair $7.334.02 $ 1.000.00
2. Loss of Rental (5 days x § 180) $ $00.00 $ 500,00 (5 days x $100)
3.LTA Search Fee $ 745 $ 745
Total | § B.241 47 S 1,507.45

**03 days recommendation for repair + | PRS+ | Sunday = 5 days

The above is for your approval,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@ lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

1




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

300 BEACH ROAD
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAFORE 198555

18-12-2019

SKF 1887J

cmpcmunmmamqa

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607158-R

M

SKM 8950G

Insured Veh. \'nh. In:p-lr.hd

Policy No. ZMTNPOS5/015040 Coverage ($) 0.00

Claim No. 17/18M8NPOS/020606 Excess (5) 0.00
Aislnn From Assign Date 15/05/2018
Make & Model TOYOTA ALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MROS3ZEE106103732 Colour GREY
Odometer 124315 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 FALKEN B mm

L/H Front Tyre |186/65 R15 FALKEN B mm

R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 FALKEN 6 mm

LH RurTyrn 1951’551115 FALKEN & mm
b K

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FHﬂNT o5 FQRTION

SINGAPORE

416875

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR FIEPA.IR:

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
Accident Date 11/052018 Inspection Date 15/05/2018
Survey held at MS CAR AUTO PTELTD

B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 #01-07 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN A{.‘.GDRDANGE TO YOUR INS‘I'RI..ICTIIDNS 'IHE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




_’ ” L’ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL. 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 189507188R GST Reg No. 18-9607198-R Page No.:1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKM 8950G

1|FRONT BONNET NOT NECESSARY 295.00 .
1|FRONT BONNET HINGE LOCK NOT NECESSARY 75.00 :
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 785.00 485.00
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET NECESSARY 125.00 38.00
1|HEADLAMP cuT 685.40 48190
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 175.00
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 225,00 =
1|FOG LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 276.00 :
1|FOG LAMP COVER RH NOT NECESSARY 75.00 d
1|RADIATOR NOT NECESSARY 735.00 :
1|cONDENSER NOT NECESSARY 824 50 .
1|FRONT FENDER RH NOT NECESSARY 465.80
1|sPONGE NOT NECESSARY 157.00
1|REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 785,00
1|WATER TANK NOT NECESSARY 235.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,479.68 25073
4,439,02 75217
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|LICESENCE PLATE F @$30.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 '
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @$5.00 (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30,00
10| HEADLAMP CLIPS @$5.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 :
10|FRONT GRILLE CLIPS @S5.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
1|FRONT SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 225,00 g
435.00 30,00
LABOUR
TO R&R ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS .TO 1,000.00 200.00
CUTMWELD ,KNOCK AND REALIGN ACCIDENT AFFECTED
AREA.
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 1,000.00 250.00
TO R&R FRONT SENSOR AND CHECK FUNCTION. 120.00 30,00

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18009043/Aka3q2



' V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sda AE = 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No, 15-'950?1“?. Flpﬂu.iﬂ!

Description of Parts

TO CHECK WHEEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY
TO R&R AIRCON CONDENSOR AND REFILL GAS. NOT NECESSARY
TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND HEADLAMP FOCUS. NOT NECESSARY

'GRAND TOTAL

YMMENDED COST OF LU A REF 'ﬁ-’: =

. ”‘Nﬂw-wr* i .
Report Ref No. CGA.“LPC‘IWSIAE&SHZ

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE.AMIRTE.AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensod Appraiser

OISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Raport Is made salsly for the uss and benefil of tha Client named on the frant pags of this Report.




