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J VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. Mo 188B07108R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9807108-R

Afiliated to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CCa/AIG18009033/wal3

78 SHENTON WAY #08-16 Il MI
CHARTIS BUILDING Date . 18-05-2018

SINGAFPORE 079120

Coda = AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SKG 3071H Veh. Inspected SJk 22268
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 181052018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
I
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/05/2018 [iInspection Date

Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1
#01-61
SINGAPORE 408717

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
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Actual ARF Pam 41 89T .00

L T e S e e e e
PARF Eligltsllity e
PARF Eflgitsllity Enpley Date 12 Oz 2010
PARE Rutiatw Aot 120848 00
CoE Eapery Diaf Dt 2010
v e
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COE Rehate Amouni §407 00
Totsl Retate Amaunt 12125100
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S0 0T AVE 1, #0125 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIGIR009033/wal
16 May 2019

Henry Bognot Lagansua
Blk 709 Pasir Ris Drive 10
#10-181

Singapore 510709

Dear SirMladam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 3071H & SJK 2226B ON 13/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise thal you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 31/05/2019, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours aithfully,

Vivian Lau
Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlau@ lkkauto.com

c.c. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Moror Claims Dept)



Kharnchna(LKK Auto)

—_— —_— —
From: Henry Lagansua <tetelestal 777 @yahoo.comsg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 7:29 PM
To; Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG3071H [AIG] & SJK2226B ON 13/05/2018 ALONG/AT
SUMS WAY AND SIMS AYE JUNCTION
Attachments: IMG_B263 (1))pg; IMG_B280 (11,)pg

Dear Khanchna,

You can download my front camera video recording from this link : 20180513 072239 N.mp4

Please scroll on the video. Accident occurred between 1:23 to 1:25 video segment. Kindly note the
following

1) Video segment 1:21 - 1:22 shows that | have already driven past the other vehicle and the driver
should have seen me already

2) Video segment 1:23 - 1:25 shows that my car was shaken as | was hit by the other vehicle. The
attached photo of my car shows that my rear wheel and door was hit by the other vehicle

3) | am driving on the OUTER MOST LANE when the other vehicle hit my rear wheel and door.

| hope this information would suffice and will facilitate your investigation. Note that my NCD was
already reduced since my past year and recent insurance renewals due to a third party claim, that in
my humble opinion is not warranted as my REAR door and REAR wheel was hit by the other
vehicle!!! To be very honest, | am very disappointed that | was penalised on an accident that was not
caused by me

Do let me know if you need further information

Thanks,



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 3:12 PM

To: CS A Team

Subject: FW: AIG REF: TP/ B2017955065G [Accident between SIK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG)

on 13/05/2018]

From: Ler, Bermard-JQ)

Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 3:11:45 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Khoo, Kay-Eng

Subject: RE: AIG REF: TP / B2017955065G [Accident between SIK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG) on 13/05/2018]

Dear Khanchna,
May | have your WP repart please? It's been a manth.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Compiex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(078120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946

Bermnard-JQ Ler@aig.com | www.&ig.com sq

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 20 January 2020 11:26

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@alg.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG REF: TP / 82017955065G [Accident between SJK 22268 & 5KG 3071H (AIG) on 13/05/2018]

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,

Dear Bernard,
We will submitting DAR repaort.

Thank you.



-I{ha-nchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February 2020 2:15 PM

To: Khoo, Kay-Eng

Cc Admin A; Ler, Bernard-JQ

Subject: RE: AlG REF TP / B2017955065G [Accident between SJK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG

on 13/05/2018)

Dear Mr. Khoo,
We will expedite and submit WP and not DAR promptly

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@alg.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February 2020 1:43 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-10.Ler@aig.com=

Subject: RE: AlG REF: TP / B2017955065G [Accident between SIK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG) on 13/05/2018)

Daar r_-1_,|:-:hr|;;.

This Is a May 2018 case

Please prioritise and submit the DAR report within the next 7 days

kay-eng khoo@aig com | www Big.5q

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visir to learn more.




‘Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 11:26 AM

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ

Co Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG REF: TP/ 82017955065G [Accident between S)K 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG)

on 13/05/2018]

Dear Bernard,
We will submitting DAR repart.

Thank you.

+ Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yegy -

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ler, Bernard-1Q <Bernard-10. Ler@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 Jlanuary 2020 11:23 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG REF: TP / 82017955065G [Accident between SJK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG) on 13/05/2018]

Hi Khanchna,
Any update on the below?
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 8419 1948

Bemard-JQ Ler@aig com | www. alg.com.sg




" Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 4:37 FM

To: Ler, Bernard-JQ

Ce: Admin A

Subject: AlG REF: TP / B2017955065G [Accident between SIK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG)

on 13/05/2018]

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we were informed by the third party repairer that the third party did not
send the vehicle for repair due to liability unclear.

In view of the above, we will proceed to submit our WP report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@® |kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:

Flag Status:

Dear Khanchna
Please close this case.
Regards,

Grace Chin
Modern Automotive Pte Lid

Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road | s01-61

Singapore 408717

lel: 6748 4422
Fax: 6747 6720

Chin =chin@modernautomotive com.sg>

Friday, 8 November 2019 1:40 PM

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

RE: Accident involving SJK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG - Ol ) on 13/05/2018

Follow up
Flagged

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Wednesday. November 6. 2019 2:36 PM

To: Chin <chin@modemautomotive.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-aia@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident involving SJK 22268 & SKG 3071H (AIG - O ) on 13/05/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir’Madam,

We would like to know whether your client is still pursuing the ¢laim or not.

Please confirm.

Thank vou.

“Kindly note that this negotistion between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

liability/damages, either party is nol bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terma/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchnal Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd



DID; 6841 2360] email: Khanchnawlkkauto com Fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Menmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked / No ssttlement

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Hotified Em Submitteds Adj Assigred Ad{ Kpt Adt] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Staius
for
|10 2018 g_ﬂ‘ 018 $$2,800.00  |5$2,800.00 St for Survey
Edit Pag i s gt | eait pavmatss | | view ro | Cancel Case |

Main
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insurad: HENRY BOGNOT LAGANSUA, 10: STIB4TOTE

Main m
Claimant: HO CHEE XIAMG VINCENT, [D: S8236435)

Vehicle R . [13/05/2018 08:00 - .59
o SIK22268 Date of Loss: | 1315 Months From LTA Rieg Date (Man ¥r])

Claim Type: |TP / 8B2017955065G PoNc/Cover | 1700029874

Wehicle Reg Palicy No.
SKGIOTIH (Claimant):

Excess:

Repaires: Modern Automotive Pre Ltd (HQ) Bl 30234 Ubi fioad 1, #01-61 & #01-58, 408717 Ut - Tel: 6748 4422 | 6747 4422

Handling AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: £5-6419-3000 . . [Handied by Lar, Bernard-2Q]

Inauser; Bernard)iQian Ler@aig com

m':" NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tal
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (W) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by ADRIAN LING] .. [Final Rpt due 30/05/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Man |

There are mo msdl for this case.

5074586450-02

Ko
(Insured):

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS= view Al | Sesrch Tasks | Crente wew Task | compets |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No resufis.

htps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 27/2/2020



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*S)K2226B (B2017955065G)
[SKG3071H]
TP

HO CHEE XIANG VINCENT
May 13 2018 8:00AM
[HENRY BOGNOT LAGANSUA]

Page | of 2

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
uptosg Docemants | upicad Photos | Compose new Lenter | upiosa vises | upised ausio | 'ﬁl-
Wideo 1 per vl &
Mo |Finalized On ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print
1 |18/05/18 15:08 m‘ mmrlﬂ.mu HENIY BOGNCT LACANSLA @ | Load mrs
Assessment Reports 1 w
No_|Finalized On AIG Asim Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. (5G) Thurnbnail | Print
3 [I8/O5/1815:06 ﬂm:uwmmm @ | Lowd HTM
Ph_nmﬂmluu r= ¥
Ne | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |D8/11/1814:17 | Photo from O1 0| wers | 4
2 |06/11/19 14:17 | Photo from OI 0| wawc | A
3 |pes1119 14:19 General View Q| eaws | A
4 |08/11/19 18:19 | General View @ | i | A
§ |pe/1n19 14019 Ganeral View g loed G | B
E|06/11/19 14:19 | General View 0| wecws |
7 |o8p118 14:19 | General View 0| eadwc | A
8 |08/11/19 1419 | General View @ | aarvc | A
5 |06/11/19 14:15 | Genaral View O eewc | A
10 |06/11/19 14:19 | Ganaral View Q| e | A
11 |06/11/19 14:19 | Genaral View g Load PG | BA
12 |06/11/19 14:19 Genersl View 0| sdws | A
13 |08/11/19 14:1% | General View 0| cadwc | A
14 |DE/11/19 18115 | General View ! lead G | &
15 |06/11/1914:19 | Genaral View B e | A
16 |06/11/10 14:19 | Genarsl View @ | oecws | 9
17 |D6/11/19 14:18 | General View Q| eadws | A
18 |D6/11/19 14:19 | Genersl View g lead 1P | BA
119 [0611/1914:19 | Genaral View 0| e | A
Documentation 1 per ult=E] =)l
hNo | Relabel/Reorder | LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |18/0S/1811:30 |TP GIA REPORT g Losd FOF
2 |05/11/1917:22  |EMAILTO O1 Load POF
3 |I6/D220 14:04 | EMATIL FROM TP WORKSHOP s Load POF
4 |26/02/20 14:18 | EMAIL TO AIG SUBMIT WP Load PDF
Mo | Fnalized On ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. (SG) Thumbnall | Print
i |21/05/18 14:44 | OI GIA REPORT © | osarre
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | i |

There are no document checklsts configured

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp ...

27/212020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: L Handling Insurer

Sl BT W PRIVEE W 1NN O BR0W & VB AThEY pAFTEL

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 27/2/2020



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne 1sss071ssm;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@ikkaulo.com;assignments@lkkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG18009033/AKA302

Date: 2710212020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. Policy No 1700029874
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SJK22268 Insured Vehicle No : SKG3071H
Dale of Loss 13/05/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: B201795506SG
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJK22268
Make & Model: LEXUS 15250, 2.5 Luxury (A) Engine No: 4GR0OS520810
Reg. Date: 13M10/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JTHBK262105088274
Colour: Black Odometer: 113729 km
Engine Capacity: 2500 cc
Market Value/New Car NJA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$); Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 22545 R1T Rear Tyre Size: 22545 R17
Front Left Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama & mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama & mm
Thia above values represent the mmaining fyre freads depi
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 6,126.70 267927 344743 56.27
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.400.00 910.00 480,00 35.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 7,526.70 3,589.27 3,937.43 52.11
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,800.00
(58) 7.528,70 2,800.00 4 726.70 62 80
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 526.87 1686.00 33087 62.80
Nett Amount (S§) B,053.57 2,8686.00 5,057.5T7 62.80
Global Sum Settlement [S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment 27arzos
Date Inspected: 27/06/2018 Inspected At: Modem Automotive Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1, #01-61 & #01-
58
Singapore 408717
Estimaled Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 27/2/2020
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NOTE: This repart reprasenty our fngings st the time ang place of inspaction stafed Aemin. Such inspection has been carred out to the bost of our
knowisdpe and abiity but any ofher fabity under any offier circumstances is harsly axpressly sxciuded,
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed BB1.90F *B81.890FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 30.00F *30.00FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LH MNecessary B8500F *65.00 FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP LH Mot Necessary 325 40F *.FL
5 1 *HEADLAMP LH Not Necessary 2.441.00F “FL
6 1 *FRONT LH FENDER Dented 920.90F *920.90FL
7 1 *FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD Deformed 382 50F *382 50 FL
8 1 *FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS Necessary 30.00F *30.00 FL
<] 1 *FRONT LH WHEEL RIM Cut 1.050.00FS “BO0.DOFS
F=Franchise pan. S=SpcNet). L=LniitemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 6,126.70 2,910.30
- List tem Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (5%) 0.00 231.03

Total Parts (S5)  6,126.70 2,679.27

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous terms selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour items

1 PANEL BEATING New 600.00 400.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New 600.00 400.00

| WIRING Mew 50.00 30.00

4  TOPERFORM WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 150.00 80.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,400.00 910.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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