Ethicarz Pre. Lid.

56 Lovang Way, Loyang Enterprise Building
“c_:h\lﬁ #04-04 Singapore S03775
ETHiCARz Tel: <65 6384 4404 Fax: +65 6384 0444
E-mail: enquiries@ethicarz.sg
Comapany No.: 201 729003E
GST Registration No: 201729003E

O Ref : SGNSERIL
Your Ref : SIG2216P

Daie ; 30.07.2018

Alin ¢ Motor Claim Department

Deear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SGNRREIL , SJGI916P AND SKZ5252P
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 14.05.2018

ALONG ¢ YISHUN DAM TOWARDS YISHUN AVE |

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

We are claiming as below:

Cost of Repair : § 12,840.00  ($ 12,000.00 + GST)
Loss of Rental 1 5 840,00 (5 120,00 X 7 DAYS)
LTA Search : 5 745

Grand Total : § 13.687.45

The abave settlement is in respect of our client’s for damage pertaining 10 his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our
client's claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal injuries.

Kindly take note that our ¢ffice is located a1 56 Loyang way, Loyang Enterprise Building, #04-04 Singapore 508773

If you have any queries, please contact Katherine Chan at 6184 4404, or email 'katherinechan@ethicorz. sg

Yours Failthfully,
Katherine Chan




an Irene (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 4:20 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020603  Accident involving SIG2916P,SGN8882L &
SKZ5252P along Yishun Ave 1 on 14/5/18  GIA Report - SGNB882L [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all €% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 6 June, 2019 4:00 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020603 Accident involving S51G2916P,SGNBBB2L & SKZ5252P along Yishun Ave
1 on 14/5/18 GIA Report - SGN8882L [External Confidential]

Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020603

Dear Gerald,
This is 3 vehicle chain collision scenario where our insured driver was the 3 in line.
Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s ETHICARZ PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs 5 22,542.21 (estimate) $12,840.00
Loss of Rental S B40.00 (5120 x 7 days) 5 700.00 (5100 x 7 days)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45
TOTAL 5 23,389.66 $13,547.45




Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.
For your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 2:54 FM

To: loy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020603 Accident involving 5JG2916P,SGN8882L & SKZ5252P along Yishun Ave
1 on 14/5/18 GIA Report - SGN8882L [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Irene,

Please note that our insured has yet to lodge the report.

We are unable to comment on liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TEI_E_{_ES} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

W ..
o o

The all (¥&w ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April, 2019 2:08 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020603 Accident involving SIG2916P,SGN88B2L & SKZ5252P along Yishun Ave
1 on 14/5/18 GIA Report - SGN88B2L




Ethicarz Pte Ltd

96 Loyang Way #04-04 Loyang Enterprise Building
Singapore 508775
—Th Tel: +65 6384 4404 | Fax: +65 6384 D444

t '_I i C A ﬁz Company No: 2017209003E

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

Accident on !‘a‘f'ﬂ"flw along YifHuW pam TowArpr TIEHuY  AVE |
Involving vehicles SaNFPE2L 4 ST629 6P 4 shzSasap

In consideration of Ethicarz Pte Ltd, 56 Loyang Way #04-04 Loyang Enterprise Building
Singapore 508775, repairing my/our motor vehicle na  faNgssaL at my request,

IWe, NG BoON cHEy (“the claimant") of Buk jgs cAuperra brive
THE EROWnToNe Ri1a-vs $(342039) (address) bearing NRIC No __ r+1353.011 the owner
of motor vehicle no LGNERFLL . hereby authorize them to demand claim, settle and

receive whatever amount settle payable by the insurance company or third party or commence
legal proceeding for cost of repairs, loss of use and etc to any of their appointed solicitors to
act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and all the amount claimed or settled shall
belong and make payable to them absolutely by the insurance company of the third party.
IMWe further authorized them absolute discharge on my/our behalf and to sign discharge

voucher(s) and any other documents necessary or incidentals to the conduct and disposal of
my/our above claims.

IWe further agree fo fully co-operate and attend all court hearings that are necessary to
prosecute the claims maintained by Ethicarz Pte Ltd.

IWe further agree and undertake to indemnify them against my/our claim for costs which arise
therawith,

In the event that my/our claim is unsuccessful, l/iwe undertake to pay to Ethicarz Pte Ltd
The cost of repairs to my/our vehicle.

In the event that settlement cheque were to be drawn in my/our favour, l/iwe hereby give
mylour instructions to clear the said cheque on mylour behalf by presenting the same for
payment directly into Ethicarz Pte Ltd account. Upon clearance of the said cheque, Iiwe
further authorize Ethicarz Pte Ltd and/or their appointed law firm to utilize the monies to pay
their charges without further reference to me. | confirm that the payment to Ethicarz Pte Ltd
shall amount to a good discharge of Ethicarz Pte Ltd and/or their appointed law firm's
obligation to me in respect of the settlement monies.

Dated this i day of us {(month) 20 _I# (year)
Signedby “the claimant” Signed by Ethicarz Pte Ltd

Name: NG Booh eHEW

NRIC No: f3lis3p91




=
o
~11 |

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/18/18/VP05/020603
DATE : 24 JUNE 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, NG BOON CHEW (HUANG WENZHOU) confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SJG 2916P the sum of
Singapore Dollars Thirteen Thousand Five Hundred Forty Seven and Cents Forty
Five Only ($13,547.45) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of
property claim competent to mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SGN

88R2L on 14 MAY 2018 along YISHUN AVENUE 1.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnifly (MOHAMED SHAH S/0
AHMED SHAH / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above secttlement sum directly to M/S
ETHICARZ PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Mame of vehicle owner/Darte

WC



Ethicarz Pte. Ltd.
56 Loyang Way, Loyang Enterprise Building

ﬂ #04-04 Singapore 508775
= Tel: +65 6384 4404 Faw: +65 6384 0444
e -
E-' L B | ‘AR_? E-mail: enquiries@ethicarz.sg
I I \- Comapany No.: 201725003E
G5T Registration No: 201725003E
Imvoice To - REPAIR BILL NO.
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD Repair Bill No.
Date 30.07.2018
Vehicle No. SGNEBRBZL
Yehicle Model MINI ONE
Accident Date 14.05.2018
Description Amount
LUMP S5UM COST OF REPAIR FOR SGNBBB2L 5 12,000.00
SUB- TOTAL| & 12,000.00
GST7%| 5 840.00
ROUNDING ADJ| 5 -
Kindly cross & make cheqgue payable to : Ethicarz Pte. Ltd. Total Payable % 12,840.00

for Customer for Ethicarz Pte. Ltd.



@SSR CARZ HAVEN

BLK 505B BISHAN STREET 11 #01-420 SINGAPORE 572505
€0, REG: 5333B147M
TEL: 63434736

DATE:; 01/06/2018 IMVOICE NO: C1386a
BLK 150 CAMBERRA DRIVE
#12-05
& (TBROTS)
ATTM: MR. NG BOON CHEW
INVOICE

DESCRIPTION aTy (DAYS) AMOUNT (5)
Rental of SGWBEE5 o7 540
14™ May 2018 to 21 May 2018

Amount Due: 240

Total: B40

SEN &gr-L—

This is a computer-generated invoice. No signature is required.



Carz Haven scsouou
Blk S han
Carz Haven ekl

wwaw,carzhaven.com

Tel: 6782 2433

Fax: 63537717

Emalk carzhaven@hotmail.com
Facebook: facebook.com/carzhaven

N 10069

CAR RENTAL AGREEMENT L3¢ verel
HIRER'S PARTICULARS
[ Name: NG ooy chew) NRIC/Passport No: & 7/ 75 FFF /

Address: E;.t .{Q:I fankerra lme e Brmritooe #12-05 | Date of Birth: 5:"“-'}' 1e7f
Mobile: ~* E%fd:}?_?{ Vehicle No: I Rental Fea:
Make/ Model: saN 188 $
VEHICLE OUT Fuel In Indication
Date: l'.{ [S; L. Time: ]
p-Plate issued: YES/NO GPS issued: YES/NO Mileage: (76, ,:.[./-r 5‘ —_ F{’éft—

| Remarks: D=Dent S=5Scratches C=Chips R=Rust M=Missing B=Broken
WVEHICLE IN Fuel In Indication
[rate: Time: FULL
P-Plate issued: YES/NO GPS Issued: YES/MO Mileage:

Rernarks: O=Dent 5=Scratches C=Chips R=Rust M=Missing

B=Broken

| have read and understood all the terms and conditions on both sides of this Agreement and | hereby agrees to be bound by it.

All the infarmation | have given in this Agreement are true.
Deposit: 3
Amount paid (Excluding depesit) : $

Mo refund will be issued if the Hirer decided to end the vehicle loan period earlier.

OFFICIAL USE:

"

Singature of Hirer

Date & time of returned: Deposit returned: YES/NO  Singature of Hirer: :Ak

Page 1



S42018 Receipt

> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 375701

G3T Registration Mo, : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 14 May 2018 / 10:00:28
Receipt Date/Time : 14 May 2018 [ 10:00:28

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No, : ITNET-00000-180514-000423
Previous Receipt No, ;

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
Mo, GS5T (5%) (5%) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - SJGZ916P
As at 14 May 2018/07:35:00

Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SJG2S16P

Enquiry Fes 7.00 049 T4a3
20180514095857T483606
Sub-Total T.00 0,49 T.49
Total Before Rounding T.00 0,49 T.48
Rounding Ditference 0.04
Total Amount Payable T.45
Paid By
XA IIT E"IT:’:"T::ITI:Gard T7.45
Tatal 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tenderad Amaunt 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THAMEK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ansure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt is considered void and late fee
may apply.

TIRERSE YT L IE . GOV SGIIE VIFBCHON COMDISTe By ment fruitiL. | IGIN_ ISR 0w i



