Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 12:21 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE- Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (O1: CTI - SNM18D02497C02)

AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118008951/Uha3
CTI REF - SNM18D02497C02/7 (GBR1927R)

Drear Thin Thin
We refer to your email and reminders pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $3,757.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh .cntaiping.co|

www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
I Singapore since 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd, Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately,

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 09, 2018 11:54 AM
To: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
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Ce: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau
<kklau@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (Ol: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF

- CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018
Importance: High

URGENT

Dear Sir / Madam,
we refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing us for settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lucas Lee <lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 11:40 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com?>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident involving GBR1927R (O1: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Irene,

Fyna.

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309
Direct (65) 6388 6181

Fax (B5)6222 7175/6224 7478

Ermail: lucas lee@sqg.cntaiping.com

Website: www. sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simpapare siner 1958



Disclaimer

This message is confidential: its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in awritten agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. [f vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately,

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@I|kkauto.com]

Sent; Monday, 1 October, 2018 11:33 AM

To: Lucas Lee; Alfred Toh; Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (OI: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing us for settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 2:49 PM

To: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; 'Claims Dept of CTVI'
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com:>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (O1: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND S5KC1795L (TP : LKK REF

- CC3/CT118008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018
Importance: High

Your Ref: SNM18D02497C02 "Without Prejudice”
Our Ref; CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA 1927R AND SKC 1795L ON 21/04/2018

We refer to the above accident.
Ol collided to rear portion of TP vehicle.

We did clarify with OI the nature of accident. We had informed Ol about TP claim.

3



We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

summary of offer made to workshop Progressive Auto Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repairs S 6,028.20 $ 2,675.00
2. Loss of Rental (5180 x 6 days) $ 1,776.00 S 1,080.00
3. LTA Search Fee S 2.00 S 2.00
4. Buy 3™ Party's GIA Report S 259.00 5
5. Incidentals 5 88.00 s
5 7,923.20 § 3,757.00

Enclosed herewith the relevant supporting documents for your kind perusal.

For your approval please,

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 31 May, 2018 4:07 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (Ol: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CT118008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Vic,

Noted, please proceed for direct settlement with Progessive Auto Pte Ltd.

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309
Direct (65) 63859 6181

Fax (B5)6222 7175

Email: lucas.lee@sa.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com




ANAIVERSARY
In Simgapore siwee 1958

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; {is contents do not constitute a commitment by Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a writien agreement between you and China Talping [nsurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or disseminagtion, either in whole ar partial, is prohibited If vow are not the intended recipient of the message, please notifv the
sender immediately.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 30 May, 2018 1:59 PM

To: Lucas Lee; Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Irene Tay; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (Ol: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18008251/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Lucas,
We refer further to our below email.

Please be informed that TP owner had taken his vehicle to another workshop for repair. Kindly refer to the attached email.
As such, we will proceed to close the matter and will submit our WP report.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)

FETLS 2l
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This &-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 25 May, 2018 11:17 AM

To: Lucas Lee; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving GBR1927R (O1: CTI - SNM 18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTIIR008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Lucas,

We refer to the below email and the contents were duly noted.
We will proceed to send first letter to Ol

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKC 1795L

Date of survey: 17/05/2018

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary Advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Elk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 25 May, 2018 8:43 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (OI: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Mei Kwan,

Cur insured has not reported the accident yet,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079308
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65)6222 7175

Email: lucas. lee@sqg.cntaiping. com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com




AN RSARY
In Singapare since 1958

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute @ commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement herween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid,. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is profibited. [f vou are not the intended recipient of the message. please natify the
sender immediately.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 May, 2018 4:00 PM

To: Lucas Lee

Cc: Irene Tay; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A

subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (OI: CTI - SNM18D02497C02) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI180085951/Uha3) on 21.04,2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary
action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 18 May, 2018 5:04 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (01: CTI- SNM18D02497C02) AND 5KC1795L (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTIIE008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay



Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motar)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
Direct (65) 6382 6181

Fax (B65)6222 7175

Email: lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

-
-

ANNIYVERSARY
fuﬁuﬂm#lﬁl?ﬂ

Disclaimer .

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notifir the
sender immediately,

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com

Sent: Thursday, 17 May, 2018 11:43 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBR1927R (OI: CTI - TBA) AND SKC1795L (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3) on 21.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd - Ubi.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TF estimate
- TP GIA report
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.



Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk =1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Progressive Auto Pte Ltd
Business Reg. No. 200712509E
GST Reg. No. 200712509E
Tel: 6844 4620 Fax: 6844 4625

Email: claimsG@progressiveauto.sg
Date 11/62018 BY E-MAIL

Yourref: GBA1927R

Qur ref: SKC17095L0
WITHOUT PREIUDICE

M/s China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road, #15-00/#16-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : ( SKC1795L & GBA1927R ) ALONG WOODLANDS AVE 3 TWDS BKE
DOA: 21/04/18 TIME: 2220 HOURS

we refer to the above matter and write on behalf of FULCO LEASING PTELTD  , the registered owner of
SKC1795L in respect of the above accident.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving/ or management
of your insured vehicle. Your insured's vehicle GBA1927R collided onto the rear portian of our client's
vehicle SKC1795L. As a result of the accident, our client has been put to loss and expenses, particulars of
which are as follows:-

|. Cost of repair (52500 + 7% G5T) 5 2,675.00
7. Lossof Rental (6 days = $296) s 1,776.00
3. Buy 3rd Party's GIA Report 5 29.00
4, GlAsearch 5 2.00
5. Incidentals 5 88.00

Total Amount: 5 4,570.00

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal.

1) Driver's driving license/ |dentity card

2| Certificate of Insurance

3) GIA report

4) LTA Search [ GBA1927R )

5) Original repair claim

6) Car Rental Agreement/ Receipt | Payless - 26768 )

Our company is the authorized workshop of any of the GIA member companies and we are writing in
purely for amicable sake.

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s for damages pertaining to his motor vehicle and any
settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not prejudice any claim in respect of personal
injuries.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the ahove said documents within 7 days and your favourable reply is deeply

appreciated.
Yours faithfully,

b2

Bereza

-



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May, 2018 11:52 AM

To: waisann@iora.com.sg

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref GBR 1927R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBR 1927R AND SKC 1795L ON
21/04/2018

Attachments: ADDENDUM pdf

!’ I’!l’/ Auto

- Cansultants
A LA B Ple L1

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (651 62363561 FAX : (165) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18008951/Uha3

30 MAY 2018

CITY BLUE BOUTIQUE PTELTD By Post and By Email
100Q ENTERPRISE ROAD

ENTERPRISE 10

SINGAPORE 629841

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBR 1927R AND SKC 1795L ON 21}'04,\" 2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further gqueries.

Best Regards,

Vice Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
B 74 Pal
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ZL2R2% SWT Spue the Earthe Print only when necessary”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.
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LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

Ta: PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD

RE: ACCIDENTINVOLVING  SKC 1395L A GBA 1431/ ALONG/AT
- Wwoodl IL{:’_"'I{iﬂLJQ‘__f_) Juwels BKE _ON_ T /O ""‘_f_} L’I"é’
LWE_Fulco L-*(L:s._m;i;_ Ple Licl NRICNO, 2C1021308¢G

oF 22 Ubi Reacl 4§ | o ;_wif"lj £ (HOSGIH )

I'he owner of the motor yehicle no, ﬁkjff__f 4995 L hereby authorize PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LD to commence
repairs of the said vehicle forthwith. |7 We agree Lo assign the whole proceeds of my / out third party claim o
PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD including any claim for loss of use if a vehicle had been provided by
PROGRESSIVE ALTO PTE LTD during the period of repairs to my / our vehicle is applicable, my / our solicttors (1o

e appointed by PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD on my / our behalf) shall accept this as my / our irrevocable
authority to pay the amount compensated direct 1o PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD after deduction of their costs a
solicitor & client basis. 1/ We undertake to co-operate fully with PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD, I'We shall
be liable there a breach in the terms and condition in any insurance policy and / or my [ our solicitors and also
with a true Motor Accident Report / Police Report until the claim to a successful conclusion including writing to
court, failing which, I / We undertake to bear repair costs, rental. legal costs at any incidentals incurred,

L. [f the 3 party claim is unsuccessful or partly successful as the case may be |/ We hereby instruet and authonze
PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD to claim direct from my / our insurance company on my / our vehicle
immediately without any delay.

2. If for any reason my / our insurers” are not willing to settle the repair costs either in part or in whole 1/ We
undertake to pay PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD for the incidentals cost incurred of the abovementioned
maotor accident claims,

Lad

In alternative (o serial number 1 and serial number 2 above, if the 3" party claims fails or only partly successul
then | / We undertake 1o pay PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD for the difference in amount of the claim.

4. 1/ We authorize PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD to sign all discharge vouchers / indemnity forms and all
necessary papers on my / our behalf in connection with the abovementioned claim.

n

|/ We also authorize PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD to appoint such firm of Solicitors on my / our behalf as
PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD deem fit to purpose of 3" party / own msurance claims.

6. 1|/ We undertake to inform PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD and / or the Solicitors appointed by
PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD on my / our behalf in the event the third’s party insurance company
communicate with me / us directly by telephone or in writing and |/ We further undertake not to accept any
monies, offer or settlement from third party's insurers without first communicate with PROGRESSIVE AUTO
PTE LTD.

DATED THIS 2D payor 10O 2018,

wu&j ﬂ’ | /

Signature of Owner " 0 Signature of Witness
(C any’s Stamp — 1Fany) Name of Witness:

\_ P1/7 _//




LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

pATE: 22210l 201%

. Lkﬁ N IM?W [ WIA."*{:PYHLE (s) Ty h‘(‘;’

To

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. SKC 119S L X GBA 1933R

ALONG  Waorllunels Bue 3 TRuds Brez oN_Difoxl 301 %

I/WE _Fulco Leasng Pig ldd of (NRIC / ROC NO.) 201021308G
& N

OF 22 Ub, Rogd #H, 1ulco  Builel 0 s (OB )
Owner of vehicle no. 2KC 1195 L in consideration of M/S PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD
Repairing my / our vehicle 3¥¢ 1 1€/5( atmy / our instruction and hereby authorize
PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settle receive whatever amount settled / payable
by the Insurance Company and / or third party or to commence legal proceeding. I necessary. under
my name, lor the cost of repairs, car rental and / or loss of use. etc and 1o their appointing Solicitor to
act for me / us in respect of the said accident / elaim and all claimed and / or settled shall belong to

them absolutely.

| further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above mentioned claim cost which may

arisen therewith,

Signature of Owner %ﬁi T -
(Company’s chop — if ang) |’
i )
Name of Owner .\ ] Fulco Leasiny Pte Ml
- a
NRIC No : 2010 21308 &




Policy No i DMCVSK3IN1TESLBOZ Claim No : SNMI1&D0O2437C02
claimant @ FULCO LERSTING PTE LTD
Amount * 55-3,757:00

Singapore Dellars Three Thousand Seven Hundred and Fifty
Seven Only

I/Wae agres to actept the above menticned amount to be paid to mefus in full 3

final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident lnvelving

Claimant Vehicle No. ¢ SKC 1795L

Insured Vehicle Neoo @ GBEE 1927R
Date pf Ldss : 2l/04/z2018
Flace of Accident s WOODLANDS AVE 3 TOWARDS BRE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (3INGAFORE) pPTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely te
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE] PTE. LTD: andior

Insured Nams + CITY¥ BLUE' BOUTIQUE FTE LTD
briver Mame : ANG 500N BEE

from all claims, present or future in respect of all less; injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liabkility on the
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 5% =
(2} Cost of Eepair/Excess 53 2,675.00
{3} Loss of Use/Rental/ 5% 1,080.00
{4) GIA/Police Reportsd
Investigation Results/Search Fee:z 5% 2..00
(5] Medical Reports/EXpenses 55 =
(&) Surwvey Fees/PB.T. Fees 33 -
{7} Cost inecluding Disbursement 55 -
EEF=SSSSsSS==RESESESS
TOTAL . . + % = & =« = + « » o « » o 5% 3,757.00
—=mpsoSooSoSEESSSS
Claimant Name* FULCO LEASING PTE LTD NRIC No : 20102130BG

Signature

Date 5 f};!fuff?




PROGRESSIVE AUTO PTE LTD

Business Reg. No: 200712509E
GST Reg. No: 2007123509E
Mo | Kaki Bukit Ave 6 AutoBay
#02-48/50 Singapore 417883

Date:  11/672018

FULCO LEASING PTE LTD

/0 NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
AUTOBAY #02-48/50
SINGAPORE 417883

MOTOR VEHICLE NO: SKC1795L NISSAN MURANO 1.5

REPAIR CLAIM $ 2.500.00
LUMP SUM Sub- total $  2,500.00
7% GST: $ 17500

Total: § 2,675.00

TWO THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SEVENTY FIVE
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: DOLLARS ONLY



PAYLESS AUTOFLEET RENTALrcw seue 47 T\

=,

No. 50, East Coast Road #02-68 (A~ Rental ~)
Roxy Sguare Shopping Cenlre Singapore 428768 '—_
Rental Tel : {§5) 6348 0500 (3 lines) Booking Fax : (85) 8440 1007 weanse My EAFPENtal com. g
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT NO.7 L (58
HIRER'S PARTICULAR ; Veh No: S JugLX Repiace Vieh No:
Nama : (as In UC) Tud Leasne Y LD e ou: Mileage Out :
NRIC | PASSPORT Mo Make & Model: Aenting Location

Address (Fes) A Litsy @OAD by Fuieg Biaipine
Soieapnze  UWOELIF
Warmn & Address of Employer

Aagivanual Wowpa_ epyssey 2%
" |OUT:Date 1\ 3y 20§ Timo: 1TLpm
HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY frar am% 5-:1‘}-11

CHARGES

Occupation : __ Driving Exp:
DL No: DAL Typo : Local/intemational | es 2B w& e '*“""-—f -
Pags Dats : Date of Birdh: Woeidy as
Tol : (O} {R) HP /PG Moninly @3
Emad ; _ [Hours as
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICGULARS Cithers a3
Mama : (s in UC) LA ®L WiglA = =
NRIC / PASSPORT No: G LD P

. PAI a%
DA Mo:_ V- 03 Jﬂ‘}? DL Type: Local/international
Pass Dae:____________ Dele of Bitn; 2004 ({3 |Delvery Service
Occupation : Driving Exp: Quetics, | waoid) sus-ToTAL 3 |va7L [-

Aelundable Deposil : ouT IN
| Cash/Neta/Cheque/VISAMC Cards No m m
{A] - ACCIDENTS (D) - DENTS {S) - SCRATCHES s . e

EXTENEION
Collection Sarvice
Misc.

ESTIMATED TOTAL RENTAL §
Rented out by :

Hiera s raspansible for the frst § 200/~ gyass
for collision [ damage bo first party. {i.e.) PAYLESS AUTOFLEET
RENTAL Vehicle (inciuding windscroen) and alec fist §

= _oxcess for colislon / damage to thind party’s
vahicle lor each and every accident / damape.

O SMOKING, NO ILLE m

g s S
[ Ashiray [ Cig Lighter ] 8/Tye Hirer's Bignalure ——

] STD Toals 3 Jsck [ Hub Caps
[ Radio/Cass [ CO/Canrdges [—] S/RAIM Addition Driver's Signature

e agread 1o the larms and condiliona above, overleal end that all information given In rue & commect in oll respect. My/Our diiving licenco(s)
Iefare current and not disgqualified fram drbdng. You may charge all amount dus on the renlal to myfour credit card.
* IMPORTANT
p, DMLY PURBOSEY ABOVE ) YRR OF AGE WTTH WOME THAM } YEARS Do EXPEFIDNCE, AUTHORISED, LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS AGREEMENT WAY DAVE THE VEHIGLE
2, VISELE W FTRICTLY FOR MMOAPOIE USE ORLY AND WAY KOT BE DRVEN OUT OF SShGAPORE WITHOUT PR CONSENT OF THE OOMPANY PAYLESS ALTOFLEET RENTAL
4, PEAL TV O 380 FOR kivy LATE PAVIENT
o, 4TI AT OF AN ACCIOLNT. THE 16RER 0R AUTHISIEED DRER
(1 shall repon o Rockients srvuving Fi sakd velects 1o the Cwesr memedaily,
) shall isks imanadiale s % compiein and sign Foms AR 1 {biotor Acciient apon Form) and do a o scs required in compliance with B "NON INURY MOTOA ACCINENT REPORT
SCEHEME™ (i ot will be macdd wvalisbla whin the acciden ls rpor o e Drereic
(] shall rapont 1 i pafics within 24 houns fnm the totumnca, e ollewing hpes of accidens -
(8] impury cage;
] movinury cats invokang & Governmanl vahicle of damaga 1o Govemment ;
mmnﬁmngw.wpﬂﬁmm%mﬂnd““ﬂdﬂw.mmmm-ﬂum:
(Y Pér-ingury cadh Pvoling & pedesinan o oyclil

e
RETURM OF VEHICLE - THE HIRER / DAIVER 1§ AEGUIARED TO BIGN IN THE COLUMN SIGHATURE OF HIRER / DAIVER® FAILING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME
MSEATED BELOW SHALL 0 DEEMED TO BE THE DAY AMD TIME THE VEMCLE 18 RETURMED TO PAYLESS AUTOFLEET RENTAL AND THE SAME SHAL OE
ACCEPTED AS COMCLUENVE EVIDEMGE OF THE SAME AND SHALL MOT 8E CHALLEMGED OR QUESTIONED DM ANY ACCOUNT WHA

DATE IN | TIME IN | MILEAGE | CHECKED BY REMARKS DEPOSIT REFUND

Llos e :Ta\ Wo_Hhewoi

SIGNATURE OF HIRERDRIVER




GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

¢ Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore (48580
lHSME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam o Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Qur Ref No; GR-18-07TT518
Date of Request: 22052018 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase

Progressive Auto Ple Lid

Mo, 1 Kaki Bukit Ave & #02-48/50
AutoBay@EKaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Daar SirfMadam,

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

Enquiry Date 22052018
Enquiry By Sin Lai Mei
TP Vehicle No. GBA192ZTR
Accident Date 21104/2018
DESCRIPTION B ) | AMOUNT (S$) ]
TP Insurer Enguiry _ !._B?'-
GST Amount | 0.13]
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) ) B ] 200

Thank You

This is a compuler generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
¥ GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chague



