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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 11:36 AM

To: waisann

Cc: chumei@iora.com.sg; loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Thin 

Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR BREAKDOWN OF THE CLAIMER'S CLAIM LKK REF 

CC4/CTI18008951/Uua3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Waisan, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed of the below breakdown as claimed by the Third Party repairer. 

 

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $      2,675.00   

Loss of Rental ($296.00 x 6 days)  $      1,776.00  

GIA Search Fee $            31.00  

Incidentals $            88.00  

  TOTAL $      4,570.00  
    

 

 

Kindly note that the above breakdown is till subject for negotiation. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: waisann [mailto:waisann@iora.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 4:48 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: chumei@iora.com.sg; loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR BREAKDOWN OF THE CLAIMER'S CLAIM 

 

Hi Vic 
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I still haven’t get any update from you, hope you can reply me asap, thanks! 

 

Regards 

Wai sann  

 

From: waisann [mailto:waisann@iora.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 11:30 AM 

To: 'vicalpeh@lkkauto.com' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'chumei@iora.com.sg' <chumei@iora.com.sg>; 'loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg' <loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR BREAKDOWN OF THE CLAIMER'S CLAIM 

 

Hi Vic 

 

Any update for vehicle GBA 1927R’s claim breakdown? 

 

Thanks.  

 

Regards 

Wai sann  

 

From: waisann [mailto:waisann@iora.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June, 2018 1:13 PM 

To: 'vicalpeh@lkkauto.com' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'chumei@iora.com.sg' <chumei@iora.com.sg>; 'loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg' <loh_weikwang@iora.com.sg> 

Subject: REQUEST FOR BREAKDOWN OF THE CLAIMER'S CLAIM 

 

Hi Vic 

 

 

As spoken, kindly send us the breakdown of the claim of $4,570, thanks.  

 

Best Regards 

Wai SannWai SannWai SannWai Sann    

Assistant Manager 
Finance & Admin Department 
City Blue Boutique Pte Ltd 
No. 10Q Enterprise Road 
Enterprise 10 
Singapore 629841 
DID: (65)-6361 0039 
Tel:  (65)-6361 0001  
Fax: (65)-6265 3080 
Website: VIPRE Anti-phishing found a known bad URL in your email message. It was deleted or quarantined, 

depending on your settings, and replaced with this message. The anti-phishing setting is located in File>Settings 

under the Email Protection tab. 

  

*****Internet Email Confidentiality Footer***** 

This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may 

contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the 

reader of this message is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent responsible for delivering 

the message to the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or 

copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, 
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please notify us immediately by telephone, fax or email, and delete the message and all attachments. 

Thank you. 
 

 


