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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 1 June 2019 1:37 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020605      ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJU6053D 

AND GBE6982B ALONG AIRPORT BOULEVARD ON 12/5/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/LPC18008931/pa3

Attachments: Weekly Partner Statement - 2017-W52 ($567.20).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2018-

W04 ($2351.80).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2018-W09 ($2820.40).pdf; Weekly 

Partner Statement - 2018-W19 ($2906.40).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2018-W15 

($30.00).pdf; Weekly Partner Statement - 2018-W17 ($2485.80).pdf; Weekly Partner 

Statement - 2018-W14 ($2741.40).pdf; SJU6053 INV.pdf

Without prejudice  

 

Dear Hsiao Tong 

 

Video footage already given , your insured was going against traffic direction. 

 

We submit our claim as follow :  

  
Cost of repair                 $4,601.00 (FINALISED WITH SURVEYOR'S) 
Loss of Use                  $   560.00               ( 7Days @$ 80.00per day)  
LOSS OF EARNINSG        $  2450.00 
Total                           S$ 7,611.00 

 

Please revert your offer to settle. 
 

 

 

 

Thank you & Best  Regards, 

Jouis Seow  

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  

Singapore 539195. 

  

Tel        : (65) 62898126 

Fax       : (65) 62870590 

Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May 2018 12:54 PM 

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/18/VC00/020605 ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJU6053D AND GBE6982B ALONG 

AIRPORT BOULEVARD ON 12/5/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC18008931/pa3 

 




