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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4085933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R 35T Reg. Mo. 19-5607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

& SHENTON WAY #24-01

Ref : CS/ASM18008880/T1s3d3

AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811 S SRS |H||\I“"H"||||“mm
Code: ASM
i Policy Particulars ;- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh, Inspected YP 2593L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S8MO0HTQ Excess (§) 1,500.00
Assign From SMARTCLAIM (KITTY TEQ) Assign Date 16/0572018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/05/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD
BELK 3, PIONEER ROAD NORTH, #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457,
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE IS 88— {EST. AVERAGE)

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




sHEf2018 Claim Portal

<< Service Request Details

Claim
SEMOOHTQ

Reference

None &

Loss Date
May 14, 2018

Request Date
May 15, 2018

Due Date
May 22, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated workshop survey
Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
YP2593L

Make
MITSUBISHI

hitps:/ivp.smartclaims axa.com.sg/claim-partalhtmlfindex-vendor-servica-requests himi# sarvice-raquasis/?service RequastNumber=45516



5M6/2018

Claim Portal

SENVILE AUUNESD

Blk 3 Pioneer Road North, , , 628457

Primary Contact/Insured

HOTEL LAUNDRY PTE LTD

80 MARINE PARADE ROAD, #21-01 PARKWAY PARADE, 449269, Singapore
91159333

IRENE@DIINSURANCEAGENCY.COM.SG

Claim Handler

TED Kitty
6568804602
kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS $1500

Message Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics MNotes
TYPE (7]
SENT 5/15/18 10:15 PM
FROM TEOQ Kitty
SUBJECT Re:WP Survey - YP2593L - Veh @ Sng Ah Tee
BODY Hi Please also get estimate from workshop. Thank..,

4,

TYPE (7]
SENT 5/15/18 10:06 PM
FROM TED Kitty

hitps:/ivp.smartciaims. axa.com.sg/claim-portalhimiindex-vendor-service-requests. htmi#/service-requests/?serviceReguestNumber=45516



SM6/2018 Claim Portal
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hitps./ivp smartclaims. axa.com, sg/claim-peral/htmlfindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-raquests/ 7serviceRequestNumber=45516



G/25/2018 Claim Porial

&« Re:YP 2593L - REQUEST AUTHORIZATION

Type
© Question

Message
Hi Shirley, Please authorise.

hﬂps:.fa'up.smartc[aimﬁ,axa.:am.sg.fclaim-pnrtaifh!ml.'index-venﬂnr-samm—raquests.htrnl#.rsa rvice-reguests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumbe... 111



Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: ADMIN SAT <admin@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 3:03 PM
Ta: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: Re: YP 2593L OD [(AXA]}

Dear Shirley,

We accept the amount .
Thanks

Best Regards

Joyce Tan | admin@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD MORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

T —

From: Shirley Hi LEE A

Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 4:17 PM
To: 'ADMIN SAT

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: YP 2593L OD (AXA)

Dear Joyce,

As Spoken, instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding lump sum 56,500.00 {inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle
YP 2593L (Excess $ 1,500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*0Our client reserve their right_ not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933}



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 418 PM

To: "ADMIN SAT'

Cc sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: ¥P 2593L OD (AXA)

Dear loyce,

As Spoken, instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding lump sum $6,500.00 (inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle
YP 2593L (Excess 5 1,500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

«0ur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5408033

From: ADMIN SAT [mailto:admin@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Friday, 22 June 2018 4:32 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: Re: YP 2593L OD [AKXA)

Dear Shirley,

We accept the amount for lump sum $6,500
Thanks

JOYCE TAN | admin@sngahtee.com

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, June 19, 2018 4:29 PM
To: 'ADMIN SAT

Cc: suri@lkkauto.com

Subject: YP 2593L OD (AXA)



Hi Joyce,

As Spoken, kindly check whether you are able to repair the vehicle at Lump sump $6,500.00 .

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 14/06/2018
Survey Details:
Date of loss 14-May-18
Date of appointment 15-May-18
Date of survey 13-Jun-18
Location of survey BLK 3, PIONEER ROAD
NORTH, #01-18 SINGAPORE
B28457.
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Yehicle number ¥P 2593L
Make and Model MITSUBISHI FUSO
Date of registration 16/5/2016
Excess 1500
Market Value 584,000
Parf Rebate 535,180
Nett Loss 548,820
Repair details:
Initial Estimate 1 11605
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts 55,585
Check items (estimate) 51,660
Labour 51,650
Total £8,895
Lump Sum(if applicable) 5
[Number of days for repair | 7 DAYS ]
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Remarks:
PENDING PART PRICES . DAMAGES CONSISTENT,REPAIR
COST ECONOMICAL. WE HAVE NOT AUTH ORISE REPAIR.
Mandate:
Liability(TP) %
Proposed repair cost S
Loss of use 5 |no. of days
Loss of rental 5|no. of days
Loss of income S|no. of days
LTA search fees 5
Others 5
Proposed Total H#VALUE!
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IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1. Please repor] correctly (he details of the accident 1o s22ed up the claims process
2 Ths Form musl be completed by the Polcyholder andlor (ne Authorised Driver

1, Information pr
repudiate policy abiliby

4. Tha meus and accaptance of this Form by insurancs

5. Ay false reporting may be refermed to the Police for Investigation.

&. This repart will be farwarded by the insurers of tha Gl Records Managament Centr

archiving and that copies of this re

7.8y L

aforessd

Date Of Report
Date OFf Accident
Exacl Location Of Accident

Country/Slate of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mamea Of Registered Owner
Co Reg Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Altemative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

% PEpor 10 the insurars, you haseby consant o |\he archiving of this repart &l the ¢

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
15/05/2018 13:49
14/05/2018 20:00
ALONG GEYLANG RD
SINGAFPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
YP2593L

HOTEL LAUNDRY PTE. LTD.
200610139H
LINENEHOTEL181.COM.5G
(LOCAL) +65-23853090
OFFICE-63638181

MITSUBISHI
FMESTMSRDEC-7.5 D (M)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action 10 bae taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Numb.er
Driver

Mams of Drver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gandear

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMall Address

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

WO

F1730744

YAMNG UM

G2000289T

26/06/1970

QUTDOOR

27i06/2012

5 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83319914

MOEMAIL

the parl ¢ the iInswrance companing

cwidhpd must B as truthful and accurata as possible, Any witful misrepresentation or withalding of material facts may aliow nsurance COmpanas o

General Insurance Association of Singapons (G1&) for

entra ard 1o copies of ihe repod being made available

Page 1of 21



. Address 21 TUAS AVENUE 4
Postoode 639371

Vilas driver an employee of the Insurad's Company YES
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own -
Vehicla -

insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

Ganeral Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
\Was any fareign vehicle invalved in this accident?  NO

MWurmber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by uf‘.knnwn parson{s) MO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance,

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passenger 1 NAME: UNKNOWN
GENDER: MALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied to the police? (9]

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? WO
If Yes.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

ON 14/05/2018 AT ABOUT 2000 HRS. MY VEHICLE COME OUT FROM LOR 20 GEYLANG TOWARDS GEYLANG RD. MY
VEHICLE STATIONARY OUTSIDE OF THE YELLOW BOX. WHEN TRAFFIC LIGHT TURN TO GREEN , SUDDEMLY | FEEL AN
IMPACT FROM MY RIGHT SIDE, | NOTICED THAT VEHICLE B HIT ONTO MY VEHICLE.

Attachment{s)
Are accident pholos available for atlachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? )
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number GBCI802M

Vehicle Makehodel'Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicke Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver

NRIC/Passport Mumber

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

MWature Of Damage

Page 2 of 21



L Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH P

INMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleass report corpectly the detalls of the aceident to spesd up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3, Ipformation provided must be as L] rate ible. Any wilful misreprasentation or withholding of material
facts may allow Insurance companies to ate bility,

4. Theissue and scceptance of this Form by insursnce compenies is not an admission of policy [Esbility on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. false reporting may be referred to Paolice for investi

. The report will be forwarded by the nsurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Aszociation of Singapore (G14) for archiving and that roples of this report will for a fee be made avalizble upon application by

interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report 1e the insurers, you herehy consent ta the archiving of this report at the cantre and to copies of
the report being made avallable sforesaid,

%, Consentunder the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agres and consent that:

{a] My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurence Associztion of Singapore {"GIAY) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclnse and/er process my personal data/personal infarmetion set aut in this |ferm] and zny other persoral information
provided by me or possessed by iy insurer {collectively the "Persanal Infarmation”) and disclose and transfer such

pParsgnal information to all insurer(s) wha have insured vehicleds) involved in this accident {all Insurer{sh who have insured

vehicle{s] involved in this accident shall be collacthvely relerred to as the “Insurers”), the Imsurars’ [awyersiaw firms, the

pionetary Autherity of Singapare and any relevant govarnment agency/authorlty {such as the police], for the purpose(s)

of:

ii) processing, handling and/ar degling with my claims including the settiement of the claims and any necassary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i} investigating the accident and/ar my clalms;

i) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enguiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims (including the malling of correspondence, statements, invaices, reparts or notices to me,

whieh could invelve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delhvary of the same as well 35 on the

external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/fer

[v) complying with applicabie law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposas”)

{b) 2ll insureris} who have insured vehicle|s) invelved In this accidant and the Insurers’ fawyers/law firms, may/are permitizd

to collect, use, distlose and/or process my Personal Infarmation for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{e} my Personal Infarmation may/can be diselosad by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or

apents|including their Ewyers/law firms], which may ba sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the abowe Purposes.

{d) my Persanal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all futisre claims.

{2) theinformation so collected under {d} above may be shared [ disclosed:

{il o all insurers and/for any other third parties that zssist in evaluating, Investigating, controlling or menaging fraug,
regulatars, law enforcement and gevernmant apencies as regsonably required for the purpoies stated, or

b

[ii} for complying with requirements under any regulations, |aws or court orders,

o |4

Policyhoider's Slgnature Oriver's Signature Reporting Centre-Fersannel's Signature
Date & Tirme: {if driver Is not the pelicyhobder) Mama:
Oate & Time! NRIC/FIN Mo

CHECH MY POLICY FOR MORE DETAILS.

T

i ) LR L 1= D

[ | AU AVVARED THATMY IN SURSR MAY HAVE A 14 DAY S TRIEFRAM E FOR ME TO SUEM IT AH OWN CAMAGE CLAIM UHDER MY CWT POLICY. I'vaLL

Page 461 21



> Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Company

013%9H

YP2593L

No

31 May 2018
MITSUBISHI

FUSO FM&5FM2RDEB
White

2016

6M60215185
FM&5FMA30088

$61,068.00
16 May 2016
16 May 2016
0

$3,054.00

Mo

$0.00

15 May 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$44,213.00

$35,180.00
$35,180.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 May 2018

Fatmq e
)

11R27-§



rE WORK PERMIT

Emplayrment of Forekgn Manpower Act [Chaptar G14)

Sileare

Rapublic of GEpare
Trpicy e =
Y HOTEL MANAGENENT PTE- LTO.
A
YOG JUN
; Wioel Pl To; Seakos
| :
el o 74750328 SERVIGE
L]

Kot113a05

VISIT PASS
* immigration Regulstions
Ham
T Claszs 1
Dewrnicad SGWorkFass
Zih App lo ohaok wta
GRO002EET ¥ Classd
Datw =1 Birt 3
28-08-4070 L]
Nouohainy
CHINESE
¥ WULTIPLE JOURNEY ViSh SSUED Elw
] YOU ARE TO SLEREXDER THS CARD WHENIT |5 CANCELLED
TS DR HAB EXPIRED, OR WHEN & NEW CARD ¥ ISSUED T0 Y OU

REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE DRIVING LICENC

mevm | ygU ARE LICENSED TO DRIVE VEHICLES N THE FOLLOWING CLASSIES

EFFECTIVE DATE
Mabar cars wrin uniaden waignt == 3J000kg with =<7 18 Feb 212
CASSanNJETs. pxclusiva & drivar; and other moior
wymhigies with unladen weight =« 2500kg
Miotor vehicias which are conatructad 10 carry load 27 Jun 2072

or passengers end the unigden weight = 2
Moot vehicies which ane nol constructed 1o an?
sard or pessengers and e uniaden welght == T250kg

e}



HOTEL LAUNDRY PTE LTD

_ 80 Marine Parade Road #21-01 Parkway Parade
Singapore 449269 Tel: (63) $3461959 Fax: (65) 63461970
ROC: 200610133H

RE : Letter of Authorise

Dear Sir / Madam .
[ hereby confimed that we have authorise Driver Yang Jun ( Fin : G2000289T ) o drive our

Company Truck of YP2593L.

Thanks.

Yours faithfully,

T / i

[ aundry Operations Manager

Daniel Sim
9385 3090




M redefining / insurance

LETTER OF UNDERTAKING/ AUTHORIZATION FOR LUMP SUM REPAIR

1. I, [Name] [NRIC] HOTEL (AunDRY PTe LTD . the owner/
authorized driver of vehicle [Registration No.] _ M2 S 3[ (“Vehicle') do hereby
authorize the Workshop/insurar] to repair the Vehicle on a lump sum basis instead of part
by part.

2. The [Workshop/insurer] has explained to me the difference between lump sum repair and
part by part repair and the consequences of my authorization for lump sum repair for the
Vehicle,

3. |understand that with lurmp sum repair, the Warkshop may use a mixture of genuine parts,
original equipment manufacturer (OEM) parts, reconditioned and second hand parts to

carry out the repair and | note that the [Workshop/Insurar] will not be furnishing a detailed
breakdown of pars or price for such lump sum repair.

4. | am aware that AXA Insurance Pte Lid ("AXA Insurance") does not encourage lump sum
repair as AXA Insurance strongly recommends repairs for vehicles on a part by part basis
for transparency reasons. | confirm that | will hold AXA Insurance harmiess from any claims
arising from the lump sum repair of the Vehicle which | have authorized.

5 " To be applicable where person authorizing is the authonized dnver.

| confirm that | have the authority from the owner of the Vehicle to authorize the lump sum
repairs and that | have duly notified the owner of the Vehicle of the contents of this Letter
of Authorization,

Signed and acknowledged by:
72N

Signature of policyholder/ authorized driver* and company stamp (where applicable)
Date:

Date:

*authorized driver to elther the named drivers as per motor insurance pelicy or in the case of commercial
vehicles, pemmitted drivers who are pemmitted to drive the insured Vehicle,
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SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD

Blk 3, Pioneer Road North, #01-18 Singapore 628457
Tel: 6268 6183 (4 Lines) Fax: 6268 1429
Email: sngahtee@singnet.com.sg

Website: www.sngahtee.com
RCB. Reg. / GST Reg. No: 200810440N

AXA Ref: SBMDOHTQ

Dzte 3052018

ATTN:THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
78 SHENTON WAY #B81-01
AxA TOWER SINGAPORE 068811

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR
Vehicle Reg No.  YP2593L Madel [ Year MIT.FUSO FMES
Date of Accident  14-May-18 Palicy No. CNE27400
Type of Claim  Own Damage Preparad By JOYCE
Chassis FMESFMZRDEE

S/INO Description

e TR B

=
L

14
15
16
1

18

FRT BUMPER

FRT HEADLAMP (RH)

FRT HEADLAMP BRACKET(RH)
FRT FOGLAMP(RH)

FRT CORNER PANEL (RH)

FRT STEP GARNISH (RH)(TOP)
FRT WHEEL ARCH(RH) GARNISH
FRT DOOR (RH)

FRT DOCR SIGNAL LAMP(RH)
FRT HEADLAMP PANEL(RH)
FRT DOOR RR PANEL(RH)

FRT DOOR " BLUE TEC" STICKER{RH)

TO CHECK WIRING
TO REMOVE & REFIX FRT DOOR RR PANEL (RH)GLAE

Qty Unit Price Amount

1 $130000 § 130000 F/~
1§ 70000 $ 700007
1 % 18000 & 160,007
1 § BOODOO & 800.007
1 § 85000 $ 850.00° 7
2 § 25000 S 500-00 Sk~
> § 75000 $ Lsaﬁfmﬁuf
1 §320000 $ 32000077
1+ % 7500 § 75.00 Cvd
1 % S - i\,-,m
1 $ " 5 T o
f.
1 % 1000 § m.um”‘épr—:mm NETT
§ 0924500 ‘ot
1 3000 $ 30.00 «
1 8000 5 BO.O0 GO

$
$
§ 20000 $
$
$

TO REMOVE & REFIX FRT DOOR GLASS(RH) 1 200.00 £®
TO KNOCK FRT DOOR PILLAR(RH),FRT WHEEL ARCH~ 1 §- 380:00 8 +66:00
FRT WHEEL ARCH PANEL,WELD, ————————=""1 95000 §  950.00 407
REMOVE & FIX ON ABOVE PARTS — 5 -
70 PUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTEDARE, 1  §1,00000 _§ 100000 $o°
TOTAL $ 1160500 | 755
*E’T{"" {}ql\.rl'\b Lot (M A& Pr’”’tw ]
LEEM_MM;M Pator gaHen [L1TOv JV‘W‘ lagaved udinTE
the Repairer of the following: o 5, Wi Lu-ﬂhm'l‘:@‘. Avivey awd allows fo
= T regurvey befomafir Spay [ty

« To displey damaged part(s) during resursay

i 5ei '@ S0 LS TR el no s gnatute: s reguited
r « Third party survey s on a “Wilhou! Prejudce” hanis
= No fllegal modification(s]} & aflowad

« Supplementary ilem(s) must be resurveyed and
i subtect fo final approval from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Regairer
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