KIAN TEONG AUTO CENTRE

Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #01-08, Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721

Tel: 64556268  Fax: 64555166

TO: AXAINSURANCE DATE: 11/06/2018

ATTN:MOTOR CLAIM DEPT YOUR REF: CCA/ASM18008834

RE: LETTER OF DEMAND

Please find below breakdown claim of the vehicle no: SLT9339S

Repair cost: $1,819.00 (INCL GST)
Loss of used: 2days x $100.00 = $200.00
Search Fees: $7.49

Total amount: $2,026.49

Your kind assistance on above matter would be appreciated
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Thanks & kg:gards. o

Wendy Siew — Mobile: 91786498



KIAN TEONG AUTO CENTRE

Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #01-08

Sin Ming AutoCare Singapore 575721

Tel No. : 64556268 Fax No.: 64555166

E-Mail : info@ktauto.com.sg

Website : www.ktauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 52991859E Buss. Reg. No. : 52991859E

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
143 CECIL STREET #01-01 GB BUILDING
069542

Tax Invoice : KT046156

Invoice Date : 11/06/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLT 9339 S
Make/Model : VOLKSWAGEN TIGUAN 2.0T

Mileage(Km) :
Contact : 6338 1288/68804635 Fax No. : 6338 2522 PO/WO/RO# :
Ref./Remark :
S/N  Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S$
1. ACCIDENT REPAIR 1,700.00 1,700.00
SingDollars : One Thousand Eight Hundred Nineteen Only
E. & Q& Total S$ : 1,700.00
4 GST@7% S$: 119.00
Amount Due S$ : 1,819.00
- Terms : Cash
[
Customer's Signature/Co. Stamp for KIAN TEONG AUTO CENTRE

Cheque must be crossed and made payable to "Kian Teong Auto Centre"



-

Land [!:ilw-h:‘ﬂx

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 14 May 2018 / 10:35:39
Receipt Date/Time : 14 May 2018/ 10:35:39
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | ITNET-00000-180514-000572
Previous Receipt No
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S%) (S$) (S%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKL6371X
As at 02 May 2018/23:59:00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SKLE371X
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20180514103406821917
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
Credit Card: Visa
XXX XXX XX 3092 Mastercard 7.45
Total 7. 45
- Cash Change - 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



http://mail.ktauto.com.sg/print/printmessage

RE: Pre-repair- SLT9339S 20180502 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM18008834/ma3
5/16/18 4:14 PM

From: "Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)" <bevanlim@Ikkauto.com>
To: "info@ktauto.com.sg" <info@ktauto.com.sg>

Cc: "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=, assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>, "Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)" <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,
We further to our email below.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned

case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of
our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor

should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

PR

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 May 2018 7:24 PM

To: info@ktauto.com.sg

Cc: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-repair- SLT9339S 20180502 *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM18008834/ma3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

1 of 3 5/18/2018, 9:24 AM



