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From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Chee Ling,

The market value of SLB 6328M is $24K-$26K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron chen I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Yap Chee Ling Imailto:CheeLing.Yap@income.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 15 May 2018 3:12 PM

subject: RESEND: SLB6328M I MT/0994191 - MV Requisition

Hi,

Any updates please?

Tha nk you.

Yap Chee l-ing (Ms)

Claims Executive
Motor lnsurance

f +65 6430 7893

www,income.com.sg

u rncglrE

EtrEE
From: Yap Chee Ling

Sent: Tuesday, May L5, 2018 9:14 AM

Subiect: SLB5328M I MT/0994191 - MV Requisition

lmportance: High

Hi,

Please advise on the MV as at May 2018.

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 1 5 May 2018 3:23 PM

'Yap Chee Ling'; SUR

RE: RESEND: SLB6328|\4 | MT/0994191 - MV Requisition



Vehicle Details
Vehicle No. SLB6328M

Vehicle to be Exported Yes

lntended De-registration Date 16 May 2018

Vehicle Make TOYOTA

Vehicle Model VIOS 1.5E A

Primary Colour Blue

Ma nufacturing Year 2006

Engine No. 1N2X519936

Chassis No. M R053 HY4204217811

Maximum Power Output 80.0 kW (107 bhp)

Open Market Valu e $72,237 .O0

OriginalRegistration Date 24 Apr 2007

First Registration Date 24 Apr ZOQT

Transfer Count 3

Actual ARF Paid S13,461.00
lntended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount 50.00
lntended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 31 Mar 2022

COE Category A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Yea rs) 5

PQP Paid 524,715.00
COE Rebate Amount 519,147.00
Total Rebate Amount S19,147.00
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon

COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier'

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 May 2018

Thank you.

Yap chee Ling (Ms)

Claims Executive

Motor lnsurance
r+65 6430 7893

www.income.com.sq
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Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)

named above. lf you have recelved this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies

of it. Thank you.
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
Subject:

Hi,

Any updates please?

Thank you.

Yap Chee ting (Ms)
Claims Executive
Motor lnsurance

r+65 6430 7893
www.income.com.sg

(r IncgffE

EtrEtr
From: Yap Chee Ling

Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 9:14 AM
subject: SLB6328M I MT/0994191 - MV Requisition
lmportance: High

H;,

Please advise on the MV as at May 2018.

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No. SLB6328M

Vehicle to be Exported Yes

lntended De-registration Date 16 May 2018
Vehicle Make TOYOTA

Vehicle Model VIOS 1.5E A

Primary Colour Blue

Manufacturing Year 2006
Engine No. 1N2X519936
Chassis No. M R053 HY4204217811
Maximum Power Output 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market valu e 512,237 .Oo

Original Registration Date 24 Apr 2007
First Registration Date 24 Api-20o7
Transfer Count 3

Actual ARF Paid S13,461.00
lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

1

Yap Chee Ling < CheeLing.Yap@income.com.sg >

Tuesday, 1 5 May 2018 3:12 PM

RESEND: SLB6328M I MT/0994191 - MV Requisition
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PARF Rebate Amount 5O.OO

lntended COE Rebate Details , I ttrt
COE Exoirv Date 31 Mar 2022 ' I '
COE Category A - Car (1500cc & below)
COE Period(Yea rs) 5

PQP Paid 524,715.00
COE Rebate Amount 519,147.00
Total Rebate Amount $19,147.00
Message

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon
COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 15 May 2018

Tha nk you.

Yap Chee Ling (Msl
Claims Executive
Motor lnsurance
r +65 6430 7893
www.income.com.sq
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Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential Information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)

named above. lf you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately a nd delete all copies

of it. Thank you.
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. i. l-= '.t- :: Auto
:rt j3 -4=: consuttan1a

;.:i.,,.i4E .sF !i. Pte Ltd Company Regislration No. 199607198R

sl UBI AvE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARI! SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6255 3561 FAX: (055) 6256 4315

Your Ref
Our Ref

: MT10994191
: CV/INC18008807Nvs2 Date: 16th May 2018

NTUC Income In$urance Co-OperatiYe Ltd
73 Bras Basah Road
#05-01 NTUC Trade Union House
Singapore 189556

Attn: Yap Chee Ling

Dear Sir/Madam,

RE: Vehicle No. SLB 6328M (Make : TOYOTA VIOS I.sE A Year of Registration: 2007)

Accident Date: ;

We refer to your enquiry on 15/05/2018

Please be informed of the following:

Market Value (Est.): 5$24.000/: to 5$26.000/=

1as at MAY)

Enclosed please find our invoice for your necessary action.

Yours faithfully,

L\a\c

DIscLAtMER OF LlABtLtTy TO THTRD PART|ESi Th]S Reoort iq madg so]elv Jor the use and benelit Qf lhe client named on the

in contract or toi, ls.accepted to anv thl! l-{l:P T:J 
t"lv 

""t#ffiffih"tv ffi-p"rt. Any thi;d party aciing oiretying on lhis Reporl, in whole or in part, does so at his or het own risk'


