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51 UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL - (b45) 62563561 FAX : (B65) 6156-1.. 3;5
Your Ref: TBA Date: 22/5/2018

Our Ref® C5/GAI18008743/K1ib

The Motor Claims Department
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sirs/Mdm
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHAS8611J.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on  14/5/2018 at the premises of M/s __ CDGE Lovang__ and have the following to
report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount (8% 542544
Revised Estimate Amount 158 295544
Check™ Items Amount :S§ 1.430.60
Market Value 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value - 5% -
MNett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained at the front
portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damage consistent

Yours faithfully
Kalvin
Motor Surveyor



Catherine Chonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sqg.gaig.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 May, 2018 1:46 PM

To: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar

Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin; LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: SHABG11) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS
Attachments: SHAB611).PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Fauzy
Our policyholder has not made GIA report, will arrange for PRI on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK
Please accept assignment for TP survey. Attached.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Monday, May 14, 2018 1:38 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: [External] SHAB611) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS

Hi Motor Claims,

Flease refer attached GIA report and estimate to arrange survey.
The taxi was Grounded Loyang workshop on 14.05.18

With Regards

Fauzy Bin Mokhtar

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Taxi Crash Repair Department

OID : 6214- 8318

FAX:: 6546-8156

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and mav be Iegally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this c-mail 5 strictly prohibited. I vou receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its atachments.



Denise Tal (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 1:19 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Tan, Rachel’; ‘Fauzy Bin Mokhtar

Cc: '‘Jumani Bin Masudin’; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SHAB611) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SHA 8611).pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHA 8611)

Please provide claim number

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay(@|kkauto.com | fax: B256-4315
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933})

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 May 2018 2:06 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel’ <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; 'Fauzy Bin Mokhtar' <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>

Cc: 'Jumani Bin Masudin' <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SHA8611) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assigment

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 May 2018 1:46 PM

To: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com>

Ce: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>; LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHAB611) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS

Without Prejudice

Dear Fauzy
Our policyholder has not made GIA report, will arrange for PRI on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK
Please accept assignment for TP survey. Attached.



MCDE150620ES ! ComferDelGeo Enginacting Pl 1Lid - Loyang
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 141052018 0505
SUBMITTED BY; Catharine Par May Juan

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Praase raport cofreclly tha detalls of the accident io spasd up the claims process.
2 This Form must be competed by e Policyhalder andfar ihe Authuriscd Driver,

3 Information provided must be as frutnful and accuraie as pessible, Any witiul misrepresentation or withalding of material facts may allow insurancs companes ta

repudiate pohcy ahility.

4 The issue and accaptance of this Farm by iNSUFANCE COMPANES |5 ok an

5. Any lalse reporting may o referred to the Police for investigation.

& This repor will be forwarded by the insurers of the GilA Records

archiving and INAL CONEs ol Uis report will, for a fee, he made avai
7. By the lodgement af this repeet to the insurers, you heraby consent o the archiving of this report at the coenirs and to copies of the repoa D

aforesaid

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

admission of policy kability on the parl of the insurance co

Managemem Centre asiablished by the General Insuranco Association of Singapore (518 foa

labie upon application by infarested parbes.

14/05/2018 09:05
12/05/2018 13:20

BARTLEY RD TWDS3 HOUGANG AVE 3 JUPP PAYA LEBAR RD

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Wehicla Registration Number SHABE11J

Insured/Policyholder

name Of Registered Owner
Co Reqg Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
far repair o your vehicla?

If No. Pleasa state aclion to be laken
Wehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company

Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Policy Mumber

Cover Note Mumber

Driver

Mame of Driver
MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Geander

nobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumber

EMail Addrass

CITYCAB PTELTD
1995028396
FLEETSAFEW@CDGT.&XLCDM.SG

OFFICE-B5508768

HYUNDAI
140

NO

THIRD PARTY
TAXI

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURAMCE LTD
THIRD PARTY FIRE ANDIOR THEFT
YES

D-1808893TMFSH

NG JOO MONG

512674182

0&/05/M1957

OUTDOOR

26041977

41 YEARS AND O MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +55-96193857

NOEMAIL

girg macde available
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Address 2608 #03-450 SENGKANG EAST WAY
Postcode 542260
VWas driver an emplayce of the Insured's Company MO

if No. Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - TAXI DRIVER

wehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own =
Vehicle <

Insurance Company of Oriver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Mumber of vehicles invalved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed 10 hospital by

ambulance? NO

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approachad by unknown parson(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NG
Mumber of Passengers {Including Driver) 4
Passanger 1 NAME: L 3

GENDER: : MALE

Passenger 2 NAME: e

GENDER: FEMALE

Passanger 3 MAME: ;

GENDER: : MALE
Details of Police Action
\Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? N
If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
SEE ATTACH.
Attachment(s)
Are accident pholos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Romarks/ Reasons: -

\Was there any audio recorded? MO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
vehicle Registration Number GZ1712C
vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Detalls Of Properties
Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number

Page 2 of 12



Contact Number
Address
Poslcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger {Including Driver)

RHT REAR
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Sketch Plan Pg. 2

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Pk

Plaace roport correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
Thie Forem must be compl sied hy the Policyholdar and/or the Authorised Driyer,

_ Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurake as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
d oy Makility.

facts may allow insurance cam panies to Mﬂm_lhﬂﬂ!

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies ks not an admission of poficy [iaksility an the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reperting ma ha refe ta the Police for investigation.

&. The report will be forwarded by the Insurers aoff the GLA Records Managemeant Centre established by the Geperal Insuranca
Assoclation of Singapere [G1A) for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interastod parties.

7. fiy the lodgment of this report to the ingurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the repart being mate available aforesaid,

B, Consent under the personal Data Protection Act {POPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

[a) My insurer, my waorkshap and the General Insurance Association of Singapore {“GLA) may/are permitted 1o collect, use,
disclose and/far process my personal data,/personal Information set out in this [farm] and any other persanal information
provided-by me of possessed by y insurer (coflectively the “parsonal information”] and disclose and transfer such
Personal Informetion to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s] involved in thic accident (all insurer{s) who have insured
wehiclels) invalved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Manetary Autharity of Singapore and any relevant government agency/autharity (such as the police), for the purposels)
of:

(i} processing, handling andjor dealing with my claims including tha settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the clalms;

{ii} irvestigating the accident and/for my claims;

{ili} carrylng out and/for dealing with my instructions or respending to any enquiries by me;

{iv) edministering miy claims (Including the maifing of correspandence, slatements, Invaices, reports or notices 1o me,
which could invelve disclosure of certain personal data sbout me to bring ebout deflvery of the same as well as an the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

{v) complying with applicable tew in administzring, processing, handling and/for dealing with my clzims.(collectively the
“Purposes”]

(b} all insurer{s) who have insured vehice(s) imvolved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
ta collect, use, disclose and/or process oy personal Information for one oF more of the above Purposas; and

[c) vy Personal inforrnation may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/ar GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including their laweyersflaw firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one oF more of the ahove Purposes.

{d) my Personal Informaticn will also be ceilected and used to compile claims histary for the purpose of fraud detection,
jrvestigation and management in present and alil future claims.

{e} the infarmation so cellected under (d] abave may be shared / disclosad:

(i} toall insurers andfer any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, contralling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government egencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{if) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

8 -
% D ?
L chBPIEL e

, HEG, NO. 199502839G y

Fo;IiI:-.-nnlder's Signatura Driver’'s Signature - Reporting Centre Personnel’s Si,gnalture

frate & Tima: [If driver is not the policyholder] Name:

Diate & Time: MRIC/FIN Na.:
GiaAC SketthPlsaform Vi 1
g bt
bee 8 L]
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w J RE: SHA8611J - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS

™ Tan, Rachel |0 Fauzy Bin Mokhtar 14/05/2018 01:48 PM
*—J Jumani Bin Masudin, LKK Assignments

*Tan, Rachel" <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com=
Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com=

it kkau
1 attachment

SHABE11J.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Fauzy
Our policyholder has not made GIA report, will arrange for PRI on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK
Please accept assignment for TP survey. Attached.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

Fram: Fauzy Bin Mokhtar <fauzy@sparkcarcare.com=>

Sent: Monday, May 14, 2018 1:38 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com=
Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: [External] SHA8611) - TP CLAIMS > GZ 1712C - GREAT AMERICAN INS

Hi Motar Claims,

Please refer attached GIA report and estimate to arrange survey.
The taxi was Grounded Loyang workshop on 14.05.18

With Regards

Fauzy Bin Mokhtar

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Taxi Crash Repair Department

DID : 6214- 8319

FAX:: 6546-8156

The content of this e-mail message and any atiachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If
you are not the intended recipicnt, be ady ised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. It you



OMFORIDELCRO DA ety P L
ENGI NEERING :-:Ial;nrkh:heu—p: A0 GEAD Facsimile + 65 6280 9756

59 Loyang Orive Singanore $|JI?:91:'.E 2 24 Bangha Lood Singapore 758158
. S O . o s
membar of COMFORIDELGRO Date/Time: *14 (05 :20T8%09: 57 Page : 1
am: ARC Repair TP(CFS0)1 JOB CARD sSales Order: 3824045 Jc NO305159741
“OMER T REGN ND 06117 5 | miLEAGE B
CITYCAE PTE LTD _
2 7010070 MAKE HYUNDAI Sl ;
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 '1-40 12.0875018 4:15
I:R:I 55551158 {0] YR DFﬂi’“"é‘ 2015 TARGET DATE
- 04,
CHASSIREO0E 4 GOMPLETION DATE/TIME:
SUNT CARD NO. | 1UMGU083806 |

OB DESCRIPTION
scident Date: 12.05.201€

ATURE: 3P 12.05.18/B-

/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION

IKED & PASSED OUT BY:

SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE

T
Aedgament Slip Exit Pass
Wahicle No.:
SHAB611J FZ GAIC SHAB611J
f Sarvice Advisor - Signatura/Date I Mame of Ser\r'n:a. Advisor Date )
furnad to Service Reception upon collection To bie kept by Security Guard®




CITY CAB PTE LTD N
RLP!\]R ESTIMATE ; Ifr 0 >, '},.» Y ‘r;,f. I(__.f ‘,"J N - I."._ —
VEHICLE NO : SHA 8611, I £ ' DATE 14/5/2018 11:41 / ~
MAKE ._;— =, gl - 2, A -‘;' - .
MODEL : HYUNDAL 40—
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover -~ P4 - $§ 56230
Front Bumper Sponge _'XJ“ $ 142.20
Front Bumper Reinforcement %"" ! 526.10
Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) f_‘ﬁl""‘ 5 22.40
Front Bumper Bracket (LH) - ¢™ 5 24.60
Headlamp Support Panc] Assy S 1.067.50
Headlamp (LH) ~— het 5 1.388.00
Front Fender (LH) ¢~ . $  619.00
Front Fender Shield (LH) € ¥* S 169.80
Front Fender Retainer % '{: 5 9.20
Frt Wheel Hub CapLH 3 ° §  150.70
SUB TOTAL 5 4.6081.80
LESS 20% 5 936.36
DISCOUNTED TOTAL % 374544
Frt Fender Advertisement Logo (LH) s 5 100.00 [Nett
S 100.00

Labour Charge

Panel Beating

Spray Painting Charge

Wiring Charge

Tull Kote

Remove/Refix Aircon & Refill Gas
Frt Wheel Alignment

TOTAL LABOUR

B 1) j‘i"]

|5lp—erf'.>¢"'*
Rﬂ)]ﬁ"rxr'l

S

b 4

g M lo
b

b

o

S 1.580.00

5,425.44

Pl % T - a ! :.&I' e - 3
This is an initial esimate based on a visual mspa:umLuf-thc-am:c!c. The final repair quantum will
be prepared afier the vehicle 1s surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the msurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 21.05.2018

Time: 18:13:52
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: 1
COMPAINY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO : 305159741
CUsTOMAER: 7010070 REGN NO . SHASB611]
ADDRESS : CITYCABPTELTD MILEAGE 1 0000000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE : HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL ¢ 140
65551188 DATE OF REGN ;o 21.04.2016
DATETIME IN ¢ 12052018 14:15
ACCIDENT DATE : 12052018
JOBIPARTS DESCRIPTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-2322-A  [40V3 BUMPER W LIF & FOG 1 56230 20,00 449.84
0002 04-01-0103-0781-A  140V2 LAMP ASSY-HEAD LH# 1 1.388.00 20,00 1,110.40
0003 04-01-0103-0574-A  140VC PANEL-FENDER LH+ 1 61900 20.00 49520
0004 04-01-0103-0637-G  140V2 BRKT ASSY-FRBPRUP 1 24,60 2000 19.68

SUB-TOTAL : 2,073.12

JOB NATURE

0000 20-05 RENEW ADVERTISMENT REAR FENDER LH 100.00
0001 L PANEL BEATING 400.00

0002 L SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 360.00

0003 L WIRING CHARGE 20,00

0004 L TUFF KOTE 20.00

SUB-TOTAL : 900.00



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 21.05.2018

Time: 18:13:52
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: 2
COMPATNY: THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO ;305159741
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO : SHAB611)
ADDRESS: CITYCAB PTELTD MILEAGE ¢ 0000000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE : HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL : 40
65551188 DATE OF REGN : 21.04:2016
DATETIME IN + 12052018 14:15
ACCIDENT DATE v 12052018
JOB/PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT
TOTAL o 2,975.12

= o AUTHORISED : YES / NO
MVA NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE : DATE:




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Qur Job Ref Mo 305159741
g ComiertDalling Enginearing Pla Lid
Date 3 2105208 50 Loyang Drive Singapore S08569
Faax: 6546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Famn :
Aln KALVIN
Vehicle Reg Mo. @+ SHABB11J Date of Accident : 12.05.2018

The survey and estimales of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows -

1. The repar job shall bill to: GREAT AMERICAN — GZ1712C

2z The finalized amount shall be:

{a)  Spare Parts after List discount $2.075.12
{b)  Labour Charges $900.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $2.975.12

(c.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost alter Less: 20% £0.00
Final Lumpsum Repalr cost 20.00
3 Estimated normal period for repairs: ] working days.

4, We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within
7 working days

3. Thank you for your assislance. We confirm the estimates and

finalzed amount

Signature ; Signature :

: Hom
Name : FAUZY BIN MOKHTAR Name k,} b
Tel ;62148319 Date Blr[<
Fax . B546B156

For Official Use Onlby

Document
Item Amount Attached {csmﬂ;t::'; Reamarks
Yes or No b
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fes 7.49
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
8 Owerrun

Remarks:




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
am——— TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CSI/GAI18008743/K1tbn2
T
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date ©  28-05-2018
SINGAPORE 0351580
Code: GAI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GZ 1712C Veh. Inspected SHA 8611
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVC000003236 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 14/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUOBE806 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 286351 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE NIS FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/05/2018 Inspection Date 14/05/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 8611J

3 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {;} [!JII
P NT OF PART

1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 562 .30 562.30
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE SERVICEABLE 142.20 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 526.10 -
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH) SERVICEABLE 22.40 -
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH) CRACKED 2480 24 60
1|HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL ASSY SERVICEABLE 1,067.50 .
1|HEADLAMP (LH} GRAZED 1,388.00 1,388.00
1|FRONT FENDER (LH) DENTED 619.00 619.00
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD (LH) SERVICEABLE 169.80 -
1|FRONT FENDER RETAINER SERVICEABLE 9.20 -
1|FRT WHEEL HUB CAP LH SERVICEABLE 150.70 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -936.36 -518.78
3,745.44 207512

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH)(SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00

LABOUR

PANEL BEATING. 850.00 400.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 400,00 360.00
WIRING CHARGE. 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 20.00
REMOVE/REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS. NOT MECESSARY 150.00 -
FRT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT MECESSARY 80.00 -
1,580.00 B00.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,425.44 2,975.12
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 2,975.12|
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