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From (Ferson): :f_t;t Pu L = of Eed Diatef/Time: JB’SI- \faglﬂ;__
Estimsied Cosl: o Bill o
O WE T RES 7 OD RES | EVA [ INV [ MV 7 C5
To Inspect Vehicle Mo QA IR B mswred: _ RLE X268,
ot Workshop mfs  QMERT Tel:_ 4331 09£8
of_ 60 Qeodlands \nd Pk EY- o . .
TPolicy bio: Clamm Mo
Sum Insured: Excess:

Make of Veh: poa__ashlek
{Client's Tecard) =
CA [ REV | REP. / REV 24 1IRS

HALEY, Endorsement:

—. _ PemonConlssled: . Vehicle INJOUT
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REF:

LRI

]
Friom Date:
Estimated Cost!

ODJTP/WS/TPRES/ODRES/EVAIINVIMY

To Inspect Vehiclg No
at Workshop mi's

o

Insured,

Palicy No

Claims No.

Sum Insured Excess

(Cliant's Record)
Make of Yen

{Palicy Candition)

AbSTGNMENT

g 1e? s (rRegn Jud | Juele
Tyna: M.Car | M.Cycle | 0R Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |

Yah Mo

Truck ! Trailer o
Make: Meccecdeg Pena (taro
Colour Mk - Colaar
SpReading [HOCC2TF km
Q0293 EC jig) 3T

CiNe. WEB{12oFf323130022
Gan, Cond: @d | Fair { Poor{ Burnt

ce €3TH

&G Insured [ Std / NI MNA
T/Radio: Insurad | Std [ M1 NA

Engito

Stearing: IngFder | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
|arder | Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or
Modi - @D I SIRim | STD A/Rim or

r 27s[76c R22S
R: J?Ff’h) R22:C

Erake:

Tyra Size:

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | 8 | | BS/DUN/EXNOVA [ GY | FS 1 LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | PIR / SUMI
repair at the time of ingpection. ¥| Tovo!vYoko o G._,“{_;ﬂ endal
Bal. or Market Value Eront Hear
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No R/Bal, A mm R/Bai, (e mm
Gla ) PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No LiBal & mm L/Bal i ,'5 mm
Est Repairs  days Res: Yesor No DOA _13;5. !’am? DOl ,".a.fl.-'g}-f;.e T
Lum Sur: % 3Val: Yes or No Survey held at
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages - Frt | Rear | O/S | NIS | UIC [ Rooftop or
Vehicle: IN/OUT 0fs kear
Date:  Person Contacled; The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision
Date | Time Action | Instruction

RECEIVED 2 § JUN 2018

———

DaeTime, File Pass ko7

Ao

DiataiTime, Flla Raturn o7

: Preli. Report

m: Final Report

”
=)

P
83

Report Format
Lump Somr? LB {5

Add Fee:

Days Of Repair: pi
Resurvey No. of Trip: | Survey Fas
Transpartation
‘Sita Insp {$ | &uRE_ -3
D Intarisw (9 Pt
E Tech, lnvs (%
D Waekend $

;




! UU Auto

- - Consulianis
Rl A B Pha Lid

51 UKL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 406933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: TBA
Our Ref: CS/EGI18008740/Vrb

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._SG 1187B .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on 14/05/2018 at the premises of M/s SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8§ 1.227.00
Revised Estimate Amount : S% 830.00
“Check” Items Amount (5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value . 8%

Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage: i

The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully

SATHYA
Automotive Assessor



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR)
<catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 2:45 PM

To: SUR; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC); AutoSvs-ARC (Bus); Bryan Ang
(LKKAuto); C5 A Team; Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalisation - SG11878 (BUS/01/17/1018) - SHC Capital Ltd

Attachments: img-626144658-0001 pdf; img-626144605-0001. pdf

To Whom it may concern.

Attached herewith our copy and Surveyor's marked copy of the bus repair estimate for the case.
Our finalised amount is $830.00 @ 2 working days under part by part repair.

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP.

Thank you

Best Regards

Catherine Lee

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
([Acecident Repair Centre)

DID: 6866 2669 Fax: 6368 5592
catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 14 May, 2018 12:07 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Subject: Ol : SLF72365 / TP : SG1187B/LKK / DOA : 23/01/2017

Attachments: SG11878B - SAS N estimate.pdf; SG1187B - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD,

ADDRESS . WOODLANDS SMRT DEPOT

60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4
SINGAPORE 757705

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUNNY TAN @ 9321 0858

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our insured/insured driver has yet to e-file their SAS
for this accident and advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-
survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the
loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate and third party SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee PeiLi

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGOD Insurance Pte. Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel : 65 6629 9198 DID: 65 6829 9194

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 couniries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk camers.



Date:
Qur Reference:

Your Refarence:

To:

14.05.2018

SLF 72365/5L/p!

5G 11878

SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: 5G 11878

Insured’s Vehicle:

Date Of Accident:

S5LF 72365

23.01.2017

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on:

11.05.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

or

Email
TanAhLeong@smrt.com.sg

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

*

AlS Automebile Inspection Services Prle Ltd LBS L.B.S Aute Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LKK LKK Alito Consultants Pte Ltd
145 Infiniti Appraisal Service P5 Priarity Services

JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd VAL “ficom Lid

v Cur Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Your request for inspection does nat have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindiy forward a copy.

Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate,

V |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM
Prepared by: Q‘ 9 Pei Li 6829 9194 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: = 3 FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Workshop use only:
Assessor attended workshep on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time
Inspectar:

Remarks:

[ venhicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Warkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Naote: Qur Inspection is on a without admission to llability basis.




SM&PN1A PARFICOF Rehata Fnoniry

> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type: Company
Owener 10: 22920
Vehicle Details
Viehicle Mo, sG11878
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended De-registration Date: 15May 2018
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Wehicle Model: CITARO 0530 £ 4L AT TURBO ABS
Primary Colour: Multi-Colour
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine Na.: 902926C1101347
Chassis No.; WEB&Z808323130022
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $284,910.00
Original Registration Date: 07 Jul 20146
First Registration Date: 07 Jul 2016
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: £0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Rebate Amount: $0.00
Total Rebate Amount: £0.00

The information cantained herein is correct as at 15 May 2018

OK

NITPS 4, 1. OV, SQATaV I actonenquirg e nale sy UDHCHETOTaLaregINpUL F LN | IUIN_ILSFUIUSUUR0

1



L :abey

BLOLILLILOIST

Nd 20-00-€0 LLDE/0/5E

eq pasedald

S9ECLATNS dl
‘NOILHOd IHDIY HY3d

© AuE JI'ouy 01 uoionusy| [enads

ON

ON
P17 [BNdeD OHS

SaA

WY 00:00:ZL LL0Z/LOIYE
WY 00:06'LL LL0Z/LO/EE
¥v3d 0L avaH

12JNYS NA

0£G0 OHVLIO g
S303243W OYVLID g
nzL-sng

006L/1L0/1L0
gLoL/LL/LO/ISNE
g/8L198

ON pieD qor Jieday juspiooy

1 Apanssi apoiyas Wawaoeday

SlUl| RIE(] YIed PaMo |
LHIER PAMO ] SI B|JIUBA
fg famng

ipasnnbay silofanng

S aw| / 8jeq papoday jusplody

Juapiooy Jo awi| | ajeq
uapiaoy jo adf)

JaalqQ jo awep

2ROy

aye

adf] spyap

2jeq Bay

ON 24

on Bay

anuas Bunuoday Juapiooy Je Jaoyjo AINQUOoSIAPY SWIE|D Aq pajaidwon aq o) - ¢ uonodas

Zio7aoEs | Jequnn Bupodsy juspiooy

EZOZOORY . IsguIny suCydeE ) JOIEWNST
ZEGGA9EG | JIOQWNN Xyd

50/52 Bodefiulg 'v3 HIEd [ELISNPU] SPUEPOCOAN 08

P17 @ld aiAdag aajowoiny LHNS

sojeuwnsy Jieday SPIYIA JUIPIOY LAWS

u .h.!.lb

ACIUUD )



:abed gLoLiLLorsng

' 8jeq pasedaid | JUNOLWY 82I0AU|
3]eQ 2210AU| . 2jeq uoneloND
ON 8210AU| . ON uojejonp

1eday jo uonajdwon uodn ‘asjuag sieday Juap)aay ‘Juelsissy ulwpy Aq pajajdwog aq o) - J uoydag

WY 62°G5'LL 8L0Z/S0/LL @ 2leq paedaid

syJeLay
aleq paisnipy | pasedaid

WY 000021 008L/LOMO WY 6255 LI BLOZ/SOILL - ajeqg yO Buig Jofeaing | iy
Ag peisnipy | pauedaid

ooo 002 “ sfeq seday Jo oN

o000 000 : [B10] Wng wn"

000 00°222°L : VL0l

000 aoo : sabieyn J1suip

000 000 : safileyD [eusjey [ej0]

000 00ZEY sabieyp Bunuied Aeids g0

000 00'G6L - safieyy nogen (ejo)

ajqeaidde yi ‘1ofamng Aq paisnipy Y Wod} uoneony

sajewnsy seday jo Mewwng
S all |/ 21er] paledwod Jieday . dous opn
0 : afea)w : ON SISSEUD



£ :abed gLoLiLLLo/sna

PR, -0 eah Al
v ] .m._.un_.__.mL ...___.u_.____r.m. ! _...r_.\..:__.\ﬁr}..m.._ * ) _T : . |
g Gt der | i} .#L.,_;,.w e L
)
by 2 w1 2<
i _.u.T?..)q *L.__ .u..uf Wy 2 ;
glet| S \i _
> M7
P M..... e ﬁ.}:. ."._n“.
S0 Jayi0 |ejoL
ajqeodde y Johsmung Ag paisnipy Y Woly ucieony) adoog gor

sasuadxg paje|ay Jieday Juapiody pue Juapiady - sJS0) JAYI0 - £ Hed

000 00°ZEr Buneag |aued g Bunued Aesds jejo)

SWILI HivdId IA0EY AVHdS3H ONY

<2=2% _goT] 002Ek|  ALLNd OL TWIHIALYW ONY ¥NO8Y1 3AINOHd

a|jqeandde y Jofenng fg paisnipy MY WOL UolEleND adoog qor

s)iom pajejay Buneag jaued g Bunuieq Aeids - z ued

000 00°S6L inogqe’ |ejol
ot S a0l D0'S6L NOILYOd Y¥3d HY Hivd3d O1
ajgeadde y 1ofesing Ag paisnipy MY Woly uoneong adoog qor

SYIOM InOgeT - | Hed



v :abed gLoL/LLILOIENE
SIVIHILYIN AMYLININITddNS TVLOL

Elell ] b =1 g (%) (%) ($) 1aqLInp

— 17 iofaang | yoeug ouy | @oud (euld | unoosig | =soud s | AD awep ved uoiod Hed
o paubig Jokaaung Jayy abfiesn |eusiey / sued aleds pappy

00°0{00°0 (pa1uno2siQ)SIVIMILYN TVLOL
SIVIH3LYIN TVL10L
<]

payoely | panoiddy |uswiuozay (%) (%) (%) Bguiny

s0j0Ud J1ofaning aHY 20114 |euid | wnoasig| aoud is | AD aEN Hed ON 42015 uoIHo g Hed

abesn |eualjey | sued asedsg - p Led



S SmRT

SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates

SMRET Automuotive Service Pta Lid

50 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, Singapore 757705

FAX Mumber 53685592
Estimalar Telephone Mumber  BREG2E23

Acsident Reporting Mumbar - 68582672

Section A - To be completed by claims Advisor/Duty officer at Accident Reporting Centre

Reg. No

Ref. Mo

Reg. Date

Wehicle Type

Make

Wodel

Mame of Driver

Type of Accident

Date / Time of Accident

Accident Reported Date / Time |

Surveyor is Required?
Survey by

Vehicle is Towed Back?
Towed Back Date/Time

Replacement Viehicle issued? :
Accident Repair Job Card No  :

SG11878
BUSM1/47/11018
07/07/2016

BUS -12M

MB CITARO MERCEDES
MB CITARO 0530

¥u Shufel

HEAD TO REAR
231012017 11:50:00 AM
240112017 12:00:00 AM
Yes

SHC Capital Ltd

Mo

01/01/2000

No

000024095068

Special Instruction to ARC,if any

REAR RIGHT PORTION.
TP: SLF72365

Prepared Date

25/01/2017 03:00:02 PM

LT

e e i

rrr——

ISIE1MTHO18

Page: 1
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WEBB2808323130022

Chassis No :
Work Shop

Summary of Repair Estimates

Total Labout Charges

Total Spray Painting Charges
Total Material Charges

Other Charges

TOTAL

Lump Sum Total

No. of Repair Days
Prepared / Adjusted By

Arc | Surveyer Sing Off Date

Prepared | Adjusted Date
Remarks

Prepared Date

e R W AR IR VSR WU

Mileage

Repair Completed Date / Time :

Quotation from ARC
795.00

432.00

0.00

0.00

1,227.00

0.00

2.00

11/05/2018 11:55:28 AM

11/06/2018 11:55:28 AM

v}
01/01/2000

Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable

530.00

300.0C

0.00

0.00

830.00

0.00

2,00

SEBASTIAN LKK

25/08/2018 08:42:56 AM

Section C - To be Completed by Admin Assistant, Accident Repair Centre, Upon Completion of Repair

Cluotation No
Cluotation Date
Invoice Amount

Irvoice No
Invoice Date
Prepared Date :

IUS/01M1T7M1018

Page:

2




Section U - Details of Repair Estimates
Part 1 - Labour Works

Job Scope Quotation from ARG Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable
TO REPAIR RH REAR PORTION 795,00 530.00
Total Labour 795.00 530.00

Part 2 - Spray Painting & Panel Beating Related Works

Job Scope Quatation from ARC Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable
PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY 432.00 300.00

AND RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS

Total Spray Painting & Panel Beating 432.00 300.00

Part 3 - Other Costs - Accident and Accident Repair Related Expenses

Job Scope Quotation from ARC Adjustad by Surveyor, If applicable

Total Other Costs

BUSI/O1MTM018 Page: 3



Part 4 - Spare Parts [ Material Usage

" Part | Portion | StockNo Part Name Qty | Uist Price | Discount [ Final Price |  ARC Surveyor | Photos
Number (%) (%6} (%) Recommen| Approved | Attached
d
TOTAL MATERIALS
TOTAL MATERIALS(Discounted) 0.00{0.00
Added Spare Parts / Material Usage After Surveyor Signed off
Part Portion Part Name Gty | List Price | Discount | Final Price | ARC Check| Surveyor T
Number ($) (%) (%) Check | Check
TOTAL SUPPLEMENTARY MATERIALS
BUS/01/M17M018 Page: 4




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199B0T198R GST Reg. No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref

CS/EGI18008740MNrbn2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 28-06-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLF 72365 Veh. Inspected 5G 11878
Policy No. Cowverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SLF72365/5Lpl Excess () 0.00
Assign From ¥EE PEI LI Assign Date 14/05/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ CITARD c.c 6374
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. WEBG2808323130022 Colour MULTI
Odometer 140027 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |27570R225 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre 27570 R22.5 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |27570 R22.5 (D) COMTINENTAL 66 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |27570R225 (D) CONTINENTAL 616 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR F‘DE'FIDN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/01/2017 Inspection Date 14/05/2018
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
B0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 787705
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SG 1187B

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

59 Libi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 190607198R GET Reg. No 109-06071868-R

Page No..1of 1

Qty Description of Parts Condition vf:::::;;; ?:" e ‘":;':J}"""d
LABOUR
TO REPAIR RH REAR PORTION. 795.00 530.00
PROVIDE LAROUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND 432.00 300,00
RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
1,227.00 830.00

GRAND TOTAL 1,227.00 830.00

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I 830.00]

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18008740/Vrbn2

SATHYA SAI KATHIRRASEN

Asst. Automotive ASSessor

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made wobEly
WW&W.WM
al his o et own risk,

Repod, in whele orin part. does 8o

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

For the use and benafit of the Client named on the Tront page of this Repart.

B.Eng, AMSDE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

acting or regplying oo inis



