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Essimat;_c;r, : Type. M.Carl M.Cycle | Bus | Van [ Lorry | Taxi/ Prime Mover |
OoiTPIWS TP EEg-j QQ_EE;!;M ;u\f { l._w__ . Truck ! Trailer o
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at Workshop m/s B Colour Blacd—- A Insured | Std / NI/ NA
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563560 FAX : (065 61564315

Your Ref: D18003732MFSH Date: 04 July 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18008655/Aqgb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJX 222G .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 11/05/2018 at the premises of M/s UNITED SG AUTOMOBILE. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;5% 2579730 .

Revised Estimate Amount :S§  5.700.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value S8

LTA Reimbursement Value : S%

Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages fﬁ
at the front o/s portion. | W)

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATA!

Licensed Appraiser



: MS‘ Fi rstca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Ccfeg o, 1950001060 GST Reg Mg, M2 00016769

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D485B0

Tek {65) 6222 2311 Fax: [B5)6222 3547

Chalm & Mool Underwiting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #1E-01 City House Singapore DEEGTT
Tel; [65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849

wwiw.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

10-05-2018 Our Ref No. D18003732MFSH
08-05-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA9988R Third Party Vehicle. SJX222G

53 UBI AVE 1 #01-56 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL FARK
VICKY

67474454/ 67474454 Fax No. 67477752

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax Mo. 684168315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

UNITEQ SG Attention. NIL
AUTOMORBILE PTE LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via WS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

E

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July 2018 441 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR; assignments
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCI18008655Aqb.pdf

Dear Lurene,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SIX 222G.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: é256-3561 | email: sipwsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 5hiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 May 2018 1:42 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=

Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MFSH/1

Dear Lurene,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJX 222G on 11/05/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 11 May, 2018 9:57 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LURENEJAW @ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phione; 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 May 2018 1:42 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Cc LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.5G; SUR; assignments
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MF5H/1

Dear Lureng,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJX 222G on 11/05/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 11 May, 2018 9:57 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

Sent: Thursday, 10 May, 2018 7:39 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003732MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System
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ESTIMATION QUOTE

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED VEHICLE NO 5IX2226G
36 ROBINSON ROAD MAKE MGDEL MERCEDES $300
#16-01 CITY HOUSE REFERENCE U5G-201805-05
SINGAPORE 068877 DOA 8:May-18
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT CLAIM TYPE 3P CLAIM
PAGE 2 OF 2
LIST ITEMS [ary[ usTPRicE($)[[  REMARKS |
BALANCE B/F §  20,877.30
FRONT BUMPER CLIP Ko HaE 6peeT 3o
FRONT FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP A we 1 SETj S So0u |
1M Mt 1|5 150000 | Y
BRAKE FUILD e £ BB 50.00 | [#
20 SUBTOTAL §  1,660.00
BALANCEC/F §  22537.3C
[LABOUR [s/NO_ LISTPRICE(S) [ |  REMARKS |
BALANCEB/F $ 2253730
|CHECK FROMT WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM ENE 6ot | 3o |
[DIAGNOIS CHECK AND CLEAR FAULT CODE |2 |5 _Sooserr row
|CHECK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT | 3 |5 15000 | | &
{REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS 4 |3 20007 | | &
|PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 5 |5 120000 | 25°
[SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS 5[5 LoceseTisaL0
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS A E 150,00 | | .
980 SUBTOTAL 5 2,260.00
GRANDTOTAL §  25797.30
&Mgu_b[mnhm notify
the Repairer of the following: Adﬂjﬁﬂ M
» To resurvey beforelatter spray F_'*""'W ’_J :
5] during rasuney
L e l\\uS 'e .
« Third party survey is ona “Without Prejudice” basis

« N illegai modification(s) & allowed i
) must ba resurveyed .
-WT@HI s lon G'{ Py 2

Acknowledged by Repairef
K9
::nm '1_"{:{'-::1'- 73238




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BlE BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/_—__! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI1B008655/Aqbn2
.01 GITe HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 R SHRRERIER N”"IM”"NI" “
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9988R Veh. Inspected SJX 222G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18003732MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 10/05/2018
Z Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ S300 c.c 2097
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WDD2211542A289205 Colour BLACK
Odometer 263513 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |255/40R19 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/40 R19 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [255/40 R19 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/40 R19 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT OVS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5, General Information
Accident Date  08/05/2018 Inspection Date 11/05/2018
Survey held at UNITED SG AUTOMOEBILE PTE LTD
53 UBI AVEMNUE 1 #01-56
PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK SINGAPORE 408934
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 bl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJX 222G
i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 o o ) “J}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER MISSING 2,180.00 2 180.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE MISSING 188.00 188.00
Z2|FRONT SIDE GRILLE MISSING 98.00 98.00
2|FRONT SIDE RETAINER MISSING &8.00 6B8.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT WOT NECESSARY 1.533.00 -
ZIFRONT BUMPER NOZZLE MISSING 194 .00 194 00
2IFRONT BUMPER NOZZLE MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 294 00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER FOAM-CENTRE CRACKED 182.00 182.00
4|FRONT BUMPER SENSOR MISSING 600,00 600.00
2IFRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER MISSING 350.00 350.00
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP MISSING 930.00 BT2.00
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 835.00 -
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP CRACKED 4 150.00 2.283.00
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP PANEL NOT NECESSARY 252.00 -
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP CONTROL UNIT NOT NECESSARY 1,480.00 -
1|FRONT RH FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 1,457.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD-INNER MOT NECESSARY 185.00 -
1|FRONT RH FEMDER INNER SHIELD-OUTER NOT NECESSARY 139.00 -
1|FRONT TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 85.00
4|FRONT SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 1,064 .00 -
1|FRONT RH SHOCK ABSORBER NOT NECESSARY 3,415.00 -
1|FRONT RH KNUCEKLE ARM MOT NECESSARY B814.00 -
1|FRONT WHEEL HUB C/W BEATING RH MNOT NECESSARY 1,082.00 -
1|FRONT LOWER ARM RH MOT NECESSARY 814.00 -
1|FRONT CONTROL ARM REH WOT NECESSARY 648.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,319.70 -701.80
2087730 8.313.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN} MECESSARY &60.00 30.00

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18008655/Agbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607T198-R

Page No.-2 of 2

: Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rhshup?;}:n {55
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,500.00 -
1|BRAKE FUILD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
1,660.00 30.00
LABOUR
CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM £0.00 30.00
DIAGNOIS CHECK AND CLEAR FAULT CODE 500.00 100.00
CHECK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 150,00 -
REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
PARTS.
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF 1,200.00 250.00
THE REPAIR OF FRONT RH FENDER.
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1,000.00 500.00
APPLY ANT| RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
3,260.00 880.00
GRAND TOTAL 25,797.30 7,223.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,700.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18008655/Agbn2

3

ADRIAM LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLABER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and banafit of the Client named on thi front page of this Repaort.




