Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Friday, 23 November 2018 5:09 PM

loy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Elaine Cheong; Chee 5o Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Bokhari Makrob; Alfred Toh
RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GED2825D (Ol: SNM18D02376C02/5)
and SHD1076J (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18008649/K1jb3 ) on 09.05.2018

LKK Reference: CC3/CTI18008649/K1jb3

Appraisal Ref: IN-CT-0001

CTI Reference: SNM18D02376C02/5 (GBD2825D)

Dear loy Irene

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $4,400.80.

We await your payment advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 63896183

FAX: +65 6224 7T478/6224 T175

Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

wWww.s.cniaiping.

ANNIVERSARY
I Siugapore vinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its confenis do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any wnauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message,

plecase notify the sender immediately

From: loy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Friday, November 23, 2018 4:51 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; '‘Bokhari Makrob’

<hokhari@aaplpro.com:>

Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
=sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1076)/GS
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

14" June 2018
(By Email Only)

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleat Tower

Singapore (079909

Dear Sir'Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD1076J & GBD2825D ALONG MEI LING STREET
TOWARDS MEI CHIN ROAD ON 09.05.18

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd, the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHDI076J. to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: GRD2825D at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr Ong Loy Yong

As a result of the accident caused by vour Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: GBD2825D, our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $ 3638.00 (Incl, GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 8Days @$101.44per day $ 811.52
(3) GIA Search Fee 5 2.00

S 4451.52

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SHD1076J

(2) Driver’s I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Centificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search & Scene video



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Refl: SHD1076J/GS

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd”.

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalf to commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

. f'.'-"‘"-"P.
Claims Bepartment — Gary Shi

Email: gary.shi@premiertaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

P5: Please quote our reference no when replying

c.c. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Ltd



Jux Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 25 May 2018 10:08 AM

To: 'zoey@evorich.com.sg'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 2825D AND SHD 1076) ON 09/05/2018
25 MAY 2018

M/S EVORICH WORKS PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 2825D AND SHD 1076J) ON 09/05/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to

resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ilkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I'We, PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant”) of 23 CHANGI SOUTH
AVENUE 2 #03-02 SINGAPORE 486443 (address), owner of SHD 1076] (vehicle no.)

hereby authorize PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)
to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use
(“claim™} for my vehicle no. SHD 1076] that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on 09/05/2018 (date) along MEI CHIN ROAD/STIRLING ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s GBI 2825D (“the accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to

settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop”.

I/We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

™
Dated this 2 (day) of ];k L (month) 2018 (year)

. _”-Ff_: :-
Signed by “the third party claimant” ﬁgﬁed by “the workshop”

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy Mo : DMCVSN1754911700 Claim No : SHM1EDOZ2T76&/CO2/5
Claimant : FPREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
Amount i 554,248.04

SINGAPORE DOLLARS FCUR THOUSAND TWO HUNMDRED FORTY EIGHT AND
CENTS SIXTY FOUR ONLY.

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount te be paid to mefus in full &

final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
gustained by mefus through an accident invelwving

Claimant Vehiecle Mo. @ SHD 10767
Insured Vehicle HNo. 1 GBD 2825D
Date of Loss : 09.05.2018
Place of Accident : MEI CHIN ROAD/STIRLING ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementlioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPCQRE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured MName : EVORICH WORKS PTE LTD
Driver Name : ALAM SARWAR

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss; injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURAMCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{l} General Damages S8
{2} Cost of Repair/Exceas 55 3,638.00
(3} Loss of UsefFental/Earning E& 608.864
(4} GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 55 2.00
(5} Medical Beports/Expenses g5
(6) Survey Fees/P.T. Feeas 55
{7} Cost including Disbursement Es

TOTAT:- 5 %G & W ow ol W T 8 Nems PRITES 4,248.64
= EESSSsSFEFSaEAARE S S ==
7
3T
_'f f ) 1 -

Claimant Name : : 4 {r_,L RRIC Ho : )L‘bthfl'?,fl_ﬁ}f

51l
1

Signature ) Date




PREMIER

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
OFFICE. 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01-02 S(456443)
TEL: 65438878 / 85438888 FAX: 2141511

CO. REG NO. 2007077430 GST REG MO 2007077430

TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 14-Jun-2018
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10FA1
SINGAPORE 486443
ITEM Description QTy U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA 3 3,400.00
REGN NO: SHD 1076 J
il
TOTAL LUMP SUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR | § 3,400.00
GST @ 7%| % 238.00
GRAND TOTAL| § 3,638.00
]

= r——
far Premier Automaotivi-Se,

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




17 May 2018

To Whom It May Concern

Dear SirMadam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves to inform that Ong Loy Yong of NRIC Number S6831532H is a
registered driver of SHD1076J). Ong Loy Yong is paying daily rental rate of $101.44

(Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8850,

Thank you,

Yours sincerely

A

Chin Bee Lian (Ms)
Assistant Vice President

Taxis Administration

Prepared By: Hosnah

PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
23 Changl Seuth Avenue 2
#0302

Simgopore 456443

Telephone: +G5 6214 8880 Fax: +65 6214 0530

www.premisni axi.cem
Co. Reg. No. 2003045751



“”@PREMIER

TAXIS

REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES/NO

CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER

VEH NO,

JOB NO.

I .

DRIVER'S NAME Dﬂnl. Lu% \{ﬂﬂ1

we s bR 3EBLE T

HANOPHONE §2318 3

e X T N

MAKE / MODEL #GL

DATEN ., . TMEN BARONT .. o TeEpir
eqdmy g Pooeo tbos |2 y54s
FLUEL IN FUEL QUT

KILDMETHES IN

L& [ual 2o 7

KILOMETRES OUT

TAXI METER DOWNLOADED

YES NO

DATE / TIME TOWEDIH TO WORKSHOR
DiDiM M YT H: kB BA

DATE / TIAE CALL ¥0 DRIER FOR VEHCLE COULECTIC

| AGKNOWELDGE AND CONFIRM THAT | HAVE

THAT THE SAME 15 IN GOOD CONDITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT
TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / ITEMS LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER IS USED IN
CONJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT.

D:D M M Y¥iY¥" HiH B MY
EXAMENED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND

CHECK IN CHECK ouT

orG kY Yoo oroGy (b Vg X

DRNNER'S NAME DRIVER'S NAME

i
y‘d X
DRIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE { DRIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE / TIME
Cl 5 1M BY CHECKED OUT BY
IER'S AUTHORISED \'fDHHSHDFJ 1FFlEMlEH'$ AUTHORISED WCIRHSE-IJP]

INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:

~ Sarious Doent &= Chip
3 — Light Scratch ¥ —Crack
4 = Sarious Scralch B=Peeling

SERVICE / AEFAIRS DONE

DRIVER'S REMARKS

0 SERVICING

0 T/ BELT

0O AIRCON SYSTEM
0 TURBD

0 BAAKE SYSTEM
O CLUTCH SYSTEM
0 BULE

0 UNDER CARRIAGE
O CPF

[ O BATTERY

0 OTHERS:

030518
T Z (

PA/DDIDENT: DATE | TIME of ACGIDENT;
18 1585

It
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
: GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

§ Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
: INSURANC Phone: 465 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
W ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE e

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-071003
Date of Request: 10/05/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchace

Premier Avtomolive Servicas Pte Ltd
23 Changi South Ave 2

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear SifMadam,

Enquiry Date 10/05/2018

Enguiry By GARY SHI GUO RONG

TP Vehicle Na. GBD2825D

Accident Date 09Ms2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo,  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GAD28250 China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple, Lid, 220820 T-21/082018 6388 6111
Thank You.

The images provided {0 you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members cf the General Insurance
Association of Singapare and we take no responsibliity for thelr accuracy or contents and shall ba undar no lizbility whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising cut of or in conpecticn with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https:/fwww.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsasé&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 10/5/2018



Involce

GENERAL

ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMEMT CENTRE

Cur Ref No:
Date of Request:

GR-18-071003
10/05/2018

Pramier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
23 Changl South Ave 2

INSURANCE

Page Lot d

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Cuay #18-00, Singapore 048580
FPhone; +G5 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam fo Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo

Online Purchase

#1102

Singapore 456443

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Data 10/05/2018

Enguiry By GARY SHI GUO RONG

TP Vehicle No. GBD2B25D

Accident Date 08/05/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Cfficial use:
Cate:
[X] GIRO[] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 10/5/2018




