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Veron Chen LKKAuto

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Friday, 1 1 May 2018 8:51 AM
'Ler, Bernard-JQ'; SUR

RE: SKD569BC/ 7365251379SG I Date of Accident: 8/5/2018

Dear Bernard,

The market value of SKD 5698C is $52K-$53K (Estimated) as at May 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-431s

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue !,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From : Ler, Berna rdJQ [ma ilto : Berna rdJQ. Ler@aig.lom]

Sent: Thursday, 10 MaY 2018 3:23 PM

To: Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne Ang <yvonne@priorityservices.sg>

Subject: SKD569SC/ 736525L379SG I Date ofAccident: 8l5l2OL8

Dear Sir/Madam,

Appreciate if you all could assist to compute market value of the vehicle above please.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler
AIG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims lAlG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(O79120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com I www.aiq.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. lf you are not the intended recipient, you must

not use or disseminate the information. lf you have received this email in error, please immediately notifo me by

,,Reply,, command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and

any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no

responsibility is accepted by American lnternational Group, lnc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use'
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Vehicle to be Exported: No

lntended De+egistration Date: 08 May 2018

vehicle Make: voLvo
Vehicle Model: 560 T4 1'6 AT ABS D/AB 2l /D 4DR TC

Primary Colour: Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2011

Ensine No.: 84164T105809_2 
.

Chassis No.: W1FS4858C2109382

Maximum Power Output: 132.0 kW (177 bhp)

open uarr91Viru9, $eb,rto.oo

Original Registration Date: 16 Dec 2011

1q 
Dec 201 1

Transfer Count: I

Actual ARF Paid: $35,116.00

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes r.l l.?V
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 15 Dec2021 t t .r f
PARF Rebate Amount: $22,825.00

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 15Dec2O21

COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)

COE Period(Years): 10

OP Paid: $55,997.00

COE Rebate Amount: $20,170.00

Total Rebate Amount: $42,995.00

The information contained herein is conect as at 08 May 2018
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Mleage Veh Type . ,1 \

Deposit $s,000,l4onthly g 1, so0,Ex-Bankuptcy A,rd Bad Credit Welcome, High Trade In.

posted 09 ttay-201! Tals 2011Votvo s6o, Votvo 56rl, Vovo, 560, Used Volvo

Volvo 560 T4

Price Deprecjaton - Eng Gp

$ss,a00 $10,460 lyt 28-Oct-20!1 1,999 cc lo1,0oo km

$58,800 $rr,l30 /yr

tcfiimD

Volvo 560 f4

30-De€'20r1 1,596 cc 100,000 km Luxrry

Equipped With A L.6LTurbo Engine providing you With Sufticient
Th€ Siyllsh 560 Where Performance, Confort And Safety cet Togeth€r perfecdyl
Power, Yet Retumlng Excelenr Flet Efficiencyt Spacious C

Post€ii 07,t'ray,21lt3 Ta!s: 20t1Votvo s60, Votvo s6i], Vovo, s6]), Used lotvo

1s1,800 3!a,770lyt 29-l!t,2olr 1,596 cc 1O8,O0O km Luxury

che€pestl showrcom condition, Very Well Ma nlained By Previous owner, wear And Tear a Reptaced, l0o% Accident Free, one of The BesrCondiro. tr _ie 
l,tarke!, We p.ovioe E,cetenr ale, Sa es Service....

HTS Motor

Posted: 28-Apr 2018 Tags: 2011 V.tv. S6rt, Vojvo 560, Votvo, 560, !se! Vovo

Volvo 560 T4 9s4,888 911,530 /r 18,Au9-2011 1,596 cc - Luxury

Looking ForAn upgrade rhat ls worry Frce? Ih nk No Morcr New Pai.t wod!12 t4onths warranty For Gear Box. Major serujcing Done. New Break
Disb New Break Pad/ New Starer. Excette.t Intertor Condttion...

Pcned 2111a.2018 Tals 2011Votvo 560, Votvo 560, Vo vo, 560, Used Vovo

save thls se.r.h c.iteri., to gerema t.terts whenevcr a flarch s found.

LtJt.
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