Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 11:31 AM

To: Dd hashim

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Attachments: DS FORM.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Hashim,
Please find attached DS form for your further action.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 13 June, 2019 11:23 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Dear Vic,
As spoken attach me the new discharge voucher for the payment process.

Thank you.

~Selamat Hari Raya~
SINCERELY

DD HASHIM

MOTOR CLAIMS OFFICER
HP:+65 81160811

FAX:+65 64520614



On Mon, May 27, 2019 at 10:27 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Dashim,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our principal still requested for a copy of the Income Tax Return.

Kindly provide.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

N Save the Larth- Print only wherr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 10:22 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)




Cc: Kenneth Ding
Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Dear Vic,

Sorry for the late.

As spoken previously,kindly refer to the attachment for the uber weekly statement as request.

Thank you.

~HAVE A GOOD DAY~

SINCERELY

DD HASHIM

MOTOR CLAIMS OFFICER
HP:+65 81160811

FAX:+65 64520614

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Tue, Apr 23,2019 at 12:50 PM Dd hashim <dd.hashim @dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear Mei Kwan,

As spoken kindly refer to the attachment for the rental receipt.

$497/7day=$71/day.



Please double check with AXA if they still require the income tax and do let me know.

Thank you.

~PEACE~

SINCERELY

DD HASHIM

MOTOR CLAIMS OFFICER
HP:+6581160811

FAX:+6564520614

On Tue, Apr 23, 2019 at 12:45 PM Carlor Chan <carlor.chan @dingauto.sg> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Michelle <accounts @dingauto.sg>

Date: Thu, Nov 1, 2018 at 9:26 AM

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>, Kelly Ding <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>, Ding Ding
Auto <ding @dingauto.sg>, Alex <admin@dingauto.sg>, You jingfeng <jingfeng @dingauto.sg>,
duan.hongbo @dingauto.sg <duan.hongbo @dingauto.sg>, Chan Carlor <Carlor.chan @dingauto.sg>

Morning Thin Thin,

Please view attached file for signed DV and repair invoice.
We will also mail both DV and invoice to your office.

Kindly revert back regarding payment as soon as possible.
*NOTE : Payment is to be made to Ding Auto Pte Ltd

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely

Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 31/10/2018 1:42 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’




SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,

We refer to the below matter.

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not
be construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver.
The terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of
this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 10:26 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018




Morning Thin Thin,

We accept the offer.
Kindly revert back with DV as soon as possible.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely

Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 31/10/2018 9:48 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,

We refer to the below matter.

We have our Principal instruction to revise offer at $ 2,850.00 (all-in).

Please re-consider our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice
basis and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our
policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement
should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be
binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 8:11 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Kenneth Ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS
AGAINST SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Morning Thin Thin,
We would like to know any update on the revised offer ?

As mention in previous email,
for swift and amicable settlement, we would still like to counter propose an
all in amount of $3000.

Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that we can close the case as soon
as possible.

If possible, please email us the reason for rejection of higher claim amount
for us to explain to your insured.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely

Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 29/10/2018 10:37 AM, Michelle wrote:
Morning Thin Thin,
Any updates on the revised offer ?
As per last email,
For swift and amicable settlement, we would still like to
counter propose an all in amount of $3000 (all in)
Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that we can close
the case as soon as possible.
If possible, please email us the reason for rejection of higher

claim amount for us to explain to your insured.

Thank you so much



Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 24/10/2018 2:09 PM, Michelle wrote:
Dear Thin Thin,

We have verify with our client.
But they do not agree with the offer.

For swift and amicable settlement, we would
still like to counter propose an all in amount
of $3000 (all in)

As mention as per our last conversation, your
surveyor came late.

Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that
we can close the case as soon as possible.
If possible, please email us the reason for
rejection of higher claim amount for us to
explain to your insured.

Thank you so much
Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 19/10/2018 9:41 AM, Thin Thin
(LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,

We refer to below matter.

We regret to inform you that we
have our instruction to maintain
our offer.



Please re-consider our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our proposal and
correspondence with you is strictly on
a without prejudice basis and should
not be construed as an admission of
liability on our part and/or that of our
policyholder and/or the authorised
driver. The terms of our without
prejudice engagement should not be
disclosed in any other related
matter(s) in respect of this accident
nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email:

thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-
4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Michelle
<accounts@dingauto.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018
12:44 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>;
'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;

9




'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: (REF :
CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

as spoken to our insured, we
do not accept the offer of
$2750.

We would still like to counter
propose an all in amount of
$3000 (all in)

As mention as per our last
conversation, your surveyor
came late.

Kindly assist to negotiate with
AXA so that we can close the
case as soon as possible.

If possible, please email us
the reason for rejection of
higher claim amount for us to
explain to your insured.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 12/10/2018 10:02 AM,
Thin Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT
PREJUDICE’

SAVEAS TO
COSTS

Dear Sir /
Madam,

10



We refer to the
below matter.

We have our
Principal
instruction to
maintain our
offer at global

sumS$ S
2,750.00 (all-in).

Please re-
consider our
offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that
our proposal and
correspondence
with you is strictly
on a without
prejudice basis and
should not be
construed as an
admission of
liability on our part
and/or that of our
policyholder and/or
the authorised
driver. The terms of
our without
prejudice
engagement should
not be disclosed in
any other related
matter(s) in respect
of this accident nor
should it be binding
in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

11



Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:

thinthin @lkkauto.
com | fax: 6741-

4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
S(408933

From: Chan
Carlor
<carlor.chan@di
ngauto.sg>
Sent:
Wednesday, 10
October 2018
11:17 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ilkkau
to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@din
gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding

auto.sg>;
'ACCOUNTS'

<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR

12



SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Please ignore
the previous
email.

We arrange
surveyor 9 May
2018.

But your
surveyor came
on 11 May 2018.

Therefore, we
counter
proposed to
close at $3000.
(all-in)

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

13



From: Chan
Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Ch
an@dingauto.sg

]
Sent:

Wednesday, 10
October 2018
9:03 AM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding';
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We accept the
offer.

Kindly revert
back with DV as

soon as
possible.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

14



From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin
@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday,
9 October 2018
12:10 PM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

‘WITHOUT
PREJUDICE’

SAVEAS TO
COSTS

Dear Sir/
Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We regret to
inform you that
we have our
Principal
instruction to
maintain our
offer.

15



Please re-
consider our
offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that
our proposal and
correspondence
with you is strictly
on a without
prejudice basis and
should not be
construed as an
admission of
liability on our part
and/or that of our
policyholder and/or
the authorised
driver. The terms of
our without
prejudice
engagement should
not be disclosed in
any other related
matter(s) in respect
of this accident nor
should it be binding
in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Lid

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:
thinthin @lkkauto.

com | fax: 6741-

4108
16



Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
S(408933

From: Chan
Carlor
<carlor.chan@di

ngauto.sg>
Sent: Saturday,

6 October 2018
1:41 PM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkau
to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@din
gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding

auto.sg>;
'ACCOUNTS'

<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Any update on
the states/offer
for this case?

17



Kindly provide
us your revised
offer or status
for us to close
this case on our
end.

We sincerely
look forward to
receive your
revised offer
for our claims.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265
2690

From: Chan
Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Ch
an@dingauto.sg

]
Sent:

Wednesday, 3
October 2018
11:44 AM
To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
18




SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We counter
proposed to
close at
$3000.00

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin
@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday,
2 October 2018
9:21 AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST

19



SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

‘WITHOUT
PREJUDICE’

SAVEAS TO
COSTS

Dear Sir/
Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We regret to
inform you that
we have our
Principal
instruction to
maintain our
offer.

Please re-
consider our
offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that
our proposal and
correspondence
with you is strictly
on a without
prejudice basis and
should not be
construed as an
admission of
liability on our part
and/or that of our

20



policyholder and/or
the authorised
driver. The terms of
our without
prejudice
engagement should
not be disclosed in
any other related
matter(s) in respect
of this accident nor
should it be binding
in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Lid

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:
thinthin @lkkauto.

com | fax: 6741-

4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
S(408933

From: Chan
Carlor

<carlor.chan@di

ngauto.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 2

October 2018

9:19 AM

To: Thin Thin

(LKKAuto)

<thinthin@lkkau

to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
21



<kelly.ding@din

gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'

<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding

auto.sg>;
'"ACCOUNTS'

<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>

Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Good day to
you and hope
this email
serve you well.

Kindly provide
us your revised
offer or status
for us to close
this case on
our end.

We sincerely
look forward
to receive your
offer for our
claims.

Thank you so
much.
22



Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Chan
Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Ch
an@dingauto.sg

]
Sent: Friday, 28

September 2018
11:01 AM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We arrange

surveyor on 9

May 2018.

But surveyor

cameon 11
23



May 2018.
Thus we would
like to claim all
in $3230.

Kindly revert
back with
better offer as
soon as
possible.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265
2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin
@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 28
September 2018
10:30 AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

‘WITHOUT
PREJUDICE’

SAVEAS TO
COSTS

24



Dear Sir/
Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We have our
Principal
instruction to
offer at global

sumSS
2,750.00 (all-in).

Please confirm
the acceptance.

“Please note that
our proposal and
correspondence
with you is strictly
on a without
prejudice basis and
should not be
construed as an
admission of
liability on our part
and/or that of our
policyholder and/or
the authorised
driver. The terms of
our without
prejudice
engagement should
not be disclosed in
any other related
matter(s) in respect
of this accident nor
should it be binding
in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

25



Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:

thinthin @lkkauto.
com | fax: 6741-

4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
S(408933

From: Chan
Carlor
<carlor.chan@di

ngauto.sg>
Sent: Friday, 28

September 2018
9:33 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ilkkau
to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@din
gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding
auto.sg>;
'"ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018
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Dear Thin Thin,

Any update on
the states/offer
for this case?

Kindly provide
us your offer
or status for us
to close this
case on our
end.

We sincerely
look forward
to receive your
offer for our
claims.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Chan
Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Ch
an@dingauto.sg

]
Sent: Thursday,

20 September
2018 1:20 PM
To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'
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Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Date of Accident
for vehicle on
5/5/2018 and
our insured
reporting on
7/5/2018.

We arrange
surveyor on
9/5/2018 but
surveyor came
on 11/5/2018.

Vehicle out on
19/5/2018.

Thus, we would

like to claim a
total of 15 days.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690
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From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin
@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday,
20 September
2018 11:37 AM
To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding';
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

"Without
Prejudice"

Dear Carlor,

Can give me
breakdown for
15 days as our
surveyor
recommended 3
days to repair
the vehicle.

Kindly note that
this negotiation
between parties on
this matter is
purely on a without
prejudice basis with
the sole intention

29



of resolving the
matter amicably
without parties
resorting to legal
proceedings. No
admission of
liability,
whatsoever, should
be deemed /
inferred from this
negotiation of
terms/settlement.

In the event of new
evidence being
discovered or
subsequently
produced by either
party that will
materially
affect/influence on
the issues of
liability/damages,
either party is not
bound, thereafter,
by the negotiation
terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Lid

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:
thinthin @lkkauto.

com | fax: 6741-

4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
5(408933)
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From: Chan
Carlor

<carlor.chan@di

ngauto.sg>
Sent: Thursday,

20 September
2018 11:34 AM
To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkau
to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@din
gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding

auto.sg>;
'ACCOUNTS'

<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>
Subject: RE:
(REF:
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We didn’t have
the income
statement from
our insured.

Based on
average we
provide
$100/day for
loss of income
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and 15 days for
repair.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin
@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday,
20 September
2018 10:38 AM
To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Carlor,

We refer to the
below matter.
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Please be inform
that we are
seeking
mandate
approval from
our Principal.

Kindly let us
have the
number of day
breakdown for
LOU and LOI.

And also provide
us income
statement for
our necessary
action.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin
Hlaing | Case
Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360
| email:
thinthin@lkkauto.
com | fax: 6741-

4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 |
S(408933)
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From: Chan
Carlor
<carlor.chan@di

ngauto.sg>
Sent: Thursday,

20 September
2018 10:17 AM
To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ilkkau
to.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@din
gauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@
dingauto.sg>;
'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@ding
auto.sg>;
'"ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DI
NGAUTO.SG>
Subject: RE:
(REF :
CC4/ASM18008
624/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Good day to
you and hope
this email
serve you well.

We would like
to check and
follow up on
the status and
offer for this
case as we

34



have not hear
from you.

Kindly provide
us your offer
or status for us
to close this
case on our
end.

We sincerely
look forward
to receive your
offer for our
claims.

Thank you so
much.

Thanks and
Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp:
9239 4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Michelle
[mailto:accounts
@dingauto.sq]
Sent: Thursday,
13 September
2018 1:28 PM
To:
thinthin@lkkauto
.com

Cc: Chan Carlor;
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'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding’;
'You jingfeng'
Subject: Re:
(REF :
CC4/ASM180086
24/R1ua3)
BILLING FOR
SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS
AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin
Thin,

As per your
email dated on
4 June 2018,
the liability is
clear for us,
We have also
already e-
mailed all
supporting
document on
21 August
2018.

But we still
have not get
back any
update at your
end.
Appriciate
your assistance
to revert back
with an offer as
soon as
possible.

Thank you so
much

Yours
sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128
Ding Auto Pte
Ltd

On 6/9/2018
6:17 PM,
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Yours
Sincerely,
Michelle
Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!
All mailed
letter &
cheque
payment is
to be mailed
to our main
office
address
BLOCK 10
#01-20

SIN MING
INDUSTRIAL
EST. SEC C
SINGAPORE
575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter &
cheque payment is to be
mailed to our main
office address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST.
SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
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Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment
is to be mailed to our main office
address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C
SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be
mailed to our main office address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our
main office address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office
address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office address
BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645
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