Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 9:27 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Kelly Ding; Ding Ding Auto; Alex; You jingfeng;
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg; Chan Carlor

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Attachments: SLG9101D (REPAIR INVOICE).pdf; SLG9101D (DV).pdf

Morning Thin Thin,

Please view attached file for signed DV and repair invoice.
We will also mail both DV and invoice to your office.

Kindly revert back regarding payment as soon as possible.
*NOTE : Payment is to be made to Ding Auto Pte Ltd

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 31/10/2018 1:42 PM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,
We refer to the below matter.

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The
terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this
accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933



From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 10:26 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Kenneth Ding
<kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Morning Thin Thin,

We accept the offer.
Kindly revert back with DV as soon as possible.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 31/10/2018 9:48 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,

We refer to the below matter.

We have our Principal instruction to revise offer at $ 2,850.00 (all-in).
Please re-consider our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis
and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder
and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any
other related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 8:11 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: (REF : CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS
AGAINST SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018




Morning Thin Thin,
We would like to know any update on the revised offer ?

As mention in previous email,
for swift and amicable settlement, we would still like to counter propose an all
in amount of $3000.

Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that we can close the case as soon as
possible.

If possible, please email us the reason for rejection of higher claim amount for
us to explain to your insured.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 29/10/2018 10:37 AM, Michelle wrote:
Morning Thin Thin,
Any updates on the revised offer ?
As per last email,
For swift and amicable settlement, we would still like to
counter propose an all in amount of $3000 (all in)
Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that we can close the
case as soon as possible.
If possible, please email us the reason for rejection of higher
claim amount for us to explain to your insured.
Thank you so much
Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128
Ding Auto Pte Ltd
On 24/10/2018 2:09 PM, Michelle wrote:
Dear Thin Thin,

We have verify with our client.
But they do not agree with the offer.

For swift and amicable settlement, we would
still like to counter propose an all in amount of
$3000 (all in)



As mention as per our last conversation, your
surveyor came late.

Kindly assist to negotiate with AXA so that we
can close the case as soon as possible.

If possible, please email us the reason for
rejection of higher claim amount for us to
explain to your insured.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 19/10/2018 9:41 AM, Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Michelle,
We refer to below matter.

We regret to inform you that we
have our instruction to maintain
our offer.

Please re-consider our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our proposal and
correspondence with you is strictly on a
without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on
our part and/or that of our policyholder
and/or the authorised driver. The terms of
our without prejudice engagement should
not be disclosed in any other related
matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email:
thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933




From: Michelle
<accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 October 2018
12:44 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly
Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'Kenneth Ding'
<kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: (REF :
CC4/ASM18008624/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON 5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

as spoken to our insured, we do
not accept the offer of $2750.
We would still like to counter
propose an all in amount of
$3000 (all in)

As mention as per our last
conversation, your surveyor
came late.

Kindly assist to negotiate with
AXA so that we can close the
case as soon as possible.

If possible, please email us the
reason for rejection of higher
claim amount for us to explain to
your insured.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 12/10/2018 10:02 AM, Thin
Thin (LKKAuto) wrote:

‘WITHOUT

PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO

COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the
below matter.

We have our
Principal instruction
to maintain our
offer at global sum
$$2,750.00 (all-in).

Please re-consider
our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our
proposal and
correspondence with
you is strictly on a
without prejudice basis
and should not be
construed as an
admission of liability on
our part and/or that of
our policyholder and/or
the authorised driver.
The terms of our
without prejudice
engagement should not
be disclosed in any
other related matter(s)
in respect of this
accident nor should it
be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Lid

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:
thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933

From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday,
10 October 2018

6



11:17 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.5g>; 'ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :
CC4/ASM 18008624
/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Please ignore the
previous email.

We arrange
surveyor 9 May
2018.

But your surveyor
came on 11 May
2018.

Therefore, we
counter proposed
to close at $3000.
(all-in)

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Chan Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Chan

@dingauto.sq]
Sent: Wednesday,

7



10 October 2018
9:03 AM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We accept the
offer.

Kindly revert back
with DV as soon as
possible.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin@Ikk
auto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9
October 2018 12:10
PM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

‘WITHOUT
PREJUDICE’

8



SAVEAS TO
COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We regret to
inform you that we
have our Principal
instruction to
maintain our offer.

Please re-consider
our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our
proposal and
correspondence with
you is strictly on a
without prejudice basis
and should not be
construed as an
admission of liability on
our part and/or that of
our policyholder and/or
the authorised driver.
The terms of our
without prejudice
engagement should not
be disclosed in any
other related matter(s)
in respect of this
accident nor should it
be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:
thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933



From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 6
October 2018 1:41
PM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.sg>; '"ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :
CC4/ASM18008624
/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Any update on the
states/offer for
this case?

Kindly provide us
your revised offer
or status for us to
close this case on
our end.

We sincerely look
forward to receive
your revised offer
for our claims.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

10



From: Chan Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Chan
@dingauto.sq]
Sent: Wednesday,
3 October 2018
11:44 AM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We counter
proposed to close
at $3000.00

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin@Ikk
auto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2
October 2018 9:21
AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

11



‘WITHOUT

PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO

COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We regret to
inform you that we
have our Principal
instruction to
maintain our offer.

Please re-consider
our offer.

Thanks.

“Please note that our
proposal and
correspondence with
you is strictly on a
without prejudice basis
and should not be
construed as an
admission of liability on
our part and/or that of
our policyholder and/or
the authorised driver.
The terms of our
without prejudice
engagement should not
be disclosed in any
other related matter(s)
in respect of this
accident nor should it
be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:
thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933

12



From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2
October 2018 9:19
AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.5g>; '"ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :
CC4/ASM18008624
/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Good day to you
and hope this
email serve you
well.

Kindly provide us
your revised offer
or status for us to
close this case on
our end.

We sincerely look
forward to
receive your offer
for our claims.

Thank you so
much.

13



Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Chan Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Chan
@dingauto.sq]
Sent: Friday, 28
September 2018
11:01 AM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
Rlua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We arrange
surveyor on 9
May 2018.

But surveyor
came on 11 May
2018.

Thus we would
like to claim all in
$3230.

Kindly revert
back with better
offer as soon as
possible.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690
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From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin@Ikk
auto.com]

Sent: Friday, 28
September 2018
10:30 AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

‘WITHOUT

PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO

COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the
below matter.

We have our
Principal instruction
to offer at global
sum S $2,750.00
(all-in).

Please confirm the
acceptance.

“Please note that our
proposal and
correspondence with
you is strictly on a
without prejudice basis
and should not be
construed as an
admission of liability on
our part and/or that of
our policyholder and/or
the authorised driver.
The terms of our
without prejudice
engagement should not
be disclosed in any
other related matter(s)
in respect of this
accident nor should it

15



be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:

thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi

Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933

From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28
September 2018
9:33 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.5g>; 'ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :
CC4/ASM 18008624
/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Any update on the
states/offer for this
case?

Kindly provide us
your offer or

16



status for us to
close this case on
our end.

We sincerely look
forward to
receive your offer
for our claims.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Chan Carlor
[mailto:Carlor.Chan
@dingauto.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 20
September 2018
1:20 PM

To: 'Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng';
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Date of Accident
for vehicle on
5/5/2018 and our
insured reporting
on 7/5/2018.

We arrange
surveyor on
9/5/2018 but
surveyor came on
11/5/2018.
Vehicle out on
19/5/2018.

Thus, we would like
to claim a total of
15 days.

17



Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin@Ikk
auto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20
September 2018
11:37 AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

"Without
Prejudice"

Dear Carlor,

Can give me
breakdown for 15
days as our
surveyor
recommended 3
days to repair the
vehicle.

Kindly note that this
negotiation between
parties on this matter is
purely on a without
prejudice basis with the
sole intention of
resolving the matter
amicably without
parties resorting to
legal proceedings. No
admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from
18



this negotiation of
terms/settlement.

In the event of new
evidence being
discovered or
subsequently produced
by either party that will
materially
affect/influence on the
issues of
liability/damages,
either party is not
bound, thereafter, by
the negotiation
terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:
thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi

Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20
September 2018
11:34 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.5g>; 'ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :

19



CC4/ASM18008624
/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

We didn’t have the
income statement
from our insured.

Based on average
we provide
$100/day for loss of
income and 15 days
for repair.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
[mailto:thinthin@Ikk
auto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20
September 2018
10:38 AM

To: Chan Carlor
Cc: 'Kelly Ding';
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng’;
'ACCOUNTS'
Subject: RE: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
R1lua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Carlor,

We refer to the
below matter.

Please be inform
that we are seeking

20



mandate approval
from our Principal.

Kindly let us have
the number of day
breakdown for LOU
and LOI.

And also provide us
income statement
for our necessary
action.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing |
Case Handler

LKK Auto
Consultants Pte
Litd

Phone: 6841-2360 |
email:

thinthin@lkkauto.co
m | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi

Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Chan Carlor
<carlor.chan@ding
auto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20
September 2018
10:17 AM

To: Thin Thin
(LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ikkauto.
com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingau
to.sg>; 'Kenneth
Ding'
<kenneth.ding@din
gauto.sg>; 'You
jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingaut
0.5g>; 'ACCOUNTS'
<ACCOUNTS@DING
AUTO.SG>

Subject: RE: (REF :
CC4/ASM 18008624
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/R1ua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Good day to you
and hope this
email serve you
well.

We would like to
check and follow
up on the status
and offer for this
case as we have
not hear from
you.

Kindly provide us
your offer or
status for us to
close this case on
our end.

We sincerely look
forward to
receive your offer
for our claims.

Thank you so
much.

Thanks and Best
Regards,

Chan Jia Le
(Carlor)

Office Hp: 9239
4128

Fax: 6265 2690

From: Michelle
[mailto:accounts@d
ingauto.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 13
September 2018
1:28 PM

To:
thinthin@Ikkauto.co

22



m
Cc: Chan Carlor;
'Kelly Ding";
'Kenneth Ding'; 'You
jingfeng'

Subject: Re: (REF

CC4/ASM18008624/
Rlua3) BILLING
FOR SLG9101D TP
CLAIMS AGAINST
SLP5116R ON
5/5/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

As per your email
dated on 4 June
2018, the liability
is clear for us,
We have also
already e-mailed
all supporting
document on 21
August 2018.

But we still have
not get back any
update at your
end.

Appriciate your
assistance to
revert back with
an offer as soon as
possible.

Thank you so
much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 6/9/2018 6:17
PM, Michelle
wrote:

De
ar
Thi
n
Thi

n,

23



We
hav

alr
ead

e_
ma
ile

all
sup
por
tin

doc
um
ent
on
21

gus

20
18.
But
we
stil

hav

not
get
bac

any
up
dat
e at
yo
ur
end
As
the
lia
bili
ty
is
cle
ar
for
us,

24



pri
ciat

yo
ur
ass
ista
nce
to
rev
ert
bac

wit

an
off
er
as
SO0

as
pos
sibl

Th
ank

yo
o)
ch

Yo
urs
sin
cer
ely
Mi
che
lle
Fa
ng
92
39
41
28

ng
Au
to
Pte
Ltd

25



On

30/
8/2
01

10:
10

Ch

an

Car

lor

Wwr

ote

0OV © v b€ .- CF—L£ . C

~

O oooTc T ® >+ 0 >0 > @ c T L 0 QO UV - £ .—

26



nw o £ ©

w UL >0 >0 3 U —

< V205 _T— ¥ 0V4p OULUE VDU OTCTw O_—— 03I s5ao

27



C »p £ U nn & O &2 5 nn © € T 0 - - OV =« 4 0 v« p <

— » U VW U w2 VE ©>UVC O 4o0C UM OE >0

28



N4

— & T —

> QO <« 0O >

— O O 5 v > 0 35 =« 0O 44 O =« O =« N 4= M += 5 Ny O « O »w +» 0 U — 0 n Vv +~ <

29



w O © ynwn O O € O 5 « U € T

S 0w C OOV U >— 0OO0O~X4w Or 2 © LT+ 0w VOOUV.- >U>0 55 v

30



OfferfOFOUFC|a.ImS

S ©oCECx~¥ >03wO0E E s o<

- C ©® C XX »n © C TN UV wnw +— X

31



U b0 « T wn

LU C T C 3 2 ©d VeOO ©® = —0 v —0 4 4. 00T

e OO N MO T = N0 WL © X

.« O N O LN N O

32



L = O €. _ UEC U — — e_|.m_ O] .y —i 421 O] -« © O VI Ol 3| C| 4 S_@d_.l_ Cl O ®© Slus O o N O—N O C 49

= 0o

33



C O w»nwT O >

. SO 4= LN

~ANO -0 N

.o = k=0

k. ChbPCc._cCcoeaX¥X¥¥JILS>o0~00

¥ 0O CcCCc oo Lc0

—_C O . X

34



O — — >0

— O

<0

— Cc o0

— C OO<C 3+ O

<l — O X

> O Oim C O 0O Cc O

..0occowe._ £

-~ Ol 3l ©

.l ol o oral o8 ol._,

35



Cl O © 3| 4+ Ol

OV 3O m0 U

e O W WL

OO0 <nNZEZ-HowoooOANT XA STOMN N J 1200 xxuna0o—~o~0

36



FoO a2 N0~ Z0NFnNaon—A—0ox0ZIn—-nNn-nNo - o

Ao uBHo - aBHo .~ ¢

-~

aasalyed

37



NS~ OO OANT ¥ — 5 <

A O 8 v O v O 0 B o &@O0O.S 0T 3 U0 M b S 800D 0058 08 oo O

38



O B B 0 B 0Bt & o 205 hom & 1 3 = O

Z 0 S > 0008 0 00T eSO DS

PNl R SV

39



40



= O R - =8 AT OO

- 0 v I — N TV @ >N = 0O & C e = om OO

41



44 O =4 O B . & » B = 0O T

S N D =4 O~ O B .« & b

HFOowag—-ZSEO 0 wowDa ™o

R I Vo BN o = TN D)

42



tOWeekend)Repa.erOSt..$2400+7% AN MNOO ] O v v O ¥ O ..8—ANO X—1in || &5 00O

43



ocd 0 v n Ot =00 B o0.P~CcOoOR—nllr—~nocodH<L<YN 08 4 OO OO ..ohm .o~ +=2 Il 5 M.~ 2o —

44



v O P O e O B OMBn e D8 S O OOl 8B O0OO0ORE O—~0»n0eS 00 n 0O n OO0 n O

45



C v .y O — O

s O B3 H4Hnw»-AHG OO Y O X

LS H0OSg 0A 1 0k 0o OoOOONMOOTT ANOAA O 3P 0P 0P T

46



HMH- -4 ECA~ 0T HOPP VALV OVLOLO>NNEOVSPP AP OOQOVECB-AAOTP OO0 HHECB-HCOHH-A OO ®TT H O

47



9]

9]

MO0V NMAOHO A

l NOWHZEZHZOHZAODONMHAEMHCAR®NH

N H OO NHZOAG A ONMELW>WWOWIT N

° Virus-free. www.avast.com

48



Yo

Si
nc
er
el
Y

Mi
ch
el
le

ng
92
39
41
28

NO

TE
I

Al

ma
il
ed
le
tt
er

ch
eq
ue
pa
ym
en

is
to
be
ma
il
ed
to
ou

ma
in
of
fi
ce
ad
dr
es

BL
ocC

10
#0

20

49



ST

MI
NG
IN
DU
ST
RI
AL
ES

SE

ST
NG
AP
OR

57
56
45

Yours
Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed
letter &
cheque payment
is to be
mailed to our
main office
address

BLOCK 10 #01-
20

SIN MING
INDUSTRIAL
EST. SEC C
SINGAPORE
575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque
payment is to be mailed to
our main office address
BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST.
SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is
to be mailed to our main office
address
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BLOCK 10 #01-20
SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C
SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed
to our main office address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main
office address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office
address

BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!

All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office address
BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575645

51



