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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-0 (LKKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 1:54 PM

To 'Elaine Ngu'

Cc assignments

Subject: RE: Our ref: 557341 SKVI6D0M & PC2602U on 02.05.2018
Dear Elaine,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for PC 2602U after some attempts to inform the
wrirkshop to present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Regards,

Byt Ruegards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emnil: assignménlaéiikkautocom | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Pays Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1,202-25 | S{408913)

From: Elaine Ngu [mailto:elaine_ngu@sg. msig-asia.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 9:33 AM

Ta: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Our ref; 557341 SKVI600M & PC2602U on 02.05.2018
Importance: High

Dear Catherine
we refer to above captioned matter.

Please advise if there Is any survey conducted on third party's vehicle. if so, please let us have a copy of your
finalisation report & invoice for payment.

Fegards,



Have a areat week ahead)

Elaine Ngu
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2540 | mrm fax +65 6225 7402 | elaine_ngu@®sg.msig-asia.com
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From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 13/06/2019 13:58 PM,
To ELAINE; MSIG_ENSM
Subject PC 602U

ﬂuur SirfMdm,

Please be Infarmed that we are unabie to corduct the inspection for FC 2502U after some attempts To inform the workshop to present the vahicle.
This cas= Nas been panding for a long tirme dus ta the unavallabllity of the awmar, theralore we decided to tamporarily close this ase.

Mindly advis= os If there is sty arrangement made and will be giad o re-apan tha :a_sn_amul_‘d'lnulv.

Bt Regards,

|G Wivitha | Admin

|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

PHade: BB41-1572 | ematis assignmentsditkkayto.com | fax: 62564315
Btk 51, Puya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There aré no goouments,




