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!' l’!lf Auto

posige Sy Consultants
e Fie Lid Company Registration No. 199607139ER

(

&1 LBIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: XEA25Y/SE/pl
Our Ref: CS/EGI18008513/Uvb Date: 17/5/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Without Prejudice

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.XD 5128C

We thank you for your instruction on 9/5/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

9/5/2018 at the premises of M/s LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING
WORKSHOP and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §%20,962.40

Revised Estimate Amount : §59,500.00 LUMP S5UM}
"Check" Items Amount : 8%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear i

n/s front portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

E

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 May 2018 10:35 AM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); SUR
Subject: RE: XE425Y / TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018
Attachments: %D 5128C PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle XD 5128C
Date of survey: 9/5/2018
Number of days:4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 May 2018 9:29 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: XE425Y / TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle XD 5128C on 9/5/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 12:37 FM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’ <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XE425Y /TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Dear Pai Lj,

Thank you for the assignment.



Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bagh-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 12:07 PM

To: 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com=>

Subject: Ol : XE425Y / TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from LIU’S BROTHER AUTO,

ADDRESS : NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUSAN @ 6741 1730
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motar)

ERGO Insurance Fte. Lid,

£ Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel: B5 6A29 9199 DID; 65 68209 9194
Website: www.ergo.com,sq

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group). one of the world's leading risk carmiers.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 11 May 2018 9:29 AM

To: ‘survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); SUR
Subject: RE: XE425Y / TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018
Dear Pei L1,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle XD 5128C on 9/5/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 12:37 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: XE425Y / TP : ¥D5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Dear Pei Li,

Thank you for the assignment,

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: pssipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.} [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 12:07 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : XE425Y /TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from LIU’S BROTHER AUTO,

ADDRESS : NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
1



#01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUSAN @ 6741 1730
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE  : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038965

Tel: B5 6820 5199 DID: 65 6829 9194
Websiie: www. ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countnes
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



Catherine Ehonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 12:07 PM

To: ‘admin-d@Ilkkauto.com’

Subject: OI: XE425Y /TP : XD5128C/LKK / DOA : 07/05/2018

Attachments: XEA25Y - SAS.pdf; XD5128C - SAS.pdf; XD5128C - PRS FORM .pdf; Re: Request for

3rd party survey XD5128C Claims against XE425Y (20,0 KB)

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from LIU’S BROTHER AUTO,

ADDRESS : NO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : SUSAN @ 6741 1730

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party
vehicle that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your
office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank yau

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038985

Tel: 65 6829 9199 DID: 65 6829 9194
Website: www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in mare than 30 countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



Date:
Our Reference;

Your Reference:

Ta:

09.05.2018

XE 425Y/SE/pl

XD 5128C

LIU'S BROTHER AUTO

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: XD 5128C

Insured's Vehicle:

Date OF Accident

XE 425Y

07.05.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PR3 on;

08.05.2018

ERGO

Sant via Fax

ar

Email

liusbro@ymail.com

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *. *
AlS Autamabile Inspection Services Pte Lid LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pte Lid
FTA FermTeam Consultancy Pte Lid LKKE LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service Ps Priority Services
IPKE JP Knights Pte Ltd VAL Vicom Ltd

v Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy,

vV |others:

OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Qur Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate,

Your request for inspection does not have your client's GLA report, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

Frepared by:
Signature:

N

Pei Li

68299194

claims@ergo.com.sg
FAX : 6829 9247

Assessor use only:

Assignment Date:
Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Workshop use only:
Assessor attended wnrlu.hng an:

Date:
Time
Inspector:

D Vehicle not available at the appeointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.

Naote: Our Inspection Is on @ without admission to lability basis.




. 09.05.2018

{er Reference: XE 42 5"f’f55,-"|3|

Your Relerence ‘E} 5128C

Ta: LIU'S BROTHER AUTO

Pre-Repair Survey [PRS) Acknowledgement

yehicle For Inspection: KD 5128C
Insured's Vahicle: KE 425Y
Date Of Accident: 07.05.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on;

08.05.2018

Sent via Fax

oar

Ermail
Husbro{@ymail.com

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016%, do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

%

A% i Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LBS L.B.% Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LEK LKK Aute Consultants Pre Lid
(L Infiniti Appraisal Service 5 Priority Services

“IPK IP Knights Pie Ltd WAl Wicom Ltd

L vV |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Ot Insured's driver has not reported the accident 1o us todate.

W Your request far inspection does not have your client's cost of repanr estimate, kindly forward a copy.
our request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy,

wWe acrknnwledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & rever! soon upon receipt of estimate,

Prepared by: \ Pei Ll 6279 9194 Jdaims@ergﬂ_mm_,, g
.

signature: A |FAX : 6829 9247

Masessor use only: Workshop use only:

Bssggnment Date:
Assagnment Time:

Remarks:

—

Ausessor attended workshop on;
Drate:

T
Indpector:

D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Vel A
Waorkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp———

Mote: Our Inspectian is on a withaut admission to llability basis,
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Usad Hino SH1EEKA Car for Sale in Singapore, - saCarMart

sGCARMART.COM

MNew Cars

HIND

Sell My Car

_' | Price Range b

Directory

DEI}I_“ECbatII.'Jn v

Home » Used Cars # Direct Owners » Hing SHIEEKA (COE till 03/2023)

Resources

Car Buying

Car Selling

Car Ownership
Car Aftermarket
On The Move
Lifestyle

vehicle Number Plates
BUY & SELL

Your AUSPICIOUS
& UNIQUE Vehicle No.

Do you know? We ore Singoperes

BIGGEST PLAYER -

with the mot vehide plete nurbers for sds

Overview

Hino SH1EEKA (COE till 03/2023)

Add to Shortlist

Depreciation

Reg Date

Lifespan
Manufactured
Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Curb Weight
Fuel type
Features
Accessories

Description

COE

oMy

ARF

Dereg Value
No. of Owners
Type of Veh
Category

Availability

Add to Shortlist

Financial

Accessories Similar

Add to Compare Add a Note

£57,000
$11,660 fyr

31-Mar-2008
{dyrs 10mths 20days COE left)

30-Mar-2028

2008

220,000 km (217K fyr)
Manual

12,913 cc

6,780 kg

Diesel

Radio CD.

Products

CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

Insurance

Photos

‘n’ear Reg v -
Research
Report Error
L 7

Well Maintain, Newly Spray Paint, 1 Owner Only. View

To Appreciate,

£20,115

£70,748

£3,538

£19,674 as of today (change)
2

Truck

COE Car, Direct Qwner Sale
Available

Add to Compare

hitp:/www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/infophp?ID= 735616&DL=1000

P OIRECT OWNER

Add a Note

QOO0

| Vehicle Type v

Article

Map

More Actions

100% FREE
PAPERWORK
SUPPORT FOR
BOTH BUYER
& SELLER:

Seller In
Contact Persc
Contact No.
Enquiry

USEFUL FOR

» Indemnity
» Receipt
» MOL

Instruction
consumer de

Regardless ¢
YOUr papeny

W3



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Owmer 1Dy
Vehicle Details
Wehicle Mo
Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Wehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis Mo.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Crpen Market Value:
Ciriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transter Count:

M\ tual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

FARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PFARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Theinformation contained herein is correct as at 08 May 2018

hitps:/fvrl Ita. gov sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput’FUNCTION ID=F03040.

Company
1196N

XD51280C

%]

08 May 2018

HING

SHIEERA 13L MANLIAL ABS TURBO
White

2011

E13CUN14045

SH1EER10035

537 764,00
11 Moy 2011
11 Moy 2011
1

54,38%.00

Mo

8000

10 Mow 2021

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$34,00%.00
$£11.922.00
$11,922.00

Page | of 1

08-May-18
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Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

- RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone +65 6224 0010 Fax, +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 35T Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo GR-18-069681
Date of Request 0B/0S2018 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase

LIU'S BROTHER AUTO WORKSHOP
1 Kak Bukit Ave 6 #01-01

Auto Bay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417863

i

Cear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 08/05/2018

Enquiry By Susan Low Siew Yian

TP Yehicle No, XE425Y

Accident Date 07/05/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo, Insurer Pericd of Insurance Insurer Tel No
XE425Y ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd 03/03/2018-02/03/2019 5820 9199
Thank You

The images provided to you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded fo the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatseever for any loss
or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images

-

This is a computer generated document and requires na signature.

hnps.wa.giaﬁnc.org.sgclaimsﬁndex.cI"m’?fusebox=MTRsas&t‘useactinn=dsp_geninvt... 08-May-18



Invoice

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURANCE 5102 t62 5224 0010 £ 266 a224 000

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref Mo, GR-18-069681
Date of Request: 08/05/2018

LIL'S BROTHER AUTO WORKSHOP
1 Kaki Bukit Ave & #01-01

Auto Bay@HKaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Cperating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No. M400017733

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No Cnline Purchase

Enquiry Date Q8052018

Enquiry By Susan Low Siew Yian

TF Yehicle Mo, XEAZSY

Accident Date Q71052018

DESCRIFPTION AMOUNT (55)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
G5T Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 200
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[%] GIRC [ ] Cash [ ]| Chegque

https fwww giarme org sg/claims/index. cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp geninvt...  08-May-18
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(Lo}

LIS IEREOVTINERE ARTTO ENGINERIENG WOltksTonr InvoleesRel No:  XOS5128C180507
. LU ¥ LAY TERR T H B TR, TR [N Eoaki Ihikin % v A1 TERT
RO Mo WORI79E) L T8 1700 CTR | TEE-STR " 1
[Costomer o i
Mame:  ERGO Insurance Pre Lid are: 08-05-18
Address: Motor Claims ”"P‘”"‘.'!].'l'l[._.. - - = SR .".f'u:hiclr_v M _‘{T_}S_QT _____ )
5 Tomasek Boulevard #04-01 = Muodel/Malee:  Hino SILEE RA
Suntec Tower Five Singapore (38985 131 Manual ABS Turbo
Crriginal Hevised
Item No. Dheseriptions OF Parts Chotation ¢ Omartativn ¢
Estimation Cost OF Repair
| Front Lh Door 36/7-ZL $ 5639.70 B
. Daor Hinge 02 pes (@ ‘s':‘plei‘« 0q) 6,{.4 /fm-—f & 29000 LT
3 Door Signal Lamp A4 17000 b
4 Door Rubber BeA ¥ 27500
5 DoorLock e Z}'ﬂ Fril--1L 43000 kb
4 Daar Hondle $ 260000 | X
7 Do CGlass .(,/{ S $ e300 b
5 Door Glass Wpf:rhprsrnp I | ?Ff{_r b 5000 L—1"
2 Daoor Glass Quter Gamish A 3 31700 :(
10 Door Glass Regulator  gadf /yw $  540.00 &=
i1 Door Glass Panel A 3 21400 [
12 Door Glass Motar Jm & e $ _#80.00
13 Door Inner Trim Board h.cfr i $ 780.704
14 Door inner Trirm Board Clip {1 set] 44 i 50,00 | X
15 Door Wire aaA 5 41000 K
& Door Quier Lower Protector (Garnish) a of 48520 LT
17 Door Gamish Inner Panel L £ 29000 L
18 Door "2041" Emblem LA £ 14500
1% Door "EURC 4" Emblern AL $  lB00 T
20 Step Panel  #L § 1.370.00 P4
21 Wheeal Panel P $ BAL2D |ne”
22 wheel Panel Quter Gamish D« § £ 37440 |-
23 Cormer Pane| S PSR
24 Sicle Mirror Arm e 0 9B0.00 J—
75 Sicle: Mitror Arm Cover 4 /1@ / 5 $ 38520 |—
24 Bumper Top Comer Panel 7 oJ P O580.00d —
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 1996071988 GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Atfillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/EGI1B008513/Uvbn2
5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD M“W”mmm
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 18-05-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code . EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  XE 425Y Veh, Inspected XD 5128C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. XE 425Y/SEfpl Excess () 0.00
Assign From PEI LI Assign Date 08/05/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HINO SH1EERA (M) c.C 12913
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. SH1EER10035 Colour WHITE
Odometer 220184 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |295/80 R22.5 TRIANGLE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |285/B0 R22.5 TRIANGLE & rmm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/B0 R22.5 (D) TRIANGLE 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |285/80 R22.5 (D) TRIANGLE 616 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/05/2018 |Inspaction Date 08/05/2018
Survey held at  LIU'S BROTHER AUTO WORK SHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-01 AUTO BAY @ KAK) BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 bl Awe 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XD 5128C
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | S rkshnp?;}] {2’,
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT LH DOOR DISTORTED 563970 3,611.42
2|DOOR HINGE @$145.00 TWISTED / BENT 290.00 280.00
1|DOOR SIGHAL LAMP MOT NECESSARY 170.00
1|DOOR RUBBER TORN 275.00 27500
1|DOOR LOCK JAMMED / TWISTED 630 00 42515
1|DOOR HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 260.00 -
1|DOOR GLASS SHATTERED 693.00 54512
1|DOOR GLASS WEATHERSTRIP DISTORTED 570.00 39065
1|DOOR GLASS OUTER GARNISH MOT NECESSARY 37.00 -
1|DO0OR GLASS REGULATOR BENT f TWISTED 540.00 540.00
1|D0O0OR GLASS PANEL NO SUCH PARTS 216.00 -
1|0O0OR GLASS MOTOR JAMMED 880 .00 645.00
1|DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED / 780.70 78070
CRACKED
1|SET DOOR INMNER TRIM BOARD CLIP MOT HECESSARY 50.00 -
1|DOOR WIRE NOT NECESSARY 410.00
1|DO0OR OUTER LOWER PROTECTOR (GARNISH) DISTORTED 485 20 485 20
1|DCOR GARNISH INNER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 290.00 -
LABOUR
1|DOOR "2041" EMBLEM MECESSARY 145.00 145.00
1|DOOR "EURO 4" EMBLEM MECESSARY 118.00 118.00
1|STEP PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,370.00 -
LABOUR
1|WHEEL PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 84520 -
LABOUR
1|WHEEL PANEL OUTER GARNISH DISTORTED 37460 37480
1|CORNER PANEL CRACKED 596.20 586,20
1|SIDE MIRROR ARM BENT 880.00 S80.00
1|SIDE MIRROR ARM COVER BROKEN 38520 385.20
1|BUMPER TOP CORNER PANEL DISTORTED 580.00 560.00
1|BUMPER SIDE MISSING 160.90 160.90
1|SIGNAL LAMP SCRATCHED 230.70 230,70

Report Ref No, CS/EGI18008513/Uvbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 P‘al,'a Uhi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition
Workshop ($)) ($)
LESS 10% DISCOUNT i -1,154.78
18,362 .40 10,393.06
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|"cORPORATE" ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 400.00 200.00
400.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT 80.00 20.00
FOR PROPER FUNCTION.
LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT WELD,STRAIGHTEN & 900.00 600.00
REPLACING PARTS ETCS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
DOOR GARNISH INNER PANEL,STEP PANEL AND WHEEL
PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TOUCH UP 1,000.00 700.00
PAINT ON ACCIDENT .
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING RESEAL TUFF-COATING 100.00 50.00
TREATMENT ON ACCIDENT AREA.
Ty REMOVE REPLACE AND TRANSFER DOOR 120.00 §0.00
PANEL FITTING AND MECHANISMS,
2,200.00 1,430.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,962.40 12,023.06
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 9,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18008513/Uvbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Report.




