Vic (LKKAuto)

From: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 5:24 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); info@yewteegroup.com

Cc: Admin A; 'YT(HQ)'

Subject: RE: SKF876C LKK REF CC6/LCR18008501/Uhb3
Attachments: SKF876C INVOICE - PAID BY OWNER.pdf

Hi,

Kindly take note owner already discharge with us as attached invoice, hence kindly due with owner directly.

Thank you.

Best Regards
MAY

&
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YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 9:00 AM

To: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; info@yewteegroup.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKF876C LKK REF CC6/LCR18008501/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Shawn,

We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have our principal’s
mandate and we offer a global sum settlement of $14,400.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward a copy to us for payment processing.



The above amount is to be made payable to YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 5:18 PM

To: YT(HQ); info@yewteegroup.com

Cc: Admin A; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SKF876C LKK REF CC6/LCR18008501/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Shawn,

We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for mandate approval from our principal.
We will follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

| B 74 7S
SR RSR i Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-



This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: YT(HQ) [mailto:utauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 5:09 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); info@yewteegroup.com; Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKF876C

Importance: High

Hi
Any status of the case

Pls take noted that yr insured has already been taken action by traffic police

Best Regards

9743 2262
www.yewteegroup.com
info@yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Managing Director of

-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

-YEW TEE (CAMBODIA) AUTOMOBILE CO. LTD
-ULTIMAX LEASING PTE LTD

-SKT TYRE & BATTERY SERVICES PTE LTD

——
TOLE TouiTio paafega

YT

WEST HQ: EAST Branch Office: NORTH Branch:

Blk 6 Woodlands Road 399F Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 Mega@Woodlands

Yew Tee Ind. Est Unit No #01-60/61 39 Woodlands Close #01-12
Singapore 678006 Singapore 417800 Singapore 737856

DID: 6765 3373 / 6762 2081 DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines) DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6760 4895 Fax: 6702 3773 Fax: 6256 2533

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg Email: info@yewteegroup.com

please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 January, 2019 9:54 AM

To: info@yewteegroup.com; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>; Yew Tee (HQ
<utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SKF876C

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.
By copy to Vic,

Case reassign to you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Saturday, 19 January 2019 4:03 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@I|kkauto.com>; Yew Tee (HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(HQ)
<info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: SKF876C

Hi,
Refer to attached, kindly let us have the DV soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards

——
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YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.
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