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! U U Consulfanis

P Pia Lid Company Registration No. 199607 198R

51 UBLAVE L, #02-25 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL PARE, SINGAPORE JO8U33 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (B65) 6Z564315

Your Ref: CLED1800069/FO0 Date: 18 May 2018

Our Ref: CS/SMO18008489/M1s3b

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
Tenet Sompo Insurance Pte Lid

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. XB 9515C

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on __14/05/2018 _ at the premises of M/s Woon Meng Motor Pte Lid and have
the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount (Incomplete) : 53 0.00
Revised Estimate Amount (Labour) : 5% 1,650.00
“Check” Items Amount : 5% -
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : 8% -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Repair days: 6 Days

Remarks : Pending Parts Prices

Yours faithfully,
Ma Chin Fook

Automotive Assessor



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) '

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 11:33 AM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)’

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; ‘Admin A’

Subject: RE: XB9515C

Dear Shirley

Accept your offer $5900.00,6days
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1121/51

Fax: 6316 7050

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 11:25 AM

To: 'Heng Sew Sow' <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg=>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XB9515C

Hi Ms Heng,
COR I/s 55,900, 6 days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, ##02-25
| 5(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 9:43 AM

To: 'Heng Sew Sow' <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Ce: sur@lkkauto.com; "Admin A" <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XB9515C

Hi Ms Heng,

Kindly send us the after paint and check item photos.
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 11 August 2018 5:34 PM

To; sur@lkkauto.com; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: XB9515C

Dear Sir/Madam
Can we finalise the repair cost
Thank you

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050



Shiriex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 18 May 2018 5:18 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace’; PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg; KokFoo.Chia@sompo.com.sg

Cc: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)’; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: Our ref: CLBD1800069/FO0 - Accident involving XB9515C & KALMAR ( ALLIED
CONTAINER SERVICE PTE LTD ) ON 30.04.18 ( PUBLIC LIABILITY )

Attachments: %B 9515C - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of XB 9515C.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: Sur@/kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 10:36 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; Chia, Kok
Foo <KokFoo.Chia@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Our ref: CLBD1800069/FOO0 - Accident involving XB9515C & KALMAR ( ALLIED CONTAINER SERVICE PTE LTD
) ON 30.04.18 | PUBLIC LIABILITY )

Our Reference: CLBD1800069/FO0

Dear LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for XB9515C.

We are pleased to inform you that Mr Chia Kok Foo will be handling this case.
You may contact him at Tel: 6329 5330 or E-mail: KokFoo.Chia@sompo.com.sg, should you need further assistance,

Would you kindly quote our claim reference, CLBD1800069/FOQ, when communicating with us.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

o

Innovation for Wellbeing
: e, SOMPO A Century of Trust

1




* Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 10:36 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Heng Sew Sow; Gnoh, Pau Loong; Chia, Kok Foo

Subject: Qur ref: CLBD1800069/FOQ - Accident involving XB9515C &t KALMAR ( ALLIED
CONTAINER SERVICE PTE LTD ) OM 30.04.18 { PUBLIC LIABILITY )

Attachments: 20180508150924. pdf

Our Reference: CLBD1800069/FO0

Dear LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for XB9515C.

We are pleased to inform you that Mr Chia Kok Foo will be handling this case.
You may contact him at Tel: 6329 5330 or E-mail: KokFoo.Chia@sompo.com.sg, should you need further assistance.

Would you kindly quote our claim reference, CLBD1800069/FOO, when communicating with us.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

i./ Innovation for Wellbaing AC £ T
& S

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www . facebook com/SompaSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

-----0riginal Message-——--

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, May 08, 2018 5:32 PM

To: Han, Bernard

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong; Teo, Grace; Chia, Kok Foo

Subject: RE: Our ref: CLBD1800069 - Accident involving XB9515C & KALMAR { ALLIED CONTAINER SERVICE PTE LTD ]
ON 30.04.18 ( PUBLIC LIABILITY )

Dear Bernard

a. LKK Auto Consultants



Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

————— Original Message--—-

From: Han, Bernard [mailto:Bernard.han@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 5:03 PM

To: woonmeng@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Chia, Kok Foo
<KokFoo.Chia@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Our ref: CLBD1800069 - Accident involving XB9515C & KALMAR ( ALLIED CONTAINER SERVICE PTE LTD |
ON 30.04.18 { PUBLIC LIABILITY )

Dear Ms Heng

We refer to your email this afternoon, tried to call you telephone number a few times but unable to reach you.
1. Our claim reference is CLBD1800069 and Mr Chia is handling the claim.

2. You can discuss with Mr Chia on the possibility of settling your client's claim directly with us.

3. We suggest to appoint one of the surveyor below to conduct survey of your client’s vehicle, kindly let us have your
consent.

a. LKK Auto Consultants
b. Priority Services
c. Raleigh Services

Thank you.

Best Regards

Bernard Han

Claims Division

D: 6322 4659 | T: 6221 2211 | F: 6221 3147

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain
confidential and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may
be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the
purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit
bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents
(acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

----- Original Message-----

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 3:51 PM

To: claimsreport <claimsreport@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Accident involving XB9515C & KALMAR ( ALLIED CONTAIMNER SERVICE PTE LTD ) ON 30.04.18 { PUBLIC
LIABILITY )



Dear Sir/fMadam

we refer to the above accident

Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:

XB9515C, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle. We would like to proceed with direct
settlement.

Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our client's Vehicle at your earliest
convenience,

Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 #01- 06 Midview Building ( S ) 659578 ( Vehicle in )

Thank you.

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel : 63161131
Fax : 63167050



W T 18055526-01 | Hitachi Capital Asla Pachic Ple. Lid - BO
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 3002018 1541

SUBMITTED BY: Mg Jiang How

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Please repert coractly the details of the accident [o speed up the claims pracess

2 Thiz Farm must be eompleted by the Policyholdes andior the Authonssed Driver

3 Intormation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible: Any wilful misrapresentation ar witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies 1o
repudiate polbicy ability

4 Tha msus and aceaptance of this Eorm by ingurance companies is not an admission of palicy Nability on the part of the Insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

= This report will be forwarded by the inaurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the Ganeral Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, far 3 fes, De macde available upon apolication by nberested parties

7. By tha lodgament of this report to the insurars, you heraby consent 1o the archiving of this repart at the cen'rs and o coples of the rapart biing made availabls
aloresaid
Date Of Report 30/04/2018 15:41
Date Of Accident 300472018 08:30
Exact Location Of Accident 25 PENJURLU LANE
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
\Vehicle Registration Number XB9515C
Insured/Policyholder
Mame OFf Registerad Owner HIN KAH LOGISTICS PTE LTD
Co Reg No 200205600M
Email Address DEREMCE@HINKAH.COM.5G
Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-97961828
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer MITSUBISHI
Model FPR17DR2RDEB

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy NO
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category GOODS VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD
Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY

Fleat Policy MO

Paolicy Number D1BMTHCVEDQOTTI
Cover Mote Mumber

Driver

Mame of Driver XIN FUMING

Passpart No/FIN G3015142P

Date Of Birth 01/06/1879

Occupation OUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 250212014

Driving Experience 4 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mahile Mumber (LOCAL) +65-98615527

Fax Number
Contact Number

=Mail Address NOEMAIL



Address NIL
Fostcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

\ehicle Registration Number of Driver's Dwn
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
MNumber of vehicles invalved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or propery damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance he
Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the sccident reported to the police? NO

If ¥es, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? [
If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO ATTACHMENT

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO
Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number KALMAR f/// (A ffff{’f""-__;ffﬂ_ /L M /(’7,{//>

Wehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category GOODS VEHICLE
Mame of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcoda

Insurance Company NMame

Mature Of Damage

No. OF Passenger (Including Driver)
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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Office 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 659578
Workshop. 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-08 Midview Building. Singapore 659578
Tel: 6316 1131 HP- 97302017 Fax: 6316 7050
42, Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 720866 Tel 63268523
{ Email Adress ; woonmeng @singnet.com.sg |

Co Reg No. 200603678M GST Reg No. 20-0603678M
Estimate
TP CLAIM
To : Tenet Sompo Insurance Pte Ltd
Motor Claims Dept Date : 14 May 2018
Dear Sirs : Fax : 6221 3147

RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR MITSUBISHI P. MOVER FP517 - XB9515C
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XB9515C & KALMAR ON 30/04/2018

ITEMS DESCRIPTION QTyY PRICE
1 Front bumper ~1pc
2 Front bumper bracket n/s. _—1pec
3 Front bumper top garnish n/s. \L_,/-,Rf 1pc
4 Front bumper side seal n/s. wA Ll —"1pc
5 Front bumper lamp n/s. oAt —Tpc
B Front bumper lamp cover n/s. ~1pc
7 Front bumper lamp side garnish n/s. _—~1pc
8 Front corner lamp n/s. —1pc
g Front corner panel n/s. —1pc
10  Front step panel n/s. _—1pc
11 Front step aluminium lower n/s. _~1pc
12  Front step aluminium lower garnish n/s. _-1pc
13  Front door n/s. _~1pc
14  Front door lamp n/s. —1pc
15 Front door outer lower glass n/s _~1pc
16  Front door lock n/s. 7 1pc
17 Front door outer handle n/s v 1pc
18  Front door outer handle garnish n/s \{.1 pc

Sum Carried Forward



19
20
21
22
23

24

Sum Carried Forward

Front door lower glass inner moulding n/s. — 1pc
Front door hinge @$ ——2pcs
Front door chek n/s. = Ape X N X
Front door inner trim n/s. ¥ 1pc NK X
Front windscreen rubber n/s. S 1pe NHX
$ I

Less 25%
Front windscreen sealant. $ )/ 3000
Labour Charge & Misc
To remove, repair, replace & install damaged 3 980700 %DJD
To R & R front windscreen glass. 5 120.00 x°

To remove & install door mechanism &
check for function.

To R & R wiring.
To putty & spray painting.

Total

All prices quoted are subjected to 7% GST

This is a computer generated document. No signature is requirad.
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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

- §0 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 859578
Warkshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-08 Midview Building, Singapore 659578

Office

Tel: 6316 1131 HP. 9730 2017 Fax: 6316 7050

42, Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729666 Tel : 63268523

{ Email Adress : woonmeng @singnet.com.sg )
Co Reg No. 200603678M

Estimate
To Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
Motor Claims Dept
Dear Sirs :

GST Reg No. 20-0603678M

TP CLAIM

Date . 14 May 2018

Fax : 6221 3147

RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR MITSUBISHI P. MOVER FP517 - XB9515C
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XB9515C & KALMAR ON 30/04/2018

ITEMS

W o =~ O W b Wk -

DE IPTION

Front bumper

Front bumper bracket n/s.

Front bumper top garnish n/s.

Front bumper side seal n/s.

Front bumper lamp n/s.

Front bumper lamp cover n/s.

Front bumper lamp side gamish n/s.
Front corner lamp n/s.

Front comer panel n/s.

Front step panel n/s.

Front step aluminium lower n/s.
Front step aluminium lower garnish n/s.
Front door n/s.

Front door lamp nfs.

Front door outer lower glass n/s
Front door lock n/s.

Front door outer handle n/s

Front door outer handle garnish n/s
Sum Carried Forward

QryY

1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc
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Sum Carried Forward

Front door lower glass inner moulding n/s.

Front door hinge @%174.71ea
Front door chek n/s.

Front door inner trim n/s.
Front windscreen rubber n/s.

Front windscreen sealant.

Labour Charge & Misc

1pc
2pcs
1pe
1pc
1pc

Less 25%

To remove, repair, replace & install damaged

To R & R front windscreen glass.

To remove & install door mechanism &
check for function.

To R & R wiring.
To putty & spray painting.

Total

All prices quoted are subjected to 7% GST.

L]<

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

Reniis, daws b

Thisis a MMWD signature s required.
o par(s) dunng resurvey

» Parts prces Are subject to confirmation
© Third party survey i on & “Without Prejudics” basis
» Mo illegal modification(s) s allowsd
» Supplamentary flemis) must be fesurveyed and
is subject to fnal approval from Insurance Company

Ackncaieaged by Repsirer
Signatune:
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE

Ref : CS/SMO18008489/Dsbn2

R

#05-01/06 Date : 29-08-2018
SINGAPCORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 0485623
Code : SMO
: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected XB 9515C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLBD1800068/FO0 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEOD Assign Date 09/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI c.C 11945
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2005
Chassis No. FP517DA0S043 Colour GREEN
Odometer 742020 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [295/80 225 RADIAL B mm
L/H Front Tyre |[295/8022.5 RADIAL B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |295/80 225 RADIAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 285/80 22.5 RADIAL 8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/04/2018 Inspection Date 14/05/2018
Survey held at WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD
50 BUKIT BATOK ST 23
#01-06 MIDVIEW BUILDING
SINGAPORE 859578
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;J = ; " ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No.10f2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. XB 951 5C
Estimate Qur Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wmhhupa{;]' ""i:'[}
EME
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 883.57 883.57
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET N/S DENTED 68.00 68.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP GARNISH N/S DENTED 150.97 150.97
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE SEAL N/IS NECESSARY 90.58 90.58
1|FRONT BUMPER LAMP N/S BROKEN 145.70 14570
1|FRONT BUMPER LAMP COVER N/S cuT 152.40 152.40
1|FRONT BUMPER LAMP SIDE GARNISH NIS cuT 169.98 169.98
1|FRONT CORNER LAMP N/S CRACKED 262.70 262.70
1|FRONT CORNER PANEL N/S DENTED 961.21 961.21
1|FRONT STEP PANEL NIS BROKEN 368.17 368.17
1|FRONT STEP ALUMINIUM LOWER N/S BROKEN 257.94 257.94
1|FRONT STEP ALUMINIUM LOWER GARNISH NIS BROKEN 219.01 219.01
1|FRONT DOOR N/S DENTED 2,945 68 2,945.68
1|FRONT DOOR LAMP NIS BROKEN 145.70 14570
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER LOWER GLASS N/S BROKEN 422,07 422,07
1|FRONT DOOR LOCK N/S NOT NECESSARY 494,32 ;
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE N/S NOT NECESSARY 254.73 A
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE GARNISH N/S NOT NECESSARY 107.33 -
1|ERONT DOOR LOWER GLASS INNER MOULDING NIS ~ [CUT 106.00 106.00
2|FRONT DOOR HINGE @$174.71 BENT 349,42 349 42
1|FRONT DOOR CHEK N/S NOT NECESSARY 118.60 -
1|FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM N/S NOT NECESSARY 1,655.39 "
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN RUBBER N/S NOT NECESSARY 670.89 .
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,750.09 -1,924.78
8,250.27 5,774.32
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 7
20.00 é
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPAIR, REPLACE & INSTALL DAMAGED. 900.00 800.00
TO R&R FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
TO REMOVE & INSTALL DOOR MECHANISM & CHECK 150.00 100.00

FOF FUNCTION

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18008489/Dsbn2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i‘- = B " ; 51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 100607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607196-R Page No.2of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
ri Parts onditi
TD RER WIRING 80.00 50.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 800.00 700.00
2.050.00 1,650.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,320.27 7,424.32
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18008489/Dsbn2

ANG BRYAN TANI

Automotive Assessor | Investigator

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI




