Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 10:15 AM

To: Admin A

Subject: FW: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving SLJ5644P & XD9525M ( yr
insured ) on 06/05/18

Attachments: img004.jpg; img005.jpg; img006.jpg; img007.jpg; img008.jpg; img009.jpg; img010.jpg;

img011.jpg; img012.jpg; img013.jpg; img014.jpg; XD9525M-060518.pdf

Our Ref. VC011456
Hi

Please assist to arrange for WP survey — Direct settlement.

Thank You & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific — Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce.foo@gbe.com

Visit us on the web at www.gbe.com.sg

We create insurance sohutions for

—

. Construction -  of

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May, 2018 3:20 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>

Subject: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving SLI5644P & XD9525M ( yr insured ) on 06/05/18

Afternoon Joyce,
I have attached the GIA & estimate for my client SLI5644P for yr ref.

Pls kindly assign yr surveyor down for the survey.



Survey location : 566 Woodlands Rd ( Mandai Estate ) S728697

Thanks

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



