.qu Irene (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 July 2018 1:25 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SIWBB06A OM 08/05/2018 AT TANAH

MERAH COAST ROAD ****LKK REF.CC4/LPC18008481/jb3

Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July, 2018 5:52 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SIW8806A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD
#xxx| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008481/jb3

Dear Sirs,
This is a 3 vehicle chain collision scenario where our insured vehicle was last in line. Bola 28-100% ; Assessed:;100%
Liability is down against us.

Summary of offer to repairer M/s SPECIALIST MOTOR PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs £ 12,648.12 (per estimate) $ 6,099.00
Loss of Rental $ 1,500.00 (5150 x 10 days) $ 1,000.00 (5100 x 10 days)
GIA Search S 8.00 5 2.00
TOTAL $ 14,156.12 $7,101.00

s Bdays recommendation for repair .
e TP Vehicle : HONDA JAZZ 1339CC YEAR 2008

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.
The above summary is subject for your approval.

Kindly advise.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: jovirene®@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden,

From: Shu Pei [LEKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 May 2018 9:35 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SIWEB06A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD
#***| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008481/jb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle SJE 3904C at M /s Specialists Motor Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 2:33 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt _claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SJW8806A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD
***%| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008481/jb3

Our Ref » 17/18/18/VP05/020591

Dear Shu Pei,



Attached insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 2:01 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SJWB806A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD
#4x%| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008481/ijb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: B366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 12:57 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_5G' <mt _claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3204C AND SIWBB06A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
3



Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408633)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 11:43 AM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com=>
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3904C AND SIWEB06A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey accordingly and revert
on liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Specialists Motor Pte Ltd [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 11:48 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JE3904C AND 5JW8806A ON 08/05/2018 AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

Please refer to the above matter.

Qur client {SJE3904C) is claiming against your insured (SIWEB0GA)

Kindly arrange the surveyor to survey the vehicle SJIE3%04C and also check for us the above claim liability and OIC as soon as possible.
Thanks & Regards

Irene Ting
6747 2112

From: cardoc@singnet.com.sq [mailto:cardoc@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 10:31 AM

To: CARDOC
Subject: Attached Image



SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD
Block 3018A. Ubi Road 1, #01-24-26, Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardoci@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SIE3904C/1805083
05" June 2018 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

The Manager

Motor Claim Dept.
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300, Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJE 3904 C, SKL 6785 K AND SIW 8806 A ON
08" MAY 2018 AT 0730 HRS AT TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.
Our Client Seah Wei Ming, Aaron the registered owner of SJE 3904 C.

Y ou are the insurer of motor vehicle no. SIW 8806 A, which was involved in the above accident.
Please be informed that the collision was caused by the negligent owner/driver of the motor vehicle no.
SJW 8806 A, in consequence of which our client has suffered damages and consequential loss.

Attached a few documents for your reference:

a) Lump-sum repair

b) GIA report & LTA search

c) Car remal bill

d) An authorisation letter from the owner (SJE 3904 C)

We are claiming as follows: -

LTA search 55 8.00
Lump-sum repair 5% 6.099.00
Car rental 5% 1.500.00

S§ 7.607.00

Dollar: Seven Thousand Six Hundred And Seven Only.

Kindly let us know whether vou are prepare to settle the claim within the next ten (10) days
from the date herewith .

Please remit the cheque in favour to “Specialists Motor Pte Ltd™ as soon as possible.
Thank you,

“Yours faithfully,

7 EH _
K ,

!
Karen Ong:



ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE
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Letter Of Authority And Undertaking
[/We Seah lyu M'iﬁfjf_ﬁmn.n (NRIC NO) c910916C F i
Yok Lespbop Tign R Y Fera

the owner / driver of Vehicle No. 83k 3904 C hereby authorise your esteem

Cﬂmpﬂn}' \_[:‘PIT L" &l EE-L fn LTU e P-LL '.T-d

as my repairer for my Damaged Vehicle involved in the above accident and to claim

against the negligent party and /or insurance company.

I/ We hereby agreed to be bound by the following:-

1. You are authorised to use my four name to claim against the negligent
party and /or insurance company pertaining to the above accident including any other
incidental losses. All payments / settlement monies shall be made in

favour of your company M/S f_%JE.L-q' ANSTS  mdlee gl Tt

2 All documents receive by me from third party or insurance company
will be sent to your office for follow-up action.

3. Any offer of settlements by the insurer and / or negligent party will
be accepted only with your concurrence and approval.

4. 1/We agree to sign/execute the Discharge Receipt within 7 working days of
issue of notice. by post, electronic mail, social media or text messaging, by your company.

5. If 1/We fail to sign/execute the Discharge Notice after 7 working days from the
Issue of notice. I/'We hereby authorise your company's authorised representative to sign and
execute the said Discharge Receipt on my/our behalf.

6. Throughout the process of claim, 1/ We will be obligated to assist and
to provide your company with accurate and correct information.

7. | / We agree that 1/We shall pay to your company all cost /expenses /
damages incurred or suffered by you as a result of the unsuccessful recovery
of the claims for the full repair cost and any other incidental cost/expenses
by you on my/our behalf.

8. 1/ We warrant and undertake that all information and statement
provided by me /us to you are true and accurate.

Thanking you in anticipation.

Yours faithfully




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 17/18/18/VP05/020591
DATE : 30 JULY 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, SEAH WEI MING ARRON confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SJW 8806A the sum of Singapore Dollars
SEVEN THOUSAND AND ONE HUNDRED ONLY. (87,100.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest. arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving, SJE 3904C on 08/05/2018 along/at
TANAH MERAH COAST ROAD.

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TEOQ WEI JIN ARRON
/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made

by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s
SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

/ iz/q

Name of vehicle owner/Date



SPECIALISTS MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 3018A, Ubi Road 1. #01-24-26, Singapore 408711

Tel: 67472112 (5 lines) Fax: 67438032
Email: cardocsingnet.com.sg

Bus. Reg No: 199502604 E  GST No: 19-9502604-E

SM/SJE3Q04C/ 1805083
05" June 2018

The Manager

Motor Claim Dept.
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300. Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Date of Accident

Location

Third Party Claim Vehicle No

Repair Cost for Vehicle No

TAX INVOICE

8" May 2018
Tanah Merah Coast Road
SIWERRO6A

SIE 3904 C  Honda Jazz

A Lump-sum repair

Add 7% G5T

5% 5.700.00
5% 5.700.00
58 399.00

8% 6.000.00

S/ Dollars :- Six Thousand And Ninety Nine Only.

SPECIALISTS MOTORAPTE |

D



SPECIALISTS AUTO SERVICE

.Biock J018A, Ubl Road 1, #01-26/24 Singapore 408711
Tel: 67472112 |5 Lines} Fax: 67438032

No. 3464
OFFICIAL RECEIPT Date:

Received from

the sum of Dollars

being payment of

?

Cash/ Cheque No: SPECIALISTS AUTO SERVICE



SPECIALISTS AUTO SERVICE

Ejé 5? t-'f ¢ Block 3018A. Ubi Road 1, #01-24/25/26, Singapore 408711, Tel: 6747 2112 Fax: 6743 8032
RENTAL AGREEMENT NO. 4678
HIRER'S PARTICULARS Vehicle No. ,L‘Lf’ 951 §
Name: Yeah It om s Aaren
Address (Res): 428  Lingkerg Tyt Make/Model k1A £3
J".IH o A" A) Time
v OUT |Date | <. &3, oosd = 0
(Of) : i Mz 0
Time
IN Date | 20, 95 . o4 sl
Tel: 064 092 Bes:
Occupation : Replacement Vehicle No: Initial:
Driving Licence No: = 7/69/6¢F
riving Licence Mo Date / Time
Expiry Date :
Passport [ ICNo: S F10T1EEF Petrol Level Out Petrol Level In
T A7 | T ks N
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS E % % % F E % %W 4 F
Name :
; RATES Amaount Due
Cecupation
Driving Licence No Days 10 @§ /50 per day $ /| Lob -00
Place Issued : Passport / 1/C No ; )
_ Weeks @ 5 per week
Date of Birth :
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION Month @S per month
Add Hours @ 8 per hour
TOTAL 41, 500-00
i
Loss Damage Waiver : With/Without 4/] accept Amount paid
3 per day Excess § 1 000 -00C Balance Due
e s : : ) Deposit amount (refundable) %
VEHICLE TO BE DEIVEN IN SINGAPORE ONLA
PROHIBITED TO ENTER MALAYSIA BY LAW .
Refund Signature
THE RENTER IS SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR BREACH
OF TRAFFIC LAWS, ANY PARKING FINES OR
SURCHARGE DURING PERIOD OF HIRE.
PAYMENT
Chegue :
RENTER DECLARATION : 1 accept the terms and conditions
above and overleaf. | declare that all mformation in this form are | Cash:
true and accurate. 1f | opt to pay by credit card, my signature here is ; g
to be deemed to have been made on applicable credit card voucher, Credit Card / Nets :
Remarks

y

RENTER'S SIGNATURE/ COMPANY STAMP

NB:

(2} VEHICLE TO BE DRIVEN IN SINGAPORE ONLY, PROHIBITED TO ENTER MALAYSIA BY LAW

VY

(11 ANY ACCIDENTS INVOLVING THIS HIRE VERICLE, NOTIFY OUR OFFICE AS SOON AS POSSIBLE
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-069528

Date of Request: 08/05/2018 Your Ref No: Online Furchase

Specialists Motor Pte Lid

Blk 30184 Uhi Road 1

#01-24/25/26

Singapore 408711

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 0a/05/2018 < 28 b

Enguiry By Teo Wei Shun il Lost ottt R

TP Vehicle Na. SJWEBB06A

Accident Date 08052018

Engquiry Result

TF Vehicle Na. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
SJWaa06A Lenpac Insurance Bhd 141 272017-26/04/2018 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their aceuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage anising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

A MOVTTARA AT e DL VTN N v rmman o Y e DN ANt o



