o g fw‘ﬁ-‘f“ ~ OfrsmosuiY| T shel

als\oi " FRIv2) 200 Rb
; Type Mr..-...q,g‘.ugw.r.'.-. Lotry | Taxi) Prse Moz
<.‘-Q_HE’] WS ' TF RES i OD RES | EVA 1INV i MY Truck { Trailer c
e FRT KAE3D wpe  Pueaks Malhstetr )9
Grhshey Vamﬁ'lﬂﬁ alowr inured | Std | NETH
n's L“'{ﬁ Q" QA v h Readini — nuratd / St I NLi HA
: ExiNo
i 20M A2ooy (piS0e5629
Gan Cond GRod/ Fair | Poor I Burnt
nsared Eaross Steenng. Inggdey | Jammed / Leaked | Burnt
lanls R 1 Brake  Inord { Jammed | Leaked | Bumnt
Make ot Vel Modi (Y SIRim 1 STD ARIm
i Tyre Sipss F: j2o L (F
(Palicy Tondition J R f‘l o / '{‘t-if f ‘7'
Femars The veh had commenced its { WS | U5 | | BS/DUN/EXNOVAIGY | 7S/ LIZA ' MIC | GHTSY @ SUMI
rapair at the lima of inspection. TOYO ! YOKO or
Bal or Markst Value %K ) Fionl R
DAL Aecident Fpert Lonsistent? Yesor No R/Bal g mm = ool g’
i ER Zapq onsistent?  Yes or No L/Bal T L Eal i
cst Rapmm gdavs= F&s Yes or No D.OA D Q/Q [ﬁJ (-1’/30
i Sum : ival Yes of No Survey heid a WLl o Lowy g,
CA | REV | REP. | J4HRS Ues. of Damages| F a‘ﬁu 1 QIS {@ / u&f%%:lin-n
falucls IN /1 OUT
e Parson Conaviea "“\*“‘:‘ ! 1 Tl"e UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure 1= b
Dale Tima P 6""30 44y ,)_{ —rr 8 N .

Aok e ble ol gl (i
a1l Pondbng Gore Fart |, Ldmt pact report-

hols 7 Re—ilpin, Mg . 4\41.4404

BIAZ Corfomed P £ 13 120/ (P Sy ol TouflA
(15 0ale bk 42D
SO veopn b anly (I ol date 118)
actondes E Prell. Rapurt Days Of Repair. .}, ' )J-\-ﬂlSt‘!’e’u
T‘ff’"_"f' [:I Final Report Resurvey No, of Trip / i 1ot Yo

Add Fese S

>

HEE N



MV - 420 K.
R



ARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

of |

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDere

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 7548F

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.: FBJ4763D

Vehicle to be No

Exported:

Intended De- 10 May 2018

registration Date:

Vehicle Make: DUCATI

Vehicle Model: MULTISTRADA 1200
M

Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2010

Engine No.: ZDM1198WC005641

Chassis No.: ZDMAZ200ACAB005629

Maximum Power -

Output:

Open Market Value: $29,507.00

Original Registration 010ct 2010

Date:

First Registration 27 Feb 2012

Date:

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $4,427.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry -

Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 26 Feb 2022

COE Category: D - Motorcycle

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $2,012.00

COE Rebate Amount: $764.00

Total Rebate Amount: $764.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 May 2018

OK

10/5/2018, 9:07 AM



' shi'rlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

—_— e ———————

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 10:07 AM

To: "Tony Alfred Desire Devaux'

Cc: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)'; 'Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'; ‘Benjamin Ong Ban Su’
Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D
Dear Tony,

Confirmed final fig of $19,120.00 (part by part) @ 5 days of repairs before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux [mailto:tony.devaux@wearnes.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 6:41 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR'
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Benjamin Ong Ban Su <benjamin.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Shirley,

We confirm that the
Final figure is 19,120.00 (parts by parts) and @ 5 days of repairs before GST.

Kind regards

Tony Devaux
Service Consultant

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103
F (65) 6474 0853 D (65) 6430 4934

WEARNES www.wearnesauto.com  tony devaux@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 4:27 PM

To: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.com>

Cc: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; 'Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR’

1




<sur@lkkauto.com>; Benjamin Ong Ban Su <benjamin.ong@wearnes.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Hi Tony,

Please Confirm final fig of $18,120.00 (part by part) @ 5 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) [mailto:bryanang@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 9:47 AM

To: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>;
Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Benjamin Ong Ban Su <benjamin.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Shirley
Please get surveyor to follow up on this finalization.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 9:34 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @Ilkkauto.com>; Taufikh
(LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>; Benjamin Ong Ban Su <benjamin.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Bryan,
Please find in attach the supplementary and finalized invoice regarding FB14763D

Kind regards

Tony Devaux
Service Consultant

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103
F (65) 6474 0853 D (65) 6430 4934

WEARNES www.wearnesauto.com tony.devaux@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

2



From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) [mailto:brvanang@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 1 June 2018 9:49 AM

To: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com>;
Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Tony
Insurer will be liable only for damages that are consistent and related to the accident.

At this moment, the amount indicated as unconfirm by our surveyor is relatively high. Without the benefit of
parts being dismantled, we cannot be sure that all these parts are damaged.

Regardless of whether the owner decides to repair the bike or not, insurer will be liable for the amount that
is lower ie if repair cost is lower than value of bike than insurer will reimburse your client on the repair cost.
However if the repair cost exceed the value of the bike, than insurer will reimburse the value of the bike.

At this moment, we are not able to recommend to the insurer or advice your client how much is the
reimbursement as the cost of repair to the bike cannot be ascertain at the moment due to the many
unconfirm parts that would require dismantling for verifications on whether damaged or not.

As this is a third party claim, insurer and our involvement is on a without prejudice basis and hence we are
unable to authorize any dismantling of the bike. To move this matter, you may want to advice your client to
authorize the dismantling and from there we can ascertain the true cost of repair.

Ultimately, do note that our recommendation will be subjected to insurer's approval.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux [mailto:tony.devaux@wearnes.com]

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 3:54 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Shirley,

The owner would like to know how much will you pay him in case he decide not to repair the bike?
From there he will take a decision to repair or not the bike.

Looking forward for your prompt reply

Regards

Tony Devaux
Service Consultant



Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103
F (65) 6474 0853 D (65) 6430 4934

WEARNES www. wearnesauto.com tony devaux@wearnes com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please nolify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 25 May 2018 3:00 PM

To: Tony Alfred Desire Devaux <tony.devaux@wearnes.com>; 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D18002866MFSH ; YOUR REF: FBJ4763D

Dear Tony,
Please be informed that the repair limited for FBJ 4763D is not more that $18,000.00

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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WEARNES
SERVICE ESTIMATE
Q2087 - CDOD18 SL: SERVICE/PARTS SALES - DUCATI
Mr Douglas Robert Lawson
5C Thomson View Bright Hill Drive Inv.No. D 0 Page 1
Thomson View Condominium Inv.date 24/04/2018
WIP No. t 56770
Veh. In/Out:
Singapore 379597 *Tel.No H:Jhile: 98373751
Reg.No. FRJ4763D / MS
Closed b; ) Ong Ban Su Benjamir Reg.date 22/07/2011
Sve Consul tant Ong Ban Su Benjamin Mileage : 0
Remarks Mr Douglas Robert La Chassis No.: ZDMAZ200ACABOOSG29
Variant.. MTS1200
Op.No Descyiption -0C Mech Qty Price Disc® Pkg Amount G
NOTES Third TFarty Claim against SHC 0.00 O % Zao S
il'.:l.'r:--l with Tirst Motor 2
pUCO-1 To replace damaged parts caus fyvo ]A‘i 5600.00 0 %0.00 5
212 FHJJ Number Plate $10 &M~ 50.00 O v 40,00 S
Frant Number plate 810 e~
R.H. PANNIER CO 1.0 EA 998. 40 MR 998.40 S
L.H. PANNIER CO~# 1.0 EA 29840 -~ 998.40 §
BRACKET BOTTOM / 1.0 EA 140.50 v 140.50' S
BRACRET BOTTOM 1.0 EA 140.50 weR 140.50' S
PLATE HOLDER 1.0 EA 121.70 "M 221.70 8
MUDFLAT 1.0 EA .70 177.70' S
NUMBER PLATE HO 1.0 EA 26.70 26.70 S
FLASHER LIGRHT F 1.0 EBA 59.40 59.40 S
FLASHER LIGHT F 1.0 EA 59.40 % 59.40 S
SPACER 2.0 EA 17.50 v 35.00 S
QUICK FASTENING 5.0 EA %.30 21.50 §
QUICK FASTENING 5.0 EA 4.30 21.50 8
SCREW TCETF M5X - 2.0 EA 2.40 4.80 5
SCREW 9.0 EA 1.00 9.00 §
REW 1.0 EA 1.00 100 8
SCREW 10.0 EA 6.90 69.00 S
BRACKET, REFLEC 1.0 EA 20.00 20.00 S
REFLEX REFLECTO 1.0 EA 7.20 7.20 8
ralt UARD ROTT 7 1.0 EA 296. 40 &Vgﬁ.qﬂ S
Tl‘tm SARISAN G’K"K"\
1\<||%Q Lo
ﬂ"“" daseke i lewan
%_ ’ “‘a ‘r’
OV ity v
Wearnes Automotive Pte. Lid. s%q)

45 Leng Kee Road, Singopore 159103 T 465 6430 3930  www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 199501200R / GST reg no M28820628x

Swr@l
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Q2087 - co0018

SERVICE ESTIMATE

Sk

Mr Douglas Robert Lawson

5C Thomson View Bright Hill

Drive

Thomsoen View Condominium

Singapore 579397
Singapore 579347

Closed by
Sve Consul tanpt
Remarks

: Ung Ban Su

Ong Ban Su

Mr Douglas Robert

Benjamis
Benjamin

lnv.
Tnv.
WIiP
Veh.
*Tel.
Reg.
Reg.

No.
date
NDS ko
In/Out
N, -
Nao.
date
Mileage
Chassis No.:
Variant...

SERVICE/PARTS SALES - DUCATI

RYa

WEARNES

o o o o L o e D . S i . o . O -, . sl S e . S i W e i . s e S . S o . . e s A S S

Wearnes Automotive Pre, Lid,

45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 7 +65 6430 4930 www, wearnesauto.com

TATL GUARD BOTT
REAR WHEEL RIM
VALVE, TUBELESS
NUT
WASHER 48.
SPACER
GEARBOY POSTTIO
REAR WHEFL SPIN
LEVA FRIZIONE B~
PLUG

REAR-VIEW MIRRO 7
HUR

STEERTNG CROWN
STEERING HEAD
HANDLERAR

SEAL RING
BEARING, CONICA
R.H. FORE LEG A-
L.H. FOREK LEG A~
FRONT WHEEL RIM
FRONT WHEFL SPI1
VALVE, TURELESS
MATT CARB.FRONT
CARBON REAR MI'D

5X65X

Co reg no. 1995014008 / GST reg no M28920626x

e ol el ek b (] () b i ad i ok U] e o b b e e ek e ks

i=f=jajofaloloflcleiclofolafolvlelelefolololol el

EA

D 0 Page 2
240472018
56770
Mobile; 98373751
FBI4763D [ MS
22/07/2011
0
ZDMA200ACABDO5629
MTS1200
Price DiscX Pkg Amount ©
296. 4 296.40 S
2433.60 2433.60 S
12 nn&?} "12.80 S
62.10 62.10 §
3.40 ''3.40 S
94 .90 .90 5
234 .00 234.00 §
1474 .80 N "1474.B0 S
209.80 bt A 209.80 S
13.70 MAAX 708
234 .00 ¢b~ 234,00 S
1145.10 1145.10 S
858.00 *"858.00 S
624.00 WA 624.00 s
299,60 299.60 S
10.80 21.60 S
100.10 200.20 s
4648 .80 4 4648 .80 S
4648 RO 7 4648.80 5
2508.50 ¥ 2508.50 S
262.30 yq % 262.30 s
27,90 X 27.90 s
730.90 X 730.90 8
569.50 ™ 569.50 §
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{ WEARNES
SERVICE ESTIMATE
92087 - COOO1R  sp . SERVICE/PARTS SALES - DUCATI
Mr Douglas Robert Lawson
5C Thomson View Bright Hill Drive Inv.No. : D 0 Page 3
Thomson View Condom | nium Inv.date : 254/04/2018
WIP No. .. : 36770
Singapore 579597 Veh. In/Out:
Singapore 579507 *¥Tel.No. i Mobile: 983731751
Reg.No. FBJA763D 7 MS
Closed hy * Ong Ban Su Banjamin Reg.date 22/07/2011
Sve Consultant : Ong Ban Su Benjamin Mileage 0
Kemarks Mr Douglas Robert La Chassis No.: ZDMAZ00ACABDDSG29
Variant... MTS1200
Op.XNo Description CCC Mech Qty Price DiscX Pkg Amount G
HEADL GHT 1.0 EA  1244.90 “®X"19,4 00 s
LEFT COVER ~ 1.0 EA 11.00 wAv 1y 00 s
COWLING 1.0 EA 932.90 “~4~ a12.9p s
ZWINDSHIELD 1.0 EA 468.00 el 16800 3
HALF-FATRING FR ~ 1.0 FA 25.00 ak-" 35 0y 5
ZTFATRING, RH 1.0 EA 135.00 o 135 .00 s
ZFAIRING, LH 1.0 EA 135,00 et 135 0o 5
~ GEARCHANGE LEVE 1.0 EA 111.40 bbr111.40 §
BUSH 1.0 EA 5.30 W X5 10 8
RUBBER PAD 2.0 EA 5.30 n'l_fm.f.o S
~ PIN PEDAL 1.0 EA 9,40 e 940 2
COVER, RADIATOR 7 1.0 EA 374 .40 M*V/’aza.m 5
CAP L.H. RED ./ 1.0 EA 202. 80 H;, 202.80 S
CAP R.H. RED 1.0 EA 202,80 ofv202.80 s
Amount 34,245.00 :35.‘1*?'
Amount 34,245.00
Labour Tot a1 3,6%0.00 GST @ 7 2 2,397.15
Parts Tot = | 28,605.00 Total Amoeun: 36,642 .15
Package Total 0.00 Less Amt Paid 0.00
Nett Amount 36,642,15

GST: S=StdRated: 0=0utO0fScope; Z=ZeroRated

Service Estimates are valid for

this Is 2 sspputer

45 Leng Kee Road, Singapare 159103 T +65 6430 3930  www.wearnesauto.com
mmmmm.'anmm.ﬂm

generated invoice, no signature |

10 days from the above date.

S required.,



WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
45 LENG KEE ROAD SINGAPORE 159103
Tel: +65 64304930 Fax: +65 6474 0853 www.ducatisingapore.com

Repair Estimate

Date 24 Sep 2018 Model MTS1200
Bike Number FBJ4763D Mileage 56,770
Chassis No. ZDMA200ACABO05629 Contact
Customer Mr Douglas Robert Lawson Sve. No.
Address 5C Thomson View Bright Hill Drive LD
Technician
Email
No. | Labour Code Description Qty Unit Price Amount
Sub-Total
No. | Part Number Description Qty Unit Price Amount
[ #|WINDSHIELD -~ owf 7 1 $468.00 $468.00
| «[FAIRING,RH -~ &~ 1 $135.00 $135.00
TS ¥|FARING, LH /7 1| $135.00 $135.00
ik [ G |GEARCHANGE LEVER ¢ bt — 1| $111.40 $111.40
| 4 |PIN PEDAL pi ) 1 $8.00 $8.00
N FRONT FENDER RED pAAX pra .~ 1 $356.50 $356.50
STAY, WINDSHIELD &f .~ 1 $53.40 $53.40
RUBBER PAD wac . 1 $3.30 $3.30
SCREW, SPECIAL Y Y 1 $2.70 $2.70
COVER, TANK RH w7 1]  $838.80 $838.80
QUICK FASTENING M5 it - 1 $1.20 $1.20
vQUICK FASTENING aki” 2 $2.70 $5.40
SCREW ol 2 $4.00 $8.00
BUSH Lt 2 $1.10 $2.20
SCREW, SPECIAL  ~&t 1 $14.60 $14.60
HOSE GUIDE A 1 $6.00 $6.00
RUBBER PAD Al o 1 $4.90 $4.90
Sub-Total $2,154.40
1. This estimate is compiled with visual inspection on the above mentioned motorcycle.
2. During the repair process, additional parts and labour may be required to complete the repairs works. A supplementary estimale shall be
created accordingly
3. The undersigned signature represents the acceptance of this estimate and the permission to proceed with repair works.
Total Labour: $0.00
Total Parts: $2,154.40
Signature: GST: $150.81
Grand Total: $2,305.21

11
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WEARNES
e O R 0 O BT BRSSO e T ES
0 - FOO003 SL: FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
36 ROBINSON ROAD Inv.No. .. : D 0 Page 1
#16-01, CITY HOUSE : Inv.date . : 25/09/2018
SINGARORE WIP No. .. : 56770
veh. In/Out: 16/07/2018 10/09/2018
Singapore 068877 *Tel.No. .. :
Reg.No. .. : FBJ4763D / MS
Closed by .... : Tony Alfred Desire D Reg.date . : 22/07/2011
Svc Consultant : 0648 Mileage .. : 1
Remarks ...... : Mr Douglas Robert La Chassis No.: ZDMAZ200ACABO0S5629
variant... : MTS1200
Op.No Description CCC Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount G
NOTES Third Party Claim against SHC .00 O© S
insured with First Motor 2o 2
DUCO-1 To replace damaged parts caus Ch 4000.00 O 0.00 S
212 Rear Number Plate $30 40.00 O 40.00 S
Front Number plate $10
L.H. PANNIER CO 1.0 EA 998.40 998.40 S
BRACKET BOTTOM 1.0 EA 140.50 140.50 8
TAIL GUARD BOTT 1.0 EA 296.40 296.40 S
LEVA FRIZIONE B 1.0 EA 209.80 209.80 &
REAR-VIEW MIRRO 1.0 EA 234 .00 234.00 S
R.H. FORK LEG A 1.0 EA 4648.80 4648.80 S
L.H. FORK LEG A 1.0 EA 4648.80 4648.80 S
LEFT COVER 1.0 EA 11.00 11.00 &
COWLING 1.0 EA 932.90 932.90 S
HALF-FAIRING FR 1.0 EA 25.00 25.00 £
COVER., RADIATOR 1.0 EA 374.40 374.40 S
CAP L.H. RED 1.0 EA 202.80 202.80 S
CAP R.H. RED 1.0 EA 202.80 202.80 S
D48710471A/WIND 1.0 EA 468.00 468.00 S
D48011501A/FAIR 1.0 EA 135.00 135.00 S
D48011511A/FAIR 1.0 EA 135.00 135.00 ©
D45612041A/GEAR 1.0 EA 111.40 111.40 S
PIN PEDAL 1.0 EA 8.00 8.00 &
FRONT FENDER RE 1.0 EA 356.50 356.50 S

Wearnes Automotlve Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kae Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4930 www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg nn., 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X



WEARNES
STEFW ICE ESTIMMET E
0 - FOOO0O03 SL: FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
36 ROBINSON ROAD Inv.No. .. : D 0 Page 2
#16-01, CITY HOUSE Inv.date . : 25/09/2018
SINGAPORE WIP No. .. : 56770
Singapore 068877 veh. In/Qut: 16/07/2018 10/09/2018
Singapore 068877 ¥Tel.No. .. :
Reg.No. .. : FBJ4763D / MS
Closed by .... : Tony Alfred Desire D Raeg.date . : 22/07/2011
Svc Consultant : 0648 Mileage .. : _ 1
Remarks ...... : Mr Douglas Robert La Chassis No.: ZDMAZ00ACABOO5&29
Variant... : MTS1200
Op.No Description CCC Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount G
STAY, WINDSHIEL 1.0 EA 53.40 53.40 &
RUBBER PAD 1.0 EA 3.30 3.30 S
SCREW, SPECIAL 1.0 EA 200 2.70. 8
COVER, TANK RH 1.0 EA 838.80 838.80 S
QUICK FASTENING 1.0 EA 1.20 1.20 S
vAQUICK FASTENIN 2.0 EA 2570 5.40 S
SCREW 2.0 EA 4.00 8.00 S
vBUSH 2.0 EA 1.10 2.20 8
vSCREW, SPECIA 1.0 EA 14.60 14.60 &
vHOSE GUIDE 1.0 EA 6.00 6£.00 S
RUBBER PAD 1.0 EA 4.90 4.90 S
Amount 19,120.00
L0, Amount 19,(52(07/.%0?
& ke wn - T e e 4.4040.00 GsST @ 7 % 1,338.40
FPar-ts Toia 15,080.00 Total Amount 20,458.40
Package Toiteal 0.00 Less amt Paid 0.00
Nett Amount 20,458.40

GST: S=StdRated; 0=0utOfScope; Z=ZeroRated
Service Estimates are valid for 10 days from the above date.
This is a computer generated inveoice, no signature is required.

Wearnes Automaotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4930 www.weamesauto.com

Co reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X



' ’d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
B BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBJ 4763D
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition WOrkshop?g)) (Sj)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE $30 (SN) CRACKED 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE $10 (SN) NECESSARY 10.00 10.00
1|R.H. PANNIER CO (SN) NOT NECESSARY 998.40 =
1|L.H. PANNIER CO (SN) cuT 998.40 998.40
1|BRACKET BOTTOM (SN) BENT 140.50 140,50
1/BRACKET BOTTOM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 140.50 -
1|PLATE HOLDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 121.70 -
1|MUDFLAP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 77.70 d
1|NUMBER PLATE HO (SN) NOT NECESSARY 26.70 .
1|FLASHER LIGHT F (SN) NOT NECESSARY 59.40 .
1|FLASHER LIGHT F (SN) NOT NECESSARY 59.40 =
2|SPACER @$17.50 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00 2
5|QUICK FASTENING @$4.30 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 21.50 g
5|QUICK FASTENING @$4.30 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 21.50 -
2|SCREW TCEIF M5X @$2.40 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 4.80 <
9|SCREW @%1.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 9.00 -
1|SCREW (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1.00 -
10|SCREW @%6.90 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 69.00 -
1|BRACKET, REFLEC (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REFLEX, REFLECTO (SN) NOT NECESSARY 7.20 -
1|TAIL GUARD BOTT (SN) DISTORTED 296.40 296.40
1|TAIL GUARD BOTT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 296.40 B
1|REAR WHEEL RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 2,433.60 -
1|VALVE, TUBELESS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.80 )
1|NUT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 62.10 !
1|WASHER 48.5X65X (SN) NOT NECESSARY 3.40 -
1|SPACER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 94.90 -
1|GEARBOX POSITIO (SN) NOT NECESSARY 234.00 B
1|REAR WHEEL SPIN (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,474 .80 -
1|LEVA FRIZIONE B (SN) BENT 209.80 209.80
2|PLUG @$13.70 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 27.40 !
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Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::;’;;%)) Our ﬁ:{"‘ted
1|REAR-VIEW MIRRO (SN) CcuT 234.00 234.00
1|HUB (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,145.10
1|STEERING CROWN (SN) NOT NECESSARY 858.00 -
1|STEERING HEAD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 624.00 -
1|HANDLEBAR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 299,60
2|SEAL RING @$10.80 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 21.60 -
2|BEARING, CONICA @%100.10 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 200.20 -
1|R.H. FORK LEG A (SN) BENT 4,648.80 4,648.80
1|L.H. FORK LED A (SN} BENT 4,648.80 4,648.80
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 2,508.50 -
1|FRONT WHEEL SPI (SN) NOT NECESSARY 262.30 -
1|VALVE, TUBELESS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 27.90 .
1|MATT CARB, FRONT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 730.90 -
1|CARBON REAR MUD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 569.50 -
1|HEADLIGHT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,244.90 .
1|LEFT COVER (SN) CuT 11.00 11.00
1|COWLING (SN) cuT 932.90 932.90
1|WINDSHIELD (SN) cuT 468.00 468.00
1|HALF-FAIRING FR (SN) cuT 25.00 25.00
1|FAIRING, RH (SN) cuT 135.00 135.00
1|FAIRING, LH (SN) cuT 135.00 135.00
1|GEARCHANGE LEVE (SN) BENT 111.40 111.40
1|BUSH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 5.30 3
2|RUBBER PAD @$5.30 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.60 s
1|PIN PEDAL (SN) NECESSARY 940 8.00
1|COVER, RADIATOR (SN) cuT 374.40 374.40
1|CAP L.H. RED (SN) cuT 202.80 202.80
1|CAP R.H. RED (SN) cuT 202.80 202.80
1|STAY, WINDSHIELD (SN) (ADDITIONAL) BENT 53.40 53.40
1|RUBBER PAD (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 3.30 3.30
1|SCREW, SPECIAL (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 270 2.70
1|COVER, TANK RH (SN) (ADDITIONAL) cuTt 838.80 838.80
1]QUICK FASTENING M5 (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 1.20 1.20
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Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our
0, flptono Workshop ($)) ($)
2|VQUICK FASTENING (SN} (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 5.40 540
2|SCREW (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 8.00 8.00
2|BUSH (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 220 2.20
1|SCREW, SPECIAL (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 14.60 14.60
1|HOSE GUIDE (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 6.00 6.00
1|RUBBER PAD (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 4.90 490
1|FRONT FENDER RED (SN) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 356.50 356.50
29,942.00 15,120.00
LABOUR
TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS CAUS 5,600.00 4,000.00
5,600.00 4,000.00
GRAND TOTAL 35,542.00 19,120.00
I RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | [ | 19,120.00]
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18008417/T1sbe2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE , AMSAE-A,M.MATAI|
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




