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This mail is associated with :

*YN3967X (C0473609)
[SHB7715U]
TP
CLEANING TECHNOLOGY MANAGEMENT PTE LTD
May 8 2018 12:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD

Reply Reply All Mark as Unread Print Message Delete Message Forward

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 14/11/2018 10:14 AM,
To LKK_HQ
cC AXA_SG; olivialau@lkkauto.com; chewht@Ilkkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com

Subject  Re: TAXA]: [1st reminder] C0473609/P1680520 / Complete VMS / CC4/AXA18008404/Kmb3

Hi Lkk,

TP has passed the case to lawyer and we have received their LOD. Please submit your adjuster report and invoice in merimen and you may close the
file at your end.

Thank you
Wancong

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg; stacey.ng@axa.com.sg; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg

CC: LKK_HQ; AXA_SG; olivialau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com
Sent On: 20/09/2018 02:58 PM

Subject: [AXA]: [1st reminder] C0473609/P1680520 / Complete VMS / CC4/AXA18008404/Kmb3

Dear KC / Stacey / Richard,

1 refer to my email of 11 Sept. TP repairer Complete VMS is chasing for a status update again.
Kindly advise PIC, and if we can proceed with direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Olivia
LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg; stacey.ng@axa.com,sg; richard.angbs@axa.com.sg
CC: LKK_HQ; AXA_SG; olivialau@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 11/09/2018 12:12 PM

Subject; [AXA]: C0473609/P1680520 / Complete VMS / CC4/AXA18008404/Kmb3

*Previously Ernest Case*

Dear KC / Stacey / Richard,

Kindly advise if we can proceed with Direct Settlement. DOA 08/05/2018. TP repairer is chasing for status.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Olivia

LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com; AXA_SG

Sent On: 22/05/2018 11:50 AM
Subject: Re: WP / New TP Assignment - C0473609/P1680520

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear LKK team,
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We will be investigating this matter due to occurrence during midnight hours.

Thank you,

With regards,
Ernest

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 08/05/2018 11:31 AM

Subject: WP / New TP Assignment - C0473609/P1680520

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,
Please survey the vehicle.

WP: [Non-Reporting] [Pending Driver License] [TP Excess]
Workshop Name: COMPLETE VMS PTE LTD

Policy Number: P1680520

Vehicle Number: YN3967X

Date of Accident:08/05/2018

Estimated Claim Amount:

Excess: 5000.00

Claim Handler Name: Ernest Tay

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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