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Calculation for LTA Rebatoe:
{afCOE Period:. -  Xxq2=

Register Before/After MAY 2002
(e) PARF =(OMV)__  x_
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (d)+(e)
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Calculation for Valuation:
Average MV

Mihs Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:

______ - B =  Mihs High demand vehicle:  Yes/ Mo - 8
(b) Balance Months - - - Paraflel ll‘npo.rtm\.:-z-e“h.i-rzlé: Yes/No | - & _
More than t0yrs old:  Yes/MNo - &
S B TP by MV for Repossessed vehicle = §
(a) ]
Engine Capacily: ~ High / Low -3
{a) _ - {b) = 2= < Europe / Asia Car |-

Car Condition: Good/FairfPoor/Burnt | -
No. of transfer : ' | -

Other deduction -

Salvage Valus{LTA Rahate - 5%):

Forced Sales Value derived .

Date / Time Action / Instruction Additional Information:
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-enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:_

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Mar 2018
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Singapore NRIC
4451C

SIN796U
No

28 Mar 2018

NISSAN

SYLPHY 1.5 4AT

Beige

2008

HR15071784B
JN1BAAG11Z0107252
80.0 KW (107 bhp)
$21,107.00

23 Jan 2009

23 Jan 2009

0

$21,107.00

Yes
22 Jan 2019

$10,553.00
] ‘//’
22 Jan 2019/

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$2,693.00

$220.00

$10,773.00
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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 2:27 PM

To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOBTW / SIN796U / DOA : 24.03.2018
Dear Kitty,

The market value for SIN 796U is $18k - $19K(est) as at March 2018

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

8ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: grace [mailto:grace@Ilbs-auto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March 2018 2:51 PM

To: chowauto <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; rta <rta@rta.com.sg>; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong
<cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey
<motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>

Cc: assign <assign@lbs-auto.com>; admin <admin@lbs-auto.com>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; winnie.ho
<winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; TAN Jas <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; Birdie Ong Lay
Hong <birdie.ong@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOBTW / SIN796U / DOA : 24.03.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Regards,

Grace Ong

LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 8 Kensington Park Drive
#01-07

Singapore 557323

tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

fax: 6281 8748

L.B.S.

CONFIDENTIALITY

This email (and any 2

wdfor confidential

|
o
pw ]
11}
Lin}
1]
<
u]
1
-2
1

< intenced only for the attention of the addressee and may contain iegaih



