Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 May 2018 9:48 AM

To: 'Joel Goh'

Cc: assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SGL2898S & YN1863A (EQ) at 02/05/2018 18:10HRS
Dear Joel,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 10.05.2018.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 4 May, 2018 1:48 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SGL2898S & YN1863A (EQ) at 02/05/2018 18:10HRS

Dear LKK
Attached both accident reports for your attention.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Joel Goh
Sent: Friday, May 4, 2018 1:47 PM



To: 'Toh Khar Kian'
Cc: Hasbullah Bin Maspot; Leon Lim; Jackson Teo Ban Chye; Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SGL2898S & YN1863A (EQ) at 02/05/2018 18:10HRS

Without Prejudice
Dear Khar Kian

Kindly email all PRS request to eqiprs@eginsurance.com.sg

Meanwhile, we will arrange for LKK to take over this direct settlement.
Dear LKK

Kindly assist on the following direct settlement.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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From: Toh Khar Kian [mailto:KharKian. Toh@ethozgroup.com]

Sent: Friday, May 4, 2018 8:27 AM

To: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Joel Goh

Cc: Hasbullah Bin Maspot; Leon Lim; Jackson Teo Ban Chye

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SGL2898S & YN1863A (EQ) at 02/05/2018 18:10HRS

Dear All,
Please be at advised that we will be submitting a claim against your insured.
We would like to propose direct settlement for this case.

Attached herewith is the GIA Report for your perusal.

Our Client’s Vehicle Number: SGL2898S
EQ Vehicle Number: YN1863A
Date/Time of Loss: 02/05/2018 18:10




Best Regards,
Toh Khar Kian
Service Engineer

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075

DID: 6654 7505 | Mobile: (65) 83987469 | Fax: 6654 7543
Email : kharkian.toh@ethozgroup.com

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group.
ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete transmission of the
information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system.



