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- Py Lper Company Registration Mo 198607 1v8R
E1 00 AYE 222 PAYA UKL INDUS THIAL PARE. SINGAMORE 408933 TEL @ 165 62563561 FAX - (IS 62564315
Yourrel:  To Be Advised Date; (18.05.2018

Our rel: CCA4/QBE]BO0OB263/T I wb3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD

Dear Sir/Mudam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SLG1768H
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 07.05.2018
al the premuses of M/s Ding Auto Pe Lid and have the following 1o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 6.711.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8§ 2.695.00
"Check” lems Amount - 8% .
Market Value - S8 -
LTA Reimbursement Value ' 5%

Nett Value ] -

" ' s
Description of Damage: o i .
The vehicle sustained damuages at the oAl ‘L-_.-’

NJ/S Portion —

Comments/Present Status:
Dumuages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs 6 duys

Yours fuithfully.

MOHD, TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



DING AUTO PTELTD
Bk mSlinu!mMEﬂlllw':
=m0
TO Singapare 575845 EAX NO:
ESTMATEREPORT 15T Guatation | © 0457 1208 Fx 84520074 04/05/2018 10:34
JOB-NO- 85008293
NAME LIONCITY RENTALSPTE LTI  CONTACT 0 Page 10f 2
ADDRESS. 50 UBIAVENUE 3 @
#0112 ML
SINGAPORE 408866
VEHICLE DETAILS
LICENSE NO:  SLG1768H TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS: MROSIREH104557785
MAKE [ MODEL TOYOTA | Als Comlla 1.6 (A) ENGINE: 1ZRY332014
OWNER'S INSURER: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
JOB-CODE: TP SA: Ding Auto User 1
CLAIM DETAILS
QUOTED DISCOUNT  DISC PRICE REV
DESCRIPTION aTY COSTS IND SURDISE o
LABOUR
! TOREMOVE & REPLACED DAMAGED BOOY 100 120000 0.00 1,200.00 ¥ _CE
PARTS REPAIR & REALIGN BODY WORK &
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT AREAS
2 TOCHECK & REPAIR WIRING SYSTEM 100 12000 0.00 120.00 y 7O
3 RUST PROCFING 100 180.00 0.00 180,00 ¥ if
4 TOREMOVE & REFLACED LHFDOOR&LHR 100 12000 0.00 120.00 Y _ga
DOOR, TRANSFER S0TH DOR MECHANISM
TO THE NEW TRIM
5 TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING OM THE 100 120000 oo 1.200.00 ¥ o
AFFECTED AREAS LMF DOOR LMA
DOOR,LHR FENDER, ROCKER PANEL LHF 1§40
FENDER
TOTAL 282000 0.00 2.820.00
MATERIALS
1 FRONT DOOR LHS 100  1,140.00 28500 #5500 L v H-
2 FRONT DOGR OUTER MANDLE LHS 100 20500 §1.25 18378 L <
3 FRONT FENDER LHS 100 BE0.00 21500 84500 L Y Ry
4 ROCKER PANEL LHS 100 83000 15750 472.50 L v #
5 OR LHS 100 1.200.00 300,00 #00.00 L v Ko
6 WINDOW FRAME STICKERLHS 100  sang 17.00 5100 L ¥ W
7 REAR FENDER LHS 100 108800 27128 a1378 L ¥ X
& FRONT DOOR WINDOW FRAME STICKER 100 000 000 G| b 5 Y Ak~ '!T
i 1 -5
tora. LI 5,188.00 297.00 1.851.00
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR 8,008 00 1257 00 BT1100 1“1}
EXCEESI OADING S 0.00 454 12
No. Of Day G ‘ %
RE-SURVEY: amma@fmns . oy’
PART-BY-PART OR Lu

DATE OF SURVEY: J2= | “':

SURVEYED BY:

W&J,«k.. 13'11< 344

5;1-*\5\..-.__.

CONTACT NO:

FAX NO:

5ub @ [Whauds: o

[assi =

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Revi(
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* Catheriie Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 May, 2018 2:30 FM

To: ‘assignments’

Ce: lenny Toh

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG1768H&SDX6556A ON 02/05/2018- ARRANGE SURVEY

Our ref: V0012707
Dear Sir/Madam
Kindly survey the TP vehicle:-

Insured : SDX6556A

TP Vehicle : SLG1768H

Date of accident: 02/05/2018
Contact: as below

Kindly acknowledge receipt.

regards

|r~--||II :
sstant, Claims
-‘l'_'ll- Fr arging Markeis - Singapare

OBE |nsurance (Singapara) Pta Lid
Phona: +65 8477 1225

Email jgnnytohE com

Vigit us on the web 5t www. qbe com sg

Wecreate insurance solutluns for

} |
: _-- _,iﬁ' I"‘: h..!d}

From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Friday, 4 May, 2018 11:51 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG176BH&SDX6556A ON 02/05/2018- ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Jenny,
Thank you for your response.

Please arrange surveyor from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
to make the full estimate for our clients vehicle as soon as possible.

1



THANK YOU

BEST REGARDS

DD HASHIM

DING AUTO PTE LTD

HP : 97335832

TEL Office : 92394128

FAX 62852690

ADDRESS 248 JALAN BOON LAY SINGAPORE 518523

On Thu, May 3, 2018 at 2:46 PM, Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> wrote:
Our ref : VO012707

Dear DD Hashim
We refer to the above captioned matter.

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage 1o vour client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the
motor survevors named in the attached list:

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte
Lid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Priority Services
Quantum Risk Mnnﬁgemem (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether vou agree 1o the appointment of any of these
MOLOr SUrVEeyors,

Janny Toh
Senior Assistan], Clisms
QBE Emerging Markets - Singapore

CHE Insurance (Bingapore) Pte Lid
Priong. «B5 G4TT 1224

Email jgnny lohgbs com
Vit us on the web o www nbe com &3



N Wecreate insurance solutions for
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From: Dd hashim [mailto:dd.hashim@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 3 May, 2018 1:22 PM
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Vivan Tan

<vivian.tan@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG1768BH&SDX6556A ON 02/05/2018- ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Motor Claims Depl

Vehicle lying at 248 Jalan Boon Lay

Please arrange survey for the above vehicle

Here | attached together GIA report for your reference

Thank you
BEST REGARDS
DD HASHIM

DING AUTO PTELTD

HP : 87335832

TEL Office ; 92304128

FAX 62652890

ADDRESS:249 JALAN BOON LAY SINGAPORE 618523

o ————

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If vou have received this email in error, please promptly

k|



. inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
~ produced.

T T

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.
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T REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE REPUBLIC OF SINGAPDRI
 |DENTITY CaRD NO. 90458151
Y. S

AZRUN BIN ZAINULLAH

u' w — w i
lﬂ'l"m | 1
Ty ™

H-1-1%E0 W "

Veticle No:QULE 1 A6 A\ ([ Hirer/Relief )
Reporting Date:%":’é} '.4 Time: {Uﬂ‘(—" hrs

Accident Date: 02 7 05/ IR Time:_\\ B;Q hrs SAS No.MSK.
[OD/TP/WC/Cash] [PG: ] [SPD:____Km/H] Mileage: /0 (&9 6
Hp: 4 66 S6 2 G| (Weather Condition : €leaf / Raining / other : 1l Road surface: Wet / Dry /

[Location: SCoTTS RBD TowARDI NELTON CIRCUS
1P1: Number Plate QD% 6ES6 A Name: CHING W Now yaie Qa0 LT Hp:A925486 2

TP2: Number Plate Name: NRIC: HP;

TP3: Number Plate Name: NRIC: HP:

[Uﬁthqess: ] [HP: [ Tow:¥/N]



OUR REF : TP/SLG1768H/85008293/ AD /2/5/2018/ MF
YOUR REF : SDN6556A
21 August 2018

Maotor Clalms Department

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, 048583
ATTN: CLAIMS OFFICER IN CHARGE

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG1768H and SDXE556A ON 2/5/2018
ALONG SCOTTS ROAD TOWARDS NEWTON CIRCUS

Wa refer 1o the above matter.
Rate per Repair AMOUNT BEFORE AMOUNT AFTER
day days GST GST
Cost of Repair $2,200.00 5$2,354.00
Loss of Rental 512000 14 51,680.00 51,680.00
Loss of
Income $100.00 14 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
LTA Search
Fee $1.87 $2.00
Total 55,436.00

The accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured and as a result, We had incurred the
following costs of repair and losses:

Enclosed are coples of the following documents for your perusal:

&  Certificate of Insurance
Original Photocopy Survey Report &  Letter of Authority (Hirer)
Original Photographs
GIA/ Police Report

@ LTA Search Slip
Please look into our client’s claim soonest possible

N NN

Yours sincerely

DING AUTO PTELTD

Michelle Fang

HP: 8748 3145

Office: 5452 1208 Fax: 6452 0614



S| LML AVE L #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATORE 408938 TEL : (063) 62363500 FAN : (063) 62504315

Our Ref: CC4/QBEI8008263/TIwh3
29 August 2018

Ching Jit Yow
9 Goodman Road
Singapore 438974

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDX 6556A & SLG 1768H ON 02/05/72018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pe
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
vour authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If vou have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim.
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 12/09/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whaisoever by you/vour driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Vivian'Lau

Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com

c.c.  QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Accident Involving ___ QG1368H & SDxLSSHA on__215) 20k

, __Azrun Bin Zagllah NRIC No. :_Soks@ial of Lion Tity Rentals Pte Ltd
Owner/Hirer of Vehicle Registration No. :__Siaitei _hereby authorize Ding
Auto Pte Ltd to submit correspond, negotiate and settle my claim for cost of
repair and uninsured losses arising from the above accident

| further authorize that agreed settlement sum for cost of repair, loss of income
and rental, survey report fee, third party vehicle Insurance particulars enquiry fess
etc. be made in favour of Ding Auto Pte Ltd and that the said payment be
forwarded to them as full and final discharge of my claim

Signed By

[

HIRER b’ DATE : 3)5/2w0 &



DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Without Prejudice
Save As to Costs

Your Relerance ! SLG 1768H
Our Reference : VC011453

IWe, LCRF PTE LTD hereby acknowledge the sum of Singapore Dollars: Three

h i I being full discharge and
satisfaction of all claims against QBE Insurance (Sin ) Pte Ltd and their Insured,
‘Ching Jit Yow, over damage to my/our vehicle ;L& | +68H from an accident involving
SDX 6556A and SLG 1768H at/along PIE (NEWTON CIRCLE ROUND-ABOUT, which
occurred 02 May 2018 at about 02:45 hours.

Further, l/we hereby acknowledge and accept that the above said sum paid to me is
‘strictly on a without admission of liability basis’ and |/we hereby discharge and release
the said QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid and their Insured ‘Ching Jit Yow’, from all
claims, demands or action of damages as a result of the said accident.

Also, l/we hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnified the said QBE Insurance

(Singapore) Pte Ltd against all and any claims whatsoever made or to be made by any
person or persons on my/our behalf in respect of the said accident.

Dated this (day) 0 of (month) __ Ocleler (year) 2018

Signature Witness's Signature
Machelle Fﬂﬂ!_t

Claimant's Name Witness's Name
Shaaie

FIN/MRIC No. FIN/NRIC No.

M 10 # 0i =20

m 1 al €. S C

i
%apcm SASLO§
Address Address

! Please return 1o;

General Claims Department

QBE Insurance |Singapore) Pie Lid
= 1 Raffles Quay

#28-10 South Towar
Singapore 048583
(By Fax: 6533 3270)

Company stamp if applicable



DING AUTO PTE LTD
Business Reg. No 2013117882

BLK 10. #07-20 SIN MING IND EST. SEC C. SINGAPORE 575645

Tel: 6452 1208 Fax 8452 0814

{24 hrs towmng services)
TAX INVOICE
QBE INSURANCE ( SINGAPORE ) PTE LTD INVOICE 1-001047
| Raffles Quay #29-10 South Tower DATE . 19/10/2018
GST.-REG NO 2013117882
TERMS CO.D
PO NO SDXES564
ATTN : CLAIM DEPARTMENT OUR REF SLG1768H
TEL - 64771186 FAX PAGE 1 ofY
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNITPRICE| AMOUNT
i Repair Cost - 5L5G1768H 1 2.700.00 1.200.00
REF ; VCD11453
|
|
|
|
REMARKS : SUB TOTAL 4,200.00
REPAIR COST FOR SLG1768H GST 154.00
TP CLAIM AGAINST SDixXe5564
TOTAL SGD 2.354.00
DEPOSIT
O/5 BALANCE
FOR DING
Customer Signature
e e e T L e

e b dorm awd the amasr dae el
arw ardf e i my s trkartion



5°12018 Invalea

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

m’ 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE #rone: +55 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No: Ma00017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Qur Rel No: GR-18-066635
Date of Reguest 03/052018 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase
Ding Auto Pta Lid
Bik 10, #01-20

Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C
Singapore 575645

Daar SirMadam,

Enquiry Data Q3052018

E—wjiry By You Jing Feng

1. «ehicle No. SDXB558A

Accidanl Data D2052018

Enqguiry Resull

TP Vahicle Na. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurer Tal. No.
SDXe5568A QBE Insurance (Singapora) Pte Lid 02/04/2018-01/04/2019 |62246833
Thank You,

The images provided 1o you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded to the canire by the mambers of the General Insurance Association of
and we take no responaibility for thelr accuracy or contents and shall be under no liabllity whatsosver for any loss or damage ansing oul of or in connection

#ith tha repons or their images

T s a compuler generaled documeni and requires no signature.

hitpa fisingapore. menmen, camiclmmaiindex. ctm ?fusebox=MTHsass luseacton=dsp _geninviplrefid=179304 TACFID=331128534CFTOKEN=C2c34479aIB1bIT4-



S3201A Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Im & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapora 048580
ASSOCLATION

Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400D01T735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Qur Rel Na: GR-18-068885
Date of Reguest. 03/05/2018 Your Rel No Online Purchase
Ding Auto Pte Lid
Bik 10, #01-20
Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C
Singapora 5756845
Dear SirffMadam,
Enguiry Dale 03052018
F iiry By You Jing Feng
Tr Vehicle No. SDXB558A
Acciden! Date 02/052018
CESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S85)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Totsl Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is 8 computer genermted document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date.
|X] GIRO | ]| Cash [ | Chague

—

nitps //singapore. manmen. com/ciaims/ingex cim 7lusecox=MTRsasi useacton=dap_geninvip&refic=17838474CFID=331 128538 CFTOKEN=cOcI4d 700D 1 BIT4-



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 9:53 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAutD)

Cc lenny Toh

Subject: Your Ref: VC011453 Our Ref : CC4/QBE1B00B263/T1wb3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SDX 6556A (Insured) & SLG 1768H ( Third Party) ON 02/05/2018 ALONG MNEWTON
CIRCLE

Attachments: LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinpsection Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustmentl. pdf;

LKKInspection pdf; LOD pdf; SLG 176BH.mp4

Hi Vivian

Kindly proceed with the settlement,

regards

lenny Toh

Senjor Assistanl Clasms

QBE Emerging Markats - Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
Fhone =65 6477 1225
Emall, jsnny tohifighe com

Jinil us on the web al www gbe com 89

Jd el Ni3s
3 oot a0

From: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 9:15 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>

Subject: RE:Your Ref: VC011453,0ur Ref : CC4/QBE18008263/T1wb3,ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDX 6556A (Insured) &
SLG 1768H ( Third Party) ON 02/05/2018 ALONG NEWTON CIRCLE

Your Ref: VCD1 1453
Our Ref : CCH/QBE | 8008263/ T 1wh3

Dear Jenny,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDX 6556A (Insured) & SLG 1768H { Third Party) ON 02/05/2018
ALONG NEWTON CIRCLE ROUNDABOUT

We refer to the above matter

This accident happened Ol swerved and hit TP ( enclosed TP CCTV)



We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal,
We did clanify with Ol the nature of accident. he agreed to settle and aware of NCD issues.

We seek your approval to offer 1o TP repairer Ding Auto Pte Lid is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

I. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 7,235.34 S$ 2,354.00
2. Loss of Earning ($ 100.00 x 12days) S$ 3.080.00 S$ 1.200.00 ( Surveyor recommend 6 days)
3. GIA Search 5% 2.00 S$ 2.00

S$10317.34 S8 3556.00

Amount of claim at liability 100% S§ 3.556.00

For your approval please.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@ kknuto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 7:32 PM

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jen h .com

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLG1768H TP CLAIMS AGAINST SDX6556A ON 2/5/2018

Your Ref: VC01 1433
Our Ref : CCA/QBETRO08263/T 1wh3i

Dear Jenny,

VOLVI DX 6556A (Insured) & SLG 1768H N 1
ALONG NEWTON CIRCLE ROUNDABOUT

We refer to the above matter

This accident happened Ol swerved and hit TP ( enclosed TP CCTV)

We have surveved the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
We did clarify with Ol the nature of accident, he agreed to settle and aware of NCD issues.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer Ding Auto Pre Lid is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
2



|, Cost of Repair (+GST) 5% 7,23534 58 2.354.00

2. Loss of Earning ($ 100,00 x 12days) 55 3.080.00 5% 1.200.00 { Surveyor recommend 6 days)
3. GIA Search 55 2.00 55 2.00
S$10.317.34 5% 3556.00

Amount of ¢laim at liability 100% 5§ 3,556.00

For your approval please.

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4n8933)

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@gbe.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August, 2018 4:17 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qgbe.com>

Subject: BILLING FOR SLG1768H TP CLAIMS AGAINST SDX6556A ON 2/5/2018

Dur ref: VC011453

Dear Vivian

Please find attached as per requesied.

regards

Janny Taoh
or Assintant Claims
JBE Emerging Markels — Singapore

OBE Insyrance (Singaporel Pte Lid
Phone +65 BATT 1225

Emaill, penny. bohdh L=l= 1]

Vinll us on the web al www Qbe Corm. &g

]

Engineering& _ -
Construction Accidemnt




From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mallto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August, 2018 2:52 PM

To: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Kelly Ding <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; Ding Ding Auto

<ding@dingauto.sg>; Alex <admin@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: (REF : VC0D11453) BILLING FOR SLG1768H TP CLAIMS AGAINST SDX6556A ON 2/5/2018
Without prejudice,
Dear Michelle,

We refer 1o the below email,

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our Ol GIA report

Dear Shu Pei,

Kindly assist CC4/QBE18008263/T1wb3

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a withowr prejudice basis with the sele intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settfement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party thar will marerially affect/influence on the
tssues of labilinvdamages, either party iy nor bound. thereafter, by the negortation rerms/sertlement,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Viianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408931)

From: Michelle [mailto:accounts@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 21 August, 2018 11:51 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkk >

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Kelly Ding <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; Ding Ding Auto
<ding@dingauto.sg>; Alex <admin@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto sg; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@abe.com>

Subject: [REF : VC011453) BILLING FOR SLG1768H TP CLAIMS AGAINST SDX6556A ON 2/5/2018

Dear all,



REF : VCO11453
Please see attached supporting document to claims against your insured

We have completed the repair, driver has collected the vehicle and your surveyor has
finalize the repair at $2200 - total 6 days repair job.

We would like to claim for our insured as per following :

Total Number of days : 14 (Due to weekend)
Repair Cost : $2200 + 7% = $2354

Loss of Use : 120 x 14 = $1680

Loss of Income : $100 x 14 = $1400

LTA Search Fee : $1.87+ 79 =5%2

Kindly revert back with an of fer so that we can close the case as soon as possible.

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
32334128

Ping Auto Pre Ltd

NOTE 11!
All mailed letter & chegue payment is To be malled to our main office address :
BLOCK 10 #01-20

SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C

SINGAPORE 575643

Virus-free. www avast com

P —

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If vou have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i B B §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya bl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL: 8255 3561 FAX: 8258 4115
Aeg. Mo 10D807198R GST Aeg. Mo. 19-BB0T188-R
Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD Ref CC4/QBE18008263/T1wb3g2
TonERSCAORE B owezeozoe | 1NN
Code: QBE
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SDX B556A Veh. Inspected SLG 1768H
Policy No. 8-V0012707-MVA-R0O01 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. V0012707 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JENNY Assign Date D4/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.C 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MRO53REH 104557765 Colour BLUE
Odometer 101588 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 ACHILLES & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 ACHILLES 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R18 ACHILLES & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 ACHILLES & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 027052018 Inspection Date 0710562018
Survey held at 249 JIN BOON LAY
Repairer DING AUTO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: G256 3661 FaX: G256 4315

Reg. No: 189607T188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE ND. SLG 1768H
aty Description of Parts Condition [ =stimate By “"""&'f"""
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DDOR LHS BENT 1,140.00 1.140.00
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE LHS TO REPAIR SEE 205,00
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER LHS TO REPAIR SEE BED.00
LABOUR
1|ROCKER PAMEL LHS TO REPAIR SEE 630.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR LHS TO REPAIR SEE 1.200.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR WINDOW FRAME STICKER LHS NOT NECESSARY BB8.00
1|REAR FENDER LHS TO REPAIR SEE 1,085.00
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT =1.297.00 -285.00
3.891.00 B55.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR WINDOW FRAME STICKER LHS (SN) NECESSARY 51.00 51.00
51.00 51.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACED DAMAGED BODY 1.200.00 B00.0G
PARTS REPAIR & REALIGN BODY WORK & CONSISTENT
TO THE ACCIDENT AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF FRONT DODR OUTER HANDLE LHS FRONT FENDER
LHS ROCKER PANEL LHS,REAR DOOR LHS AND REAR
FENDER LHS
TO CHECK & REPAIR WIRING SYSTEM 120.00 30,00
RUST PROOFING 180.00 S0.00
TO REMOVE & RPELACED LHF DODOR & LHR 120.00 &0.00
DOOR ,TRANSFER BOTH DOOR MECHANISM TO THE
NEW TRIM
TO PUTTY £ SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED 1,200.00 800.00
AREAS LHSE DODR LHR DODR LHF FENDER ROCKER
PANEL LHF FENDER
282000 1,840.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,762.00 2,T46.00

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE1B008263/T1wb3q2
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