Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Md Noar, Norsiah <Norsiah. MdNoor@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 May 2018 11:21 AM

To: Bevan Lim (LKE Auto)

Cc Vic (LkKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LC/A527/15/KWCT(ATIN ff ACCIDENT INVOLVING JOQD1015 & SP52R ALONG

WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT ON 25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

Dear Bavan,
Please proceed.
Thank you

Norsiah Md Noor

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606 | Fax +{65) 6835-7417
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any

copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG

for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, May 04, 2018 10:28 AM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LC/4527/15/KWC1{A1)N // ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT
ON 25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

Importance: High

Dear Norsiah,
We refer to our email below.
Kindly let us have your instruction for our necessary action as TP will be proceeding a writ of summons.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@|kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
4 C4
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SeSRER mn Syve the Sarth Frint only when necessary:

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 1:57 PM

Ta: 'Md Noor, Norsiah' <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LC/4527/15/KWC1[AL1)N // ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT ON
25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

Dear Norsiah,
We have offer to TP lawyer as per our email below and it was rejected.
Kindly let us have your instruction for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

o
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From: L54 [mailto:ls4@mcclegalfirm.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 4:08 PM

To: Bevan Lim [LKK Auto) <bevanlim@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: lalita@mcclegalfirm.com; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>;
'Md Noor, Norsiah' <Narsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>

Subject: RE: LC/4527/15/KWC1(A1)N /{/ ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT ON
25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

Our Ref LC/4527/15/KWC1(A1)N
Your Ref 28653691955G-003

27 April 2018



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT (THIRD PARTY) BY EMAIL ONLY
AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD
78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120
Attn : Ms Norsiah

LKK Auto Consultantis Pte Lid BY EMAIL ONLY
51 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

#02-25 Ubi Avenue 1

Singapore 408933

Attn : Mr Bevan Lim

Dear Sirs

CLAIMANT: KONG WEA CHENG
ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT ON 25/6/2015 AT 2300
HOURS

We refer to Mr Bevan Lim’s email of 26/4/18 (below).

The offer of $%4,219.20 in your aforesaid email was lower than the offer of 534,773.50 in your email of 8/10/15
(attached). Our client rejects your offer of 26/4/18.

Please revert by 4/5/18 with a discharge voucher or cheque for $%5273.50 (attached) made in favour of
*MATHEW CHEW & CHELLIAH (CLIENT A/C)", failing which we will proceed with Writ of Summans.

Yours Faithfully

Jayme Lim (Ms)

Legal Secretary

MATHEW CHEW & CHELLIAH (UEN No: 53131184L)

133 New Bridge Road

#13-10 Chinatown Point

Singapore 059413

Tel: 6533 1123 Fax; 6533 1121 Email; lawyers@mcclegalfirm.com

CONFIDENTIALITY: The information contained in this message is confidential information and is also subject
to legal professional privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this communication. If you have received this document in error, please notify us immediately by fax or
phone.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 12:51

To: L54

Cc: lalita@meclegalfirm.com; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LC/4527/15/KWC1(A1)N // ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R. ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT
ON 25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Your Ref: LC/4527/15/KWCI1(A1)}N
Our Ref: CC6/AIG15011340/Kna3



Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your email below

We propose settlement as follows:

Cost of Repair 54,226.50
Loss of Use (Gdays x S80) 5 400.00
VEP Auto Pass 5 145.00
@ 80% $3,817.20
LTA Seach s 2,00

Legal & incidental cost S 400.00
Total 54,219.20

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resclving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim®@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

| P Lt
EERER SET Save the Larthe Print only when necessary:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient. you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



l‘! U Autcy

Fd ==y Consultants
aAdda na B Plo Lid

S1UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 08933 TEL : (0651 62363561 FAX (WS 67414108

Our Ref: CC/AIGIS0T11340/Knal
27 AUGUST 2015

TAN SWEE KIAM
BLK64] YISHUN 5T 61
#12-212

SINGAPORE 760641

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SP52R AND JQD 1015 ON 25/06/2015

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we are in the midst of investigating the matter. If you have
evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us
have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 07/09/2015, after we shall proceed
with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any
settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other
party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and vour NCD will be protected. In the event that you are making a claim against third
party and successful with 80% in your favor, our principal will also re-instate your NCD.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Itim Chin Siong Bevan
Case Handler
DID:6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: bevanlim(@ lkkauto.com

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
iMaror Claims Depi)



Payment Au ion I

Kong Wea Cheng (720102016560)
P 87 Kampung Bahru
86700 Kahang, Johor

TO: LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD &
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

ACCIDENT CLAIM

MY/OUR VEHICLE: JOD1015

3" PARTY VEHICLE: SP52R

DATE & TIME: 25 JUNE 2015 AT 2300 HOURS
PLACE: ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT

['We hercby irrevocably authorise the full settlement sum in this matter (inclusive of
damages, costs of repair, loss of repair, rental and/or legal costs and disbursements) to be paid
to the law firm, MATHEW CHEW & CHELLIAH (CLIENT A/C) in respect of our claim

for property damage to my/our motor-vehicle.

Dated this ‘ghv day of "NM:] 2018

Yours faithfully

Ly

Kong Wea Cheng \(



MATHEW CHEW & CHELLIAH

advocates B solicitars + commissioner for oaths < notary public

133 New Bridge Road #13-10 Chinatown Point Singapore 059413
Tel: (65) 6533-1123 Fax: (B5) 6533-1121 {not for service of Court documents) Email: lawyers@@meclegalfirm.com
UEN Mo: 53131184L

Our Ref LC/452T/15/KWC1(ATIN
Your Ref 28653691855G-003

18 May 2018
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
BY EMAIL & POST ONLY
(ORIGINAL DV & PAL BY POST)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
#02-25 Ubi Avenue 1
Singapore 408533
Attn : Mr Bevan Lim

Dear Sirs

CLAIMANT: KONG WEA CHENG
ACCIDENT INVOLVING JQD1015 & SP52R ALONG WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT ON
25/6/2015 AT 2300 HOURS

We refer to your email of 7/5/18.

We enclose the original duly signed Discharge Voucher and Payment Authorisation Letter for
your attention.

Kindly let us have the chegue for 5%5,173.50 made in favour of "MATHEW CHEW &
CHELLIAH (CLIENT A/C)" by 22/6/18.

Yours faithfully

/
CC' AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
Attn : Ms Norsiah f‘;:/} gyl mg

CONFIDENTIALITY: The information contained in this message is confidential information and is also subject to
legal professional privifege. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this communication. If vou have received this document in error, please notify us immediately by fax or
phone,
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RELEASE
Claim No: 28653691955G Policy No: 2100307629-03000

I'We, JOD1015 — KONG WEA CHENG, hereby agree to accept the sum of (SINGAPORE DOLLARS

FIVE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED SEVENTY-THREE AND CENTS FIFTY ONLY) (35,173.50) 10 be puid
w (MATHEW CHEW & CHELLIAH) in full and final setllement of all claims, costs and dishursement arising from
—pecsonal injur-ar loss of or damage to property sustained by mefus as a result of an accident involving SP 52R and
JOQD 1015 on the 25 day of JUN 2015 along WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT and Ifwe agree that the said sum is
paid with a denial of liability on the part of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid. being the insurer, insured and the
driver of vehicle No SP S2R respectively, (or any other person or persons) in respect of said loss and for damage
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, and is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said AIG Asia Pacific
Insurance Pre. Lid. and all other persons be absolutely and finally exonerated and discharged from all claims of every
nature and kind whatsoever which I'we now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with of traceable 1o the
said accident, ['We further state that the foregoing release has been carefully read by mefus or has been read 1o mefus
and Lhwe know the contents thereof and have signed the same as my/our own free and voluntary act and have not been
influenced in making this seitlement by any representation of the party or parties released. I'We also declare thar I
am'we are the person/persons entitled to receive the above compensation and hereby undertake to indemnify AIG Asia

Pacific Insurance Pre. Ltd. against any claim made or which may be made in respect of this compensation.

“This Release does not bind the insured and insured driver of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. and is not to
be construed as an admission of liability on their part and shall not be used as evidence in any claims, actions

which may be lodged by them,”
Dated this '.S‘L‘ day of H:-j Sold

;L\mﬂ{

\ 1

Name \fr(" : r,'-h Name : _@mu-@nmﬁjmu
Address - \) Address : FB" hMM ‘lﬁ)'/‘vﬂﬁ,
Wion kalanp Plor

NRIC No: 110[1?'2#1‘5{&'0

WITNESS || CLAIMANT

Signature: \ f i Signature: %«
1 rain
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=== AUTOEXCEL ENGINEERING PTELTD TAX INVOICE
& Al Block 19, Sector A, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, GST Reg. No-19:9003355-R

#01-05 Singapore 575877
Tel: 64591630 Fax: 64591698 INVOICE NO: TP 5727
DATE VEH NO
T MODEL
PAYMENT TERM
JOB NO
SN DESCRIPTION AMOUNT S8

MOTE : All chegues must be crossed and make
payable lo Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd

RECEIVED VEHICLE IN GOOD ORDER

TOTAL II

el Engineering Pte Ltd




B2R2MS Muorimen e-Glaims

TP Insurer Enquiry

ENQUIRY DETAILS

Actident Date 25/06/2015 = |
NRIC/FIN or Co. Reg. Mo,

viehiche No, SPSZR

=ZPalicy Detallg
Reg. By - Req. Date 5r.ard1]| E“‘_"D"‘:t':“““
AUTOEXCEL

:Mmm‘,&f_ﬂinwm“ zﬁfllja;?fuzgis SPSIN  35/06/2n15  AIO MI.;:I'L.::!F“W“M! ﬁﬁigés- :I.lﬁs.l'f%?ﬁ%i]; Recaip:

Bgte:
* All submitted enquery will be recarded and you can refer back from the Histary,




LAND THAMSPORT AUTHORITY
LTk ¥TL
PAYHENT RECEIPT
JuD1015 CAR
04 Jul 315, 02:15 PH

Counter No: 1
Racaipt Mo :TANSLIENRD]S0TOS0003E

VEP payable pariod:
Mon 06 Jul 2015
Ta Thu 09 Jul 2015

VEP fea S5 140.00
ERP (1 day) 5 500
Total paid 8% 145.00
Paymant Detalls

Cash S8 145.00

Renaining Card Balance
1111737022010926 (FP} 5§ 12.34

Year ; 2015
Remaining Free VEP Days :8 Deys

The no. of Fres VEP dags ol lazated par
calondar yoor iy bind to the sshicle.
For more defuils. please sesk

sesiebonce ok sar VER/Tall LTH effice,




