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Calculation for LTA Rebate:

Calculation for Valuation:
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\RF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period{Years):
QP Paid:
CCE Rebate Amount:
Teotal Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Mar 2018
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Yes

26 Mar 2018

HYUNDAI

CMSANTAFE 27 AS/R

Blue

2008

GOEABAZ13447

KMHSHB1DR9U421395

139.3 kW (186 bhp)

$22,015.00

11Sep 2008

11 Sep 2008

0

$22,015.00

Yes
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105ep 2018

8- Car{1é601cc & above}
10

$14,235.00

$651.00

$11,658.00
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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 2:34 PM

To: HO Winnie

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: VERY URGENT - $JJ3932U - S8MO0BTZ
Dear Winnie,

The market value for SJJ 3932U $16k - $17k(est) as March 2018

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: HO Winnie [mailto:winnie.ho@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 April 2018 8:54 AM

To: 'admin' <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; 'rta’ <rta@rta.com.sg>; Yvonne Ang <yvonne@priorityservices.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: VERY URGENT - S1J3932U - SSBMOOBTZ

Importance: High

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to winnie.ho@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler by today 12pm.

Please find attached Parf Rebate for your refer.

Thanks & Regards

Winnie Ho, Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 / Fax: (65) 6880 4838

redefining /insurance

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately



