Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 3:57 PM

To: ‘WANG Peter'

Cc: HO Vincent; 'ANG Yvonne'; Kitty Teo Poh Guek; SUR
Subject: RE: To check MV - SBMOOCNI / GA097232 / SJIK4533B
Dear Peter,

The MV of SJK 4533B is S40K-$43K(est) as at Apr’18.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: WANG Peter [mailto:peter.xiao@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 5 April 2018 9:23 AM

To: collin.wong@a-pac.sg; claims2 @fta.com.sg; admin@Ibs-auto.com; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>; ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; TEO Kitty
<kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Subject: To check MV - SSMOOCNI / GA097232 / SJIK4533B

Dear All

Please check Market Value and email back to me at peter.xiao@axa.com.sg within 48 hours. Thank you!

The rebate information is shown below.

Regards

Peter Wang | Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:peter.xiao@axa.com.sg




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Crwner 1D Type: Singapore MRIC
Cwner 1D: 39891

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: 5IK4533B

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes

Intended De-registration Date: 31 Mar 2018
Vehicle Make: B.MW.

Vehicle Model: 7301

Primary Colour: Red

Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine Mo.: 0&6726808BM52B30AF
Chassis No.: WEBAHLZ2000DD51440
Maximum Power Output: 1200 kW (254 bhp)
Open Market Value: $£71,808.00

Original Registration Date: 21 Oct 2008

First Registration Date: 210ct 2008
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: £71,808.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

FPARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 200ct 2018

PARF Rebate Amount: $35,904.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 200ct 2018

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £14,8689.00

COE Rebate Amount: $736.00

Total Rebate Amount: $36,640.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 31 Mar 2018

OK



This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



