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Catherine Chunﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Ryan Tan <ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 3:38 PM

To: CatherineChong@Ikkauto.com; ‘assignments’

Cc Tan, Theresa

Subject: Re: Mew Case - Damage to S1067CD (High Comm of Msia)

Attachments: MITI CAR RENTAL 7 DAYS.PDF; sharpmxm@gmail.com_20180430_143043.pdf;

20180430_124921 jpg; 20180430_124942 jpg; 20180430_124836.jpg

Importance: High

Insured: Shangri-la Hotel Singapore
Policy No: M5C/MCGL/17-000048
Malaysian Embassy car damaged on driveway (51067CD)

Dear Catherine,
Thanks for taking my call.

As mentioned, we have a new third party motor vehicle claim. We are the insurer for Shangri-la and the third party
vehicle was damaged when a partition fell on the vehicle’s rear door.

Our liability is 100% engaged and it is a case of quantum. Can you assign a surveyor to help us review the damages?

Attached Performance Motors estimate and photos of damages.

cc: Theresa, for your info, we are getting our panel of motor surveyor to assess the damages and the costing.
Thereafter, we will arrange for direct settlement with Performance Motors.

Ryan Tan (Chartered Insurer, ACII)
Assistant Manager, Claims Services
D: +65 6643 1342 | F: +65 6643 1349 | ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

M S | G ‘4* ) VARL Team of the Year
| AS) 2016

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o

AMember of TN INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail {including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential, The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the Intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or canfidentiality that attaches to It. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the emall and do not capy, distribute or disclose its contents



Catherine Ehﬂna (LKK Auto)

From: Ryan Tan <ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 4:23 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: RESEND: New Case - Damage to S1067CD (High Comm of Msia)
Hi Catherine,

Can LKK help us with a paper adjustment instead?
Thereafter, to assist us with negotiations with PML on the repair quantum,
We look forward to LKK's advice before giving a mandate on the repairs

Ryan Tan (Chartered Insurer, ACII)

Assistant Manager, Claims Services

D: +65 6643 1342 | F: +65 6643 1349 | ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com
|

Insurer Claims

M S IG *'__ ' Team of the Year

W LS5 2016

MS5IG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +63 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

Amemberof IRETANY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 3:52 PM

To: Ryan Tan <ryan_tan@®sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: 'assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RESEND: New Case - Damage to S1067CD (High Comm of Msia)

Dear Ryan,

Thank you for the assignment,

Flease be informed that according to the repairer, the vehicle already start repair.
Kindly advise,

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssisnments@lkkawto.com | fax: 6256-4915
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, UThi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Ryan Tan [mailto:ryan tan{@sg msig-asia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 3:50 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: "assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.coms>

Subject: RESEND: New Case - Damage to 51067CD (High Comm of Msia)
Importance: High
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INVOICE
Shangrila Singapore Inv No: 332/MITI
22 Orange Grove Rd Inv Date: 02-May-18
Singapore 258350
Finance Administrative Assistant
Attn: Ms Pei Yi Chee
Job Ref No Job Due
CAR RENTAL CoD
aTy Description Price Amount

Malaysia International Trade Industry

1 Menday 30th April to Monday 7th may 2018 S 1000015 700.00
7 days Rental Toyota Camry 2.4 (Black)

Grand Total | &5 700.00

Please make cheque payable to: VIP Limo Services

—
Customer's Signature, Stamp & Date FabfurRazi
Events Manager

THANK YOU FOR HONOQURING US BY YOUR VISIT

VIP LIMO SERVICES tReg Wo.: s3zzszainy
31, Pasir Ris Street T2, #02-24 Singapore 518769
Tebsite: wuw.viplioosg. com
Nobile: +65 0455 2848 Fax: +65 6314 2520 Ewmail: viplisolO@gmail. com



weveaies Performance Motors Limited
A momber of the S5ime Dachy Group
Ca. feg Ho. 197401555W COTF Reg. He M2-0030081-x
;?31; ;:::mP:iE:f::nm ConE ra i::; gm:nggﬁz::q Fand %;:TE‘:%EE:’?EEE;::‘: Ceptee
!Il.r.l_'rlp:hr- IhER4L 5.u|-3a.pbrt l!!:l\? Tﬁ: E:HEI]!-H |k[:EISI:l‘B:"
Tel, 1190100 |Sales & Admin) Tel. 631%0008 (AfierSales) £3190521/510 [Mokazead]
31150111 |Afterdales) Fox. 6345773 Fax. EAT96601 [afEerSaleal
Fax, S&a747T770 E4TIEEDS [Hobar rad)
GST REG. NO : M2 - 00Z00B1 - X
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate Na. : bl 46775 J/ hvm ('L ...DPa.ge No. : 1 of 2
Date Estimated : 30/04/2018 F . QQ’
| Prepared By : Chua Kee Sin Wl i
[ - ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - | / - ACCOUNT - 40000 ]
High Commission Of Malaysia oL Cash Sale=z - Service
301 Jervois Reoad Ili Singapore
|
| Singapore 245077 I
REGHN. NO. CHASSIS NO, REGN. DATE MCDEL MILEAGE
S1067CD NP47245 07/06/2013 320iA/4 0
DESCRIPTION VALUE
Replace rear right daor ‘.2?,! 1,275.00 4
Spray painting rear right door b'; S 885.00
To transfer lock mechanism from old to new door including WA jl{ 531.00
cenduct checks on new door power window system for proper
function. (1 door).
To carry out body cavity preservation b % 118.00
(Per panel)
Sundries. “ 80.00
W Ly
Fersupply-and-install rear right window glass ‘;{ 425.00
solar film.
To conduct water leak tests, - g /75,00
A
Fe-supply-and install rear right window glass (quater) A 425.00
solar film.
AR
Total Labour 1: 3,814.00
DESCRIPTION QTyY PRIC VALUE
PLUG-IN RETAINER 4 0.B5 n Y340
Fillister 10 2.45 ™ %2480
REAR RH DOOR -~ 11,2360 - Hv1,.23660
RH LOWER REAR DOOR HINGE ' 1 57.15 [ %57.15
RH UPPER REAR DOOR HINGE 1 57.15 |. ¥ 57.15
REAR RH DOOR BRAKE 1 7530 ~A 4% 7530
CLIP COVER FOR COLUMN B B 1.35 [ % 10.80
Abdichtung B 1 4.50 L 450
SEALING STRIF 1 20.15 ML 9015
RRE RH DOOR OUTER MOULDING 1 82.25 AN 8225
L REAR RH DOOR INNER WEATHERSTRIP 1 59,85 “ pan - 55895 |

rep LT

L !



smeesies Performance Motors Limited
h nember of the Sime Dachy Oroup
Co. Eeg, Wo, 10T0LEGFW 08T Res. Ho HI-0020081-x
TRy e OO 1 o 1 oo sins Dacty Business centrs
Singapere 155941 Singapore 418180 e ﬁumza RS
Tel, 431190L00 (Sales & Ad=in) Tel. 6IL90888 (AfrecSalen) G11PB533/530 (Mazoread)
BA1RAL1] (Afreriales] Fax EIELETTY Fax, EETEERD IRfCRESAles]
Fax. 64747770 a4 TREE2S iMatorrad)
GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate No, : bl 46775 Page No., 2 of 2
Date Estimated : 30/04/2018
| Prepared By : Chua Kee Sin )
s —k
REGN. HNO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
81087CD NP47245 07/06/2013 320ina/4 0
DESCRIPTION OTY FRIC VALUE
RH EXTERIOR COVER WINDOW GUIDE WEB 1 51.40 " % 51.40
RH B PILLAR FINISHER QUTER 1 54.75 AN 54.75
REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP < 1 138.00 < mA 138,00
RR RH DOOR WINDOW FRAME COVER 1 7T3.25 I 73.25
REAR RH SIDE WINDOW FIXED 1 167.50 | 167.50
RR RH WINDOW LIFTER W/O MOTORT 1 24215 % | 24215
Sealing 1 16.95 alt/ 16.95
Seal 1 16.95 [ 16.95
REAR RH DOOR WINDOW GUIDE " 1 12135 121.35
REAR RH WINDOW LIFTER DHWE_: 1 31205 L312.05
(DG) CLEANER R1 (100ML) - 1 23.85 AL 2385
(DG/SL) WISCREEN SEALANT (COLD 1 HOUR) -~ 1 131.55 i 131 55
(DG/SL) GLASS PRIMER 30ML (VP208) .- 1 27.85 ke =" 27 85
Total Parts 3,019.35
Labour 1 3.814.00
Parts ) r&.MB.SS
|
Labour 2 L et 0.00
Excess . 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 478.33
Grand Total 7.311.68
“* THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS OMNLY** (758 -od”

** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Ryan Tan <ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2018 10:43 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: [MSIG]; RESEND: New Case - Damage to $1067CD (High Comm of Msia)
Attachments: sharpmxm@gmail.com_20180510_083637.pdf; MITI CAR RENTAL 7 DAYS.PDF
Hi Janice,

Revised invoice from PML for this case.
Please see attached. We look forward to your advice.
Ryan Tan (Chartered Insurer, ACII)

Assistant Manager, Claims Services
D: +65 6643 1342 | F: +65 6643 1349 | ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

MSI G & Team of the Year

= 2016
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o

A Member of [URTARN INSURANCE GROUP

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 9 May, 2018 7:00 PM

To: Ryan Tan <ryan_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>; Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [MSIG]: RESEND: New Case - Damage to 51067CD (High Comm of Msia)

LKK Ref: C51/M5G18008145/rb

Hi Ryan,
Thank you for your email.
Janice — please look into it.

Best Regards,

Olivia Lou | Admin Monoger

LEK Auto Consultants M
phone: 6256-3541 | email; olivialou@lkkouto.com | fo: 6741-4108 Bﬁ,‘
f; 5] ]

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Pork, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)



wowe  Performance Motors Limited
& member of the Eime Darby Groug
Co. Reg. HO. 197401559 OFT Red WG MZ-0ORCDEl-%
4 : ! ’ 2 4
0, Memsnded ol owcw  hask fotor pamene tos Bty aiigees ot
i 2 1 Sin re 15594
i;ﬂdﬁi;alzgsﬁlnu & hémind rfr':?ﬂtﬂ:?;ign!?nrr_u-e:nu; _MEHP':“MEH \hfterSales)
1198111 (AfrarEalesl Fax BI445TT] £3150510/810 [Mocorradl
Fax &4T47770 Fax LaT96E0T [AfEaTSaled)
EATRALIS Mo arradl
SERVICE TAX INVOICE
a— “
Repair Order Ho. bl 1263498 Page Ho. (S P i |
Inveice Humber : 1961568 / WSE
Date IN 30;'}4;2“’15 lﬂ‘.’DiCE Date . DTIDE!ED]-E
cust. Sve. Advigor Chua Kee S5in Payment Term : Cash
i Invoice By : Chua Kee Sin
"~ CUSTOMER INFORMATION - — INVOICE TO - 40000 )
High Commission Of Malaysia Cash Sales - Service
301 Jervois Road Singapore
| Singapore 249077 )
= A
REGHM. HO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
| S1067CD NP47245 07/06/2013 320iA/4 190815 )
— o
DESCRIPTION UNITS NETT
Eeplace rear right deoor 1.00 881.00
gpray peinting rear right dooxr 1.00 656.00
To carry out body cavity preservation. 1.00 80.00
(PFer panal) .
To conduct water leak tests. 1.00 75.00
Touch up whole car scratches mark 0.00 Q.00
Wash vacuum and waxing 0.00 0.00
s e T
Sub-Total 1,692.00
DESCRIETICHN .JNL'IE i NETT
(pG) CLEANER R1 (100ML) 1.00 23.85
(DE8/8L) W/BCREEN SEALANT [COLD 1 HOUR) 1.00 131.55
(DG/5L) GLASS PRIMER 30ML (VF2086) 1,00 27.88
REAR RH DOOR 1.00 1,236.60
REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIF 1.00 138.00
EXPANDING NUT — | | 2.00 4.70
Sub-Total 1,562.55
— .1
Lakour Charges 1,692.00 Total Labour & Parts Charges 1 3.254,55]
FParts Charges 1,562.55 Less Insurance Excess Ss 0.00
Lubricant/Misc 0.00 Invoice Total Amount Exclude GST 5% 3,254.55
GST & 7% : 8% 227.82
Invoice Total Amount Include GST 5% 3,482.37
Less Deposit/Voucher 5% 0.00
Computer generated invoice. No signature is required. |Amount Payable Include GBT: 8% $3,482.37

All amounts are in Singapore Dollars.

Waork was carried out subject to the Company's
Mo complaints will be entertained unless reported within seven (7) days of the date of this invoice.

Terms and Conditions of Service.

For credit purchases, interest @1% per month will be debited on overdue amounts
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INVOICE
Shanegrila Singapore Inv MNo: 332/MITl
22 Orange Grove Rd Inv Date: 02-May-18
Singapare 258350
Finance Administrative Assistant
Attn: Ms Pei ¥i Chee
lob Ref Mo Jlob Due
CAR RENTAL coD
aTy Description Price Amount
Malaysia International Trade Industry
1 Maonday 30th April te Monday 7th may 2018 S 1000005 700.00
7 days Rental Toyota Camry 2.4 (Black)
Grand Total | 5 700.00

Please make cheque payable to: VIP Limo Services

Customer's Signature, Stamp & Date FatfurRazi

Events Manager

THANK YOU FOR HONOURING US BY YOUR VISIT

VIP LIMD SERVICES (Rez ¥o.: 532232010
341, Pasir Ris Street T2, #02-24 Singepore 518768
Tebsite: wew. viplimosg. con
Mobile: #65 9455 2848 Fax: +65 8314 2520 Ewmail: viplimoll@geail. com

¥



Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 URIAVE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6256 3561 FAX: (065) 6256 4315

Your Ref: MSC/MCGL/17-000048 Date: 11" May 2018

Our Ref: CS1/MSGI18008145/T1rbs2

M/s MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#24-01 Hong Leong Bldg

Singapore 048581

(The Mator Claims Department)

Drear Sir / Madam,
EVALUATION REPORT (PAPER SURVEY) OF ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO:
S 1067CD INSURED VEHICLE: Public Liability
We thank you for your instruction on 02/05/2018.
We acknowledge receipt of the following documents:-
a) Automobile Inspection Report of S 1067CD from M/s Performance Motors Lid.

b) Final Repair Bill of S 1067CD from M/s Performance Motors Ltd.
¢) Colour damaged vehicle photographs of 5 1067CD.

Based on the documents received from you, we have evaluated the damages of the vehicle and have
the following comments:-

1. Information Recorded: -

Registration Number : S 1067CD
Make & Model : BMW 3201A/4
Year of Registration 12013

Chassis Number : NP47245

)

We recommend that the repairs of the entire damage require about __4 (Four)  working days
to complete.

3. We hereby provide our recommendations on the cost of repair to the damaged vehicle as stated
in the following page.



' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AJE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. S 1067CD
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ™ o op (9) “j,
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
4|PLUG-IN RETAINER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 3.40
10|FILLISTER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 24,50 :
1|REAR RH DOOR (SN} BENT 1,236.60 1,236.60
1|RH LOWER REAR DOOR HINGE (5N) NOT NECESSARY £7.15 ;
1|RH UPPER REAR DOOR HINGE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 57.15 ;
1|REAR RH DOOR BRAKE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 75.30 .
8|CLIP COVER FOR COLUMN B (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.80 :
1|ABDICHTUNG B (SN) NOT NECESSARY 4.50
1|SEALING STRIP (SN} NOT NECESSARY 2015 :
1|RR RH DOOR QUTER MOULDING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 82.25 "
1|REAR RH DOOR INNER WEATHERSTRIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 69.95 :
1|RH EXTERIOR COVER WINDOW GUIDE WEB (SN) NOT NECESSARY 51.40 2
1|RH B PILLAR FINISHER OUTER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 54,75 :
1|REAR DOOR WEATHERSTRIP (SN) NECESSARY 138.00 13800
1|RR RH DOOR WINDOW FRAME COVER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 73.25 .
1|REAR RH SIDE WINDOW FIXED (SN) NOT NECESSARY 167.50 .
1|RR RH WINDOW LIFTER W/O MOTOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 24215 4
1|SEALING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.95 -
1|SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.95 .
1|REAR RH DOOR WINDOW GUIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12135 4
1|REAR RH WINDOW LIFTER DRIVE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 312.05 g
1|(DG) CLEANER R1 (100ML) (SN) NECESSARY 23.85 23,85
1]{DG/SL) WSCREEN SEALANT (COLD 1 HOUR) (SN) MECESSARY 131.55 131.55
1|(DGISL) GLASS PRIMER 30ML (VP208) (SN) NECESSARY 27.85 27.85
1|SUNDRIES (SN} NOT NECESSARY 80.00 I
1|REAR RIGHT WINDOW GLASS SOLAR FILM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 425.00 -
1|REAR RIGHT WINDOW GLASS (QUARTER) SOLAR FILM  |[NOT NECESSARY 42500 5
(SN)
2|EXPANDING NUT (SN) NECESSARY 470 470
3,954.05 1,562.55

Report Ref No. C51/MSG18008145/T1rbs2




' P V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i—l = ; ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533
= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate B Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | o oop {;}] “l,
LABOUR
REPLACE REAR RIGHT DOOR. 1,275.00 881.00
SPRAY PAINTING REAR RIGHT DOOR B85.00 656.00
TO TRANSFER LOCK MECHANISM FROM OLD TO NEW  |NOT NECESSARY 531.00 -

DOOR INCLUDING CONDUCT CHECKS ON NEW DOOR
POWER WINDOW SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTION. (1

DOOR)
TO CARRY OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION. (PER 118.00 80.00
PANEL)
TO CONDUCT WATER LEAK TESTS 75.00 75.00
2,884.00 1,682 .00
GRAND TOTAL 6,838.05 3,254 .85
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 3,254.55
Report Ref No. CS1/MSG18008145/T 1rbs2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH K.K.LAU CPT(RET)
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A BEng(Hons),B.Bus MBA,PEng,PE,
MinstAEA MASME MIRTE
Automotive Assessor REGD Auto Consultant-SAE, Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY T0 THIRD PARTIES:- This Repord is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repart,

Mo lkabdigy of responsibility whatsoever, in contact ¢r ter. I8 accepted to any third party who may reply ¢n the Regort wholly or In part. Any third Darly acling o
Eepori. kn whole or in pan, does $0 &l his O er 0w risk.




