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42018 Adjuster Immediate Advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne:1sssarissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #07-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn: Date: 04 May 2018

Preliminary Advice
Vehicle No : SLEGS11J Accident Date : 05/04/2018
Make tAUDI A4 Policy No. :
Assignment Date : 03/05/2018 Excess 1 550.00
Date of Inspection  : 03/05/2018 Est. Duration of Repair 15,00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
535 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 17,985.00
Revised Amount 85 8,804.00
Check Items (Estimated) 8% 1,209.00
Total 5% 10.013.00
Lump Sum Repair 2t ]

Total Loss Consideration

MNew for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5% 123,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% B7,456.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair 5% 55,544.00

Remarks

{ x } The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly '
let us have your authorisation.

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ | Other comments ;

’
¥

https://singapore.mearimen.com/claima/index.cim?fusebaox= SVQdocifuseaction=dsp_viewersmar&llype=25&docid=3489265%&corole=4&CFID=33175703&CF



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 May 2018 10:27 AM

To: Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: SLE 6511 ) Own Damage Claims
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLE 6511 (Excess $1200/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 4 May 2018 11:12 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLE 6511 ) Own Damage Claims

Dear all,
Any update for this case ?
Thank you,

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (s e 1eseazriw)

55 Ubi Read 1 Road Singapore 408629

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p, +65 6836 2223



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAutao)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 4.59 PM

To: Boo seng yak; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); SUR; Carrine Leong;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLE6511) - OD AIG - SURVEYED 3 MAY 18

Dear Mr Boo,
confirm repair cost of $6915.80 @ 5 days of repairs

Please provide DV and Invoice for our early closure.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 7 July 2018 3:48 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=; Carrine Leong <carrine leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg,
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLE6511) - OD AIG - SURVEYED 3 MAY 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of 56915.80 @ 5 days of repairs.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - jb



ST2018 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SLEG511] (24790473125G)
oD

Apr S 2018 4:05PM
[PREMIUM LEASING PTE LTD]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Fl&plvl Reply .ﬁlll Mark as Unread I Print Message | Delete Message | Forward I

From ALG fisia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 04,/05/2018 14:56 PM.
To LKK_HG
Subject

Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$8804.00) - SLES511] - Claim Handler: Mohd Zawaye, Norsazani

Approved:8804.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY )
There are no documents,

https:/singapore. meriman comiclaims/index cfm Husebox=8VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&inboxid=1279393&iDomainid=11&I0b|Id=4248&IRecipi




RIAMRGAR

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Ma.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 May 2018

»
"

PARFITMF Rahate Foonning

Company
FETEM

SLE&511)

Mo

04 May 2018

AUDI

A4 1ATESISTRONIC
Silver

2016

CVYND13854
WAUZZZF44GA1087 54
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
$32,034.00

2B Jul 2016

28 Jul 2016

0

$26.848.00

Yes
27 Jul 2026
$20,136.00

27 Jul 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 7kW (130bhp)
10

$57,508.00

$47,320.00

£47,456.00

NIPELTYNLITE, gov, SQinanTi/ acnon/enguire R enam sy Fubicoerorneueraginpul fE UL | Jn_IUSeuagauesE i
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MPRATB04BS02-02 | Premiumn Autocare Cenlre - Alexandra

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 120412018 1914
SUBMITTED BY

IMPORTANT NOTICE

‘Wonrg Ehong Seny. Gearge

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e<Filling Submission Date & Time: 30/04/2018 20:00

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1, Please report carrectly the details of thie accident o epeed up the claims process,
2, This Form mast be completed by the Policvhobder andior the Authorised Driver,

4. Informalion provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any willul misrepresentation or withokiing of matenal facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate palicy ability

4. The issus and acceplance of this Form '.::l_.. Insance companies is not an admissan of policy liaks |||',- on the F*’-"'I af the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

B. This repart will b farwarded by the insuress of the Gl Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA] for
archiving and that copies of this repart will, for a fee, be made available upon application by inlerested parties.
7. By the lodgemant of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Reponr
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Yehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo
Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please stale action fo be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
MName of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Flaet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

MName of Driver
Passport No/FIN
Date Of Birth
Qcoupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address

12/04/2018 19:14

05/04/2018 16:05

MONT KIARA KUALA LUMPUR
MALAYSIA/SELANGOR DARUL EHSAN

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

SLEG511.

PREMIUM LEASING PTE LTD
201009676M
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-64712123

ALDI
Ad SEDAN 1.4 TFS| S-TRONIC

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE HIRE

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

COMPREHEMNSIVE
N

RAMESH NADARAJAH
G3295750K

10/04/1979

INDOOR

23/052017

0 YEAR AND 10 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-91278128

NOEMAIL

FPage 1.af 10



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown persons)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

MNumber of Passengers {Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

ZA, ONE TREE HILL
2118670

NO

PAID DRIVER

COLLIDED INTO PROPERTY
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO

YES

NO

NO

NO

| WAS PARKING MY CAR IN A COMPLEX IN MON'T KIARA, KL. | WAS DRIVING HEAD-IN INTO A PARK LOT, AND | DIDN'T

SEE THE BARRIER PROPERLY AND | KNOCKED IT, CAUSE DAMAGE TO THE FRONT OF THE CAR.

Attachments)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
NO

Page 2 of 10



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Panss réport corrg ety the delak ¢ the accdent fo speed up the clers process
2. This Formmust be gg :

14 LT AR 1RL" IS il At [

3 nformation provided rmus! o ms Lruthiul pod accutate s pospible Amy w Ful misrepresentabon o w thhoiding of meteral Fects rmay

alow nsusance companies o re pudiate policy lability

4 The msue and Rcceptance of this Form by nsurance companes s not an admssion of polcy Sabdty on the pan of the suance
COMENes

& i ¥
& The report w il e forw arded by the nsurers of the GIA Records Management Cantre estatished by the Genaral aurance Assoc aten
of Sngapoce (GIA) for Brchiving ard that copies of this report w il for 3 Tee be made avalable upon appkcston by nterested partios
?.mmmﬂhwmﬂﬂm.ywmw cofsent 1o the archiving of ths report ot 1he centre and to copies of na
report being made avadable af oresad

& Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (POPA)

lunderutand, achnow kedge, agres and consent that |

(8] My insurer . my w orkahop and the Ceneral nswancs Assocaton of Sngapore ("GIA"]| irayiare parriied 10 colecl ule, Gacioss
Andior pracess My parsonal datapers.onsl nformation Bt out in th [fonm and any ofer personl nformaten provided by me of
possested by my naurer (collectvely the “Personal information™) @nd dacloss and tramsfer such Personal informaton 1o af insurer(s)
whhmiﬂwﬂm:hilihﬂ'ﬁﬁﬂlﬂ'ﬂ‘lhiccilﬂ!lﬂﬂwliﬁwhhv.ﬂuﬂ#ﬂh:ﬂi}m“hh sccident shal be
colectvely refecred to as the “Insurers’). the nsumers’ e yersiaw frme, B Monetary Autharity of Sngapare and any relevant
governmans Bogency fsuthorfy (Buch as e polce), fer the purpoee(s) of

{1 precessing. handing andicr dealng w ith my claime ncluding the seftiement of e claims and any necessaty nvestgatons relatng to
ihe clairs,

() mwestigating the accdont and'or my clams,

(%) carrying out andior dealing w Eh my irstructions of respondng to any enquires by me;

() adminitering my clairre (inchading the maling of corfeipendence, STRIRTRENGS, INVOICRS, repOrts of ROBCES 10 fe, which could invele
dsciosurne of cenain perscnal dats about me to bring about delbvery of the same as w el as on T exernsl cover of envelpedmal
pckinges |, andior

(v] complying w ith applcable lrw in adminaiering, procesting. handing and'or dealng with my clms.

(colecthoely the “Purposes”)

() ol insurer(s) whe have neured vehick{s) nvolved n tha accident &0 the isurers liw yersbw firms, may/ane permitied (o colect
Use, declose 0ol process my Personal idormation Tor one of more of the above Pusposes, and

(e} my Personal iMormaticn may/can be daciosed by any of the haurers andior G, to thewr third party service provides of agents
{mcluging ther lw yersfaw firms ), which may be sited cutside of Singapore, for ona o more of the above Purpeses.

Page 3 of 10



Sketch Plan #2

Deseribe Circumstances of the Accident

NS Y P U S PO T
Tous dovey Al i g oohn b ald hdelr fh fovne
[ i i
(pAy” od T baedd Lk (8d g deoioge b e Heoad

L YL:L!IT‘

Declaration

e declare the loregoing particulars sre true in every respect

M'{LF

Folcy holagh® Signature  Date & Oriver's S {F driver & net the policy haldar) /
Teve

Page 4 of 10



Accident Photo

R e S RE

QLD

SLEG511J

Page 5of 10




Pemerhatian/Observation

BEARER IS ALSO KNOWN AS:
RAMESH A/L MADARAJAH

&

7

(0
311801

Tandatangar Permbawa/Signature of Bearer

"ALAYSIA m enn  Tywe Kol Wwgars / Caunlry Cnale W Faapeit f Fap L
P i

MYS Al11301

Marnd | Nawe

RAMESH MADARAJAH

MALAYSIA 790410146148

Tarink Labis / Bute of Btk Tampan Lkt | Face Ij.lm

10 APR 1878 WP KUALA LUMPUR
Jarking / S § MEnghd

L-a 184 cm

Tarlkh Hiwiusrkan / Date of Wiss Tirikh Tasain | Dot o Lapiey

27T NOV 2013 27 MAY 201% -
Pajaaan Penpaluar  mpeing OfTics -
HONG KONG

P<MYSRAMESH<NADARAJAHC<CCL<CCCCLLLLLLCLLLCLLL
A311801293MYST7904107H1905272790410145149<<92
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IRIEEIN] DR de%) cate-3one
TN TR

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

MOTOR VEHICLEE (THIRD-PARTY RISKES AND COMPENSATION|) ACTICHAPTER 183)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD FARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960
ROAD TRHANSPORT ACT, 1607 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS] RULES, 1959 (MALAYSI14)

[T
COMPREHENSIVE COMMERCIAL MOTOR OWN DAMAGE EXCESS  ss120000 (1)
WINDSCREEN EXCESS S8100.00
CERTIFICATE NO. 5tu854958/100784602-00000 {107 DOLCHER wr EMEE! B bt Mg FO

SUM INSURED =<1 g
INSURING WITH COE/PARF  ,co

1) VEHICLE REGISTRATION NO. SLE6511.
2) NAME OF INSURED

Premium Leasirg Ple Lo

3} EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE COMMENCEMENT 21 Jul 2017
OF INSURANCE FOR THE PURPOSES OF THE ACT
4 ) DATE OF EXPIRY OF INSURANCE 20 Jul 2018

5) PERSON OR CLASSES OF PERSONS ENTITLED TO DRIVE *

Any parson wha s driving on the Insured's order of with ther permissicn

Prowvided that the person doving s permilied in accardance with (he licensing or other laws of regulatons 1o drve the Motar Vehicke of

has been so permitled and 15 nol disquanfied by order of & Coun of Law of by reason ol any enaciment or regudation in that behalf
from drrving the Motor Vehicle

&) LIMITATION AS TO USE *

Use for lhe camage of passengers or goods n conneclion with the Insured's business

Use for social, domestic, pleasure purposes and business purposes of any person whom the vehicke s hired,
Thie Policy does not cover

1) Use lor racing, pace-making, reliabiiy trial or speed-testing

2] Use whilst drawing a Irailer excep the towing (ather than for reward) of any one disabled mechanically propelied vehichs
3] Use lor the camace of passengers for hire of reward by any pemon 1o whom the vehicle is hired

LOSS OF USE  yin7 \NGLUDED

* NAMED DRIVER M#

HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY UNITED OVERSEAS BANK LTD

* Limilangns renderad moperative by Sechon Bof the Molor Vehicles [ Third-Party Fisks and Compensation) Act (Chapler 185) and
Section 85 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malapsia), are nol lo be included under fhese headings

I # We hereby Certify thal the policy 1o which this Cenificate relates is issled in accordance with the provisions of the Molor Vehicles (Third
Party Risks and Compensation) Acl {Chapter 189) and Parl IV of the Road Transport Acl, 1587 (Malaysia)

Issued At Bingapore g Sep 2017 AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
S 108-222
PREMILM AUTOMOBILES FTE LTD

65, LiE ROAD 1 4 '
AL CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE .

] 4 i -
SINGAPORE 406650 — Bulhorised Representative

ORIGINAL

LEERYH

AP A Pueilis imgronze P

i



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183
Email: Nara khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sqg

Telefax

Estimate ¢ Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference 1 PA/OD/0516/201B/NK
Date : 02-May-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Liability
Excess Cost
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

M/S Premium Leasing Pte Ltd

9 Leng Kee Road

Singapore 159090

HP +65 67689828

Own Damage Claim
9999994958/100784602-00000

SLE6511]

Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI S
Jul-16

CVN 013854
WAUZZZF44GA108764

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
05-Apr-18
Maon't Kiara Kuala Lumpur



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg | claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate . Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad 1

Contact No + 6366 2323

Fax No = BB41 1183
Reference ¢ PAJOD/D516/201B/NK
Date : 2-May-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name +  M/S Premium Leasing Pte Ltd
Address :  9leng Kee Road

Singapore 159090
Telephone : HP +B5 67689828
Type of Claim . Own Damage Claim
Policy No. : 9999994958/100784602-00000
Vehicle No : SLE6511J
Model Code - Audi A4 SEDAN 1.4 TFSI S
Model [ Year : Jul1g
Engine No :  CWN 013854
Chassis No © WAUZZZF44GA108764
Mileage
Date In o
Liability T
Excess Cost no#
Estimated By +  Johnny Boo [ Allan Wu
Accident Date :  5-Apr-18

Place of Accident + Mon't Kiara Kuala Lumpur




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note - This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Neorah Khai
78 Shenton Way 6768 9911
#07-16 AIG Building Hi41 1183
Singapore 079120 Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg
Attn: Motor Claims Dept Body & Paint Dept
Yr Ref: SLE 6511 J PA/OD/0316/2018/MAS

20 Nov 2018
Dear Sir,

RE: INSURANCE CLAIM FOR SLE 6511 J, Audi A4 Sedan 1.4 TFSI S-tro

With reference to the above-mentioned vehicle, no. SLE 6511 J, claimant,
Premium Leasing Pte Ltd, please find the related document per attached.

1. A copy of the Original invoice no. 85013166 — $$6.115.91

2. A copy of the Discharge Voucher duly signed by client.

Based on the above document, we would appreciate you could expedite the
payment soonest possible.

If you require any further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact me at
6768 9911,

Regards

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.

Norah Khai
Claims Dept

Encls

AIG - SLE 6511 )

from

Telephone +65-
Telgfax  +65-
EMail

Our department
Qur Ref

Your Ref

Date

total pages

Premium Automabiles Pte Lt
Showroom

@ Leng Kee Road

Singapore 158090
Telephons (B5) 6566 1111
Telefax  (65) 6471 3733
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Natified Fat Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Ay Rpt [ Adj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed  Status
13 Apr 2018 03 May 2018 $%6,915.80 5$6,915.80 | Pending far Survey
Main 15:34 Edit Estirnates J View Rpt ] Report
Edit Ady Rpt_| Cancel Case |

I!aferen:a Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS E == [Created by insurer]
| Insured: PREMIUM LEASING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201009676M .
. | p5/04 2018 16:00 - 5%
Vehicle Reg. Mo.: SLE65113] Date of Loss: [20 Months and & Days From LTA
I = |Req Date (Man Yr)]
| Claim Type: oD/ 247904731256 | Policy/Cover Mote No.: |{Cnmpreh=nswe} i
Excess: [5%1,200.00
Repairar! Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI1) 55 Ubi Road 1, 405699 Ubl - Tel: ﬁ?ﬁmszsﬂsznggn
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. [ﬂi] Tel: B5-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Mohd Zawaye,
Morsazani] Morsazani Zawayedalg.com
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-1561 ... [Handled hn,- ADRIAN LING] . [F‘I:nal 'Rpt
(due 14/05/2018]
Dhriver/ Custodian: BAMESH NADARAIAH [33 ! Male:, Ner: 63295? SBK  Tel: +551;12?31 2&

| Handling Insurer:

I Adjuster:

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED ' View Al | Compose Case Mall

| o AIG SG (04/05/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5§8804.00) - . SLEE511] - Claim Handler: Mohd Zawaye...
'« AIG_SG (04/05/2018): SLE6S111 / OD / 05/04/2018 / Coverage & Excess update

=1
a

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS view all_ | sesrenTasks |

| Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On pDone? |
._ Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/ claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 3/1 2/2018
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— - . |
1 30/04/18 19:50  Addendum Sheet O Lacws @
4 30/04/18 20:00  Accident Statement Addm. #2 | €9 | Load HTM |

Photos/Images 3 per page - ¥
Mo | Finalized On Premium Autocare Cantre (Alexandra) | |Thumbnail | Print
1 13/04/18 09:24 Accident Photo | € | Loanies | [

5 130418 00:24  Accident Photo €| adres | [#
3 13/04/16 09:24 Accident Photo @  toadws | &

4 13/04/1809:24  Accident Photo | O weds |
5 13/04/1805:24  Accident Photo © toadws | &
Documentation iperpage < | @ .
Ho  Finalized On premium Autocare Centre (Alexandra) | Thumbnall | Print
1 13/04/iE 08:54  Sketch Plan O  edirc |
7 13/04/1B0B:54  Sketch Plan #2 O ladwc | F

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Print |
There are no document checklists configured.

| Cur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

I ‘
| Show Remarks To: | Handling Insurer
Note: BAMArks are private uniss wou show it o pther pafies. J
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo 198607 188R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapaore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Our File No:  CC3/AIG18008103/ATBN2
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #07-16 )
S-.HEEE E!.E ﬂ'?9‘1 an Date: 03M 2:"2{”3
REFERENCE
Insured/Claimant: PREMIUM LEASING PTE LTD Policy Mo:
Date of Loss: 05/04/2018 Nature of Claim: 0D Claim No: 247904731256
DESCRIPTI D IFIC NO HICL
Reg No: SLEGS511J
Make & Model: AUDI A4, 1.4 TFSI S TRONIC (A) Engine No: CWNO13854
Reg. Date: 28/07/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: WALZZZF44GA108764
Colour: Silver Odometer: 28439 km
Engine Capacity: 1395 cc
Market Value/New Car
Price: 5%123,000.00
Sum Insured (S§8): Market Value/New Car Price
COMNDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME QF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): vez Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥es Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60R16
Front Left Side: Continental & mm Rear Left Side: Continental 6 mm
Front Right Side: Continental & mm Rear Right Side: Continental & mm
Tha above values reprasant the remaiming [yre traads cepth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 13,833.00 4,263.80 9,569.20 658.18
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4.152.00 2,652.00 1,500.00 36.13
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 17,985.00 6,915.80 11,069.20 61.55
- Excess (S$) 1,200.00 1,200.00 0.00 0.00
(S%) 16,785.00 5,715.80 11,068.20 65.95
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 1,174.95 400.11 774,84 65.95
MNett Amount (S§) 17,959.95 6.115.91 11,844.04 65.95
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 03/05/2018
Date Inspected: 03/05/2018 Inspected At: Bremium Automobiles Ple Ltd (UBI)
55 Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408699
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: DENISE TAY KWEE CHENG

NOTE: This report represenls our findings at the nme and place of inspection stated harain Such inspection has been camed cut fo the bast of our
knowledge and ability but any other fabilty under any other circumstances is hermeby expressy exciuded

hups:.-'.-’singupurc,merimen.conv’c laims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=¢... 3/12/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1,B40.00FS *1 479.20F5
2 1 “‘RADIATOR GRILLE Cracked g72.00FS *777.20FS
3 1 *GRILLE CENTRE Not Necessary 171.00FS *.F5
4 1 *FOAM FILLER Mot Mecessary 107.00FS *-FS
4] 1 “*FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Mot Mecessary TO2.00FS *-F5
6 2 “FRONT BUMPER SUPPORT LHIRH Not Mecessary 48 00FS *FS
7 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOCK CARRIER BRACKET Cracked 118.00FS  *94 DOFS
B 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER COVER Cracked 109.00FS  *BT720FS
g 1 *SIGN CAUTION Necessary 12.00FS *9.28F5
0 1 *STICKER FOR AIR CONDITIONER Necessary 7O00FS “4 BBFS
11 1 “LED HEADLIGHT LH Mot Necessary  6,973.00FS *FS
P *BONNET Dented 2 163.00FS *1,730.40F5
131 *BOMNET ATTACHMENTS PARTS Mot Necessary 105.00FS ~FS5
14 3 *BONNET IMPACT PROTECTION LH/RHICENTRE  Mecessary 72.00FS “5B.B4F5
15 1 “FRONT NO PLATE Bent 2500F5  *25.00F5
18 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 400.00 FS =FS8
F=Franchise part. S=5Spchett — ——
Total Parts (§%) 13,832.00 4,263.80
|_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. J

https://singapore.merimen.c om/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 3/12/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo  Particulars

Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL FRONT WIRING HARNESS
FOR HEADLIGHTS, HORNS,OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
SENSOR,HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY

2 TO DISMANTLE FRONT BUMPER ASSY,BONNET AND
LHS HEADLIGHT RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH
MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS.REINSTALL ALL PARTS
REMOVED

3 TO RESPRAY FRONT ELUMPER AND BONNET

4 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK

Gross Labour Cost (S§)

Lab.Type

MNew

Mew

New
Mew

Repairer's

360.00

2,100.00

1,500.00
192.00

4,152.00

Page 3 of 3

Amount

360.00

1,000.00

1,100.00
192.00

2,652.00

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

=

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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