Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms>

Sent: Thursday, 12 July, 2018 %:44 AM

To: Vic (LKKAUTO)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE= LPC REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020583 RE: Accident involving

motor vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & SBM 520 £ // Propose for Direct Settlement
***| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008086/hb3

Dear Vic,

We are prepared to accept the DV.

Kindly let us have original copy.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 July, 2018 9:32 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE: LPC REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020583 RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLW
5145 U & SBM 520 Z // Propose for Direct Settlement ***Lkk REF:CC4/LPC18008086/hb3

Dear Gerald,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had settle the matter with TP,

However, TP repairer signed the DV. Please refer to the attached email from TP and scan copy of DV and LOA for their
explanation on this,

Please advise if this DV is acceptable or not.

Thank you.



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 July, 2018 2:12 FM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT _Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE= LPC REF; 17/18/18/VP05/020583 RE: Accident involving

motor vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & SBM 520 Z // Propose for Direct Settlement
***| KK REF:CC4/LPC18008086/hb3

Dear Vic,
Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 July, 2018 11:47 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> LPC REF: 17/18/18/VP05/020583 RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos, SLW 5145
U & SBM 520 Z // Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK REF.CC4/LPC18008086/hb3

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020583
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18008086/T1hb3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SBM 520Z (O1) AND SLW 5145U (TP) ON 02/05/2018 ALONG CLEMENTI ROAD
We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 3™ May 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear-cut case where Insured vehicle had rear-ended the TP vehicle. As such, liability is not to our Insured’s
favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer "CYCLE AND CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5 4,899.97 5 3,872.82
Loss of Rental w/gst (5100 x 4 days) 5 428.00 5 428.00
GlA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL | § 5,329.97 S 4,302.82

Breakdown of days is as follows:

[Dur surveyor's recommended days to repair 3 days




Downtime / PRI 1day
TOTAL 4 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

05 5 -5 T Sove the Earth FPrint only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May, 2018 9:23 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & SBM 520 Z // Propose for Direct Settlement ***LKK
REF:CC4/LPC18008086/hb3

WITHOUT PREIUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle SLW 5145U at M/s Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@l|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

-—---Original Message-----

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 5:15 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G =mt_claim@lonpac.com>



Owr ref* C%LL{.] L)-r"q' (A
Your ref; EEI 95“ 7

. Direct Settlement
Date: - ¢ JUL 2018
To: _,[{'Ji"’fp(,tﬁ T’ -
/
Singapore
Atin: Motor Claims Department

Re:  Accident I]“-ﬂh??@ otor ‘«’ehi’deéfuf. CELLu‘S |4 3B 2
5 g 'D]]. . b

At/Along L f (i 'j’r

2}, )
I am the owner of v hidef nu,ézzf(/\g/ﬁ‘{famat was involved in an accident with your
:ﬁﬁ}d/ 5; C

insured vehicle no. ) Z of the above accident.

As the accident was caused by your insured negligent/inconsiderate driving, thus I am claiming
from you for the following; -

1. Cost of Repairs ; I 'ﬁ c.; gu)“
2. Loss of Use / Rental (ﬂ days @ $ H"i per day) S o

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $. D .00

4. GIA Report Fee $ _~

5. Others $ e

Total: S /) L5 )

[ hereby give vou fourteen (14) days to comply with the above, failing which, I shall instruct my
solicitor to commence legal action against you. If you have any queries, please contact the
representative of CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD at Telephone No:
67714353 (Mr Yik Chan Hoe) / 67714304 (Ms Amanda Ang).

I hereby give full authority to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD and their
representative to negotiate/comprise settlement of the above claim on my behalf.

Your co-operation and immediate attention to the above is greatly appreciated. I hereby look
forward to hearing from you soon.

Yours faithﬁﬂl}r o

Name & Signature

Address: Clo. 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378

Ce; Mr Yik Chan Hoe/ Ms Amanda Ang

E-mail: chanhoe.vikweyelecarriage. con.sg / amanda.ang@eyclecarriage.com.sg
Fax No. 67795383

Updated..22/01/15



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

To:  \MAPAL \NEuvani Wl

Singapore

Attn.: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

MOTOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLLJBIAR UL (owneRr's
VEHICLE NO.) AND ZRMSJ0 Z(3RD PARTY'S VEHICLE NO.)
ON 915/ / S/ (DATE) AT 043> (TIME)
aT/ALONG . (laMerc(s ! (ROAD)

)
[ am the registered owner of gl—wf/f‘ "5 A {Vehicle No.}.

I hereby authorise CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED and
its agents or any person(s) authorised by Cycle & Carriage Industries Pre
Limited to do all or any of the following:-

s Submit, resolve and make any claims which I may have against the 3%
party insurers; and/or

s  Execute and sign discharge voucher, indemnity forms and all necessary
documents in connection with and arising from the above claim.

All payment towards settlement of my claim should be made in favour of
CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LIMITED.

b

-—ﬂ
A

Registered Owner's Signature

(Company stamp & authorized signature if it is a company-registered vehicle)

Name Tan _S1AD M\Aen

NRICNo.  : SLW5I45U

Date :




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : IT/18/18/VPO5/020583
DATE ;09 JULY 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

[/'We, TAN SIAO YUEN confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of SBM 520Z the sum of Singapore Dollars Four Thousand
Three Hundred Two and Cents Eighty Two Onlv ($4.302.82) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/fus upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
melus whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SLW 5145U on 02 MAY 2018 along
CLEMENTI ROAD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (TEH SIOK TEANG /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made

by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S CYCLE
& CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.
\ X e
I_ I". \ 'l.-'
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Signature of vehicle owner/Date

-

....................... O T IR
Name of vehicle owner/Date



TAX INVOICE

Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carriage

Industries Pte Limited

Authorised Dezler

Campany Ma. 19440034 7
GET Reg Mo, MR-BS00111-X

Invoice Mame & Address

Crwner Name & Vehicle Info

LONPAC IWSURANCE BHD

Cust No/Mame

WCY34166/Ms Tan Siac Yuen {Chen Xiaoyan)

Reg Mo/Req Date SLWs145U J 19/02/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMEMT Date InMileage 15/056/2018/ 4771
300 BEACH ROAD :
¥17-08/07 THE CONCOURSE Chassis Ma WOD2050402R360133
SINGAPORE 199555 Engine No 27491031236818
NG 67507388 MakeMadel MB/MB C 180 SEDAN (W205) "AVANTGARDE / A
T B
Account Mo Terms Cate/Time Printed CSE Cperator WIP Mo Invoice/Credit Mote Ma
WLOO1605 Credit 19/06/2018/ 14:34 ¥ 395 / Yik Chan Hoe 23297 28143199
Description of Goods [ Services Qty Unit Price 53 Amount 55
M BPNSUN F.0.C.
POLICY NO/ACC DATE : 1800014762 // 02/05,/2018
DRIVE INJEXCESS ¢ 02/05/2018 f/ TP VEH MO SBM5Z0Z LOMWPAC
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 15/05/2018 & 1700 // TAUFIKH LKK
BY /AUTHRIZED ON : DIRECT SETTLEMENT // VIC LKK
& BPILAR 960.00
PANEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW
BODY PAMELS WITH REFINISH.
A BPIRES 600.00
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER
A BPILAB 0.10 3B0.00
USING XENTRY SYSTEM TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS, RESET MEMORY TO
STANDARD SETTINGS.
A BRILAB 120.00
CHECK REAR LIGHTING SYSTEM AND CONDUCT WATER TEST FOR ANY LEAKAGE .NETT
% REAR TRIM BUMPER 1.00 1559.46 1559.44
Parts 1,559.46 Nett 3,619.46
Labour 2,060.00 7% GST on 3619.46 253.36
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 3,872.82
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 0.00 Total Due 3,872.82
Total (w/o GST) 3,619.45

Pagment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or credif cards, Thank you.

Any dispute (o e irveice must oe made within 3 days. This is & compuber genarabed dogument, ne signature is required,

WE DRIVE FIRST CLASS

€e

CFILE & CARRLAGE

._J-'_\' Mercedes-Benz - are registered tragemarks af Daimler, Stuttgart, Gerrmanmy

Pandan Loap Serdoe Center
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Tel; 6777 B3EB

Fax- 6779 5383

www. mercedes-beng com, 58

Fage 1ol



CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

1
363 Sembawang Road ‘ I Iq n S
Singapore 758379

Tel 67532536 Fax 67567565 wWww.chans.com.sg

GST Reg No: 51-326900-M

TAX INVOICE

TAN SIAO YUEN INVOICE AR1805-0283
DATE 21/05/2018
TERMS c.0.D
STAFF ID ELAINE

AGREEMENT NO.
ATTN : ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

HAZ01805-0138

| DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (SGD) |

Vehicle RegNo  : SLJ9920R 400.00

Make / Model . TOYOTAALTIS 1.6 AUTO

Rental Dates . Rental Billing From 15/05/2018 To 18/05/2018 {incl}

Period . 4 days

Rental Rate : 5% 107.00 Per Day {Including GST)

Reference No ¢ SLW5145U

AMOUNT : S NON-TAXABLE VALUE : 0.00

FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY-EIGHT DOLLARS ONLY TAXABLE VALUE 400.00
GST 7% : 28.00

| TOTAL S§ : 428.00|

Please make your chegues payable to : CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

Far Official USe Only

Payment Date

F ! Amt

CS/CC /CH

CS/CC/CH

Member ol £

VRHA & ARTAS .:"”‘:' A R [ fﬂ\ ‘; 343 Sembawang Road Goodink Park Singapare TSEITR T 67532536 F 47567565 F mabes e



chans

CAR RENTALS www.chans com 59

RENTAL AGREEMENT

CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE

363 Sembawang Hoad, Goodlink Park,
Singapore TSE3TY.

Tel: 6753 2536 Fax; 6756 7565
Breakdown Recovery; 9742 9446

201205 - 0139

Hirer's | Date of Birth Passport! Nric No. I Nationaiity
|
Iy Siae Yuen 09091978 (ARG 3
Address ' | Occupation | Driving Licence No Date of Expiry
| Postal Code | Contact No | Mobile Phone Ne. =
e ool | $9475) ﬂ,q'l,(ﬂ,ﬁ
Jeinf Hirer s 7 Guarantor'’s Mame —wn | Date of Birth Passpar!.r‘ Nric N Matianality
! [
Address I [ Occupation I Driving Licence Na. | "Date of Expiry &
)
—— I v
. [ Postal Code Contact No | Mabila Phone No,
1
| |
CHECK OUT | i Tima Maange S o T e ()
N CELE | {"1} | o 1 112 504 g 7
CHECK IN — e e | ‘I . promre O | i e
. : !
g. 5 1® Spm o 14 b
| IMPORTANT NOTES: | UNIT | RATE (3) TOTAL (%)
» Carls restricted 1o SINGAPORE use. Sea clausa 1(f) for non-compliance. ; = . T - ;
= Mo refund will be given lor vehicle that returns early. RATE o A & ! ff' 0 | "{'ﬂ'ﬂ I i
| = Own Damage Liability — First $1500 for damage 1o vehicls plus loss of |
earmings while damaged vehicle i under repalr. | D’SW_UNT L =S| f T SR

= Third Party Liability — First $2000 for any Third Party Accident Claim, | GST @ 7% . | | M

s Additional Excess of 3000 for drivers wunder 24yrs old or above 7Oyws : - _— ———— -
ancllor less than 2yrs driving experience, | TOTAL | [ %n 0y

| & Hirer is responsibie for all p.u_rkim fines & tralfic summons. | —_— —

« Extansion- One day's advance nofice is required otherwise no extension EXTEMSION [ .
will be allowad. [T ! i | = 3

» Vehicde should be retumed at the same time as collection excepl on |
Salurday wnere raturn time is before 10am. - — I + HECE

s \ghicla ralurned after office hour will be charged o the next working day. ,J__. ‘ | | |

* Hourly extansion 5 chargad at 1/5 of the daily rate. '_\“17 A ' [ ==

»  As praventive malntenance, please check water & enging ol daily. \ | [ !

- = T

» Please chock that you have not kel any of your personal balongings in tha ﬁ i, e i
vehicle, Our company and siafl will not be responsible for any loss of i S ll""m |§ \.F.g‘ll U
pelangings after the vehicle is retumed. : ]

« For the comifort of other users, please refrain from smoking, eating or | | |
carrying of pets In the car. A cleaning charge of $200 will ba imposed lor = I |
smioky, smelly or dirty vehicla. ' DEPOSIT q:a!undabta] 53 RAAL | |

* Carrying of PASSENGERS in commercial vehicle s stricly prohibited
Only WORKERS covered under hirer's workmen compensation are CHANGED OVER FROM VEH. DATE

alleywed.

-

1We declare that ail information given on this form (s true and accurale.

g
IW'e have read and agree to the terms and conalfions of the mmarngraemwabamnrﬂu set overteal. [

L
Hirer's Signatura

' VEHICLE NO.

FRGM

OPERATING HOURS: MDNDA\" TO FRIDAY 8 30AM TO 5.30PM. SATURDAY B 30AM TO 12,30PM. CLOSED ON SUNDAY & PUBLIC HOLIDAY

"-\ |H’ ...-"" . 'I”}u N—'_ )
3 B —
|
Joint Hirer's/ Guarantor's Signature for CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE !
Dt > “es= e =
SL”‘g '“_ﬁ%u e - MODEL Togsa ATD (04
Y ) ] 'F;bmul:uw mmmmmm_:
H ETUH N




Yik Chan Hoe
i e = e ST S e T e e =]

From; Amanda Ang Ying Chun

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 11:02 AM
To: Yik Chan Hoe

Subject: Emailing: SBM520Z

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION

GENERAL  OF SINGAPORE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +635 6224 0030
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Our Ref No: GR-18-065663
Date of Request;  02/05/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Lid
188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Dear Sir/Madam,
Engquiry Date 02/05/2018
Enquiry By Ang Ying Chun

TP Vehicle No. SBMS5207
Accident Date 02/05/2018

Enquiry Result

[P Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SBMS207 Lonpac Insurance Bhd 25/11/2017-24/11/2018 +635 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy er contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any less or damage arising out
of or in connaction with the reparts or their images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.



Our Ref No: GR-18-065663
Date of Request:  02/05/2018
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

188 Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enquiry Date 02/05/2018
Enquiry By Ang Ying Chun
TP Vehicle No. SBM520Z
Accident Date 02/05/2018

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION
OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO[ | Cash[ ] Cheque



