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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
54 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

T s TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807198-R
|_ Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC4/LPC18008086/Mb3

i?g-ﬁiggﬁﬁg ggwcouasmwemow iggsss Date: 03-05-2019 mm‘mmm‘l‘"m
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SBM 5202 Veh. Inspected SLW 5145U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 03/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 1]
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer 2 Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/05/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL
188 PANDAN LOOP
SINGAPORE 128378
(MERCEDES-BENZ)
a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTI
B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR IN

ON WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
STRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Aufa
Commaitants
Pie-Lid

Company Registration No. 199607 198R

SULBRLAVE 1, #0225 PAYA LI INDUSTRIAL PARRK SINGAPORE 40033 TEL @ (b3 62503501 FAN 1 (651 625364315
Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 21.05.2018
Car ref; CC4/LPC1R008086/T1hib3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF YEHICLE NO. SLW51450

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 15.05.2018
al the premises of M/s Cycle & Carriage Industries Pie Lid and have the following 1o report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Mett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs:

Yours laithfully.

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser

;85 4.579.41
1 33 3.736.05
5% 45336
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Catherine Chona (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 May, 2018 9:39 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: FW: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & 58M 520 Z // Propose for
Direct Settlement

Attachments: img-502183755-0001.pdf

Qur Ref: to be advised
Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the survey and revert to them on Direct Settlement.

At this juncture, our insured has yet to lodge a report. 136520 8 @ 10150
Yl Nt A

Best Regards

Gerald Poh ; i

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd thde h‘[bhj

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

----- Original Message-----

From: Yik Chan Hoe [mailto:chanhoe.yik @cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 6:40 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Accident involving motar vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & 5BM 520 £ // Propaose for Direct Settlement

To: Lonpac Ins
Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SLW 5145 U & SBM 520 Z along Clementi road before entering slip road,
Accident date: 02/05/2018

Dear Officer In-Charge,

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer. We have since been

instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number SLW 5145 U), to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we are the
authorised repair workshop for his/her car.

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the {(motor vehicle number SBM 520 Z) involved. As such we are
proposing for a Direct Settlement with regards to the repair costs and other consequential losses.

We appreciate your assistance in this matter and look forward to your agreement on this direct settlement.

| can be reached at chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg



Thanks & Regards,

Yik Chan Hoe

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

Pandan Loop Service Center

Mobile: 9186 5109 | DID: 6771 4353 | Fax: 68721

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any

views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



ESTIMATE FOR SLW5145U

Mercedes-Benz,

KK

Cycle & Carriage
industries Pte Limited
Autharised Dealer

Carmpany Mo, 1 Fo4003850W
GST Aeg Mo, MA-8500111-X

/_ Wehicle & Document information
Tan Siao Yuen (chen Xiaoyan) w WIF: bo 23297
Reg Nao/Reg Date SLW5145U  /19/02/2018
53 Hume Avenue Date In/Mileage I 0
#04-05 . :
; Ch
Singapore 508751 assis Mo WDD2050402R360133
Engine No 27491031236818
l\‘ MakeMadel HMBE/MB C 180 SEDAN {W205) "AVANTGARDE /A
_/ Colour/Trim 021 197 Obsidian B1/ 041 118 ARTICO Leat
Account Mo Tarms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator
WCV 34166 CROVCH  02,/05/2018/ 18:36 YK 395 / Yik Chan Hoe
Description of Goods / Senvices Oty Unit Price  Disc% Armount
M BPNSUN
POLICY NO/ACC DATE : 1800014762 // 02/05/2018
DRIVE IM/EXCESS G?,J"GS,"ED}.E J/ TP VEH NO SBM5ZOZ LONPAL
DATE IN/DATE SURVEY:
BY /AUTHRIZED ON 9/
A BPILAB Y 1200.00
PANEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH MEW .
BODY PANELS WITH REFINISH. [ o=
A BPIRES =z 750.00
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER .
A BRPILAB Q.10 " 380.00
USING XENTRY SYSTEM TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS, RESE,'I HEHDR'I' Tﬂ
STANDARD SETTINGS. *
A BPILAB ~ 120.00
CHECK REAR LIGHTING SYSTEM AND CONDUCT HATER TEST 'FEIR N‘i‘l’ LEARAGE HETT
M REAR BUMPER | Bea .4l 00 1676.05 00.00| ¥ 1676.050€
M REAR BUMPER LOWER CHROME HUULDINE 1.00 245.00 00.00 |MWA 7 245.09 %
M REAR BUMPER LOWER 1.00 208.27 00.00 | W, -,: 208. 2?..](

Tandlu~ a3 34
g v & L.J‘{ i

slsl1se (32

o

L% L L
S 14»«63
sw @ [IWfieunfr e,
LK Auto Consuitants hence nolify
Confirmed & accepted by * To resurvey iﬂ}f':-r-!':%flt-' spray r;ai-nrlnq
L] TC- d 59-3:\- |‘,|.1r"..7|-.'_|:'~_‘_ a -.r!.-;,i giir .ﬁ.:] fE'SL:ﬁ‘ﬂ'f MEtt 4, 5?9 .41
» Parts prices are subjsct to confirmation 7% GST on  4579.41 320.56
* Third party survey 12 on a "Withoul Prejudice” basls
sl enalog s s allowed Tﬂtal Pa ab‘e 4.,899.97
Autharized signatory and cnmpan[ LT i y ;
validity of this estimate 15 L4 days from |j?|un'tt This 154 Jﬂwhdr nmruwwinl ure iz required.

Estimated costs quoted are excluding &5T.
required after repair work has commencad.
we would adwise you. Plaase be infarmed
chagen, Yes must alen agree to pay Tull
the resowal of the windscreen.

€e

EYCLE & CARRIAGE |

.'1_.-'..?'- Warcades Benz - are registerad trademarks of Daimler, Suttgart, Germarny

cas Winaged gkFts are discavarsd after work

inspaction and dess net include asy additional parts or labour which may be
started and needed for repairs or replacemeat. Howswer, should this eccur,
ncement of the work. Payment fer this may be made i cash, credit card or

would mention that the sbows estimate 5 based on our imiti

a digEtatief; 507 of the above estimate is payable pafore &

nt fagegenews! of the wisdscresn in the mvent af insdvertest Breakage in the course of renewing the rubber seal or other repair requiring

WE DRIVE FIRST CLASS

Pandan Loop Service Center
18E Pandan Loop
Singapore 128378

Tel: 4777 8388

Fax: 477% 5383

www, marcedes-beng. Com.sg Pege 1ot 1



@ Mercedes-Benz

Cycle & Carmiage

. = . Industries Pte Limited
Finalization i Y
ESTIMATE FOR SLW5145U GET Reg No. MR-8500111-K
[ e WY : : L el Wehicle nt Info
LONPAC INSURANGE BHD WIP No 23297
Reg Mo/Reg Date SLW5145L [ 19/02/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT Date InMikea /0 1
e S EYET 45U
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE
SINGAPORE 198555 Engine No 27491031236818 !
"l\- B2507388 Maka/Madel ME/MB C 180 SEDAN (W205) “AVANTSARDE / A
/" Colour/Trim 021 107 Obsidian B1/ 041 118 ARTICO Leat
Account No Terms  Date/Time Printed CSE Operator
WLOO1605 Credit 19/06/2018/ 14:31 YK 395 / Yik Chan Hoe o,

Description of Goods [ Services

M_EPJS

ThSdS NOT AN-OFEICIA)

DATE IN/DATE SURVEY: 15/05/2018 @ 1700 // TAUFIKH LKK

BY/AUTHRIZED ON : DIRECT SETTLEMENT // VIC LEK

A BPILAB 960.00
PAMEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED AREAS, REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW
BODY PANELS WITH REFINISH.

A BPIRES 600,00
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER

A BPILAB 0.10 380.00
USING XENTRY SYSTEM TO CHECK CONTROL UNITS, RES
STAWDARD SETTIMGS.

& BPILAB 120.00

CHECK REAR LIGHTING SYSTEM AND Eﬂeﬂ TER TEST EAKAGE .METT
% REAR TRIM BUMPER S 1.00 1559.46 00.00 155%9.46

ik Chan qu i
Cycle & Carviage Indu?.nes?l:r
Body Cars & Repair Cent i
DiD: 6771 4353 HI o186 5‘1;{!‘! F"u..wm-a
E.-mnlnluq ﬂunhq-.yih@arﬂ SR ETIES

Confimed & accepied by
Mett 3,619.46
7% GST on 3619.48 253.36
Total Payable 3,872.82

Authorized signatory and company stamp

validity of this estimate is 1A days from date of gests. Thin {4 & computer ganarated docussnt, no signature 1s reguired.

Fitisated costs quated are sxcluding 45T, We would mention that the shove sstimate f& Based on our initial inspection snd does not include asy additiesmal parts er labour which may e
raquired after repair work has comesced, oecasionally wern or damaged parts are discoversd after work has started snd nesdsd for repairs or replecemest. Bawsver, should this occar,
wo waild advise you, Plesse be informed that o doposit of 50% of the ibove extimate is payable before comeacensat of the work. Paymeat for this may be made in cash, credit card or
chegee. You must alsa agree to pay full wmount for reneer] of the windscress in the svent of {nedvertest Broakige in the courde of respaing the rubber sea] or atber repair requiring
fhe romoval ef the wisdieraen.

Pandan Loog Service Cenber
@@ | WE GRIVE FIRST CLASE 188 Pandan Leop
Singapors 178378

Tel: 6777 8388
Fac 6779 5383

CYCLE & CARRLADE

E'.I.\} Mercedes-Henz - are reisterad trademarks of Daimber, Stutteart, Germany

whaea mercadas-benr com.sg e 4 w1



Vic (LKKAuto)

f

From: Vic (LkKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 July, 2018 243 PM

To: Yik Chan Hoe

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAUTD)

Subject: RE Your Ref SLW 51450 ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5BM 5207 AND SLW
5145U ON 02/05/2018

Attachments: DV.pdf

Withouot P inp

Dear Mr Yik,
We refer further to our below email and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD and supporting documents.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we confirm acceptance of your offer of $4,302.82 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

Kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward the original signed DV together with the Authorization to Act
letter ot cioned by the owner to us (LKK) for payment processing.

The ahnve amount is to be made payable to CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD.

Thank vou.

"plens nate that our above offer and any c=t*'=ment arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
showiy not be construed o5 an adimis J on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
shouw! ¢ be disciosed in any ol (1o matter(s) in respect of the accident, Our offer made in respect af this present

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this affer or any settlement arising from this offer
frrany rrelated maotters.

Best Begards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

I'h tyt-anah | email: vicalpeh@ bkt i | fax: 6741-4108

ik =1 Pava Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenne 1. #02-25 | 5(408933)

. 5 only when ecessary:
This e-mail contain confidential and privilened material, and are for the zole uze of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unii is prahibited, and | ation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
rear! r any a4ached itcms. Ple = the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sent { vau have deleted the e-mail all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,
Fron
Sent: Jay, 9 May, 2015 112
To: Yik Chan Hoe
Ce: Avimin A Vic [LKKAute): Bevan Lim [LKK Auto)
Subject ¢f: 5LW 5145U_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SEM 520Z AND SLW 5145U ON 02/05/2018



Your Nof SIW 51450 “WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
Our | LE1108086,/Mh3

Dear ’

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SBM 5207 AND SLW 5145U ON 02/05/2018

w" r.l__ S| 11 omattor
Please bo infrrm .1 that hasine nn the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to
thr! ; 1 S A alailall

Please notn that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to

your ol e and admiccian of o Lo bility to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
cons o damages according 1o 1he nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number nf days of el 9 rpeammond e e ar sSurveyvor.
Kifidly Frraedtbha | AR and all supporting decuments to us if available to proceed with the settlement.
Than

21

Vie Al Mandler

LK1 tamtg Pl 1 11

I [ Bl wie 7 fax: 6741-4108

Blle s Tenrdn] Mol ; 5 | SCinfaa3)

|

fa Tecessary”

This in o fidential and priviiened material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
un ahihite { ey I<tion of l=w. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
re | I ¢ ihe e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
5¢ i ati ts and any copies thereof. Thank you.

Le*)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L.. ;‘. : 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62556 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 18-0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE EHD Ref : CC4/LPC18008086/T1hb3n2
300 BEACH ROAD ,
#17-04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D2t¢" 2005201 Imm,mmmm“
Code: LPC2

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SBM 5202 Veh. Inspected SLW 51450
Policy No. Z17VPD5015903 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 171 EBMBNVPOSI0Z0583 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 03/05/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C180 c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WDD2050402R360133 Colour BLACK
Odometer 4771 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [225/50 R17 CONTIMENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R1 T CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/05/2018 Inspection Date 15/05/2018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL
188 PANDAN LOOP
SINGAPORE 128378
{(MERCEDES-BENZ)
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLW 5145U

Page Mo.1of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop 1:]1 {ijl
LACEMENT OF PART
1|REAR BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 1,676.05 1,569.46
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER CHROME MOULDING (SN} NOT NECESSARY 24509
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 208.27 -
2,129.41 1,559.46
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING TO REPAIR AFFECTED 1,200.00 960.00
AREAS ,REMOVE AND REPLACE WITH NEW BODY
PANELS WITH REFINISH,
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER. 750.00 600.00
USING XENTRY SYSTEM TO CHECK CONTROL 380.00 380.00
UNITS ,RESET MEMORY TO STANDARD SETTINGS.
CHECK REAR LIGHTING SYSTEM AND CONDUCT WATER 120.00 120.00
TEST FOR ANY LEAKAGE .
2.450.00 2.060.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,579.41 3,619.46
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 3,619.46

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18008086/T1hb3n2

M.

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

o
|

|
(]
[ d

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor




